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Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)
Sent: Friday, 6 March 2020 11:25 AM
To: 'Lalitha Krishnan - III'
Cc: Admin A
Subject: RE: III REF: MCV2020D0000228 //LKK REF: CC3/III20001555/pa3 [ACCIDENT 

INVOLVING GBB 9448Z(III) AND SLX 3659L ON 26/01/2020]
Attachments: EVIDENCE: VERY URGENT REMINDER: CAR IN WORKSHOP, PLEASE SURVEY ASAP - 

REQ FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT - SLX3659L & GBB9448Z (INDIA) ON 26 JAN 2020 
//LKK REF: CC3/III20001555/pa3 

Hi Lalitha, 
 
As per our tele-conversation yesterday, I have contacted our driver Mr Ameer at 8497 4969 to verify the nature of 
accident on 05 March 2020. He said that he cannot remember what had happened. Informed him that third party 
had a copy of video footage to show that his van had hit onto third party’s car from behind. He refused to talk too 
much and said that he tried to recall and call me back. I have tried to call him again this morning but his phone is 
offline.  
 
Third party repairer is chasing for update/outcome. Kindly refer to the attached email for your easy reference. Third 
party claimant had provided additional information on this matter. 
 
Kindly let us have your instruction on this matter. 
 
Thank you. 
 

 
 

Best Regards, 

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

 

 
 

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)  
Sent: Monday, 17 February 2020 5:19 PM 
To: Gabriel Wee <Gabriel@iii.com.sg>; Lalitha Krishnan - III <lalitha@iii.com.sg> 
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: III REF: MCV2020D0000228 //LKK REF: CC3/III20001555/pa3 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBB 9448Z(III) AND 
SLX 3659L ON 26/01/2020] 
 
Dear Sirs/Mdm, 
 
Further to our below email. 
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We noted that insured driver had reported that he cannot remember what had happened. However third party had 
submitted video footage & accident report with our driver particular details on this case. 
 
Kindly advise if we may proceed DS and let us have your instruction thru Merimen. 
 
Thanks. 

 
 

Best Regards, 

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

 

 
 

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)  
Sent: Wednesday, 12 February 2020 10:31 AM 
To: 'Gabriel Wee' <Gabriel@iii.com.sg> 
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: III REF: MCV2020D0000228 //LKK REF: CC3/III20001555/pa3 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBB 9448Z(III) AND 
SLX 3659L ON 26/01/2020] 
 
Hi, 
 
Noted with thanks. 
 
Attached is a copy of video footage submitted by 3rd party for your easy reference. 
 
 
 

 
 

Best Regards, 

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

 

 
 

From: Gabriel Wee <Gabriel@iii.com.sg>  
Sent: Wednesday, 12 February 2020 10:23 AM 
To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> 
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Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: III REF: MCV2020D0000228 //LKK REF: CC3/III20001555/pa3 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBB 9448Z(III) AND 
SLX 3659L ON 26/01/2020] 
 
Dear Hsiao Tong, 
 
Insured has not reported the accident. 
 
Best Regards, 
Gabriel Wee 
 

 
64 Cecil  Street; #05 - IOB Building    
Singapore 049711 
Tel: 6347 6100, Ext – 248 
 
 
 

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) [mailto:chewht@lkkauto.com]  
Sent: 12 February, 2020 10:11 AM 
To: Gabriel Wee <Gabriel@iii.com.sg> 
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: III REF: MCV2020D0000228 //LKK REF: CC3/III20001555/pa3 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBB 9448Z(III) AND SLX 
3659L ON 26/01/2020] 
 
Dear Sirs/Mdm, 
 
We refer to the above matter. 
 
Kindly advise if there is any insured accident report. If so, kindly assist to upload a copy of it in Merimen for our 
necessary action. 
 
Thanks. 
 
 

 
 

Best Regards, 

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

 

 
 
This email is intended solely for the person to whom it has been addressed. It may contain confidential and/or 
legally privileged information. If you are not the person for whom this e-mail was intended, or if this e-mail has 
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reached you by mistake, please delete it immediately and inform us of the error and also be hereby notified that any 
use, distribution, transmission, printing, copying or dissemination of this information in any way or in any manner is 
strictly prohibited and may be unlawful. Internet communications may not be entirely secure or accurate as 
information could be intercepted, corrupted, lost, delayed or contain viruses. Therefore, we do not accept liability 
for any errors or omissions in the content of this message or any delay in delivery which may arise as a result of 
Internet transmission or any modification.  


