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Jia Le (LKK Auto)

From: Jason Tea <JasonTea@msfirstcapital.com.sg>
Sent: Tuesday, 5 May 2020 4:24 PM
To: Jia Le (LKK Auto)
Subject: RE: Revised mandate Ack LOD Accident involving SLT6308B & SHA5759L on 

22/01/2020 - Your ref: D20000587MFSH *** LKK REF: CC4/FCI20001470/R1da3q2

Dear Jia Le,  
 
Ok noted please proceed. 
 
 
Regards  
Jason Tea 
Motor Claims 
 
Personal Data Protection Act 2012 ("PDPA"): 
Under the PDPA, there are various requirements that regulate the processing of your personal data. Please refer to http://www.msfirstcapital.com.sg for details of 
PDPA Personal Data Collection Statement. 

Confidentiality Notice: This e-mail is confidential. It may also be legally privileged. If you are not the addressee or to whom it is intended, you may not copy, 
forward, disclose or use any part of it. If you have received this message in error, please delete the message and all copies from your system and notify the sender 
immediately by return e-mail. 
 
With effect from 15 January 2018, we will be known as MS First Capital Insurance Limited. Our new website will be 
www.msfirstcapital.com.sg. 
 
As a response to the COVID19 outbreak, we are observing staggered working hours and some of us are on Work From Home 
arrangement. 
  
However, our office is open and we are actively working to support our clients and partners. We have access to e-mails and will 
work to respond in a timely manner.  
 
We appreciate your understanding on this matter. 
 
Our Motor Claim email address is:  
motorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg  
 
Thank you and have a nice day.  
 

From: Jia Le (LKK Auto) <JiaLe@lkkauto.com>  
Sent: Tuesday, 5 May 2020 3:52 pm 
To: Jason Tea <JasonTea@msfirstcapital.com.sg> 
Subject: RE: Revised mandate Ack LOD Accident involving SLT6308B & SHA5759L on 22/01/2020 - 
Your ref: D20000587MFSH *** LKK REF: CC4/FCI20001470/R1da3q2 
 
Dear Jason, 
 
Amount should be $6,410.41 (COR $5,682.81, LOR $727.60 [4days x $170 +GST]) 
 
Kindly let us have your approval. 
 
 
Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via 
email.  Submission of claim related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much 
regretted. 
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Best Regards, 

Chan Jia Le | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6749 5792 | email: Jiale@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
 

From: Jason Tea [mailto:JasonTea@msfirstcapital.com.sg]  
Sent: Tuesday, 5 May 2020 3:23 PM 
To: Jia Le (LKK Auto) 
Subject: Revised mandate Ack LOD Accident involving SLT6308B & SHA5759L on 22/01/2020 - Your 
ref: D20000587MFSH *** LKK REF: CC4/FCI20001470/R1da3q2 
 
Dear Jia Le,  
 
As the TP vehicle is 1911cc Mercedes we can agree to LOR $170.00 per day. 
 
Mandate given for settlement is $6,362.81 
 
 
Regards  
Jason Tea 
Motor Claims 
 
Personal Data Protection Act 2012 ("PDPA"): 
Under the PDPA, there are various requirements that regulate the processing of your personal data. Please refer to http://www.msfirstcapital.com.sg for details of 
PDPA Personal Data Collection Statement. 

Confidentiality Notice: This e-mail is confidential. It may also be legally privileged. If you are not the addressee or to whom it is intended, you may not copy, 
forward, disclose or use any part of it. If you have received this message in error, please delete the message and all copies from your system and notify the sender 
immediately by return e-mail. 
 
With effect from 15 January 2018, we will be known as MS First Capital Insurance Limited. Our new website will be 
www.msfirstcapital.com.sg. 
 
As a response to the COVID19 outbreak, we are observing staggered working hours and some of us are on Work From Home 
arrangement. 
  
However, our office is open and we are actively working to support our clients and partners. We have access to e-mails and will 
work to respond in a timely manner.  
 
We appreciate your understanding on this matter. 
 
Our Motor Claim email address is:  
motorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg  
 
Thank you and have a nice day.  
 

From: Jia Le (LKK Auto) <JiaLe@lkkauto.com>  
Sent: Tuesday, 5 May 2020 2:40 pm 
To: Jason Tea <JasonTea@msfirstcapital.com.sg> 
Subject: RE: Express Settlement Ack LOD Accident involving SLT6308B & SHA5759L on 22/01/2020 - 
Your ref: D20000587MFSH *** LKK REF: CC4/FCI20001470/R1da3q2 
 
Dear Jason, 
 
TP did not accept LOR at $642 and they request $170/day. 
 
Kindly let us have your approval/instruction. 
 
Thank you. 
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Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via 
email.  Submission of claim related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much 
regretted. 
 
Best Regards, 

Chan Jia Le | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6749 5792 | email: Jiale@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
 

From: Jason Tea [mailto:JasonTea@msfirstcapital.com.sg]  
Sent: Wednesday, 15 April 2020 5:34 PM 
To: Chermaine Loo; Jia Le (LKK Auto) 
Subject: FW: Express Settlement Ack LOD Accident involving SLT6308B & SHA5759L on 22/01/2020 - 
Your ref: D20000587MFSH *** LKK REF: CC4/FCI20001470/R1da3q2 
 
Dear Chermaine,  
 
Please check whether LOD send to INSD and ID  
 
Dear Jia Le,  
 
LOR start from $120.00 X 4 days. 
 
Mandate given $ 6,196.41 to $ 6,324.81 
 
Please pend case for 2 weeks for us to notify Insured and ID. 
 
 
Regards  
Jason Tea 
Motor Claims 
 
Personal Data Protection Act 2012 ("PDPA"): 
Under the PDPA, there are various requirements that regulate the processing of your personal data. Please refer to http://www.msfirstcapital.com.sg for details 
of PDPA Personal Data Collection Statement. 

Confidentiality Notice: This e-mail is confidential. It may also be legally privileged. If you are not the addressee or to whom it is intended, you may not copy, 
forward, disclose or use any part of it. If you have received this message in error, please delete the message and all copies from your system and notify the 
sender immediately by return e-mail. 
 
With effect from 15 January 2018, we will be known as MS First Capital Insurance Limited. Our new website will be 
www.msfirstcapital.com.sg. 
 
As a response to the COVID19 outbreak, we are observing staggered working hours and some of us are on Work From Home 
arrangement. 
  
However, our office is open and we are actively working to support our clients and partners. We have access to e-mails and will 
work to respond in a timely manner.  
 
We appreciate your understanding on this matter. 
 
Our Motor Claim email address is:  
motorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg  
 
Thank you and have a nice day.  
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From: Jia Le (LKK Auto) <JiaLe@lkkauto.com>  
Sent: Wednesday, 15 April 2020 11:07 am 
To: Jason Tea <JasonTea@msfirstcapital.com.sg> 
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: Express Settlement Ack LOD Accident involving SLT6308B & SHA5759L on 22/01/2020 - 
Your ref: D20000587MFSH *** LKK REF: CC4/FCI20001470/R1da3q2 
 
Claim No: D20000587MFSH/1 
LKK Ref: CC4/FCI20001470/R1da3q2 
 
Dear Sirs/Madam, 
 
ACCIDENT INVOLVING SHA 5759L AND SLT 6308B ON 22/01/2020 
 
We refer to the above matter. 
 
We have checked with our surveyor, the damage is consistent to the accident. 
 
We seek your approval to offer Third Party repairer “CYCLE & CARRIAGE INDUSTRIES PTE LTD” at $6,324.81(all-in). 
 
The summary is as follows:- 
 

 Claimed Amount Revised Amount 
1. Cost of Repair (w/GST) $ 9,124.50 $ 5,682.81 
2. Loss of Rental (4days x $170)(w/GST) $     727.60 $     642.00 (4days x 

$150)(w/GST) 
                                                                             Total $ 9,852.10 $ 6,324.81 

 
Surveyor recommended 04 days for repair  
 
Enclosed here with all the relevant documents for your perusal. 
 
Kindly let us have your approval/instruction. 
 
 
 
Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via 
email.  Submission of claim related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much 
regretted. 
 
Best Regards, 

Chan Jia Le | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6749 5792 | email: Jiale@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
 

From: Jason Tea [mailto:JasonTea@msfirstcapital.com.sg]  
Sent: Tuesday, 14 April 2020 1:35 PM 
To: Amanda Ang; Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) 
Subject: Express Settlement Ack LOD Accident involving SLT6308B & SHA5759L on 22/01/2020 - Your ref: 
D20000587MFSH 
 
Dear Amanda 
 
We acknowledge you LOD dated 14/04/2020. 
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LKK will assist us on the express settlement.  
 
Thanks.  
 
 
Regards  
Jason Tea 
Motor Claims 
 
Personal Data Protection Act 2012 ("PDPA"): 
Under the PDPA, there are various requirements that regulate the processing of your personal data. Please refer to http://www.msfirstcapital.com.sg for details of 
PDPA Personal Data Collection Statement. 

Confidentiality Notice: This e-mail is confidential. It may also be legally privileged. If you are not the addressee or to whom it is intended, you may not copy, 
forward, disclose or use any part of it. If you have received this message in error, please delete the message and all copies from your system and notify the sender 
immediately by return e-mail. 
 
With effect from 15 January 2018, we will be known as MS First Capital Insurance Limited. Our new website will be 
www.msfirstcapital.com.sg. 
 
As a response to the COVID19 outbreak, we are observing staggered working hours and some of us are on Work From Home 
arrangement. 
  
However, our office is open and we are actively working to support our clients and partners. We have access to e-mails and will 
work to respond in a timely manner.  
 
We appreciate your understanding on this matter. 
 
Our Motor Claim email address is:  
motorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg  
 
Thank you and have a nice day.  
 

From: Amanda Ang <amanda.ang@cyclecarriage.com.sg>  
Sent: Tuesday, 14 April 2020 1:09 pm 
To: Jason Tea <JasonTea@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; CWS Motor Claims 
<cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg> 
Subject: Accident involving SLT6308B & SHA5759L on 22/01/2020 - Your ref: D20000587MFSH 
 
Dear Jason,  
 
Attach herewith our LOD for your kind attention.  
 
Thank you.  
 
 
Best regards, 
Amanda Ang 
 
Cycle & Carriage Singapore • 188 Pandan Loop Singapore 128378 
T: +65 6206 1818 • DID: +65 6771 4304   
www.cyclecarriage.com.sg 
 
DISCLAIMER:- This email and any attachment to it is confidential and intended only for the use of the 
individual or entity named above and may contain information that is privileged. If you are not the intended 
recipient, you are notified that any dissemination, distribution or copying of this email or any attachment is 
strictly prohibited. If you have received this email in error, please notify us immediately by return email and 
destroy the original message. Any views expressed are those of the individual sender, and not necessarily 
the views of Cycle Carriage Industries Pte Ltd and/or any of its related corporations.  


