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                    SIN HO AUTO 

DESIGN AIRE BULDINGS SERVICE ( S ) PTE LTD Date:

Singapore 408714

Final Bill For Vehicle No: GBJ28U TOYOTA DYNA 150 3.0 

Descriptions AMOUNT

Lump Sum repair cost as recommended by $23,400.00
LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD

Total $23,400.00

S/DLRS: TWENTY THREE  THOUSAND FOUR HUNDRED  ONLY

                                     BLK 3020A #01-33 UBI ROAD 1 #01-33 SINGAPORE 408714

                         INVOICE

17th DECEMBER 20
Blk 3020A #01-33
Ubi Road 1 

Accident date:20th JANUARY  2020



Land Transport Authority
10 Sin Ming Drive
Singapore 575701

GST Registration No. : M4-0006529-2

Print Date/Time : 20 Jan 2020 / 23:07:33

Receipt Date/Time : 20 Jan 2020 / 23:07:27

Tax Invoice/Receipt

Receipt No. : ITNET-00000-200120-004286

Previous Receipt No. :

S/N Item Description/
Business Transaction Reference 
No.

Amount 
Before

GST (S$)

GST 
Amount 

(S$)

Amount 
After GST 

(S$)
Result of Insurance Enquiry - YM9486H
As at 20 Jan 2020/06:40:00
Insurance Co: LONPAC INSURANCE BHD

1 Insurance Enquiry - YM9486H
Enquiry Fee 
20200120230642310854

7.00 0.49 7.49

Sub-Total 7.00 0.49 7.49

Total Before Rounding 7.00 0.49 7.49

Rounding Difference 0.04

Total Amount Payable 7.45

Paid By

xxxxxxxxxxxx4105
Credit Card: Visa

/MasterCard
7.45

Total 7.45

Cash Change 0.00

Tendered Amount 7.45

Excess Refundable Amount 0.00

THANK YOU AND HAVE A NICE DAY!

Please ensure that all payments to the Authority are good and promptly settled by the payment service 
provider / financial institution. Otherwise, the transaction and receipt is considered void and late fee 

may apply.
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Jaslin Kok (LKK Auto)

From: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@lonpac.com>

Sent: Monday, 8 February 2021 4:02 PM

To: Jaslin Kok (LKK Auto)

Cc: MT_Claim_SG

Subject: RE: GBJ28U & YM9486H Doa 20/1/20 [External Confidential]

Lonpac External - Confidential 
Dear Jaslin, 
 
For cost of repair , we proposed $22,500.00 and loss of use for 30 days at $80 per day.  
 
Best Regards 
Gerald Poh 
Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd 
300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555 
Tel: (65) 6250 7388 Ext.255 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706 

 
 
We are committed to acting professionally, fairly and with integrity. We do not condone bribery, fraud or corrupt practices. 
 
Lonpac External - Confidential data is for use by authorised external parties only. 

 

From: Jaslin Kok (LKK Auto) [mailto:jaslinkok@lkkauto.com]  

Sent: Friday, 5 February 2021 10:33 am 

To: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@lonpac.com> 

Cc: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: RE: GBJ28U & YM9486H Doa 20/1/20 [External Confidential] 

 
Dear Sirs/Mdm, 
 
ACCIDENT INVOLVING YM 9486H (CTI) AND GBJ 28U (TP) ON 20/01/2020 
 
We refer to the above matter. 
 
The said chain collision involved 5 vehicles whereby our insured was the last vehicle. In accordance to the MCF guideline for chain 
collision, we have to settle the front vehicle's claim at 100%. 
 
We seek your approval to offer repairer “SIN HO AUTO" at $ 26,707.45 (all-in). 
 
The summary is as follows: - 
  

Amount 

Claimed 

Amount Revised 

1. Cost of Repair  $ 50,124.69 $ 23,400.00  

2. Loss of Use (33 days x $100.00) $ 3,300.00 $ 3,300.00 (33 days x $100.00) 

3. LTA Search Fee $ 7.45 $ 7.45 
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Total $ 53,432.14 $ 26,707.45 

 

Surveyor recommended 28 days for repair + 1 PRS + 4 Sundays = 33days. 
 
Enclosed here with all the relevant documents for your perusal. 
 
Kindly let us have your approval / instruction. 

 

Thank you. 

Best Regards, 

Jaslin Kok | Case Handler  

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6841 2157 | email: JaslinKok@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741 4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

From: GERALD POH WEE BIN  
Sent: Thursday, 17 December 2020 1:07 PM 
To: Jia Le (LKK Auto)  
Cc: MT_Claim_SG  
Subject: FW: GBJ28U & YM9486H Doa 20/1/20 [External Confidential] 

 
Lonpac External - Confidential 
 
Our Ref: 19/20/20/VC06/022935 
 
Dear Jia Le, 
 
For your necessary action. 
 
Please advise if the surveyor is able to reduce the repair further. 
 
 
Best Regards 
Gerald Poh 
Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd 
300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555 
Tel: (65) 6250 7388 Ext.255 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706 

 
 

We are committed to acting professionally, fairly and with integrity. We do not condone bribery, fraud or corrupt practices. 

 

Lonpac External - Confidential data is for use by authorised external parties only. 

 

From: chan pick yuen [mailto:chris_chanbebe@hotmail.com]  
Sent: Thursday, 17 December 2020 1:03 pm 
To: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com> 
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Catherine Chong (LKK Auto) <admin-d@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: Fw: GBJ28U & YM9486H Doa 20/1/20  

 
Dear Sir / Mdm ,  
 
Enclosed is our GIA report , invoice , LTA fee & LOA . 
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As request following :  
 

1. RC $23400 ( as agreed )  
2. loss of RENTAL $3400 ($100 -3000CC X 34 days ( 28 days recommend + 1 days waiting PRS + 4 day weekend ) - TOTAL 

34 DAYS  
3. lta fee $7.45 

@ 100% ( CHAIN COLLSION )  
 
Total $26807.45/- 
 
Please let us have your offer & DV soon . Thanks  
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 
 
Best Regards  
Chris Chan  
Ho Beng Trading  
Hp:92712214  
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