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Denise Tay (LKKAuto)

From: Darren <claims@teamworkgarage.com>

Sent: Thursday, 23 April 2020 4:56 PM

To: Taufikh (LKKAuto)

Cc: Denise Tay (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: SMJ7160T KIA CERATO

Hi Taufikh, 

 

Yes confirmed 

 

Darren 

Teamwork Garage Pte Ltd 

53 Ubi Avenue 1 

#01-24 Paya Ubi Industrial Park 

Singapore 408934 

Tel: 68442475 

Fax: 68442474 

 

From: Taufikh (LKK Auto) 

Sent: Tuesday, 21 April 2020 3:57 PM 

To: 'Darren' 

Cc: 'Denise Tay (LKKAuto)' 

Subject: FW: SMJ7160T KIA CERATO 

 

Hi Darren, 

 

Able to close as per below? 

 

Regards 

Taufikh 

Lkk Auto 

 

 

From: Taufikh (LKK Auto) [mailto:taufikh@lkkauto.com]  

Sent: Monday, 23 March 2020 4:41 PM 

To: 'Darren' 
Cc: 'Denise Tay (LKKAuto)' 

Subject: RE: SMJ7160T KIA CERATO 

 

Hi Darren, 

 

Refer attached, COR l/s$4000 , 5 days. 

 

Regards 

Taufikh 

Lkk Auto 

 

 

 

From: Darren [mailto:claims@teamworkgarage.com]  
Sent: Wednesday, 11 March 2020 2:03 PM 
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To: Taufikh (LKK Auto) 
Cc: 'Denise Tay (LKKAuto)' 

Subject: RE: SMJ7160T KIA CERATO 

 

Hi Taufikh, 

 

Attached is the supplementary for Door inner trim board. 

 

I would like to counter-propose COR @ $5000 (Including Rear Axle Beam) 

 

Darren 

Teamwork Garage Pte Ltd 

53 Ubi Avenue 1 

#01-24 Paya Ubi Industrial Park 

Singapore 408934 

Tel: 68442475 

Fax: 68442474 

 

From: Taufikh (LKK Auto) 

Sent: Wednesday, 11 March 2020 9:55 AM 

To: 'Darren' 

Cc: 'Denise Tay (LKKAuto)' 

Subject: RE: SMJ7160T KIA CERATO 

 

Hi Darren, 

 

Refer to attached , COR l/s$3300 , 5 days. 

 

Regards 

Taufikh 

Lkk Auto 

 

From: Darren [mailto:claims@teamworkgarage.com]  

Sent: Tuesday, 10 March 2020 4:43 PM 
To: Taufikh (LKK Auto) 

Cc: Darren 
Subject: RE: SMJ7160T KIA CERATO 

 

Hi Taufikh, 

 

Please see attached 

 

Darren 

Teamwork Garage Pte Ltd 

53 Ubi Avenue 1 

#01-24 Paya Ubi Industrial Park 

Singapore 408934 

Tel: 68442475 

Fax: 68442474 

 

From: Taufikh (LKK Auto) 

Sent: Tuesday, 10 March 2020 4:44 PM 

To: 'Darren' 

Subject: RE: SMJ7160T KIA CERATO 
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Hi Darren, 

 

Can pass the wheel alignment report and after repair photos? 

 

Regards 

Taufikh 

Lkk Auto 

 

From: Darren [mailto:claims@teamworkgarage.com]  

Sent: Friday, 14 February 2020 5:12 PM 
To: Taufikh (LKK Auto) 

Subject: RE: SMJ7160T KIA CERATO 

 

Hi Taufikh, 

 

REMINDER 

 

Kindly revise and get back to us on the finalize amount. 

 

Darren 

Teamwork Garage Pte Ltd 

53 Ubi Avenue 1 

#01-24 Paya Ubi Industrial Park 

Singapore 408934 

Tel: 68442475 

Fax: 68442474 

 

From: Darren 

Sent: Monday, 3 February 2020 11:45 AM 

To: Taufikh (LKK Auto) 

Subject: SMJ7160T KIA CERATO 

 

Hi Taufikh, 

 

FYNA 

 

Based on estimate calculation: 

 

COR @ $5600 

DOR @ 7 Days  

 

Kindly revise and get back to us so that we can close the case asap. 

 

Darren 

Teamwork Garage Pte Ltd 

53 Ubi Avenue 1 

#01-24 Paya Ubi Industrial Park 

Singapore 408934 

Tel: 68442475 

Fax: 68442474 
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