Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

From: Alfred Toh <alfred toh@sg.cntaiping.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 4 March 2020 6:21 PM

To: Asher Sng (LKKAuta); Admin A

Ce: Irene Tay; Alfred Toh: Chee So Chow; Claims Dept of CT1; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuUto)

Subject: RE: [IMANDATE REQUEST] RE: OUR REF : SNM20D200460/SGESBI9G/IREME - Accident
Involving SGE5899G AND SLK9383K (TP : LKK REF - CCB/CTI20001331/Uea3) on
20/01/2020

Follow Up Flag: Follow up

Flag Status: Flagged

LKK REF - CC6/CT120001331/Uea3
CTPIS REF - SNM20200460C02/thp

Dear Asher
Please proceed to resolve the property damage claim at $8,762.00.

We await your payment advice to enable our Irene to act accordingly.

Best Regards

Alfred Toh

Senior Executive

Claims Department

China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd.

J Anson Road #15-00 Springleaf Tower Singapore 079809
DID: 65 6389 6183

Email: Mmmm

alfred.tohf@sg.cntaiping.com
W: www.sg.cntaiping.com | FB: www.facebook.com/chinataipingsg/ | WeChat: A £ % TaipingSG
Disclaimer: This e-mail and any files transmitted with it is intended only for the named recipients and may contain
confidential information. Any unauthorized disclosure, use or dissemination of this message, either in whole or
partial, is prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient, please notify the sender immediately. Please delete the
e-mail and any copies of it thereafter.

From: Asher 5ng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Wednesday, March 4, 2020 4:40 PM

To: Claims Dept of CT1 <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com>; irene Tay <irene.tay@sg.cntaiping.com>

Cc: Alfred Toh <alfred.toh@sg.cntaiping.com>

Subject: [MANDATE REQUEST] RE: OUR REF : SNM20D200460/SGESB99G/IRENE - Accident Invalving SGE5899G (Ol : CT|
REF - TBA} AND SLK9383K (TP : LKK REF - CC6/CT120001331/Uea3) on 20/01/2020

Your ref : SNM20D200460
Qur ref : CCB/CT120001331/Ueain2

Dear Sirs,

We refer to the above matter.



) The said chain collision involved 3 vehicles whereby our Insured was the last vehicle.

In accordance to the MCF guideline for chain collision, we have to settle the front vehicle's claim at 100%.
We did clarify with insured the nature of the accident and he's aware that NCD (if any) would be affected.
We seek your approval to offer repairer " HUP MOTOR TRADING & SERVICE" at 58,762.00 (all-in).

The summary is as follows: -

Amount Claimed Amount Revised

1. Cost of Repairs 5 14,648.08 S 7,200.00
2. Loss of Rental (13days x 5130) $ 1,690.00 S 1,560.00 (13days x 5120)
3. LTA Search Fee 5 2.00 s 2.00

Total $ 8,762.00

Enclosed here with all the relevant documents for your perusal,

For your approval please.

Thank You.

Biest Rpopordy,
Asher Sng | Case Hanaler
LEK Auto Consultants Ple Lid

phone: 6841 -6051 | amal gseetngSkioutio.corm | fo &741-4108
Bk 51, Paya Ul Industric Park, Ul Avenue |, 202-25 | 5(408933)

From: Claims Dept of CTl <claimsdept@sg cntaiping.com>

Sent: Thursday, 23 January 2020 11:17 AM

To: Irene Tay <irene tay@sg cntaiping.com>; Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Melkwan@lkkauto.com>; Asher Sng (LKKAuto)
<AsherSng@|kkauto.com>

Cc: Claims Dept of CTl <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.coms

Subject: OUR REF : SNM20D200460/SGESB99G/IRENE - Accident Involving SGE5899G (Ol : CTI REF - TBA) AND SLK9383K
(TP : LKK REF - CC6/CTI20001331/Uea3) on 20/01/2020

Dear Irene,
Please revert LKK.
Note : officer in charge — Irene Tay 63896192

“** Kindly quote our reference number when replying.

Thank you

Claims Department
China Taiping Insurance (Singapore] Pte. Ltd.



3 Anson Road #15-00 Springleaf Tower Singapore 072809
*DID (65) 63896116 | F (65) 62247175

W: www sg cntaiping.com | FB: www facebook comichinataipingsal | WeChat: & 3 §ink Taping SG

Discigimer This e-mad and any INes fransmifted with |1 s infended orly for ihe named recprants and may conlain confidental miormation. Any
urtsuthanzed disciosure. Use oF (Nsseminalion of Ifks message. aither in whole or partiad, (s profibited. I you are nat the intended recipient, pisase Hotify
the sender immedhately. Please deile the e-mal and amy copes of If thersafter

Fram: Mel Kwan (LKKAuto) <Melkwan @|kkauto.coms

Sent: Thursday, lanuary 23, 2020 10:46 AM

To: Claims Dept of CTl <claimsdept @ sg.cntalping.coms

Cc: Asher 5ng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.coms>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.corms

Subject: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SGE5899G (Ol : CT1 REF - TBA) AND SLK9383K (TP : LKK REF -
CCp/CTI20001331/Uea3) on 20/01/2020

Dear Sir / Madam,
We refer to the above matter.

We have received a new assignment from M/s Hup Motor Trading & Service - Tampines and TP repairer proposed
for a direct settlement.

Enclosed for your perusal is:
+ TPGIA report
e TP estimated cost of repair

Please let us have a copy of insured's accident report for our necessary action.
Kindly take note that the case handler in-charge is Asher and she can be contacted at DID: 6841 6051.

To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned.

« Wishing you a Happy ana rrosperous Lunar New Year -

Thank vouw.

Best Regards,

Mei Kwan | Admin

LEK Auto Consultants Ple Lid

Phone: 666 o055 | email: MeiBwan g lkkouto.com | fax: 67414108
Blk 51, Paya Ubj Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, 202-25 | Slqo8933)
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HUP MOTOR TRADING & SERVICE  &aail : hupsotorggmail.com

Bk 9004 Tampines Street 93 901-120 Singapore S28838 Tel: 6784 0039 Fax 6754 0076 WEB SITE: http-/hupmotor.com sg Reg. No. 37809 1/00W

Our Ret: rF 2978/01/2C Your Ref: Data: 15th FEOEUARY £0=C
" The Claim's Manager
Motor Claime Dept,
CHINA EAIPIHu INSURANCE (5) FTE 11D
3, Anson Rd, f16-00, Springleaf Tower,

Sinpapore ""-'?ﬂti-:‘“_:‘.

Dear Sirs,
RE : ACCIDENT ON 21/01/202CALONG 4.Y.2 TuDd EEFTEL

IRVOLVING : S1K 9383 K & YQUR INSUHED : SOE 5899 ¢ & UTHER i SHA 2616 L
We act for Jamarul Aszher Din Abkmad Kmmil,, WRIC : SE303361/1
Who is the registered owner of ?sh. No 3 31K 9383 K Which was involved
in the above accident with Veh., No : ITCE ©E99 O Which we understand is

insured with you.

We had appointed surveyor to surveyed our client's damaged vehicle and
we had repaired the vehicle,

The accident was clearly caused by your insured's negligence, I am,
therefore, seeking compensation from you for my financial losses as
itemised below : =

Cost of repair $ 7.,200C.0C
Car rental for ' ' days (1 day X § 1'0.00 ) 1, f?«--o
LTA search fee 2.00
Survey fee €.00

$ B8,892.00

S sEEsEEss s OE =

We have enclosed coples of relevant documents to support my Client's
claim, There was no receipt enclosed, as my client's did not pay us
any single amount..

Your prompt settlement of our claim would be much appreciated.

Yours faithfully,

HuP HDTDR@D.’.‘IG & SERVICS
—

H.r' Dﬂ"id m BI !.

Encl ; Final Bill, Car Rental Bill, LTA Search Fee, Owner Authorisation
letter, GEA-fReport, Burvey Report & Ins; Gery,

Remark : Kindly Acknowledge Recelipt.

NOTE : Oar Rental Total 13 days, Due to 08/02/20 & 16/02/2020 are Sundasy,
Mot working dsys,

nportant Note: The Sattemant only value for property claims,
Nat ncluda imury claims
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&1 UL AVE 1, #01-25 PAYA UBL INDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408933 TEL : (065) 62563561 FAX : (I5) 41584015

Our Reft CC6/CTIZ0001331/Ueald
05 FEB 2020

KE JINSHAN

BLK 850 JURONG WEST STREET 81
#07-279

SINGAPORE 640850

Dear Sir/Madam,
ACCIDENT INVOLVING SGE 5899G / SLK 9383K / OTHERS ON 21/01/2020

We refer {o the above accident where we are acting for China Taiping Insurance (Singapore)
Pte Ltd to resolve the claim against you and/or your authorized driver under the Auto
Insurance policy taken up with them.

Pursuant to the above said accident wherein you and/or your authorized driver had amongst
other information given us your version of how the accident had occurred, we as the
appointed agent of your insurers shall proceed to negotiate for an amicable settlement with
third party claimant

Should you however wish to further discuss on the matter prior to our negotiations and
settlement, please contact us within 10 days from the date of this letter.

Please call us if you have further queries.

Yours faithfully,

Chew Hsiao Tong (Ms)

Case Handler

DID: 67423197

FAX: 6741 4108

EMAIL: chewht@Ilkkauto.com

c.c.  China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pre Lid
(Mator Claims Dept)



-

0 : CHINA TAIFING INSURHANCE (5) ¥IE. 13D.

AUTHORIZATION TO ACT

7, CAMARUL ALKAR BIN AHMAD BAMTL (“the third party
claimant™)

of DLE T44, 06-772, Woodlands Clrcle, S (730744) (address),
owner of _- . 90 4 (vehicle no.) hereby authorize

Hup Motor Trading & Service,

(*The workshop”) to act for me with respect to my claim for

repair costs and/or rental and/or loss of use ("claim®) for my

re

Vehicle No. E 9383 K that was damaged pursuant to the

21/

accident which occurred on S1/20-T(date) along __ 4= THI8

pead d Eu.a

{iocation)

involving Vehicle Nofs S3= 5800 0 (lecured) & Ufker : b 2616 K

(*The accident").

T further authorize the workshop to settle my above mentioned
claim in a manner that they deem fit and the workshop is further
authorized to receive payment further to settlement of my claim
with payment cheque/s being made in favour of the workshop.

1 further acknowledge that any settlement the workshop may reach
on my behalf is on a without prejudice and without admission of
liability basis insofar as the driver/owner/insurers of the
other vehicle/s is concerned.

pated this _9'E day of Fcorunig {month) 20 = (year)

M | HUP MOTOR TRADIMNG & SERVICS

SEECJ%ETJI (Qwner OF ;h& 353 _K)
Eigned the third party claimant” Signed by “the workshop”

Lipanam Note: The Settiernent only value for property ClaeTs,
Mot inttuds injury claims :



MOTOR CLAIMS DISCHARGE VOUCHER

Folicy Ne : DMPCSHI®13611900 Claim No : SNM20D2004&0
Claimant : CAMARUL AZHAR BIN AHMAD KAMIL

Amount + 858,762.00

POLLARS EIGHT THOUSAND SEVEN HUNDHED AND SIXTY IWD ONLY.
1/WHe agres to accept the above mentloned amount to be pald te mefus in full &
final settlement of all claims, costs & disbursemants for injuries / damages
sustained by mefus through an accident invelving

Claimant Vehicle No. : SLK %183K

Insuread VYehicles No. EGE 55995
Dare of lLoss « 2170172020
Flace of Accident : AYE TWOS HEPPEL

IN CONMSIDERATION of the payment made to me/us of the aforsmentioned sum by
CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE (SINGAPORE] PTE. LTD., 1/We agree absolutely to
discharge CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE (SINGAPORE) PTE. LTD. and/forc

Insured Hame ¢ KE JINSHAN
Driver Hame : KE JINSHAN

from all claims, present or future in respect of all loss, injury or damage
sustained by mefus arising out of the sald accident.

1 acknowledge that this payment is mads without admission of liablility on the
part of CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE (SINGAPORE) PTE. 1TD,

(i) Ganeral Damages 5%
(2] Cost of Repair/Bueees 58 7.200.00
{3) Loss of Uae/Rental/Earniag 5§ 1.560.00
(4} GIA/Folice Reports/

investigation Results/Search Fees 5% 2.00
{8} Medical Reports/Expenses 5%
{6] Survey Fees/Towing Fes/Disbursemant 55
{7T) Cost including Disbursament 55

TOTAL . . + « v = 2 s = = s« « » » » 58 B,7€62.00

Clzimant Name : QAMARIL AZHAR BIM AHMAD EAMIL HRIC Ho ; SXXXX361D

Signature : _..'-"':; E Pate i a'r/ ﬂﬂ/éa >0

‘mportant Nota: The Settiement anly value for propary claims,
Mol include imjury ciaims,
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HUP MOTOR TRADING & SERVICE

ik 9004 Tampines Street 93 8011 20 Singapore S28K0 Tel, 6754 0039 Fax 6784 0076 Enmil: hupmetor@ gmail.com Reg, No. 378091 00W
19tk ¥EB 2020

ouwRet. TF 2978/01/20 Your Rt Data:

ANARUL AZEAH DTV ARNAT KANTYL
81K 744, f06-772, Weodlands Circle
ingapore 710744

Cost of repeir to HONDA STREAE 1.8 {(A) EJV - SLK 9383 K

To supply front bumper, reinforcement, clips, side retainer,

front grille, moulding, front bonnet, Read lamp aassy, lowsr
retainer, tsil gate door, esblems, rear windsoresn glass moulding,
dam rubber, seplent, inner lock, rear bumper, elips, revarge pansor,
rear end pansl, tall lamp saay, spare tyre carrler, loak, reuar
flgor board panel insulator L necessary parts,

"o remove & refix cerpet, cushlon seat, floor bourd cover, tocl
get, spare tyre, carrier &L necessary parts, Ineluding wirisng
ckeck up for all affected wiring syatem.

To remove k refix rear windporsen glass, trim board cover, wiper
motor, hinge, shock abscrber, inner lock, gernish & necessary
parta Inte naw deoor,

Labolr charge to remove E cut out damsgad parta, to jack, atrsighten
E knocking out froent support panel, frout fender, resar floor board
panel, rear fender, rear chassls frame, rear exhaust, tall plpe &
necessary parts, to weld, repnew L slign above parts.

To putty & Tespray painting on all affected aceldent parts, including
resprey Tuff-=Kote on ull effected anccldent paris.

Lump Sum Hepalr : § T7,200.00

EEIEEESAEE

Dollars : Seven Thoumand And Two Nundred Only.

HUP MOTOR TRADIG & SERVICS
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LYHHERE .

BAN HONG LEE MOTOR SERVICES i cecors  Sax3 A
BIk 5033, Arig Mo Kio Indusiril PArk 2 #01:279 (oft A1 Mo K0 ME 3] e s s Car RARS DEFENCE
mm Tol B4B2 5577 3 Umes]  Fax G52 5300 Autmonses Castrt Service Centy S SRAT G ;;Am
TOWING SERVICE: 6858 4067 (After 10.30pm|

=EHmEEER
VEHICLE RENTAL AGREEMENT

Date: Ttn FEBRUARY 2020 Yy 11232y 2333
Owner: BAN HONG LEE MOTOR SERVICES (“the owner”)
Hivor: QANARUL AZHAR DIN AMMAD KAMIL (Owner Of SLE 9383 k)
Address: CLE Td4, §06-772, Woodlends Circle, 5 (T30744)

NRIC / Co. Reg, No: 28303361/1

Tel: Fax: H/P: 33691283 81180100

Owner and Hirer have agreed 1o enter into this Vehicle Remtal Agreement for the motor vehicle described below and upon the
terms and conditions contained on both sides of this document. Hirer acknowladges having read and understood all the terms and

conditions and signifies acceptance upon signing.

Vehicle Reg. No: STS Y%y £ 15505 "y | AgeementNo: 141117
Driver's Particulars

Name: NOMAMMAD AS-BANARI 3IN AEMAD KAKIL
Address: Lk 429, #0%9-246, Woodlands Street 41

Date & Time Out:  06/02/2020 (17:00kes)

Date & Time In; 19/02/2020 (17:60krs)

Singapore T30429

I/C No: | DriLicence No:
881265740 | se126574q cinsssisierseseee: HHOUE @ e oreren s
Date of Issue: 16/C6/2003 | Occupation; A3 Days@s 13090 | § 1,630/«
Yoo - TE;"I‘EKEC?} Sﬁlf-ﬁmplﬂyud B e Lo L
Date of Birth: Toolg: Une Bet
13763/ 1981 Spare Tyre: CUne e MhE @S N -
Tnird Fary Clawm . -
mrllpmnium mmnmdmmmmimdhnhmdm the Deposit (Refundable) - i
vehicle [both dates inclusive). Hirer uncanditionally io pay Owner 5§ -
mmmwwm for impact of clem on future motor Sub-Total : & 1,59(‘.—60
irsurancs prom
Own Vehicie . 1, 690=00
Hirer is for the first § qubf'/;uhmﬂ-hmmuﬂrﬁpw (e} Balance ToPay - [¥ 1,6
‘BAN HONG LEE MOTOR SERVICES (including windscreen) pliss joss of saming while damaged
ushicle s yhder repait
Authonised Driver
Hmﬂm:smymﬂwﬂmnmu;31MHmmmwmhﬁwhmmﬁw
is ahove BS years Sriving experinnice
nﬂ-uumcamlghu‘:rm i T A OWN

Ganemil Excepbon: Irsinarice policy does not covar againat any diver agod below 22 andion abows T0 yearn FOR LOCAL USE DMLY
old andor with driving expefence of 1 yesar end balow,

BAN HONG LEE MOTOR SERVICES

7 Lpok

Autharised Signature Hirer's Signature |




6 Raffles Quay #18-00, Singapore 048580

Phone: +65 6224 0010 Fax: +65 6224 0030

Operating Hours: Monday to Friday 9am o 5pm
RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE GST Registration No: M400017735

GENERAL INSURANCE ASSOCIATION OF SINGAPORE
m RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE
ASSOCIATION

Third Party Insurer Enquiry

Our Ref No; GR-20-012458

Date of Request:  21/01/2020 Your Ref No: Online Purchase
Hup Motor Trading & Service

Blk 9004 Tampines Street 93

#01-120

Singapore 528838

Dear Sir/Madam,

Enquiry Date 21/01/2020

Enquiry By David Ang Beng Yeow

TP Vehicle No. SGE5899G
Accident Date 21/01/2020

Enguiry Result

TP Vehicle No. |Insurer Period of Insurance Insurer Tel, No.
SGES5899G China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd. 31/03/2019-31/03/2020 |6389 6111
Thank You.

The images provided to you are taken from the original reports forwarded to the centre by the members of the
General Insurance Association of Singapore and we lake no responsibility for their accuracy or contents and shall
be under no liability whatsoever for any loss or damage arising out of or in connection with the reports or their
images.

This is a computer generated document and raquires no signature.



IOURANCE

RECOR MANAGEMENT GE

Our Ref No: GR-20-012458
Date of Request: 21/01/2020

Hup Motor Trading & Service
Blk 8004 Tampines Street 93
#01-120

GENERAL INSURANCE ASSOCIATION OF SINGAPORE
RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE

6 Raffles Quay #18-00, Singapore 048580

Phone: +65 6224 0010 Fax: +65 6224 0030

Operating Hours: Monday to Friday 9am to Spm
GST Registration No: M400017735

TAX INVOICE

Your Ref No: Online P.rchase

Singapore 528338

Dear Sir/Madam,

Enquiry Date 21/01/2020

Enquiry By David Ang Beng Yeow

TP Vehicle No. SGES899G
Accident Date 2110172020

DESCRIPTION AMOUNT (s§) )
TP Insurer Enquiry 1.87
[GST Amount 0.13
Total Amount Due (GST Inclusive) i 2.00

Thank You.

This is a computer generated document and requires no signature.

For GIARMC Official use;
Date:
[X] GIRO[] Cash [ ] Cheque



