Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Claims Assistance - VAG Singapore <claims@vag.sg>
Sent: Friday, 24 April 2020 10:22 AM

To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Subject: Re: FW: SJX 4888J-DOA: 11/1/2020

Hi Veron,

Our client will be extending his COE by 5 years in May. We will inform you upon his confirmation so as to
review the repair limit of this vehicle before proceeding for repair.

Best Regards,
Jeffrey

AVANTAGE VAG
Audi | BMW | Mercedes | Volkswagen

6515 9515 Sales & Service | 6795 5005 24hr Towing | www.avantage.sg

AVANTAGE VAG WEST Service & Tuning Centre
48 Toh Guan Road East, #05-123 Enterprise Hub, Singapore 608586

AVANTAGE VAG NORTH Service Centre
160 Sin Ming Drive, #04-17 Sin Ming AutoCity, Singapore 575722

AVANTAGE VAG EAST Service Centre
8 Kaki Bukit Ave 4. #06-48 Premier @ Kaki Bukit, Singapore 415875

Accident Reporting & Repair Centre
48 Toh Guan Road East, #05-155 Enterprise Hub, Singapore 608586

On Thu, Apr 16, 2020 at 9:56 AM Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen @lkkauto.com> wrote:

Dear Isaac,

Any update?



Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via
email. Submission of claim related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much
regretted.

Best Regards,
Veron Chen | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 9 April 2020 2:13 PM

To: Claims Assistance - VAG Singapore <claims @vag.sg>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>; Guo Qiang
(LKKAuto) <GuoQiang @lkkauto.com>

Subject: FW: SJX 4888J-DOA: 11/1/2020

Dear Isaac,

Any update?

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 13 March 2020 3:59 PM

To: Claims Assistance - VAG Singapore <claims @vag.sg>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>
Subject: FW: SJIX 4888J-DOA: 11/1/2020

Dear Isaac,



Any update?

Best Regards,
Veron Chen | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 23 January 2020 12:18 PM

To: Claims Assistance - VAG Singapore <claims @vag.sg>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>
Subject: RE: SJIX 4888J-DOA: 11/1/2020

Dear Isaac,

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Enclosed surveyor’s marking.

Kindly take note repair cost Not Exceeding $3000/-.

Best Regards,



Veron Chen | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur @lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 1 S(408933)

From: Claims Assistance - VAG Singapore <claims @vag.sg>
Sent: Wednesday, 22 January 2020 11:10 AM

To: Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-d @lkkauto.com>

Subject: Re: SJX 4888]J

Dear Nivitha.

Kindly refer to the attached GIA, LOG CARD and ESTIMATE.

Please ask the surveyor to call this customer @ 9672 7373 30 mins in advance.

Please arrange the survey today at their premises from 3pm to Spm

Waterfront key
Bedok reservoir road

postal code: 479253

Blk 776

Best Regards,
Isaac Wong




AVANTAGE VAG
Audi | BMW | Mercedes | Volkswagen

6515 9515 Sales & Service | 6795 5005 24hr Towing | www.avantage.sg

AVANTAGE VAG WEST Service & Tuning Centre
48 Toh Guan Road East, #05-123 Enterprise Hub, Singapore 608586

AVANTAGE VAG NORTH Service Centre
160 Sin Ming Drive, #04-17 Sin Ming AutoCity, Singapore 575722

AVANTAGE VAG EAST Service Centre
8 Kaki Bukit Ave 4, #06-48 Premier @ Kaki Bukit, Singapore 415875

Accident Reporting & Repair Centre
48 Toh Guan Road East, #05-155 Enterprise Hub, Singapore 608586

On Wed, Jan 22, 2020 at 10:50 AM Nivitha (LKK Auto) <admin-d @lkkauto.com> wrote:

Dear Issac,

Kindly assist to provide us the estimate and GIA for SJX 4888]J.

« Wishing you a Happy and Frasperous Lunar New Yaq, »

Best Regards
G.NIVITHA
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Litd

Phone: 6841-1972 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
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