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SKODA Centre Singapore

24 Leng Hee Rd
Singapore 159104

Biz Reg No 1991014047
GST Mo . M200885052

Cusiomers Detais:
MS Mr
FIRSTCAPITAL INSLURANCE RODNEY
@ BAFEHES QUAY CHNG MENG HLUAT
#21-00 Z JALAN RABU
Singapore 048580 Singapore STTD18
License plate | Model code First registration | VIN
‘ SMKA13 IV3Isc | 28-02-2019
Diagnostic and Programming 1 pcs
Check Short Circuit / Harness Repair 1 pes
IVORI1052A Doar / m 1 pcs
{RHF Door)
D 37850042 Soung Absorber Laminated .~ [ 2 pes
IVEEII0EZE Door - l'"ﬁ 1 pcs
(RHA Doar)
IVOBS4RA0E GRU  Protection »~ ( 1T 1 pes
IVOBS4050E GRU  Protestion _— [+ 1 pes
[door protecior] =
- ., . Lasour £ §5 pes
f F".LF'S'H"‘*MMM; 75 pes
Do Pwhly TRANSFER DOOR PART 7 s
Quotation wvald wll 27-01-2020
Tax Labout ‘Materisl GST%
Code
#1 TEO.00 17,576 80 ™

| Mode

TMEBOTNPIKTD 15686 | Superb Ambition 2 01 TSI 182w DSG

480,00
28000
343000

4140
143000

38300
ar.oo

84000

80000
84000

1283 58

9280

Quotation

Mon binging - Pravnes

Page "
Documeant na

Document date 20-01-2020
Cusiomer no 5211041856
Customer GST-ID 185000106C
Dealor Joooa

Job order number 2020000212/ 1
Job order dale 20-01-2020
Sennce Advisor PEARLYN CHEONG

Mieage
‘!1

#1 48000 51380
1 280 00 209 60
#1 3,430 00 367010
# B2 B B8 B0
1 343000 dsgmoo
1 383.00 400 61
g1 7100 368 57
1570 n#fb 420000 448400
#1917 4,000 00 4 280 00
#igyn 188000 1,787 60
F4.
: i amoun|
18,336 80 1962038

Cuslomer

Service Advisor
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> Back to OneMotoring

Enguire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Vehicle Owner Particulars
Owner 1D Type:

Cwner 1D:

Vehicle Details

IIu".-.rhh;le No.:

Vehicle ta be Exparted;
Intended Deregistration Date:
Vehicle Make:

Vehicle Model:

Primary Colour:
Manufacturing Year:

Engine No.:

Chassis No.: _

Maximum Power Qutput:
Open Market Value:

Original Registration Date:
First Registration Date:
Transfer Count:

Actual ARF Paid:

Intended PARF Rebate Detalls
PARF Eligibility:

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date:
PARF Rebate Amount:
Intended COE Rebate Details
COE Expiry Date;

COE Category:

COE Perlod|Years):

QP Paid:

COE Rebate Amount:

Total Rebate Amount:

Singapare NRIC
8131

SMKB13)

Mo

23 Jan 2020

SKODA

SUPERB AMBITION 2.0 TSI (&)
White

2018

CHH294592
TMBBD7NPPKTO145684
162.0 kW (217 bhp)
$25976.00

28 Feb 201%

28 Feb 201%

0

$28,367.00

Yes
27 Feb 2029
$21,.275.00

27 Feb 2029

B - Car above 1600cc or 97kW (130bhp)
10

$35,403.00

$32,199.00

$53.474.00

The information contained herein |s correct as at 23 Jan 2020

OK

mn




MS@FirstCapital

6 Rafties Quay #2100 Singapare D4ESE0
Tet (BS) 6222 2311 Fax (65) 6222 3547

M3 First Capital Insurance Limited (o sy s 1550001050

5T W e R OODIRTE B

Claism & Mutar Uncinrwsiting Depe: 36 Fobineen Aoad 816-01 City Howme Singapare 058877

Teli [65) 6507 3848 Fax (65) 6507 3645

wenl.mafirstapital com.sg
MOTOR SURVEY ASSIGNMENT
Date 20-01-2020 Our Ref No. D20000488MFSH
. £l lyo20
Accident Date 17-01-2020 Claim Type. Third Party | o "
f- |
Insured Vehicle SHCT7900X% Third Party Vehicle. SMK813J S N &ﬁ' n
Survey Location 247 ALEXANDRA ROAD
Contact Person. CHARMAINE KONG
Contact No. 63057176/ 0 Fax No. 64743643
Survey Type WITHOUT PREJUDICE:
Appointad LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD
Surveyor
Contact Person NA Fax No. 68416315
Contact Number. MNA

Please submit to us the Tax Invoice together with letter of claim for Rental OR Loss of use (based on
NIMA Benchmark rates) together with your survey report.

FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT

THIRD PARTY SURVEY REQUEST

Cc : Workshop

Cc : TP Solicitor

Officer Incharge

Kindly submit the survey report via CWS within 14 days for survey assignment

VOLKSWAGEN GROUP
SINGAPORE PTE LTD Attention., NIL
NA TP Solicitor Fax No, NA

RACHELWU LIME]

IMPORTANT NOTE

This is a computer generated letter, no signalure required

and 7 days for re-inspection.




Asher SII! (LKKAuto)

From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 19 March 2020 10:08 AM

Te: ‘Rachel Wu'

Cc Admin A

Subject: RE: SLIRVEY ASSESSMENT - D20D004BBMFSH/1 // EXPRESS SETTLEMENT

Your ref : D20000488MFSH
Our ref : CC4/FCI20001291 /Eeald

Dear Saliha,

ACCIDENT INVOLVI & SMK 813J 1

We refer to the above matter.

Please be informed that TP claimant have converted to OD claim, as liability unclear for this case.

In view of above, we will submit W/P repart to your office.

Thank You

Bt Regards
Asher Sng | Case Handler
LEE Aulo Consultants Ple Lid

phone &841-6051 | emal! gshemngdiickguto com | fox 67414108
Bk 3. Fovo Ubl Industricl Fork. Ubl Avenue | #02-25 | 5/408933]

From: Mei Kwan [LKKAuto) <Meikwan@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Sunday, S February 2020 10:44 AM

To: 'Rachel Wu' <RachelWu@msfirstcapital.com.sg>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com>
Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D20000488MFSH/1 // EXPRESS SETTLEMENT

YOUR REF: DZ20000488MFSH
LKK REF: CC4/FCIZ0001291/Fea3

Dear Sir / Madam,

We refer to the above matter.




We had inspected TP vehicle SMK 813] on a WP basis and TP repairer proposed for a direct settlement.

Enclosed for your perusal is:
TP estimated cost of repair
Preliminary advice

Please take note that the case handler in-charge is Asher and she can be contacted at DID: 6841 6051.

To check availability of the case handler, you may contoct the undersigned.

Thank vou,

est Reparde

Mei Kwan | Admin

LEK Auto Consultants Ple 1id

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@ kkautocom | fax: 67414108

Blk 51. Paya Ubi Industrial Park. Ul Avenue |, #02-25 | S{408991)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 21 January 2020 1:06 PM

To: "CWS Motor Claims'; assignments

Cc: 'Rachel Wu'; Admin A

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D20000488MFSH/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,
Thank you for the assignment.

Please be informed that vehicle is not in the workshop, repairer will arrange.

« wWishing you a HAPPY and Frosperous Lunar New ¥eg, -

Pest Regards

G.NIVITHA

LKK Auto Consultanis Ple Lid

Phine 6841-1972 | email: gsignmments il kkuute.com | fan: a256-4015
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Pack, Ui Avenne 1. f02-25 | S{4oRiaygl

From: CWS Motor Claims [mallto:cwsmotorclaims @msfirsteapital.

Sent: Tuesday, 21 January 2020 12:51 PM

To: ASSIGNMENTS@ LKKALTO,.COM

Cc: CWS Motor Claims <cwsmaotorclaims@mstic il3).coim.sg>; Rachel Wu <RachelWu@msfirsteapital com sg>
Subject: PRI: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D200004BAMFSH/1




Dear Sir/Mdm,

We refer to the above reference.
Please find attached the necessary documents for survey.
Kindly submit your report via CWS within the next 14 days.

Note: All the accident reports are uploaded into CWS for your perusal,

Best Regards,

Admin Team

Claim Workflow System

Motor Claims Department

MS First Capital Insurance Limited
Tel : 6507 3848

Fax : 6507 3849

PS: This is a system generated mail. Please do not reply to this mall.

- AVB This email has been checked for viruses by AVG antivirus soltware
WWW SVE, COM




' B V4 74 LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Bl B = 51 Ubl Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
- TEL 8256 3561 FAX. 6256 4315

Reg No: 1899607198R GST Reg. No. 18-8607188-R

MS FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LTD Ref . CC‘-!'FCIMHBHEMM

36 ROBINSON ROAD _
#16-01 CITY HOUSESINGAPORE 068877 Date: /28-05:3020 I||I|II“I|I"I||"I

Insured Veh. SHC 7900% Veh. Inspected SMK 813J

Policy No. D-2008492 1MFSH Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. D20000488MFSH Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From RACHEL WU Mlgn Date 21/01/2020

2. __ Vehicle Partic
Make & Model SKODA SUFPERB c.c 19684
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2019
Chassis No. TMBBD7NPEKT016686 Colour WHITE
Odometer 10976 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification SPORTS RIM

Size Illalta Balance
R/H Front Tyre |[215/55R17 PIRELLI B mm
L/H Front Tyre |215/55R17 PIRELLI & mm
R/H Rear Tyre |[215/55R17 PIRELLI & mm
L/H Rear Tyre |215/55 R!? PIRELLI B mm

1THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE O/S BODY,
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.

Survey held at VOLKSWAGEN CENTRE SINGAPORE

247 ALEXANDRA ROAD
SINGAPORE 158934

AJTHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PRE.IUDIGE" BAEIS
H}IN ACEDRDANGE TO ‘fCILIR IHSTRLEWNS WE HJWE NOT A.UTHUHIE‘ED REFF.IHS

ESTIMATED NORMAL F'ER!DL‘I' FOR REPAIH




' V V LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Sl DS B 51 bl Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park. Singapore 408233
TEL: 6255 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. No 189607198R GST Reg No 19-9507198-R Page No.1 of 1

ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SMK 813J

|
Qy|  Description of Parts =
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|DOOR (RHF DOOR) (SN) DENTED 3,430.00 3,430.00
2|SOUND ABSORBER LAMINATED (SN) NECESSARY B2.80 82.80
1|DOOR (RHR DOOR) (SN) DENTED 3.430.00 3,430.00
1|PROTECTOR (SN) cuT 383.00 383.00
1|PROTECTOR (DOOR PROTECTOR) (SN) cuTt 371.00 371.00
7,696.80 7,696.80
LABOUR
LABOUR. 4,200.00 2,520.00
SPRAY PAINTING. 4,000.00 2,800.00
TRANSFER DOOR PART. 1.680.00 B40.00
DIAGNOSTIC AND PROGRAMMMING. 480.00 480.00
CHECK SHORT CIRCUIT/THARNESS REPAIR, 280.00 280.00
10.640.00 6,820.00
GRAND TOTAL 18,336.80 14,616.80
RECOMMENDEDCOSTOF REPARS | [ [ 1461680

Report Ref No. CC4/FCI20001291/Eeadq2

= s

CHEN TSUE YEE HO LEONG CHUAN
Automotive Assessor Automotive Assessor

DISCLAIMER OF LLARILITY TO THIAD PARTIES: - This Aepart w mase saiety lor the usa and benalit of the Clhisni nemed on ife frond page of this Bepart.




