Jia Le (LKK Auto)

From: Jia Le (LKK Auto)

Sent: Thursday, 16 April 2020 3:11 PM

To: Asia Motorsports Solution Pte Ltd; Admin A

Subject: RE: (Gentle Reminder) ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKS 3378 K & SHA 1828 Y ON 17
JANUARY 2020 - CALL FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT

Attachments: SHA1828Y 17-01-2020 NAF.mp4

Without Prejudice

Dear Sirs/Mdm,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SHA 1828Y & SKS 3378K ON 17/01/2020
We refer to the above matter.

Based on ourinsured’s video footage, our insured’s vehicle had stationary and your vehicle furning out and
collided onto our insured’s vehicle.

In view of the above, we have our principal instruction to deny liability and unable to look into your client’s
claim.

Thank you.

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via
email. Submission of claim related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much
regretted.

Best Regards,

Chan Jia Le | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6749 5792 | email: Jiale@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Asia Motorsports Solution Pte Ltd [mailto:asiamotorsports@hotmail.com]

Sent: Thursday, 9 April 2020 4:18 PM

To: Jia Le (LKK Auto); Admin A

Subject: Re: (Gentle Reminder) ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKS 3378 K & SHA 1828 Y ON 17 JANUARY 2020 - CALL FOR
DIRECT SETTLEMENT

PROPERTY CLAIM
(WITHOUT PREJUDICE
TO: Any Personal Injury
Claims)

Dear Sir/Madam,
Here is a gentle reminder on the abovementioned accident and call for a direct settlement.

We sincerely hope that you will be able to revert to us as soon as possible. Please be assured that we are
only seeking an amicable settlement on this matter.



In the meantime, please note that with effect from 15t June 2019, we have shifted to and are
now operating from the following address:

37A Everitt Road
Singapore 428586

Please update your records accordingly and send all future correspondence to the new
address above.

Thank you and we hope to hear from you soonest.

Regards,

Asia Motorsports Solution Pte Ltd
37A Everitt Road

Singapore 428586

asiamotorsports@hotmail.com

From: Asia Motorsports Solution Pte Ltd <asiamotorsports@hotmail.com>

Sent: Monday, March 30, 2020 5:09 PM

To: Jia Le (LKK Auto) <JiaLe@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: Re: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKS 3378 K & SHA 1828 Y ON 17 JANUARY 2020 - CALL FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT

PROPERTY CLAIM
(WITHOUT PREJUDICE
TO: Any Personal Injury
Claims)

Dear Sir/Madam,
From our understanding, there is no video footage of the accident, as indicated in our client’s report.

In the meantime, please note that with effect from 1% June 2019, we have shifted to and are now operating
from the following address:

37A Everitt Road
Singapore 428586

Please update your records accordingly and send all future correspondence to the new address above.

Thank you and we hope to hear from you soon.

Regards,

Asia Motorsports Solution Pte Ltd
6745 3811

6746 5110 (fax)

asiamotorsports@hotmail.com




From: Jia Le (LKK Auto) <JiaLe@Ikkauto.com>

Sent: Tuesday, February 25, 2020 12:34 PM

To: Asia Motorsports Solution Pte Ltd <asiamotorsports@hotmail.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>
Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKS 3378 K & SHA 1828 Y ON 17 JANUARY 2020 - CALL FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT

Without Prejudice

Dear Sirs/Mdm,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SHA 1828Y AND SKS 3378K ON 17/01/2020

We refer to the above matter.

Please be informed that liability is unclear for this matter. Enclosed herewith in this email is a copy of our
insured's accident report for your perusal.

We are in a course of investigating into the circumstances of the accident. After verifying further with our
OI we will revert with our opinion on the cause of the accident. Kindly do not refer to any party for legal
assistance until you heard further from us.

Meanwhile, we would like to request a copy of video footage/witness statement/scene photos(if any) in
order for us to look into the matter.

We shall revert upon hearing from you.

Thank You.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of
resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed /
inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the
issues of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

Best Regards,

Chan Jia Le | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6749 5792 | email: Jiale@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Asia Motorsports Solution Pte Ltd [mailto:asiamotorsports@hotmail.com]

Sent: Monday, 24 February 2020 2:34 PM

To: Jia Le (LKK Auto); Admin A

Subject: Re: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKS 3378 K & SHA 1828 Y ON 17 JANUARY 2020 - CALL FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT

Your Ref:
Our Ref : SKS 3378 K

24 February 2020

MS First Capital Insurance Limited PROPERTY CLAIM
36, Robinson Road (WITHOUT PREJUDICE
#16-01 TO: Any Personal Injury



City House Claims)
Singapore 068877

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park,
Ubi Avenue 1,

#02-25

Singapore 408933

Attn: Claims Department
Dear Sir/Mdm,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKS 3378 K & SHA 1828 Y ON 17 JANUARY 2020 - CALL FOR DIRECT
SETTLEMENT

Kindly find attached the finalized report for SKS 3378 K, as proposed by our Single Joint Expert. We are pleased to
inform that we are agreeable to the amount proposed.

As such, we are writing to your kind office to call for a direct settlement, in relation to the accident involving SKS
3378 K & SHA 1828 Y on 17 January 2020. We will like to know if your company is prepared to settle for the amount
as stated below:

Cost of Repair (amount as proposed by SJE) :$ 3,100.00

Loss of Use (repair days as proposed by SJE) :$  720.00 ($180/day X 4 days)
Loss of Use (for PRI from 17/01/2020 to 20/01/2020) $ 540.00 ($180/day X 3 days)
LTA Search  $ 7.45

Total: : $4,367.45

We seek your kindest assistance in letting us know whether your kind office is agreeable to the above within the next
7 days and we look forward to you forwarding us the DV (without prejudice to any personal injury claims), if
required, so that we can expedite on its return for an amicable settlement to the matter.

We have also attached a copy of our company’s invoice for SKS 3378 K, the Singapore Accident Statement of SKS
3378 K and LTA search for your easy reference.

In the meantime, please note that with effect from 1% June 2019, we have shifted to and are now operating
from the following address:

37A Everitt Road
Singapore 428586

Please update your records accordingly and send all future correspondence to the new address above.

Thank you and we hope to hear from you soonest.

Regards,

Asia Motorsports Solution Pte Ltd
37A Everitt Road

Singapore 428586

6745 3811
6746 5110 (fax)

asiamotorsports@hotmail.com




From: Asia Motorsports Solution Pte Ltd <asiamotorsports@hotmail.com>

Sent: Monday, January 20, 2020 2:51 PM

To: CWS Motor Claims <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; motor claims@msfirstcapital.com.sg

<motor claims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>

Subject: Re: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKS 3378 K & SHA 1828 Y ON 17 JANUARY 2020 - APPOINTMENT OF LKK AUTO
CONSULTANTS PTE LTD AS SINGLE JOINT EXPERT

Your Ref:
Our Ref: SKS 3378 K

20 January 2020

MS First Capital Insurance Limited PROPERTY CLAIM
36, Robinson Road (WITHOUT PREJUDICE
#16-01 TO: Any Personal Injury
City House Claims)

Singapore 068877

Attn: Claims Department

Dear Sir/Mdm,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKS 3378 K & SHA 1828 Y ON 17 JANUARY 2020 - APPOINTMENT OF LKK AUTO
CONSULTANTS PTE LTD AS SINGLE JOINT EXPERT

Thank you so much for your reply dated 20 January 2020. We are pleased to inform you that we are agreeable to
your selection of LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD as the Single Joint Expert.

In compliance with the New State Courts Practice Directions, we shall await your kind office to instruct LKK AUTO
CONSULTANTS PTE LTD (as the Single Joint Expert) to attend to the pre-repair survey of our client's damaged
vehicle at our premise at 15 Kaki Bukit Road 4 #01-05/53 Bartley Biz Centre Singapore 417808.

We seek your assistance in arranging for the pre-repair survey by 22 January 2020 (Wednesday), 1500H so that
we can commence repair on our client's damaged vehicle as soon as possible and expedite the return of the vehicle
to our client.

Thank you and we hope to hear from you soonest.

Regards,

Asia Motorsports Solution Pte Ltd
6745 3811

6746 5110 (fax)
asiamotorsports@hotmail.com

*Please note that with effect from 1st June 2019, we have shifted to and are now operating from the following
address:

37A Everitt Road
Singapore 428586

Kindly update your records accordingly and send all future correspondence to the new address above please.




From: CWS Motor Claims <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>

Sent: Monday, January 20, 2020 12:57 PM

To: ASIAMOTORSPORTS@HOTMAIL.COM <ASIAMOTORSPORTS@HOTMAIL.COM>

Subject: PRI REQUEST : FC REF: SHA1828Y. (D20000475MFSH) & TP REF: SKS3378K. (SKS3378K) ACCIDENT ON 17-01-
2020

Dear Sir,

We refer to your request dated Jan 20 2020 3:20PM.

Please click on the below link to access our list of surveyors for your reference. Kindly select from our list
and inform us of your choice within next 2 days. In case of any difficulties in accessing the link, please
reply to this email with your query.

Click Here for list of surveyors

Once you inform us of your choice, the surveyor will be appointed within 2 working days of your email.

We wish to highlight:

If you do not agree to any of the surveyors from the list, please click on Decline button & you may proceed to
appoint your own surveyor. In this instance, we will also appoint a surveyor from our list to conduct the PRI. Upon
completion of repairs, please contact our appointed surveyor to conduct a physical re-inspection of the vehicle.

Thank You

Thanks and Regrds
MS First Capital Insurance Ltd
cwsmotorclaims@ msfirstcapital.com.sg




