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Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

From: Anthony Goh <anthony.goh@autoclinicgroup.com.sg>
Sent: Wednesday, 30 June 2021 11:44 AM
To: Asher Sng (LKKAuto)
Subject: Re: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLR7380U & PC7477G ALONG COLLEGE ROAD 

TURNING TO CTE (AYE) TOWARDS JURONG

Categories: PROCESSING

Received with thanks Asher!  

Best Regards, 
 
 
Anthony Goh 
Director  
Hp +65 9336 8442 
 
 

Autoclinic Group of Companies 

48 Toh Guan Road East #02-136, Enterprise Hub | Singapore 608586 |  

Office   +65 6686 2511 | Fax   +65 6686 2509 | info@autoclinicgroup.com.sg 

 
 
 
This email is intended solely for the person named. If you have received this transmission in error, please notify the 
sender immediately by reply e-mail and then delete this message. You should not copy or use it for any purpose or 
disclose its contents to any other person. Thank you.  
 
 
Sent from my iPhone 
 
 

On 30 Jun 2021, at 11:34 AM, Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com> wrote: 

  
‘WITHOUT PREJUDICE’ 
  SAVE AS TO COSTS 
  
Hi Anthony, 
  
We refer to the above matter. 
  
We have paynow you the settlement on the 22/06/2021 the amount of $4,771.90. 
  
Thank You.  
  

Best Regards, 
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Asher Sng | Case Handler  
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 
email: ashersng@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108| did: 6841-6051 
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
  
Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email.  Submission 
of claim related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted. 
  

From: Anthony Goh <anthony.goh@autoclinicgroup.com.sg>  
Sent: Friday, 25 June 2021 3:43 PM 
To: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: Re: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLR7380U & PC7477G ALONG COLLEGE ROAD TURNING TO CTE 
(AYE) TOWARDS JURONG 
  
Dear Asher 
  
Please refer below for 2 payment options; 
  
AUTOCLINIC PTE LTD 
DBS CURRENT 
054-906022-4  
  
OR 
  
AUTOCLINIC PTE LTD 
PAYNOW TO UEN NO.: 
201801145H 
  
  
  
Thank you.  
  
  
Best Regards, 
  
Anthony Goh 
Mobile: +65 9336 8442 
  
  
<~WRD0002.jpg> 
Autoclinic Group of Companies 
  
48 Toh Guan Road East #02-136, Enterprise Hub | Singapore 608586 |  
Main Office  +65 6686 2511 | Fax  +65 6686 2509  | anthony.goh@autoclinicgroup.com.sg 
Parts Distribution Office: +65 6475 5775  
  
This email is intended solely for the person named. If you have received this transmission in 
error, please notify the sender immediately by reply e-mail and then delete this message. 
You should not copy or use it for any purpose or disclose its contents to any other person. 
Thank you.  
  
"She saw Grace in him, He saw Faith in her. " 
  
  
  
On Tue, Mar 31, 2020 at 3:03 PM Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com> wrote: 
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‘WITHOUT PREJUDICE’ 

  SAVE AS TO COSTS 

  

Hi Anthony, 

  

We refer to our tele-converstion. 

  

Please kindly let us have 3 month weekly statement pior to the accident in order for us to review 

on the loss of income. 

  

Kindly forward the following document: 

  

1. Letter of Demand 

2. Final repair bill 

3. LTA Search Reciept 

4. Authorisation to act 

5. Insurance Cerfiticate 

6. 3month weekly statement   

  

Thank You. 

  

Best Regards, 

Asher Sng | Case Handler   

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 
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phone: 6841-6051 | email: ashersng@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

  

  

From: Anthony Goh <anthony.goh@autoclinicgroup.com.sg>  
Sent: Saturday, 7 December 2019 6:05 PM 
To: Chris TAN (CNB) <Chris_TAN@cnb.gov.sg> 
Cc: Celine Fong (LKKAuto) <celinefong@lkkauto.com>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>; Olivia Lau 
(LKKAuto) <olivialau@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: Re: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLR7380U & PC7477G ALONG COLLEGE ROAD TURNING TO CTE 
(AYE) TOWARDS JURONG 

  

WITHOUT PREJUDICE 

 
Dear Chris 
 
The accident was caused solely by the negligence on the driver. As a result of 
the 
said accident, our client has suffered losses which are set out here-under as 
follows: 
 
Cost of repair $3849.86  inclusive of GST 
LTA search fee $7.45 
Total $3857.31      
 
A copy of each of the following supporting documents is enclosed : 
1. Copy of accident report. 
2. Repair bill.       
 
Note: 

My client's occupation is a full-time private-hirer. The repair took four (4) 
working days to complete. Therefore my client will also seek compensation for 
loss of income during these 4 days of repair works.  

  

 
 
Thank you.  

  

Best Regards, 

  

Anthony Goh 
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Director  

Mobile: +65 9336 8442 

  

  

<~WRD0002.jpg> 

Autoclinic Group of Companies 

  

48 Toh Guan Road East #02-136, Enterprise Hub | Singapore 608586 |  

Main Office  +65 6686 2511 | Fax  +65 6686 2509  | anthony.goh@autoclinicgroup.com.sg 

Parts Distribution Office: +65 6475 5775  

  

This email is intended solely for the person named. If you have received this transmission 
in error, please notify the sender immediately by reply e-mail and then delete this message. 
You should not copy or use it for any purpose or disclose its contents to any other person. 
Thank you.  

  

"She saw Grace in him, He saw Faith in her. " 

  

  

  

On Thu, Sep 26, 2019 at 2:31 PM Anthony Goh <anthony.goh@autoclinicgroup.com.sg> wrote: 

Without Prejudice   

  

Dear All 

  

Please refer below for repair workshop address; 

Alan United 

Blk 7 Sin Ming Industrial Estate Sector C #01-76 S(575642) 

Attn: Alan  
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Please advise if next Monday is available for LKK to survey the damages?  

  

  

  

Best Regards, 

  

Anthony Goh 

Director  

Hp +65 9336 8442 

  

Autoclinic Group of Companies 

48 Toh Guan Road East #02-136, Enterprise Hub | Singapore 608586 |  

Office   +65 6686 2511 | Fax   +65 6686 2509 | info@autoclinicgroup.com.sg 

  

  

This email is intended solely for the person named. If you have received this transmission in error, 
please notify the sender immediately by reply e-mail and then delete this message. You should 
not copy or use it for any purpose or disclose its contents to any other person. Thank you.  

  

Sent from my iPhone 

 
On 25 Sep 2019, at 4:56 PM, Chris TAN (CNB) <Chris_TAN@cnb.gov.sg> wrote: 

Message Classification: Confidential 

Dear Anthony 

  

We have appointed LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd as our surveyor. Please provide 
the location and contact details. Thanks. 

  

Chris Tan 

Logistics Officer 
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Corporate Services Division 

Central Narcotics Bureau 

DID: (65) 6557 4315 
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Join us at the Home Team Festival and 

Singapore-Global Firefighters & Paramedics Challenge

  

Keeping Singapore Drug-Free 

  

WARNING: "Privileged/Confidential information may be contained in this message. If you are 
not the intended addressee, you must not copy, distribute or take any action in reliance 
thereon. Communication of any information in this email to any unauthorized person is an 
offence under the Official Secrets Act (Cap 213). Please notify the sender immediately if you 
receive this in error." 

  

From: Anthony Goh <anthony.goh@autoclinicgroup.com.sg>  
Sent: Tuesday, 24 September 2019 3:37 PM 
To: Chris TAN (CNB) <Chris_TAN@cnb.gov.sg> 
Subject: Re: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLR7380U & PC7477G ALONG COLLEGE ROAD 
TURNING TO CTE (AYE) TOWARDS JURONG 

  

WITHOUT PREJUDICE 

  

Dear Chris Tan 
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Please refer attachment for repair estimates.  

  

Note: 

Our client is having a lot problem securing the boot after this 
accident. He would like us to commence the repairs for him asap. 
Kindly expedite process if engaging of your surveyor is required.  

  

  

Thank you.  

  

  

Best Regards, 

  

Anthony Goh 

Director  

Mobile: +65 9336 8442 

  

  

<~WRD0002.jpg> 

Autoclinic Group of Companies 

  

48 Toh Guan Road East #02-136, Enterprise Hub | Singapore 608586 |  

Main Office  +65 6686 2511 | Fax  +65 6686 
2509  | anthony.goh@autoclinicgroup.com.sg 

Parts Distribution Office: +65 6475 5775  

  

This email is intended solely for the person named. If you have received 
this transmission in error, please notify the sender immediately by reply e-
mail and then delete this message. You should not copy or use it for any 
purpose or disclose its contents to any other person. Thank you.  
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"She saw Grace in him, He saw Faith in her. " 

  

  

  

On Mon, Sep 23, 2019 at 11:18 AM Chris TAN (CNB) <Chris_TAN@cnb.gov.sg> 
wrote: 

Message Classification: Confidential 

Dear Anthony, 

  

Please send the repair quote to me, we will assess whether a physical survey is 
needed. Thanks. 

  

Chris Tan 

Logistics Officer 

Corporate Services Division 

DID: (65) 6557 4315 

  

<image017.jpg> <image018.png> 
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Keeping Singapore Drug-Free 
Central Narcotics Bureau W cnb.gov.sg    FB fb.com/CNB.DrugFreeSG   IG Instagram.com/cnb.drugfreesg 

WARNING: "Privileged/Confidential information may be contained in this message. If you are not the intended addressee, you must not copy, distribute 
or take any action in reliance thereon. Communication of any information in this email to any unauthorised person is an offence under the Official 
Secrets Act (Cap 213). Please notify the sender immediately if you receive this in error" 

  

  

From: Anthony Goh <anthony.goh@autoclinicgroup.com.sg>  
Sent: Monday, 23 September 2019 9:24 AM 
To: Chris TAN (CNB) <Chris_TAN@cnb.gov.sg> 
Subject: Re: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLR7380U & PC7477G ALONG COLLEGE ROAD 
TURNING TO CTE (AYE) TOWARDS JURONG 

  

Without Prejudice  

  

Dear Chris  



10

  

Yes quotation we can send you.  

  

Best Regards, 

  

Anthony Goh 

Director  

Hp +65 9336 8442 

  

Autoclinic Group of Companies 

48 Toh Guan Road East #02-136, Enterprise Hub | Singapore 608586 |  

Office   +65 6686 2511 | Fax   +65 6686 2509 | info@autoclinicgroup.com.sg 

  

  

This email is intended solely for the person named. If you have received this 
transmission in error, please notify the sender immediately by reply e-mail and 
then delete this message. You should not copy or use it for any purpose or 
disclose its contents to any other person. Thank you.  

  

Sent from my iPhone 

 
On 23 Sep 2019, at 9:00 AM, Chris TAN (CNB) <Chris_TAN@cnb.gov.sg> wrote: 

Message Classification: Confidential 

Dear Anthony 

  

Do you have a quotation for the repair? 

  

Chris Tan 

Logistics Officer 

Corporate Services Division 
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DID: (65) 6557 4315 
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Keeping Singapore Drug-Free 
Central Narcotics Bureau W cnb.gov.sg    FB fb.com/CNB.DrugFreeSG   IG Instagram.com/cnb.drugfreesg

WARNING: "Privileged/Confidential information may be contained in this message. If you are not the intended addressee, you must not copy, distribute 
or take any action in reliance thereon. Communication of any information in this email to any unauthorised person is an offence under the Official Secrets 
Act (Cap 213). Please notify the sender immediately if you receive this in error" 

  

  

From: Anthony Goh <anthony.goh@autoclinicgroup.com.sg>  
Sent: Thursday, 19 September 2019 4:07 PM 
To: Chris TAN (CNB) <Chris_TAN@cnb.gov.sg> 
Subject: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLR7380U & PC7477G ALONG 
COLLEGE ROAD TURNING TO CTE (AYE) TOWARDS JURONG 

  

Without Prejudice 
 
  
Dear Sir/Mdm, 
 
 
1.   
We are instructed to notify you of a road accident 
on 04 SEPT 2019 at about 17:25 hours ALONG 
COLLEGE ROAD TURNING TO CTE (AYE) TOWARDS 
JURONG involving our client’s vehicle registration 
number SLR7380U and vehicle registration number 
PC7477G driven by your insured at the material 
time. A copy of the Accident Statement is enclosed.  

 
2. 
As a result of the accident, our client’s vehicle has 
been damaged. Before our client proceed to repair 
the damaged vehicle, please let us know within 2 
working days of your receipt of this notice whether 
you would like to conduct a pre-repair survey of the 
vehicle. If we do not receive any reply from you 
within the stipulated timeline, our client shall 
proceed to repair the vehicle without further 
reference to you. 
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Kindly forward this email to the relevant claim 
department. 

  

  

  

Best Regards, 

  

Anthony Goh 

Director  

Mobile: +65 9336 8442 

  

  

<~WRD0002.jpg> 

Autoclinic Group of Companies 

  

48 Toh Guan Road East #02-136, Enterprise Hub | 
Singapore 608586 |  

Main Office  +65 6686 2511 | Fax  +65 6686 
2509  | anthony.goh@autoclinicgroup.com.sg 

Parts Distribution Office: +65 6475 5775  

  

This email is intended solely for the person named. If you 
have received this transmission in error, please notify the 
sender immediately by reply e-mail and then delete this 
message. You should not copy or use it for any purpose or 
disclose its contents to any other person. Thank you.  

  

"She saw Grace in him, He saw Faith in her. " 

  


