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Nivitha (LKK Auto)

From: Claims <claims@premiumauto.com.sg>
Sent: Thursday, 16 January 2020 5:52 PM

To: ‘Admin A'; 'Nivitha (LKK Auto): "SUR’

Cc: 'Claims’

Subject; OD CLAIM FOR 5JW 4392 C ON 16/1/2020
Attachments: SIW 4392 C - 16012020.pdf

Dear all,

Kindly register OD claim for this vehicle. Attached is the GIA for your reference.
We will forward you the estimate once it is available.

Kindly arrange survey on 20/1/2020, 12.30pm. Owner waiting.

Best Regards,
Svalig
Claims Admin Assistani

Premium Automobiles Pte Lt (o v e
35 Lbi Road | Road Singapore 086949
p. +65 638X 2323 d. +65 6TARR OB2R £ 465 6841 1143

Audi Showroom, Audi Centre 281 Alexandra Road  Sineapore | 59938

i
"

»”

~“It comesin blue.

The new Audl A7 Sportback. Do you really need a rea BONT,

i ! * Find out mora n .

T R
Ermail Disclaimer



Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

From: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 5 February 2020 17:04 AM

To: claims@premiumauto.com.sg; Denise Tay (LKKAuto); SUR
Subject: RE: OD CLAIM FOR SIW 4392 C ON 16/1/2020

Dear Kee Siang,

As instructed by our client, please proceed to repair the insured vehicle SIW 4392C based on our
surveyor recommendation. (Excess $600/-).

If there are any check items or supplementary items please inform our office’s Assignment Team at Tel:
6741 8434 to arrange our surveyor for inspection.

All supplementary items and unconfirm items are subjected to further approval from insurance company
before completion of the repair.

*Qur client reserve their rights_not to pay if there is no valid approval obtained before repair.

« Wishing you a Happy ana rrosperous Lunar New Yeg, »

Best Regards,

Shiau Chan (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: siewsc@]kkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Pava Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408033)

From: claims@premiumauto.com.sg <claims@premiumauto.com.sg>

Sent: Tuesday, 4 February 2020 3:09 PM

To: Denise Tay (LKKAuto) <denisetay@Ikkauto.com>; Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) <siewsc@Ikkauto.com>; SUR
<sur@Ilkkauto.com>

Cc: 'Claims' <claims@premiumauto.com.sg>

Subject: RE: OD CLAIM FOR SJW 4392 CON 16/1/2020

Dear Denise,
Any update from AIG regard to our email below ?

Best Regards,
Kee Siang
Claims Advisor

Premium Automobiles Pte Ltd (Reg No 199902271W)

55 Ubi Road 1 Road Singapore 408699

D. +65 6768 9911 P. +65 5871 9902

e, claims@premiumauto.com.sg  w. www.audi.com.sg

Audi Showroom, Audi Centre 281 Alexandra Road Singapore 159938 p. +65 6836 2223




Your closest
on the road.

e gy

The new Audi AR -

| Find out mMores

Email Disclaimer

This email, including any attachment, is confidential and may also be privileged.

If you have received it in error, please notify us immediately by reply email and then delete this message from your
system.

Please do not copy it or use it for any purpose, or disclose its contents or any attachment to any other person. Thank

you

From: claims@premiumauto.com.sg <claim remiumauto.com.sg>

Sent: Tuesday, 28 January 2020 12:35 PM

To: 'Denise Tay (LKKAuto)' <denisetay@Ikkauto.com>; 'Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)' <siewsc@Ikkauto.com>; 'SUR'
<sur@l|kkauto.com>

Ce: 'Claims' <claim remiumauto.com.sg>

Subject: RE: OD CLAIM FOR SJW 4392 C ON 16/1/2020

Dear Denise,
We maintain our asking price.
Thank you.

Best Regards,
Kelvin Khoo
Claims Advisor

Premium Automobiles Pte Ltd {Reg Mo 199902271W)

55 Ubi Road 1 Road Singapore 408699

D. +65 6768 9911 P. +65 9871 9902

e. claims@premiumauto.com.sg w. www.audi.com.sg

Audi Showroom, Audi Centre 281 Alexandra Ran Singapore 159938 p. +65 6836 2223

g e

el .I|‘r-.

Your closest
on the road.

Email Disclaimer
This email, including any attachment, is confidential and may also be privileged.




If you have received it in error, please notify us immediately by reply email and then delete this message from your
system,.
Please do not copy it or use it for any purpose, or disclose its contents or any attachment to any other person. Thank

you

From: Denise Tay (LKKAuto) <denisetay@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 28 January 2020 12:07 PM

To: claims@premiumauto.com.sg; Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) <siewsc@lkkauto.com>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>
Subject: RE: OD CLAIM FOR SJW 4392 C ON 16/1/2020

Dear Sir,
As instructed by our client, please proceed to repair the insured vehicle SIW 4392C (Excess $600/-).

If there are any check items or supplementary items please inform our office’s Assignment Team at Tel: 6741 B434
to arrange our surveyor for inspection.

All supplementary items and unconfirm items are subjected to further approval from insurance company before
completion of the repair.

*Our client reserve their rights_not to pay if there is no valid approval obtained before repair.

Best Regards,

Denise Tay | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: denisetay@Ikkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5{408333)

From: claims@premiumauto.com.sg <claims@premiumauto.com.sg>
Sent: Thursday, 23 January 2020 5:10 PM

To: Denise Tay (LKKAuto) <denisetay@|kkauto.com>; Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) <siewsc@Ikkauto.com>; SUR
<sur@lkkauto.com>

Cc: 'Claims' <claims@premiumauto.com.sg>
Subject: RE: OD CLAIM FOR SJW 4352 CON 16/1/2020

Dear Denise,

Attached is the document for your reference.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Kelvin Khoo

Claims Advisor

Premium Automobiles Pte Ltd [Reg No 199502271W)

55 Ubi Road 1 Road Singapore 408699
D. +65 6768 9911 P. +65 9871 9502




e. claims@premiumauto.com.sg wW. www.audi.com.sg

Audi Showroom, Audi Centre 281 Alexandra Road Singapore 159938 p. +65 6836 2223
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| Find out more

Email Disclaimer

This email, including any attachment, is confidential and may also be privileged.

If you have received it in error, please notify us immediately by reply email and then delete this message from your
system,

Please do not copy it or use it for any purpose, or disclose its contents or any attachment to any other person. Thank
you

From: Denise Tay (LKKAuto) <denisetay@lkkauto.com>
Sent: Thursday, 23 January 2020 3:37 PM

To: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) <siewsc@lkkauto.com>; claims@premiumauto.com.sg; SUR <sur lkkauto.com>
Subject: RE: OD CLAIM FOR SJW 43582 C ON 16/1/2020

Dear Kelvin,
We have request for the interview form and undertaking letter.

Please sent us. Approval cannot be given if we don’t have the documents

Best Regards,

Denise Tay | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | emall: sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-35 | 5(408933)

From: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) <siewsc@lkkauto.com>
Sent: Thursday, 23 January 2020 9:51 AM

To: claims@premiumauto.com.sg; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>
Subject: RE: OD CLAIM FOR SJW 4352 C ON 16/1/2020

Dear Kelvin,

Not yet.

« Wishing you @ Happy ana rrosperous Lunar New Yeqy »

Best Regards,
Shiau Chan (Ms) | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd



Phone: 6256-3561 | email: siewsc@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

Erom: claims@premiumauto.com.sg <claims@premiumauto.com.sg>
Sent: Thursday, 23 January 2020 7:44 AM

To: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com=>
Cc: 'Claims’ <claims@premiumauto.com.sg>

Subject: RE: OD CLAIM FOR SJW 4392 C ON 16/1/2020

Hi All,
Any update ?
Thank you.

Best Regards,
Kelvin Khoo
Claims Advisor

Premium Automobiles Pte Ltd (Reg No 199902271W)

55 Ubi Road 1 Road Singapore 408699

D. +65 6768 9911 P. +65 9871 9902

e. claims@premiumauto.com.sg w. www.audi.com.sg

Audi Showroom, Audi Eentre 281 Arexandra Hoad Smgapnre 159933 p +65 6836 2223

on the road.
Ihe new Audi J"kﬂ,

Email Disclaimer

This email, including any attachment, is confidential and may also be privileged.

If you have received it in error, please notify us immediately by reply email and then delete this message from your
system.

Please do not copy it or use it for any purpose, or disclose its contents or any attachment to any other person. Thank

you

From: claims@premium .com.sg <claims@premiumauto.com.sg>
Sent: Tuesday, 21 January 2020 9:17 AM
To: 'SUR' <sur@lkkauto.com>

Cc: 'Claims' <claims@premiumauto.com.sg>
Subject: RE: OD CLAIM FOR SJW 4392 CON 16/1/2020
Dear All,

Any update on repair approval ?

Thank you.




Best Regards,
Kelvin Khoo

Claims Advisor

Premium Automobiles Pte Ltd (Reg Mo 199902271W)
55 Ubi Road 1 Road Singapore 4086599

D, +65 6768 9911 P. +65 9871 9302

e. claims@premiumauto.com.sg  w._ www.audi.com.sg
Audi Showroom, Audi Centre 281 A!exarld[a -Bfii. Singapore 13‘9933 p. +65 6836 2223

Your cluses:i.

%

on the roads
i I-:i.-. new Al “._ii' AB_ ok E

Email Disclaimer

This email, including any attachment, is confidential and may also be privileged.

If you have received it in error, please notify us immediately by reply email and then delete this message from your
system.

Please do not copy it or use it for any purpose, or disclose its contents or any attachment to any other person. Thank

You

From: claims@premiumauto.com.sg <claims@premiumauto.com.sg>
Sent: Monday, 20 January 2020 3:25 PM

To: 'SUR' <sur@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: 'Claims' <claims@premiumauto.com.sg>

Subject: RE: OD CLAIM FOR SJW 4352 CON 16/1/2020

Dear All,
Attached is the marked estimate and Cl for your reference.

Thank you.

Best Regards,
Kelvin Khoo
Claims Advisor

Premium Automobiles Pte Ltd (Reg Mo 199902271W)

55 Ubi Road 1 Road Singapore 408699

D, +65 6768 9911 P. +65 9871 9902

e. claims@premiumauto.com.sg w. www.audi.com.sg

Audi Showroom, Audi Centre 281 Alexandra Road Singapore 159938 p. +65 6836 2223




| Find out more I

Email Disclaimer

This email, including any attachment, is confidential and may also be privileged.

If you have received it in error, please notify us immediately by reply email and then delete this message from your
system.

Please do not copy it or use it for any purpose, or disclose its contents or any attachment to any other person. Thank
You

From: Claims <claims@premiumauto.com.sg>

Sent: Thursday, 16 January 2020 5:52 PM

To: 'Admin A' <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; ‘Nivitha (LKK Auto)' <admin-d@Ilkkauto.com>; 'SUR' <sur@lkkauto.com>
Cc: 'Claims’' <claims@premiumauto.com.sg>

Subject: OD CLAIM FOR SJW 4392 C ON 16/1/2020

Dear all,
Kindly register OD claim for this vehicle. Attached is the GIA for your reference.
We will forward you the estimate once it is available.

Kindly arrange survey on 20/1/2020, 12.30pm. Owner waiting.

Best Regards,
Syafig
Claims Admin Assistant

Premium Automobiles Pte Ltd jzeq o 13ms00271w)

55 Ubl Road 1 Road Singapore 408699

p. +55 6388 2323 d. +65 6768 9828 f. +65 6841 1183

e. claims@premiumauto.com.sg  w. www.audicom.sg

Audi Showroom, Audi Centre 281 Alexandra Road Singapore 159938 p. +65 6836 222

es in blue”

ack. Dt u really need a reasc

Email Disclalmer
This emall, including amy attachment, is confidential and may also be privileged

If you have received it in error, please notily us immediately by reply emall and then delete this message Irom your systen

Plaase do not copy it or use it for any purpose, or disciose its contents or any attachment to siy other parsan. Thank you,
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Denise Tax (LKKAuto)

From: Denise Tay (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 28 January 2020 12:07 PM

To: claims@premiumauto.com.sg; Shiau Chan (LKKAuto); SUR
Subject: RE: OD CLAIM FOR SJW 4392 C ON 16/1,/2020

Dear Sir,

As instructed by our client, please proceed to repair the insured vehicle STW 4392C (Excess S600/-).

If there are any check items or supplementary items please inform our office’s Assignment Team at Tel: 6741 8434
to arrange our surveyor for inspection.

All supplementary items and unconfirm items are subjected to further approval from insurance company before
completion of the repair,

*Qur client reserve their rights not to pay if there is no valid approval obtained before repair.

Best Regards,
Denise Tay | Case Handler

LK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Phone: 6256-3561 | email: denisetay@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5i408933)

From: claims@premiumauto.com.sg <claims@premiumauto.com.sg>

Sent: Thursday, 23 January 2020 5:10 PM

To: Denise Tay (LKKAuto) <denisetay@Ikkauto.com>; Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) <siewsc@Ilkkauto.com>; SUR
<sur@lkkauto.com=

Cc: 'Claims' <claims@premiumauto.com.sg>

Subject: RE: OD CLAIM FOR SJW 4392 C ON 16/1/2020

Dear Denise,
Attached is the document for your reference.
Thank you.

Best Regards,
Kelvin Khoo
Claims Advisor

Premium Automobiles Pte Ltd (Reg No 199902271W)
55 Ubi Road 1 Road Singapore 408659
D. +65 6768 9911 P. +65 9871 9902

e. claims@premiumauto.com.sg  w._ www.audi.com.sg




View Received Message

This mail is associated with :
*SIW4392C (3999447 7135G)
oD
Jan 16 2020 8:30AM

[RAJAN PRABURAM]
Premium Autcmobiles Pte Ltd

From AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd. (AIG_SG), sent on 28/01/2020 11:56 AM.
To LKK_HG

Subject  Alert - Adj Mandate Approved (5510563.00) - SJW4392C - Claim Handler: Nadaraja, Deeban

Approved:10563.00:Note: Labour at (4hrsx2=8hrs) 1.5 days @5750.00 - To re-negotiate. Re-inspection to be done for damage check and
supplementary items / labour.

[DOCUMENTS SUMMARY — :

| There are no documents. ) -




112112020

Adjuster Immediale Advice

Note: This document has not been finalised.

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (coregnoisssoriser)
51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25, Paya Ubi Industrial Park

Singapore 408933

Tel: 6256-3561 Fax: 6844-8805 Email: sur@lkkauto.com:assignments@Ikkauto.com

To: AlG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Lid,
AlG Building
78 Shenton Way #08-16
Singapore 079120

Altn:
Vehicle No s BJW4382C
Make L AUDI A4

Assignment Date : 21/01/2020
Date of Inspection  : 20/01/2020

From: LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
51 Ui Ave 1 #01-25
Paya Ubi Industrial Park
Singapore 408933

Date: 21 Jan 2020

liminary Advice
Accident Date +16/01/2020
Paolicy MNo. $ 1900247429
Excess : 580,00

Est. Duration of Repair :4.00

Inspection At - PREMIUM AUTOMOBILES PTE LTD (UBI)

55 UBI ROAD 1

SINGAPORE 408699

Point of Impact / General Description of Damages

The vehicle sustained impact / damages ofs portion and parts claimed are consistent to the accident.

Repairer's Estimate (Gross) S5
Revised Amount 5%
Check Items (Estimated) 5%
Total S8
Lump Sum Repair 55
Total Loss Consideration

New for Old Value 5%
Pre-Accident Value 55
COE / PARF Rebate 1S5
Salvage Value 8%
Margin for Repair 5%

Raemarks

14,477.00
10,563.00

&678.00
11,241.00

160,000.00
68,456.00

91,504.00

{ X ) The vehicle is repairable at our adjusted amount. We have also confirmed excess and policy coverage. Kindly

let us have your autheorisation.

() The vehicle is uneconomical to be repaired, you are advised to invite tender for the wrack.

{ ) Other comments |

hitps://singapare. merimen.comiclaims/index.cfm?fussbox=

SVCdoc&luseaction=dsp_viewersmari&docid=50828851&preview=1 Anolayoult=1&CF1...

L1h)



