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Nivitha (LKK Auto)

#‘

From: WONG JOSEPHINE <josephinewong@uoi.com.sg>

Sent: Monday, 20 January 2020 2:39 PM

To: sur@Ikkauto.com; assignments@lkkauto.com

Cc: teamautopl@gmail.com; LEE KATIE

Subject: FW: 2 Days Notice: SKG 705 H (Our Ref) and SKV 3313 G (Your Ref) Dated 18TH
JAMUARY 2020

Without Prejudice
Dear LKK
Kindly attend to the TP survey.

Details of survey as email below.

Josephine Wong
Executive
Claims

United Overseas Insurance Limited

3 Anson Road, #28-01 Spnngleal Tower, Singapore 079809
Main = (65) 6222 77353 | DID « (65) 5490 9329 | Fax - (65) 6327 3869 | Email « josephinewong@uo. com.sg

UOB EMAIL DISCLAIMER

Any person receiving this email and any attachment(s) contained, shall treat the information as confidential and not misuse, copy.
disclose, distribute or retain the information in any way that amounts to a breach of confidentiality. If you are not the intended
recipient, please delete all copies of this email from your computer system. As the integrity of this message cannot be guaranteed,
neither UOB nar any entity in the UOB Group shall be responsible for the contents. Any opinion in this email may not necessarily
represent the opinion of UOB or any entity in the UOB Group

From: TeamAutoPro North [mailto;teamautopl@gmail.com
Sent: Monday, January 20, 2020 11:20 AM

To: LEE KATIE <katielee @uoi.com.sg>; LEE KATIE <katielee@uoi.com.sg>
Subject: 2 Days Notice: SKG 705 H (Our Ref) and 5KV 3313 G (Your Ref) Dated 18TH JANUARY 2020

Dear Sir/Madam,

Road Traffic Accident Involving SKG 705 H (Our Ref) and SKV 3313 G (Your Ref)
Dated 18™ JANUARY 2020, Time around 11:00HRS
@ TOA PAYOH LORONG 4 BLK 94

We represent our client; PHUA CHIN HOW (PAN ZHENHAD), to notify you of the aforesaid road traffic accident
involving our client’s vehicle registration number: SKG 705 H and your insured’s vehicle registration number: SKV
3313G.

nclosed herewith a copy of our 2 Days Notice Letter and the relevant Singapore Accident Statement filed for your reference.

For efficiency purpose, we are agreeable with the appointment of Mr Lim - LKK as the SJE for subject claim. Please
let us know within 2 working days from today your agreeing to the above otherwise kindly send us your list of at least ten
{10) motor surveyors, via email following personn



[Contact Person Eric Lee 8269 9599

Email Address Eeamautngl@gmail,cum
ISurve',r Address 160 Sin Ming Dr, #01-14 Sin Ming AutoCity Singapore 575722

Thank you for your attention to this email and we look forward to your earliest reply.

+The above settlement is in respect of our client for damage pertaining to his motor vehicle and shall
not prejudice our client’s claim in respect of damages and consequential loss in relation to his personal
injuries.*

Wishing you a Happy and Prosperous Lunar New Year

Peach Ang

Team AutoPro Pte Ltd

%.TEAM_
mai= AUTO

Tel: 6258 1955 Fax: 6258 1956

(Newly Shifted) Main Office: 160 Sin Ming Dr, #02-12 5in Ming AutoCity Singapore 575722
Workshop/Survey Venue: 160 Sin Ming Dr, #01-14 Sin Ming AutoCity Singapore 575722



Shirlgz Hiew (LKK Auto)

From: WONG JOSEPHINE <josephinewong@uoi.com.sg>

Sent: Friday, 14 February 2020 10:41 am

To: Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto)

Subject: RE: 2 Days Notice: SKG 705 H (Our Ref) and SKV 3313 G (Your Ref) Dated 18TH
JANUARY 2020

Ref no: M12D12642002

Josephine Wong
Executive
Claims

United Overseas Insurance Limited
5 Anson Boad, #28-01 Springleal Tower, Singapcre 0793039
Main « (B5) 6222 7733 | DID - (65) 6430 8323 | Fax - (65) 6327 3860 | Email + josephinewong@uai.com.sg

UOB EMAIL DISCLAIMER

Any person receiving this email and any attachment(s) contained, shall treat the information as confidential and not misuse, copy,
disclose, distribute or retain the information in any way that amounts to a breach of confidentiality. If you are not the intended recipient.
please delete all copies of this email from your computer system. As the integrity of this message cannot be guaranteed. neither LOB
nor any entity in the UOB Group shall be responsible for the contents. Any opinion in this email may not necessarily represent the
apinion of UOB or any entity in the UOB Group.

From: Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto) [mailtn:&hirIevHiew@Ikkautu.cum]

Sent: Thursday, February 13, 2020 4:47 PM

To: WONG JOSEPHINE <josephinewong@uoi.com.sg>

Cc: LEE KATIE <katielee@uoi.com.sg>; SUR <sur@Ikkauto.com>; assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>
Subject: RE: 2 Days Notice: SKG 705 H (Our Ref) and SKV 3313 G (Your Ref) Dated 18TH JANUARY 2020

Dear Josephine,

Kindly provide us your claim number.

Thank you

Best Regards,

Shirley Hiew | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Suri@|kkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, f02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-d@lkkauto.com>
Sent: Monday, 20 January 2020 2:44 pm



To: '"WONG JOSEPHINE' <josephinewong@uoi.com.sg>; assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>

Ce: 'LEE KATIE' <katielee@uoi.com.sg>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>
Subject: RE: 2 Days Notice: 5KG 705 H (Our Ref) and SKV 3313 G (Your Ref) Dated 18TH JANUARY 2020

Dear Sir/Mdm,

Thank you for the assignment.

Best Regards

G.NIVITHA

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-1972 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: WONG JOSEPHINE [mailto:josephinewong@uoi.com.sg)

Sent: Monday, 20 January 2020 2:33 PM

To: sur@Ikkauto.com; assignments@lkkauto.com

Cc: teamautopl@gmail.com; LEE KATIE <katieleg@uoi.com.sg>

Subject: FW: 2 Days Notice: SKG 705 H (Our Ref) and SKV 3313 G (Your Ref) Dated 18TH JANUARY 2020

Without Prejudice
Dear LKK
Kindly attend to the TP survey.

Details of survey as email below.

Josephine Wong

Executive
Claims

United Overseas Insurance Limited

3 Anson Aoad, #28-01 Springleal Tower, Singapora 079303
Main - (65) 6222 7733 | DID - (55) 6490 9329 | Fax - (65) 6327 3869 | Email « josephinewona@ui,com.sq

UOB EMAIL DISCLAIMER

Any person recelving this email and any attachment(s) contained, shall treat the information as confidential and not misuse, copy,
disclose, distribute or retain the information in any way that amounts to a breach of confidentiality. If you are not the intended recipient,
please delete all copies of this email from your computer system. As the integrity of this message cannot be guaranteed, neither uoB
nor any entity in the UOB Group shall be rasponsible for the contents. Any opinion in this emall may not necessarily represent the
opinion of UOB ar any entity in the UOB Group.

Erom: TeamAutoPro North [mai ;n:teamautugl@gmail,mml
Sent: Monday, January 20, 2020 11:20 AM



To: LEE KATIE <katielee@uoi.com.sg>; LEE KATIE <katielee@uoi.com.sg>
Subject: 2 Days Notice: SKG 705 H (Our Ref) and SKV 3313 G [Your Ref} Dated 18TH JANUARY 2020

Dear Sir/Madam,

Road Traffic Accident Involving SKG 705 H (Our Ref) and SKV 3313 G (Your Ref)
Dated 18™ JANUARY 2020, Time around 11:00HRS
@ TOA PAYOH LORONG 4 BLK 94

We represent our client; PHUA CHIN HOW (PAN ZHENHAD), to notify you of the aforesaid road traffic accident involving
our client’s vehicle registration number: SKG 705 H and your insured’s vehicle registration number: 5KV 3313 G,

nclosad herewith a copy of our 2 Days Notice Letter and the relevant Singapore Accident Staterment filed for your reference.

For efficiency purpose, we are agreeable with the appointment of Mr Lim - LKK as the SJE for subject claim. Please let us
know within 2 working days from today your agreeing to the above otherwise kindly send us your list of at least ten (10) motor
surveyors, via email to the following personnel:-

Contact Person ‘Eric Lee 8269 9999

Email Address kgamautu@@gmall.com
urvey Address 160 Sin Ming Dr, #01-14 Sin Ming AutoCity Singapore 575722

Thank you for your attention to this email and we look forward to your earliest reply.

*The above settlement is in respect of our client for damage pertaining to his motor vehicle and shall not
prejudice our client’s claim in respect of damages and consequential loss in relation to his personal
injuries.*

Wishing you a Happy and Prosperous Lunar New Year

Peach Ang
Team AutoPro Pte Ltd

Tel: 6258 1955 Fax: 6258 1956

(Newly Shifted) Main Office: 160 Sin Ming Dr, #02-12 Sin Ming AutoCity Singapore 575722
Workshop/Survey Venue: 160 Sin Ming Dr, #01-14 Sin Ming AutoCity Singapore 575722
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Email: st @& idac com sy
Tel ne: 6555 AREE  Fax no: 6454 3279

Personal Particulars of Owner & Driver (Vehicle A)

ate of Accident: 18/01/2020 {ddfmmfyy) Time of Accident: i :'UU { 24-HR-FORMAT)
HYUNDAI ELANTRA 1.6 AT ABS D/AB Zm

Vehicle No. : SKG 705 H Vehicle Make & Model:
TOA PAYOH LORONG 4 BLK 94

botcsmotders Name /16 o PHUA CHIN HOW (PAN ZHENHAO) $72075652

Driver's Name 110 Na. s T HUA CHIN HOW (PAN ZHENHAQ) S7207565Z kg EI

Drriver's Contact No. 9383 9572 Company Contact No:

Driver's Address: 100 TOA PAYOH LORONG 1 #07-273 $310100

Exact lecation of Accident:

Insurance Company: AI_GL R Email sddress (if any): A
Belationship betwesn Owner & Dener: o\WNER <
or Others specify:
What do you wish to claim? (Please TICK one only)
D Crwn Insurance ,.f Other Vehicle (The ene you want to claim against) / D Reporting {For Record Purpuose)
%&MW Occupation (nature of job) IEI lndnuﬂ@ Dutdoar
E] Private use f EI Work purpose No, of Passengers (Including Driver): —[]2
Passenger Name ; WIFE Gender ; Femae
Passenger Name : Gender :
Weather conditi ditions 7 af sccident

Dﬂ Clear & Dry / I:I Raining & Wet / I:I Alter-Rain & Wet FU Drizeling & Wer / Oihers;

Was there any video eaptured by your Cor Camera? [ | Yes / [/] No

Injuries: [ ] Yes/ [y/] No (If YES) Injured Person’ Name:

Injured Person in Which Viehicle:

Injuries Sustain:

Police Report filed; [ ] Yes/ [/] No (If YES) Which Police Siation:
The Other Party(s) Details:

Yehicle No: SKV 3313 G

|. Diriver's Name / 1C N

Driver's Contact Mot _ Insurance Company (I any):

Vehicle Nn:

2. Driver's Name 7 IC No:

Driver's Contact No: Insurance Company (1 any}:

Contact No:

*Independent Witness (IT Anyh:

Contact My

Preferred Workshop Name:

* i nar proger docurnents ane produced, 1DAC shoubd not file the repont Informiation will be decsrded afier one week
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DECLARATION
I/'We declare the fhregoing particulars are true in every respect

Pn:.r_ﬁmﬁer{ Signature Driver's Signature Reporting Centre Persannel's Signature
Date & Time: J“:{ﬂ' Ir.‘L.-E [o h-l\'b {If driver is not the palicyholder) MName:
Date & Time: NRIC/FIN No.:



> Back to OneMotoring

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Vehicle Owner Particulars
Owner |D Type:

Owner ID:;

Vehicle Details

Vehicle No.;

Wehicle to be Exported:
Intended Deregistration Date:
Vehicle Make:

Vehicle Model:

Primary Colour:
Manufacturing Year:

Engine Mo.:

Chassis Ma.:

Maximum Power Qutput:
Open Market Value:

Original Registration Date:
First Registration Date:
Transfer Count:

Actual ARF Paid:

Intended PARF Rebate Details
PARF Eligibility:

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date:
PARF Rebate Amount:
Intended COE Rebate Details
COE Expiry Date;

COE Category:

COE Period(Years):

QP Paid:

COE Rebate Amount:

Total Rebate Amount:

The information contained herein is correct as at 22 Jan 2020

Singapore NRIC
365Z

SKGY05H

No

22 Jan 2020

HYUNDAI

ELANTRA 1.6 AT ABS D/AB 2WD 4DR 5R
Red

2012

G4FGCUS97763
KMHDH41CMCU596811
95.6 kW (128 bhp)
$14,535.00

28 Jul 2012

28 Jul 2012

1

$14,535.00

Yes
27 Jul 2022
$8,721.00

27 Jul 2022

A - Car (1600cc & below)
10

$£62,600.00

£15,734.00

£24,455.00

OK



112212020 Used Hyundai Car & Used Cars & Vehicles Singapore - sgCarMart

saCARMART.COM Login  Sign up
MNew Cars Used Cars Rental Cars Sell My Car Directory Products Insurance Articles Forym Resources
Post an Advertisement DR NSRS Sl Ao Sing for $24-100 g " Think One Automobile RS~ &
Sell It yoursell? Advertise It &t just MEW . USED i
i WEWY . USED
%58 until it's SOLD! s : f.OHM'tHICMI.'-. 1
Direct Owner 5 : =
Pest an Ad Advertisar Login ‘Ways of Seling ¥ 4 |
Browse by Category ¥ | « Back {12 ) ext » [ Sort by Reg. Date v | [ 20 results/page ¥
31 vehicles Hyundal Elantra ' it i N
Frice Deprediation i Eng Cap Mileage Veh Typa Status
Search Selection Hyundal Elasnbra Ary Ay 2012 By Ry By Al
Hyundai Elantra 1.6A Elite $31,800 §5,100 fyr 17-0ct-2012 1,561 oo 120,045 km Sadan Available
Het Deall Cheapest In Market. Best Saling Model And Bast Fuel EMiclent Ever. Good Choice For You And Your Farily. Superd Handing
And Condition, Low Mileage Done, No Repalrs Needed. High Trade In Welcome, WhatsApp Me For More Information, Call Now Before Tt v io |
SmartCars Boutique Phe Lid
3 nn Taga: 2012 Hyundai Elankra, 2312 hyunda elara, Hyundsl Elantra, hyundai elardra, Hyurdai, Elanira
Posted: 17-lan-2020 elarnra, Used HyLndai
Hyundai Elantra 1.6A Elite - N.A 31-Aug-2012 1,581 e - Sedan SOLD
Secured And Well Maintained By Fussy Owner, Immaculate Condition Inside And Qutside, Certified With Assurance And Quality From STA
Evarluation, Give Yourself A Peace OF Mind! Buy Tt From Us! A Company With Professional Sales Serviced Assured., Call Our Sales Team A... ()
Car Search
' Tags: 3012 Myuncai Elantra, 2012 hyundai elbandra, Hyunda Elantra, kyundal elantra, Hyundal, Elanira,
Posead: 02-Dec-2019 elarkra. Used Hyndal
Hyundai Elantra 1.6 $29,.800 $9.300 fyr 28-Aug-2012 1,591 e - Sedan Available
Beautiful Sports Rima! Very Clean Spacious Interior And Boots Space! Good Fuel Effidency Above 12KmJL. Easy To Drive And Maintain!
Bank Loan Or In House Loan Availablal Mot To Se Missed| Trade In Welcome| CallfWhatsapp Us Mow! I rr 1o
Monster Motors Pie Lid
Loy anag TS 20137 Hyunoal Elantra, 2012 hyundai efantra, Hyundal Elantra, hyundal elantra, Hyundad, Banma,
Pasted: 16-Dec-2019 alnnkra, Usad Hyurdai
Hyundai Elantra 1.6A Elite - N 28-Jul-2012 1,591 cx . Sedan S0LD
Sunroof
In House Comprehensive Warranty Up To & Manths With 24/7 Breakdewn Recovery Service, Brand New Loather, Maw Paintwork, Buy
Fram Reputable Cormgany With Good Track Recards, Call Kow For Appointment! We Welcomed Ex-Bankruptoy. Best Purchase Exparienc... IUTOw
e Tags: 2012 Hyundai Elsntra, 2012 hyundai elantra, Hyundai Elantra, hyundai elantra, Hyundal, Elantra,
Postod: 19-Jn-2020 elantra, Used Hyurdal
Is your COE expiring? Let us help you renew it!
Getting your COE renewed i eagy, fast and affordable, We'll help you renew your COE and get a loan for it Get the cheapest loan In town and an
aporoval In 2 days without effoet! Enquire today,
undai Elantra 1.64 Elite 531,800 510,140 fyr 26-Jun-2012 1,551 cc 138,000 km Sedan Available
Hy!
Hat Deall Cheapest [n Market. Best Selling Model And Best Fuel Efficient Ever, Good Choice For You And Your Family. Superb Handling
Ard Condition. Low Mileage Done, No Repairs Needed, High Trade [n Welcoma. WhatsApp Me For Mare Information. Call Now Before It..
. ey VEgsl 2012 Hyundai Elamira, 2012 Feundai elankea, Hyusdai Blanirs, hyundai elantra, Hyohdai, Blantra,
Pt 26-Kie- 2020 elanira, Used Hyunda
Hyundal Elantra 1.64 Elite . MLA 26-Jun-2012 1,591 cc - Sedan S50LD
Consignment Code: A363. Flexible And Attractive Loan Avedable, Trade-In Avalable For Your Carl Mo Hidden Costs, For Further
Information Or If You Hawve Any Questions Please Do Not Hesitate To Contact Us, TR
" aoae Tagsl 3012 Myundai Elentra, 2002 hyundal elantra, Myusdal Elastra, hyundai elantra, Myundai, Elantra
Posted: 15-hov-1019 elantra, Usen Hyundai
Hyundai Elantra 1.6A L MN& 15-May-2012 1,551 cc . Sedan SOLD

1 Owner Only! Full Agent Maintained! Original Stock Paintwork! Accident Free| Beautiful Sports Rims| Very Clean Spacious Interior And
Beots Space! Good Fuel Efficiency Above 12KmyL, Essy To Drive And Maintain! Bank Loan Cr Full Loan Available] Mot To Be Missed! Tra..,

Posted: 10-Dec-201%  Tags: 2002 Hyundai Elendra, 2012 hyurdai elantra, Hyundai Elanira, fvundas elantra, Hyundai, Elanb

hittps:ifvwww, sgearmant comiused_cars/listing.php?ORD=RGD_DESCAMCD=Hyundal&MMO=Elantra&RPG=204VEH=08RGD=2012

13



o Team AutoPro Pte Ltd 355 sin Mirig Drive #01-02 Vicom Inspection Centre Singapore 575718

Tel: 8265-9999 Email: teormautogl@gmol.cam / tegmoutoffice@grmall.com > 3
SIE : Vehicle Nos: SKG 705 H
Date of Survey : Model : Hyundai Elantra
Date of ReSurvey: After-Paint: Year:
Contacts : Chassis No :
+ AGREED Cost Of Repair and Repair Day/s with SIE *
Amount; Working Day:
MNos. |PARTS Qty Unit 55 TOTAL 55
1 |Front bumper 3 IS 102340 [ 580 60 283340 | LDy
2 |Front bumper lower lip T 47360 |5 385 60  a33ee-|ccd 1L
3 |Front bumper side retainer 2 |5 5:.90 124385 133,80 Hge0 | NEL :
4 |Front bumper grille 1 |3 47360 | 5 47368 [T x
5 |Front bumper lower grille ADX e phedr 1 |$ 34580 | § 24342 3580 ' N D X
g |Front bumper fog lamp RH ' 1 5 48250 5 -482:50- NDN
7 |Front bumper fog lamp garnish RH a 5 41530 | 5 |47 -4D 30 LT o
5 |Bonnet 1 |5 1,106.40 | & 10640 | LD
g |HeadlampRH 1 5 95230 |5 BHS-S¢ es3e|Ly v
10 |Headlamp lower bracket RH 1 |$ 186.70 | & 1ee7e DX
11 |Front fender RH 1 |s 958,10 | $ 55840 | X
13 |Front fender inner cowling RH g 5 378.20 | S 37830 |N PX
12 |Front fander side garnish RH 1 | & 24160 | 5 24360 | |
14 |Wiper washer tank 1 |= 386.40 | & 28640 {r NDX
15 |Wiper washer tank motor 1 5 21790 | & 24790
16 |Steering rack 1 |s 98530 | 5 aasan-| M 04
17 |Front lower arm RH 1 |s 482.60 | $ 35¢ 48268 |1«
18 |Front knuckle arm RH 1 |s 513.70 | 5 26380 s233a | 0] ¥
19 |Front knuckle arm bearing RH A 31240 |5 295.0mn a0 | A0 L
20 |Frentabsorber RH I |5 47250 | 5 47250 (MDA
314940 Parts SubTotal: | $ 338444 10,656.90
6317 88 20% Discount | § &39rap 213138
250 Ba, PARTSTOTAL: | $-27H 312 8,525.52
Nos. |[SPECIAL NETT Qty Unit S$ TOTAL 5%
1 |Front bumper clips i 5 5000 | S 230 i 5658
2 |Front bumper lower lip clips 1 3 S0.00 | 550 o1 588 | NE<
3 |Front bumper lower grille clips 1 15 50.00 | §he—- MN ;:;' 50:80 ‘ !
4  |Bonnet sealant i | & 80.00 | & 8600 | NN X
5 |Front fender sealant 1 |5 80.00 | 5-2eow || N} 8008 [N
6 |Front fender inner cowling clips 1 5 S0.00 [ 5 se.80 |1
7 |Front fender side garnish clips 1 |3 50.00 | 5 se.00 | M DX
8 |Allay rim RH 1 |5 85000 |5 Jef oy 85888 |y T,
9 |Tyre RH 1 15 380.00 | 5 38600 | LiDA
10 |Sundries 1 |35 8000 | 5 Beae-| b Iy
SPECIAL NETTTOTAL: | 5 iﬁﬂ*ﬂﬂ 1,720.00 |

Prepared by Eric (3269-9999) Page 1 of 2




Nos. |LABOUR 55
1 Panel beat L L D 20000
2 |Rustproofing Sep 01 200:00
3 |Spray painting S Loy HReees
4 |Diagnotic & reset fault code 5 200:80 NN X
5  |R&R undercarriage parts. S ROy 36000
& |R&R front tyre and balancing SEo-nn 5000
7 |wiring / bulb checking 5 30 ween|
g8 |Wheel alignment SEO G 12608 |
LABOURTOTAL: | §/5 6o B0 347000
PARTS TOTAL: $2519,52 8,525.52
SPECIALNETTTOTAL: $ 340 -8 1,720.00
S veuy S e _.;_w: sz, 311 fse se LABOURTOTAL: § /5[0 40 3,470.00
o : ! GRAND TOTAL: $4429.F713,715.52¢
& I |l :-'l e \ |:f ':?—li Wa ..'!"L - =
na ¥ @ 200, 88390
(a0 aa% |56t fus
3551.62Z
:L_J.LH-LIIC A U Iﬂ{‘fl"‘
I_{ﬁ .i‘?jﬂ'/b- .
t'-cl_\‘ Pﬂ-t \, L‘.I_h{_ .'_':T,r_:l b '.Taj’?..ﬁ |||.|"'L
y
3/3 [2020
Tr—
LKK Auto Consuitants hence notify
the Repairer of the foliowing:
* To resurvey beforafer spesy painting
* To dnpiay damaged pani(s) during resurvey
® Parts prices are subject ko confirmation
# Third party survey is on 8 "Without Prejudics” basis
* No iflegal modification(s) is sllowed

* Supplementary item{s) mus! be resurveyed
8 Sublect 10 Wl agorovel Fom Insurance Company

Acknowsiedged by Repairer
Signaiure:
m:-
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o 0 0

SKGT705H
TEAM

Hyundai : Avante/Elantra/Lantra 2013.3.26-16 (-MD-)

4-Wheel Total Alignment
Front : Left Front : Right
[ Actual | Before | Specified Range Actual | Before | Specified Range |
0°35° 0°35 -1°00° 0°00° | Camber -2°00' -2°00' -1°00' 0°00'
3°54 3°32' 4732 | Caster 419 4°18 3°32' 4°32'
-2°39' -2°39' -0°03' 0°09' Toe -2°54' -2°54' -0°03' 0°09"
13°05° | 13°05° 13°18" 14°18' SAl [ 14°15 14°16 13°18" 14°18'
[ 12°29 12°29' 12°18" 14°18' Inciuded Angle = | 12°18 | 12°15 12°18' 14°18'
| Turning Angle Diff. | |
Front
Actual Before | Specified Ram
Cross Camber 1728 1°25'
Cross Caster -0°25 -0°25'
Cross SAl 111 111
Total Toe -5°32' -5:32' -0°0&" 0°18'
Cross Turn Diff. L
Rear : Left Rear : Right
Actual | Before | Specified Range | Actual | Before Specified
-2°02 | -2°0Z -2°00" -1°00' Camber 174 -1°41 -2°00" -1°00"
02 ) -0°02' 0°2¢' Toe [ 27 | 072 -0°02" 0°2¢'
Rear
[ Actual | Before | Specified Range
Cross Camber | o021 021
Total Toe 44 044 0°00' 0°54'
Thrust Angle oot o°o1’

Wirvalign 15.0 B2ZT13  intsmations 201802 Hasd



LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408533
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. No: 199607198R GST Reg. No. 19-3607198-R

Affillated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile

UNITED OVERSEAS INSURANCE LTD Ref : CS/UOI20001170/Bed3s2

A

3 ANSON ROAD #28-01

SPRINGLEAF TOWER SINGAPORE 079909 Date:  10-03-2020

Code: UOI2
1. Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. SKV 3313G Veh. Inspected SKG 705H
Policy No. Coverage () 0.00
Claim No. M12D12642002 Excess (§) 0.00
Assign From JOSEPHINE WONG Assign Date 20/01/2020
2, Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model HYUNDAI ELANTRA c.c 1591
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2012
Chassis No. KMHDH41CMCU556811 Colour GOLD
Odometer 172875 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification SPORTS RIM
General FAIR
3 Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |225/40 ZR18 KINFOREST 6 mm
L/H Front Tyre |[225/40 ZR18 KINFOREST 6 mm
R/H Rear Tyre |225/40 ZR18 KINFOREST B rmm
L/H Rear Tyre |225/40 ZR18 KINFOREST & mm
4, Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE C/5 FRONT PORTION.
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
5. General Information
Accident Date  18/01/2020 [Inspection Date 21/01/2020
Survey held at TEAM AUTOPRO PTE LTD
160 SIN MING DR
#01-14 SIN MING AUTO CITY
SINGAPORE 575722
5a. Remarks .
AJTHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS,
B}IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REFAIRS.

5b. Estimate Days of Repair

ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR: 5 Working Days




LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

&1 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi industrial Park, Singapore 408933

G TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. Mo: 199607198R GST Reg. No. 19-9607188-R Page Mo:16of2
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SKG 705H
Estimate By | Our Adjusted
aty Description of Parts Condition | st {{] {sli
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|FRONT BUMPER DENTED 1,023.40 580.00
1|FRONT BUMPER LOWER LIFP CuT 473 .60 3B85.00
2|FRONT BUMPER SIDE RETAINER @ $124.30 MECESSARY 248 60 173.80
1|FRONT BUMPER GRILLE NOT DAMAGED 47360 .
1|FRONT BUMPER LOWER GRILLE NOT DAMAGED 345.80 :
1|FRONT BUMPER FOG LAMP RH NOT DAMAGED 482 .50 -
1|FRONT BUMPER FOG LAMP GARMNISH RH cuT 415.30 148.40
1|BONNET NOT DAMAGED 1,106 40 -
1|HEADLAMP RH cuT 952.30 858 20
1|HEADLAMP LOWER BRACKET RH NOT DAMAGED 186.70 :
1|FRONT FENDER RH TO REPAIR SEE 858.10 -
LABOUR
1|FRONT FENDER INNER COWLING RH NOT DAMAGED a78.20 -
1|FRONT FENDER SIDE GARMISH RH NOT DAMAGED 241.60 -
1IWIFPER WASHER TANK NOT DAMAGED 3B6 40 -
1|\WIPER WASHER TANK MOTOR NOT DAMAGED 217.80 -
1|STEERING RACK MOT DAMAGED Q85,30 -
1|FRONT LOWER ARM RH DENTED 482.60 356.00
1|FRONT KNUCKLE ARM RH DENTED 513.70 383.00
1|FRONT KMUCKLE ARM BEARING RH JAMMED 31240 265.00
1|FRONT ABSORBER RH NOT DAMAGED 472.50 .
LESS 20% DISCOUNT -2.131.38 -£29.88
B,525.52 251952
SPECIAL NETT ITEMS
1|FRONT BUMPER CLIPS (SN) NECESSARY 50.00 30.00
1|FRONT BUMPER LOWER LIP CLIPS (SN} MECESSARY 50.00 30.00
1|FRONT BUMPER LOWER GRILLE CLIPS (SN NOT NECESSARY 50.00 -
1|BONNET SEALANT (SN} NOT NECESSARY &0.00 -
1|FRONT FENDER SEALANT (SN) NOT NECESSARY 80.00 j
1|FRONT FENDER INNER COWLING CLIPS (SN) NOT DAMAGED 50.00 -
1|FRONT FENDER SIDE GARNISH CLIPS (SN} NOT DAMAGED 50.00 -
1|ALLOY RIM RH (SN} cuTt 850.00 300.00
1|TYRE RH (SN} NCT DAMAGED 380.00 -

Report Ref No. CS/U0I20001170/Bsd3s2




’ V V LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

;J ;; ! 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi industrial Park. Singapore 4080833

Reg. No: 199607198R GST Reg. Mo, 19-9607198-R

Page Mo.:Z2 of 2

(TO ITS PRE-ACCIDENT CONDITION)

Qty Description of Parts Condition ::::::rp B{;] Our Al:]:'uﬂnd
1|SUNDRIES (SN) NOT NECESSARY BO.OC -
1,720.00 380.00
LABOUR

PANEL BEAT. INCLUSIVE OF THE REPAIR OF FRONT 1,200.00 600.00

FEMDER RH.
RUST PROOFING. 200.00 &0.00
SPRAY PAINTING. 1,200.00 600.00
DIAGNOSTIC & RESET FAULT CODE. NOT NECESSARY 200.00 -
RA&R UNDERCARRIAGE PARTS. a00.00 150.00
R&R FRONT TYRE AND BALANCING. 150.00 60.00
WIRING / BULE CHECKING. 100.00 30.00
WHEEL ALIGNMENT. 120.00 60.00
3,.470.00 1,560.00
GRAMND TOTAL 13,715.52 4,439.52
RECOMMENDED COST OF LUMP SUM REPAIRS 3,550.00

Report Ref No. CS/U0I20001 170/Bsd3s2

LIM TEOW GUAN

Automotive Assessor

ADRIAN LING WAI PING

B.EngAMEﬂE,AHIRTE.AHEAE-A,H.MATAI

Licensed Appraiser

BISCLAIMER OF LIABILITY TO THIRD PARTIES:- This Repor is made selely for the use and bensfit of the Client named an the front page of this Repor.




