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Jasper Chua (LKK Auto)

From: Jasper Chua (LKK Auto)

Sent: Monday, 9 March 2020 3:45 PM

To: 'desmond.lim@rentokil-initial.com'

Cc: Vic (LKKAuto)

Subject: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLC 1670B AND SH 7091Z ON 08/01/2020

Our Ref: CC6/CTI20001135/Dha3 

 

09 MARCH 2020                      

                                       

LIM KOK LEONG  
 

Dear Sir/Madam, 

 

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLC 1670B AND SH 7091Z ON 08/01/2020 

 

We refer to the above accident where we are acting for China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte Ltd to resolve the 

claim against you and/or your authorized driver under the Auto Insurance policy taken up with them. 

 

We have received a claim from Body Repairer/Workshop acting on behalf of the owner of SH 7091Z against your 

motor insurance policy. 

                 

Based on the accident report, accident scenario and evidence at hand, liability is down against us. We will therefore 

proceed to negotiate for an amicable settlement with the Third Party. 

 

Should you however wish to further discuss on the matter prior to our negotiations and settlement, please contact us 

within 10 days from the date of this letter. 

 

Please call us if you have further queries. 

 

 

Best Regards, 

Jasper Chua| Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6841-2928 | email: jasperchua@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
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Jasper Chua (LKK Auto)

From: Claims Dept <claims_ltr@bifrostauto.com>
Sent: May 2, 2020 11:11 AM
To: Jasper Chua (LKK Auto)
Cc: Vic (LKKAuto); Claims Dept; Claims Dept; Cc: Assessment
Subject: Re: RE : PRS SH 7091 Z and your insured’s vehicle SLC 1670 B on 08.01.2020. - CHINA 

TAIPING *** LKK REF: CC6/CTI20001135/Dha3 - Final Inv
Attachments: SH 7091 Final Inv.pdf

Without Prejudice 
 
 
Dear Jasper, we accepted your offer as per your email on  Fri, 17 Apr 2020 at 12:36, kindly refer our attached 
final invoice for your next action, please. 
 
Looking forward to the payment as soonest. 
 
Thanks & Regards 
 
Mr Lee, PBM 
Bifrost Auto Pte Ltd 
Accident Claims Dept 
 
 
On Fri, 17 Apr 2020 at 12:36, Jasper Chua (LKK Auto) <jasperchua@lkkauto.com> wrote: 

Without Prejudice 

  

Dear Sirs/Mdm, 

  

Refer to the matter above  

  

We propose a settlement at a global sum of $14,100.00(all-in). 

  

Please confirm acceptance. 

  

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving the 
matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred from this 
negotiation of terms/settlement. 
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In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues of 
liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.” 

  

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via 
email.  Submission of claim related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience 
caused is much regretted. 

  

  

Best Regards, 

Jasper Chua| Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6841-2928 | email: jasperchua@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

From: Vic (LKKAuto)  
Sent: Thursday, 16 April, 2020 4:46 PM 
To: Claims Dept 
Cc: Claims Dept; Assessment; Claims Dept; Admin A; Vic (LKKAuto); Jasper Chua (LKK Auto) 
Subject: RE: RE : PRS SH 7091 Z and your insured’s vehicle SLC 1670 B on 08.01.2020. - CHINA TAIPING *** LKK REF: 
CC6/CTI20001135/Dha3 - REMINDER - follow up 4th REMINDER 
  
Without Prejudice 
  
Dear Mr Lee, 
  
We refer to our below email. 
  
Please be informed that we are still pending for mandate approval from our principal. 
  
We will continue to follow up on the matter and will get back to you for an update/offer. 
  
Thank you. 
  
Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email.  Submission of claim 
related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted. 
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Best Regards, 

Vic Alpeh | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6841-2096 | email: vicalpeh@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

Save the Earth. Print only when necessary. 

  

 

This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by an 
unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mail in error, please do not 
read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the 
sender that you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and any copies thereof. Thank you. 
  
  
From: Claims Dept [mailto:claims_ltr@bifrostauto.com]  
Sent: Thursday, 16 April, 2020 4:35 PM 
To: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto); Admin A; Vic (LKKAuto) 
Cc: Claims Dept; Assessment; Claims Dept 
Subject: RE : PRS SH 7091 Z and your insured’s vehicle SLC 1670 B on 08.01.2020. - CHINA TAIPING *** LKK REF: 
CC6/CTI20001135/Dha3 - REMINDER - follow up 4th REMINDER 
  
WITHOUT PREJUDICE   
  
Dear Sir / Madam, 
  
We have not heard from you since my emailed to you with regards to LOD sometimes in mid-February 2020 
  
We would appreciate it if you were able to respond to this email and looking forward to your professionalism 
in handling this case. 
  
Looking forward to hearing from you soon. 
  
Thanks & Regards 
  
Mr Lee, PBM 
Bifrost Auto Pte Ltd 
Accident Claims Dept 
  
---------- Forwarded message ---------- 
From: Claims Dept <claims_ltr@bifrostauto.com> 
To: "Vic (LKKAuto)" <vicalpeh@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: "Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)" <Meikwan@lkkauto.com>, Claims Dept <claims_ltm@bifrostauto.com>, Admin 
A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>, Assessment <claims@bifrostauto.com>, Claims Dept 
<claims_ltv@bifrostauto.com>, "simonho@lkksuto.com" <simonho@lkksuto.com> 
Bcc:  


