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31 URIAYE 1, P02-25 PAYS LI ISDUSTHIAL PARK, SINGAPURE J0muit TEL @ 068 E25a0561 FAN : (065, 2564115

Your ref: CMTD200274/THE
Our ref: CS/SMO2001095/Kvi3 DATE: 21/1/2020
The Motor Claims Department

M/s SOMPO INSURANCE SINGAPORE PTE LTD

Dear Sir/Madam,

PRELIMINARY ADVICE OF VEHICLE NO.SDT 9028

We thank you for your instruction on 17/1/2020

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the above mentioned vehicle

on 20/1/2020 at the premises of M/s OPTIMA WERKZ PTE LTD
and have the following to report:-

Workshop Estimate Amount » 5§7,073.53

Revised Estimate Amount + §53,397.19

"Check” Irems Amount : §5150,00

Market Value : 53

LTA Reimbursement Value : 5§

Nett Value : 5%

Description of Damage:

The vehicle sustnined damages at the —

/s rear partion frore

Comments/Present Status:

Damages Consistent

Yours faithfully,

KENNETH KONG
Licensed Appraiser



. Veron Chen !LKI{Autu!

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuUto)

Sent: Tuesday, 21 January 2020 10:56 AM

To: Ye, Yong Kang Melvin'; SUR

Cc: ‘Henry, Irene James'; ‘Teo, Grace’; 'Choo, Thelma'

Subject: RE: Ref : CMTD2000274/THE  RE: PRI - SDT9028) CLAIMING AGAINST SDLBSOR
DOA 16/01/2020 (SOMPO)

Attachments: SOT 9028) PRELI ADVISED.pdf

Dear Melvin,

Enclosed preliminary revised of vehicle SDT 9028]
Date of survey: 20/1/2020
Number of days (estimated) : 4 days

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | emall :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubl Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-d@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Friday, 17 January 2020 4:20 PM

To: 'Ye, Yong Kang Melvin' <melvin.ye@sompo.com.sg>; assignments <assignments@Ikkauto.com>; SUR
<sur@lkkauto.com>

Cc: 'Sharon Ten' <sharon@ow.sg>; 'Ling Ting An' <tingan.ling@ow.sg>; 'Ong Hock Kong' <hockkong.ong@ow.sg>;
'Henry, Irene James' <irene henry@sompo.com.sg>; 'Teo, Grace' <grace.teo@sompo.com.sg>; 'Choo, Thelma'
<thelma.choo@sompo.com.sg>; "Lily Loi' <lily.loi@ow.sg>

Subject: RE: Ref : CMTD2000274/THE RE: PRI - SDT9028) CLAIMING AGAINST SDL880R DOA 16/01/2020 (SOMPO)

Dear Sir/Madam,
Thank you for the assignment.

Please be informed that vehicle currently not in the workshop, repairer will arrange.

o w‘ishll"l! you a Happy ana rrosperous Lunar New Yeg, »

Best Regards,

Summer Lee | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6741-8434 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue
1, #02-25 | 5(408933)



From: Ye, Yong Kang Melvin <melvin. sOMpo.com.sg>

Sent: Friday, 17 January, 2020 3:20 PM

To: assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>; sur@lkkauto.com

Cc: Sharon Ten <sharon@ow.sg>; Ling Ting An <tingan.ling®@ow.sg>; Ong Hock Kong <hockkong ong@ow.sg>;
Henry, Irene James <irene.henry@sompo.com.sg>; Teo, Grace <grace.teo@sompo.com.sg>; Choo, Thelma

<thelma.choo@sompo.com.sg>; Lily Loi <lily.lol@ow.sg>
Subject: RE: Ref : CMTD2000274/THE RE: PRI - SDT9028) CLAIMING AGAINST 5DLBBOR DOA 16/01/2020 (SOMPO)

Dear LKK Auto,
Please assist to conduct survey on SDT9028J.

Please revert with your preliminary report upon completion of survey.

Best Regards
Melvin Ye

Claims Division
D 6322 4667 | T; 6461 6555 | F: 6221 3302

@ SOMPO A century of Trust

Sompo Insurance Singapore Pte. Ltd.
50 Raffles Place, #05-01/06 Singapore Land Tower, Singapore 048623
Website: www sompo.com sg | Facebook: www facebook com/SompoSG

Quick & Easy Claims Submission’ & Product Purchase’ via Sompo 5G

Download now @
' For Travel, Personal Accident & Home Insurance | * For Travel, Personal Accident, Home & Private Motor Insurance

Disclaimer: This e-mail, including attachments, ls intended far ihe person(s) or company namad and may contain confidential
and/or legally privileged information. Unauthorised disclasure, copying or use of this information may be unlawful and is prohibited
If you are not the intended recipient, please delete this message

Privacy Policy Notice: Sempo Insurance Singapore Ple. Lid. may collect. use and disclose your personal data for the purposes
stated in our Privacy Policy. This may include disclosure to holding and associated companies, credit bureau, parties to whom
disclosure is permitledirequired by laws, our third parly service providers and agents (acting on our behalf). Please click here for
our Privacy Policy

From: Lily Loi <lily.loi@ow sg>

Sent: Friday, 17 January, 2020 3:08 PM

To: Ye, Yong Kang Melvin <melvin ye@sompo.com.sg>

Cc: Sharon Ten <sharon@ow.sg>; Ling Ting An <tingan.ling@ow.sg>; Ong Hock Kong <hockkong ong@ow.sg>;
Henry, Irene James <irene.henry@sompo.com.sg>; Teo, Grace <grace. teo@sompo.com.sg>, Choo, Thelma
<thelma.choo@sompo.com.sg>

Subject: RE: Ref : CMTD2000274/THE RE: PRI - SDT9028) CLAIMING AGAINST SDL88OR DOA 16/01/2020 (SOMPO)

Dear Melvin,



‘We choose LKK Auto Consultants.
Thank you.

Best Regards,

Lily Lol (Ms.)
Senior Claims Executive, Mator Claims Department
D: +65 6481 1522 | F: +65 b481 1011

ORPT/MAERHKZ veuo.

Fmad offica @ Kung Chong Rosd Singapors ABOIAD Tol (»GS) 3472 1213 Faou (+06) G4TE ENE
franchs BA Serangoon NOrth Ave B Singapore BS4800 Tel (+08) 8484 GO0 Fax: (+05) 8401 W01
Eranch 453 Tegore noustrial Ave Singapore TRTE3 Tel i»B5) G402 GH6E Fax («5H GART DIEI

www ow sg | www facebook com/Optima\Werkz

Privileged/Confidential information may be contained In this message. |1 you are nat the intended reciplent. you must not cogy, dist/ibule or use i for any
purpose, nor distiose its contents te any other person
Please notify the sender if you receive this email in error, and delete the emill and s content immediately alter which

From: Ye, Yang Kang Melvin <melvin.ye @sompo.com.sg>

Sent: Friday, 17 January 2020 2:51 PM

To: Lily Loi <lily.loi@ow.sg>

Cc: Sharon Ten <sharon@ow.sg>; Ling Ting An <tingan.ling@ow.sg>; Ong Hock Kong <hockkong ong@ow.sg>;
Henry, Irene James <irene henry@sompo.com.sg>; Teo, Grace <grace.teo@sompo.com.sg>; Choo, Thelma

<thglma.choo@sompo.com.sg>
Subject: RE: Ref : CMTD2000274/THE RE: PRI - 5DT9028) CLAIMING AGAINST SDLEE0OR DOA 16/01/2020 (SOMPO)

Our Reference: CMTD2000274/THE
Your Reference; SDT9028)

Date: 09.01.2020

Attention:
OPTIMA WERKZ PTE LTD
Dear Lily,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SDT9028) & SDL880R ON 16.01.2020

We refer to your Notice of Accident dated 17/01/2020 and our telephone conversation today.
Please be informed that Ms Thelma Choo is the handler of this case.
We intend to conduct a pre-repair survey of the damage to your client’s/your customer’s vehicle jointly with your

client/your motor workshop. We propose to use one of the motor surveyors named in the attached list to conduct
the joint pre-repair survey as a single joint expert.

Pre-Repair Survey

Selection (Indicate as
Motor Surveyor Surveyor tick)




1 | Raleigh Services Andrew Ow Yong
Vincent Ng

Kenneth Kong (North

2 | LKK Auto Consultants area)

Marcus Chua (East area)
Mohd Rasul (West area)

Mohd Taufikh (West area)
3 | Priority Services Jimmy Lee

Lawrence Ng

leffery Ong
4 | In House surveyor Teo See Ling

Please let us know within two (2) working days whether you agree to the appointment of any of these motor
surveyors as a single joint expert. You may select up to two of the listed motor surveyors. We will bear the cost of
the pre-repair survey carried out by the single joint expert.

Best Regards
Mealvin Ye

Claims Division
D: 6322 4667 | T. 6461 6555 | F: 6221 3302

@

Sompo Insurance Singapore Pte. Lid.
50 Raffles Place, #05-01/06 Singapore Land Tower, Singapore 048623
Waebsite: www.sompo.com.sg | Facebook: www facebook com/SompaS

SOMPO A century of Trust

[ A R
INSURANCE

Quick & Easy Claims Submission® & Product Purchase® via Sompo 56

% App Store

Download now @
' For Travel, Personal Accident & Home |msurance |  For Travel, Personal Accident, Home & Private Motar Insurance

Disclaimer: This e-mail, including attachments, is intended for the persan(s) or company named and may contain confidential
andior legally privileged information. Unauthorised disclosure. copying or use of this information may be unlawful and 1s prohibited
If you are not the intended reciplent, please delete this message.

Privacy Policy Notice: Sompo Insurance Singapare Pte. Lid. may collect. use and disclose your personal data for the purposes
stated in our Privacy Policy. This may include disclosure to halding and associated companies, credit bureau, parties 10 whom
disclosura is permitted/required by laws. our third party service providers and agents (acting on our behalf). Please click here for
our Privacy Policy

From: Ye, Yong Kang Melvin

Sent: Friday, 17 January, 2020 1:22 PM

To: "Lily Loi' <lily.loi _SE>

Cc: Sharon Ten <sharon@ow.sg>; Ling Ting An <tingan ling@ow.sg>; Ong Hock Kong <hackkong.ong@ow.sg>;
Henry, Irene James <irene.henry(@sompo.com.sg>; Teo, Grace <grace.teo@sompo.com. sg>; Choo, Thelma



<thelma.choo@sompo.com.sg>
Subject: Ref : CMTD2000274/THE RE: PRI - SDT9028) CLAIMING AGAINST SDL88OR DOA 16/01/2020 (SOMPO)

Hi Lily,

We acknowledged receipt of your claim documents.

Please be informed that Ms Thelma Choo is the handler of this case.
Kindly advise us when the vehicle is in for survey.

Best Regards

Melvin Ye

Claims Division
D' 6322 4667 | T. 6481 6555 | F: 6221 3302

o SOMPO A century of Trust

Sompo Insurance Singapore Pte. Ltd.
50 Raffles Place, #05-01/06 Singapore Land Tower, Singapore 048623
Website: www sompo.com sqg | Facebook: www facebook.com/SompoSG

Quick & Easy Claims Submission’ & Product Purchase’ via Sompo 56

Download now @
LEar Travel, Personal Accident & Home Insurance | ¥ Far Travel, Personal Accident, Home & Private Mator Insurance

Disclaimer: This e-mall, including attachmants, is intendad far the person(s) or company named and may contain confidential
and/or legally privileged information. Unauthorised disclosure, copying or use of this information may be unlawiul and 1s prohibited
I you are not the intended recipienl. please delete this message.

Privacy Policy Notice: Sompo Insurance Singapore Pte. Lid. may collect, use and disclose your personal data fof the purposes
stated in our Privacy Policy. This may include disclosure to holding and associated companies, credit bureau, parties to whom
disclosure is permittedirequired by laws. our third parly service providers and agents (acting on our behall) Please click herg for
our Privacy Paolicy

From: Lily Loi <lily.loi@ow sg>

Sent: Friday, 17 January, 2020 11:10 AM

To: Claims - Motor Survey <MotorSurvey@sompo.com.sg>

Cc: Sharon Ten <sharon@ow.sg>; Ling Ting An <tingan.ling@ow sg>; Ong Hock Kong <hockkong ong@ow.sg>
Subject: PRI - SDT9028) CLAIMING AGAINST SDL88OR DOA 16/01/2020 (SOMPO)

Dear Motor Claim Department,

Please arrange PRI at 9A Serangoon Ave 5
Thank you.

*Carnotin

Best Regards,



Lily Loi (Ms.)
Senior Claims Executive, Motor Claims Department
D: +65 6481 1522 | F: +65 6481 1011

OPT/MAIERHZ sruin

vsad office: & Kurg Chong Rosd Sngapors 159143

www ow.sg | www.facebook.com/OotimaWerkz

Privileged/Confidential Information may be contained in this medsage | you are net the intended recipient, you mist not copy, distribute or wse it for @y

purpess, nor disclose iLs contents Lo any other persan.
Please nolify the sender if you receive this email in error, and delete the emall and its content mmediatsly after which



Nivitha (LKK Auto)

From: Ye, Yang Kang Melvin <melvin.ye@sompo.com.sg>

Sent: Friday, 17 January 2020 3:20 PM

To: assignments; sur@Ikkauto.com

Ce: Sharon Ten; Ling Ting An; Ong Hock Kong; Henry, Irene James; Teo, Grace; Choo,
Thelma; Lily Loi

Subject: RE: Ref : CMTD2000274/THE  RE: PRI - SDT9028) CLAIMING AGAINST SDLBSOR

DOA 16/01/2020 (SOMPC)

Dear LKK Auto,
Please assist to conduct survey an SDT9028),

Please revert with your preliminary report upon completion of survey.

Best Regards
Melvin Ye

Claims Division
D: 6322 4667 | T. 6461 B555 | F: 6221 3302

@ SOMPO A Century of Trust

rH SURANCE

Sompo Insurance Singapore Pte. Ltd.
50 Raffles Place, #05-01/06 Singapore Land Tower, Singapore 048623
Website: www.sompo.com.sqg | Facebook: www facebook com/SompoSG

Quick & Easy Claims Submission’ & Product Purchase’ via Sompo 5G

Download now @ @ App Store i

For Travel, Personal Accident & Home insurance | ¥ For Traval, Personal Accident, Home & Private Motor Insurance

Disclaimer: This e-mail, Including attachments, is inlended far the person(s) or company named and may contain confidential
andior legally privileged information. Unauthorised disclosure, copying or use of this information may be unlawful and is prohibited
If you are not the intended recipiant, please delete this message

Privacy Policy Notice: Sompo Insurance Singapore Ple. Lid. may collect, use and disclose your personal data for the purposes
staled in our Privacy Paolicy. This may include disclosure lo holding and associaled companies, credil bureau, parties 1o wham
disclosure is permitted/required by laws, our third party service providers and agents {(acling on our behalf). Please click hare for
our Privacy Policy

From: Lily Loi <lily.loi@ow.sg>

Sent: Friday, 17 January, 2020 3:08 PM

To: Ye, Yong Kang Melvin <melvin.ye@sompo.com.sg>

Cc: Sharon Ten <sharon@ow.sg>; Ling Ting An <tingan.ling@ow.sg>; Ong Hock Kong <hockkong.ong@ow.sg>;
Henry, Irene James <irene.henry@sompo.com.sg>; Teo, Grace <grace.teo@sompo.com.sg>; Choo, Thelma
<thelma.choo@sompo.com.sg>

Subject: RE: Ref : CMTD2000274/THE RE: PRI - SDT9028) CLAIMING AGAINST SDL880R DOA 16/01/2020 (SOMPO)



Dear Melvin,

‘We choose LKK Auto Consultants,
Thank you.

Best Regards,

Lily Lol (Ms.)
Senior Clalms Executive, Motor Claims Department
D: +65 6481 1522 | F: +65 6481 1011

ORPT/MALERHKZ e

Feandl affice @ Hung Chong Road Singapode 150143 Tk |«88) BATE 1073 Fasc
Branch BA e angoon North Ave B SINgapors B04AB00 Teb (+881 B404 000 Fax: («B8) Ga07 Y01
Branch 4B Togore industrial Ave Singapors 7TETEE3  Tel (+G8) S452 660 Fax:

wrw. ow.si | www.facebook.com/OptimaWerks

Privileged/Conlidential information may be contained in this message. If you atn not the intended recipient, you must not copy, distribute or use it far any
purpose, nor disclose ity contents to any other peron.
Plaase notity the sendir it you receive this emall in errar, and delete the email and its content immediately alter which.

From: Ye, Yong Kang Melvin <melvin.ve @sompo.com.sg>
Sent: Friday, 17 January 2020 2:51 PM

To: Lily Loi <lily. loi@ow.sg>
Cc: Sharon Ten <sharon@ow.sg>; Ling Ting An <tingan.ling@ow.sg>; Ong Hock Kong <hockkong ong@ow.sg>;
Henry, Irene James <irene.henry @sompo.com.sg>; Teo, Grace <grace.teo@sompo.com.sg>; Choo, Thelma

<thelma.choo@sompo.com.sg>
Subject: RE: Ref : CMTD2000274/THE RE: PRI - SDT9028] CLAIMING AGAINST SDL8S0R DOA 16/01/2020 (SOMPO)

Our Reference: CMTD2000274/THE
Your Reference: SDT9028)

Without Prejudice
Date: 09.01.2020
Attention:
OPTIMA WERKZ PTE LTD
Dear Lily,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SDT9028J & SDL8SOR ON 16.01.2020

We refer to your Notice of Accident dated 17/01/2020 and our telephone conversation today.
Please be informed that Ms Thelma Choo is the handler of this case.
We intend to conduct a pre-repair survey of the damage to your client’s/your customer’s vehicle jointly with your

client/your motor workshop. We propose to use one of the motor surveyors named in the attached list to conduct
the joint pre-repair survey as a single joint expert.

Pre-Repair Survey



Selection (Indicate as

Motor Surveyor Surveyor tick)
1 | Raleigh Services Andrew Ow Yong
Vincent Ng
Kenneth Kong (North
2 | LKK Auto Consultants area)

Marcus Chua (East area)
Mohd Rasul (West area)

Mohd Taufikh (West area)
3 | Priority Services Jimmy Lee

Lawrence Ng

Jeffery Ong
4 | In House surveyor Teo See Ling

Please let us know within two (2) working days whether you agree to the appointment of any of these motor
surveyors as a single joint expert. You may select up to two of the listed motor surveyors. We will bear the cost of
the pre-repair survey carried out by the single joint expert.

Best Regards
Melvin Ye

Claims Division
D 6322 4667 | T. 6461 6555 | F: 6221 3302

, SOMPO A cCentury of Trust

INSURANCE

Sompo Insurance Singapore Pte. Ltd.
50 Raffles Place, #05-01/08 Singapore Land Tower, Singapore 0485623

Website: www sompo.com.sg | Facebook: www.facebook.com/SompoSG

Quick & Easy Claims Submission’ & Product Purchase? via Sompo SG

™ Google Play

@ App Store

Download now @ or
Far Travel, Personal Accident & Home Insurance | © For Travel, Persanal Accident, Home & Private Motor Insurance

Disclaimer: This e-mail, including attachments. is intended for the person(s) or company named and may contain confidential
and/or legaily privileged information. Unauthorised disclosure, copying or use of this information may be unlawful and is prohibited
If you ara not the intended recipienl. pleasa dalets this message

Privacy Policy Notice: Sompa Insurance Singapore Ple. Lid may collect, use and disclose your personal data for the purposes
slated in our Privacy Policy. This may include disclosure to holding and associaled companies, credit bureau, parties to wham
disclosure is permitted/required by laws, our third party service providers and agenis {acting on our behall). Please click here for
our Privacy Policy

From: Ye, Yong Kang Melvin
Sent: Friday, 17 January, 2020 1:22 PM
To: ‘Lily Loi’ <lily.loi@ow.sg>



Cc: Sharon Ten <sharon@ow.sg>; Ling Ting An <tingan.ling@ow.sg>; Ong Hock Kong <hockkong.ong @ow. sg>:
Henry, lrene James <irene.henry@sompo.com.sg>; Teo, Grace <grace. teo@sompo.com.sg>; Choo, Thelma

‘<thelma.choo@sompo.com.sg>
Subject: Ref : CMTD2000274/THE RE: PRI - SDT9028) CLAIMING AGAINST S5DLEBOR DOA 16/01/2020 (SOMPO)
Hi Lily,
We acknowledged receipt of your claim documents.

Please be informed that Ms Thelma Choo is the handler of this case.

Kindly advise us when the vehicle is in for survey.

Best Regards

Melvin Ye

Claims Division

D: 6322 4667 | T: 6461 6555 | F: 6221 3302

@s

Sompo Insurance Singapore Pte. Ltd.
50 Raffies Place, #05-01/06 Singapore Land Tower, Singapore 048623

Website: www sompo.com.sq | Facebook: www.facebook.com/SompoSG

Quick & Easy Claims Submission' & Product Purchase® via Sompo 5G

& Aoo Store
Download now @ pp Store a

"For Travel, Personal Accident & Home Insurance | # For Travel, Personal Accident, Home & Private Motor Insurance

OMPO A Century of Trust

INSURANCE

Disclaimer: This e-mail. including attachments, is intended for the person(s) or company named and may contain confidential
andiar legally privileged information. Unautharised disclosure, copying or use of this information may be unlawful and is prohibited
If you are not the intended recipient, please delete this message

Privacy Policy Notice: Sompo Insurance Singapore Ple Lid may collect, use and disclose your personal data for the purposes
stated in our Privacy Policy. This may include disclosure 1o holding and associated companies, credil bureau, parties to whom
disclosure is permitted/required by laws. our third party service providers and agents (acting on our behalf), Please click here for
our Privacy Policy

From: Lily Loi <lily.loi@ow.sg>

Sent: Friday, 17 January, 2020 11:10 AM

To: Claims - Motor Survey <MotarSury SOMPO.COMm.Sg>

Cc: Sharon Ten <sharon@ow.sg>; Ling Ting An <tingan.ling@ow.sg>; Ong Hock Kong <hockkang.ong@ow.se>

Subject: PRI - SDT9028) CLAIMING AGAINST SDL88OR DOA 16/01/2020 (SOMPO)

Dear Motor Claim Department,

Please arrange PRI at 9A Serangoon Ave 5
Thank you.

*Car not in



Best Regards,

" Lily Loi (Ms.)
senlor Claims Executive, Motor Claims Department
D: +65 6481 1522 | F: +65 6481 1011

OPT/MATERHKZ sre o,

Haad office: @ Kung Chong Road SNgapors 150143 Tei (+88) 8477 1313 Fax (-85 D472 I
B mncn. GA Serangoon North Ave § Singagore BE4S00 Tak (+00) 8404 GO0 Fax: («68] G401 01
francr 4BZ Tagore ndustrial Ave Singapore TOTEZI  Tek (-66) 452 G000 Pax: [-B5] G452 O2E3

toww ow sg | www facebook com/OptimaWerksz

Privileged,/Confidential Informatian may be contained in this message. Il you are not the intended recipient, you must not capy, distribute or use it for any

purpose, nor discioss its contents to any other person.
Flirate natify the sender if you receve this email in error, and delete the email snd its content immediately after which



.

> Back to OneMotoring

" Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Vehicle Owner Particulars
Oniner 1D Type:

Owner 1D:
Vehicle Details

Vehicle No:

Viehicle 1o be Exported:
Intended Deregistration Date:
Vehicle Make:

Wehicle Model

Primary Calour:
Manufacturing Year:

Engine No.:

Chassis No.t

Maximum Power ODutput:
Open Market Vilue:

Original Registration Date:
First Registration Date:
Transfer Count:

Actual ARF Paid:

Intended PARF Rebate Detalls
PARF Ellgibility.

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date:
PARF Rebate Amount:
Intended COE Rebate Details
COE Expiry Date:

COE Category:

COE Period(Years)

QP Pad:

COE Rebate Amount:

Total Rebate Amount:

The infarmation contained herein is correct as at 16 Jan 2020

Singapore NRIC
291

SDTR028)

Mo

164 Jan 2020

BMW.

4201 AT ABS DVAIRBAG 2WD
Black

2016
22979555B48B20A
WEA4TIZ0105C20578
135.0k\W (181 bhp)
$45.618.00

29 Jun 2016

29 Jun 2016

1]

£55.864.00

Yes
28 Jun 2026
541 B99.00

28 Jun 2024

B - Car above 14600ce ar 97kW (130bhp)
10

$57.01000

$35.771.00

£78,470.00
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Date: 17/01/2020 Third Party Insurer: SOMPO
Vehicle No: SDT9028) Third Party Veh No:  SDL880R
Model: BMW420I Date of Accident: 16/01/2020
Chassis: WBA4T320105C20578-2016 /Uﬂ j?fﬂ Aﬁ?
Reg.Year: 2016 A:f.- V4
ey ﬁ'/c.;,gr
?a"'
ESTIMATE /g
NO. DESCRIPTION Qry | UNIT 58 AMOUNT 55
1 |REAR QUARTER PANEL LH 1 2T 6315960 X
2 |REAR QUARTER PANEL LINER CLIPS LH 8 $7.20| 4 - $57.60| X
3 |REAR BUMPER 1 r o $2,395.20 | —
4 |REAR BUMPER CLIPS 10 56.50 | Ae, 56500
SUB TOTAL $5,677.40
LESS 5% .$283.87
PARTS TOTAL $5,303.53
LABOUR CHARGES: 5 s /
LABOUR CHARGES TO REMOVE,REPLACE,REPAIR,READIUST REAR ACCIDENT AREAS & $700.00
ETC.
LABOUR CHARGES TO REMOVE & REFIX REAR QUARTER INNER MECHANISM & ETC. T $150.00 X
LABOUR CHARGES FOR PAINTING & TO SUPPLY PAINT & FURNISHING MATERIALS AT $600.00 fdﬂ(
REAR QUARTER PANEL LH,REAR BUMPER & ETC.
LABOUR CHARGES TO REMOVE & REFIX REAR BUMPER REVERSE SENSOR & ETC. $80.00 (ay
TO DIAGNOSE FAULT CODE & RESET MEMORY. /U ~$150.00 t
LABOUR TOTAL $1,680.00
ONG TOTAL $7,073.53
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60 RAFFLES PLACE
#05-01/06
SINGAPORE LAND TOWERSINGAPORE 048623

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubl Indusinal Park, Singapors 408533
TEL 6256 3561 FAX: 2256 4315
Reg Mo 188607188R GST Reg No. 18-8807188-R

SDL 880R —

Rel

Date: 20-02-2020
Code: SMO

CS/SMO20001095/Kvi3n2

Insured Veh.

Policy No. Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No, CMTD2000274/THE Excess (5) 0.00
Assign From MELVIN YE YONG KANG 1701/2020

Make & Model BMW.420( (A) c.c 1998

Engine No HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2016

Chassis No. WBA4T3IZ20105C20578 Colour METALLIC BLACK
Odometer 98814 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification SPORTS RIM

THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE

R/H Front Tyre |225/40 R18 CONTINENTAL & mm
L/H Front Tyre |225/40 R18 CONTINENTAL 6 mm
R/H Rear Tyre |255/35 R18 CONTINENTAL & mm
L/H Rear Tyre |255/35 R18 & mm

CONTINENTAL

Estimate Lays |

ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR:

DY B e

4 Working Days




¥y L LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
-ﬂy_. 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapors 408933
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 8256 4315
Reg. No: 199807198R GST Reg No. 19-9607198-R Page No 1 of 1
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SDT 9028J

1|REAR QUARTER PANEL LH TO REPAIR SEE 3,158.60 -
LABOUR
B|REAR QUARTER PANEL LINER CLIPS LH @3%7 20 NOT NECESSARY 57.60 .
1|REAR BUMPER BUCKLED / 2,385.20 23856.20
DENTED
10|REAR BUMPER CLIPS {@56.50 NECESSARY 65.00 85.00
LESS 5% DISCOUNT -283.87 -123.01
5,393.53 233118
LABOUR
LABOUR CHARGES TO T00.00 500.00
REMOVE REPLACE REPAIR READJUST REAR ACCIDENT
AREAS & ETC INCLUSIVE OF THE REPAIR OF REAR
QUARTER PANEL LH.
LABOUR CHARGES TO REMOVE & REFIX REAR NOT NECESSARY 150.00 -
QUARTER INNER MECHANISM & ETC.
LABOUR CHARGES FOR PAINTING & TO SUPPLY PAINT B00.00 500.00
& FURNISHING MATERIALS AT REAR QUARTER PANEL
LH,REAR BUMPER & ETC.
LABOUR CHARGES TO REMOVE & REFIX REAR BUMPER 80,00 60.00
REVERSE SENSOR & ETC
TO DIAGNOSE FAULT CODE & RESET MEMORY. NOT NECESSARY 150,00 -
1,680.00 1,060.00

1085/Kvi3n2

CHESCLAIMER OF LIABILITY TO THERD FARTIES - This Mepod i suds sclely for the uls nd bansiis of the Chant named on ihe irani page of tis Repon.
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