Eric Woo
B e e e e e e e e e e

From: Rachel Wu

Sent: Wednesday, February 26, 2020 10:47 AM

To: Eric Woo

Subject: FW: RESEND LOD for SLB 2511 B; Our Ref : D20000403MFSH/SHA1358L ; DOA :
14/01/2020

Attachments: Letter of Demand (PDF).pdf

Dear Eric,

New LOD fyna.

Thank you

Best Regards

Rachel Wu

Motor Claim Department

MS First Capital Insurance Ltd | 36 Robinson Road, City House #16-01 Singapore 068877 | Tel: 6507 3848 | DID : 6507
3862| Fax No. 6507 3849 |Email: rachelwu@msfirstcapital.com.sg |Company Regn. No. 195000206C
A Member of BEEEEM Insurance Gloup

Personal Data Protection Act 2012 ("PDPA"):

Under the PDPA, there are various requirements that regulate the processmg of your personal data. Please refer to
http://www.msfirstcapital.com.sg for details of PDPA Personal Data Collection Statement.

Confidentiality Notice: This e-mail is confidential. It may also be legally privileged. If you are not the addressee or to
whom it is intended, you may not copy, forward, disclose or use any part of it. If you have received this message in
error, please delete the message and all copies from your system and notify the sender immediately by return e-
mail.

From: Eileen Lee <EileenLee@msfirstcapital.com.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, February 26, 2020 10:46 AM

To: Rachel Wu <RachelWu@msfirstcapital.com.sg>

Subject: RE: RESEND LOD for SLB 2511 B; Our Ref : D20000403MFSH/SHA1358L ; DOA : 14/01/2020

Hi Rachel,

Reserves updated.

Thank You.

Regards,
Eileen Lee (Ms)
Maotor Claims Dept.

Email address

eileenlee@msfirstcapital.com.sg



Motor Claims E-mail : motorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg

Website: http://www.msfirstcapital.com.sg

MS First Capital Insurance Ltd | 36 Robinson Rd #16-01 City House Singapore 068877 | TEL : 6507 3848 |
Fax No. : 6507 3849 | Company Regn. No. 195000106C

A Hember of BYREHRLEN INSURANCE GROUP

From: Rachel Wu <RachelWu@ msfirstcapital.com.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, February 26, 2020 10:44 AM

To: Eileen Lee <EileenLee @msfirstcapital.com.sg>

Subject: FW: RESEND LOD for SLB 2511 B; Our Ref: D20000403MFSH/SHA1358L ; DOA : 14/01/2020

Dear Eileen,

- TPD1rrto $6,480.00.
- Review done.

Thank you
Best Regards

Rachel Wu
Motor Claim Department

MS First Capital Insurance Ltd | 36 Robinson Road, City House #16-01 Singapore 068877 | Tel: 6507 3848 | DID : 6507

3862| Fax No.:6507 3849 |Email: rachelwu@msfirstcapital.com.sg |Company Regn. No. 155000106C
A Member of B Insurance Group

Personal Data Protection Act 2012 ("PDPA"):

Under the PDPA, there are various requirements that regulate the processing of your personal data. Please refer to
http://www.msfirstcapital.com.sg for details of PDPA Personal Data Collection Statement.

Confidentiality Notice: This e-mail is confidential. It may also be'legally privileged. If you are not the addressee or to
whom it is intended, you may not copy, forward, disclose or use any part of it. If you have received this message in
error, please delete the message and all copies from your system and notify the sender immediately by return e-
mail.

From: Karen Chin <KarenChin@msfirstcapital.com.sg>
Sent: Wednesday, February 26, 2020 8:56 AM
To: Rachel Wu <RachelWu@msfirstcapital.com.sg>

Cc: Teo Swee Keong <TeoSweeKeong@msfirstcapital.com.sg>
Subject: FW: RESEND LOD for SLB 2511 B; Qur Ref : D20000403MFSH; DOA : 14/01/2020

Dear Rachel,

Please ignore previous email as per Rico 60 email.



. Please assist to issue DV for TPD settlement.

Thank you.

Warmest regards,
Karen Chin
Motor Claims Department

MS First Capital Insurance Ltd | 36 Robinson Road, City House, #16-01 Singapore 068877 | TEL: 6507 3848
Fax: 6507 3849 | Company Reg. No 195000106C
AMemder of IERES .’\U JRAN 3

Personal Data Protection Act 2012 ("PDPA"):
Under the PDPA, there are various requirements that regulate the processing of your personal data.
Please refer to www.msfirstcapital.com.sg for details of PDPA Personal Data Collection Statement.

Confidentiality Notice: This e-mail is confidential. It may also be legally privileged.

If you are not the addressee or to whom it is intended, you may not copy, forward, disclose or use any part of it.

If you have received this message in error, please delete the message and all copies from your system and notify the sender
immediately by return e-mail.

From: Rico 60 <claims@rico60.com>

Sent: Tuesday, February 25, 2020 7:58 PM

To: Rachel Wu <RachelWu@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; Motor Claims <MotorClaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>
Subject: RE: RESEND LOD for SLB 2511 B; Our Ref : D20000403MFSH; DOA : 14/01/2020

Dear Rachel,

Attached file as per your pursuant.
Kindly release DV / cheque.

*%* Please ignore previous mail.
Thank You.

Best Regards,
Yvonne Teoh

RICO 60 AUTO SERVICES PTE. LTD.

Co. & GST Reg. No.: 201807623M

8 Kaki Bukit Avenue 4, Premier @ Kaki Bukit
#02-24, Singapore 415875

Tel: +65 6286 6060 | Fax: +65 6286 7060

Email: claims@rico60.com

From: Rico 60
Sent: Tuesday, 25 February 2020 6:15 PM

To: RachelWu@msfirstcapital.com.sg; motorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg
Subject: LOD for SLB 2511 B; Our Ref : D20000403MFSH; DOA : 14/01/2020

3



Dear Rachel,

Attached file as per your pursuant.
Kindly release DV / cheque.
Thank You.

Best Regards,
Yvonne Tech

RICO 60 AUTO SERVICES PTE. LTD.

Co. & GST Reg. No.: 201807623M

8 Kaki Bukit Avenue 4, Premier @ Kaki Bukit
#02-24, Singapore 415875

Tel: +65 6286 6060 | Fax: +65 6286 7060
Email: claims@rico60.com




Vic (LKKAuto)

From: Rachel Wu <RachelWu@msfirstcapital.com.sg>

Sent: Monday, 16 March, 2020 11:02 AM

To: Vic (LKKAuto)

Cc: Admin A

Subject: RE: <SEEK MANDATE> RE: <EXPRESS SETTLEMENT> RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT -

D20000403MFSH/1/SHA1358L. DOA 14-01-2020 - LKK REF CC4/FCI120001074/Uha3

Dear Vic,
Please proceed as per your recommendation at $6,302.45 .
Best Regards

Rachel Wu
Motor Claim Department

MS First Capital Insurance Ltd | 36 Robinson Road, City House #16-01 Singapore 068877 | Tel: 6507 3848 | DID : 6507
3862| Fax No.:6507 3849 |Email: rachelwu@msfirstcapital.com.sg | Company Regn. No. 195000106C
A Member of IEEE Insurance Group

Personal Data Protection Act 2012 ("PDPA"):

Under the PDPA, there are various requirements that regulate the processing of your personal data. Please refer to
http://www.msfirstcapital.com.sg for details of PDPA Personal Data Collection Statement.

Confidentiality Notice: This e-mail is confidential. It may also be legally privileged. If you are not the addressee or to
whom it is intended, you may not copy, forward, disclose or use any part of it. If you have received this message in
error, please delete the message and all copies from your system and notify the sender immediately by return e-
mail.

From: Vic (LKKAuto) <vicalpeh@Ikkauto.com>

Sent: Thursday, March 5, 2020 6:38 PM

To: Rachel Wu <RachelWu@msfirstcapital.com.sg>

Ce: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Vic (LKKAuto) <vicalpeh@lkkauto.com>

Subject: <SEEK MANDATE> RE: <EXPRESS SETTLEMENT> RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D20000403MFSH/1/SHA1358L.
DOA 14-01-2020 - LKK REF CC4/FCI20001074/Uha3

Your Ref: D20000403MFSH/1/SHA1358L
Our Ref: CC4/FC120001074/Uha3

Dear Rachel,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLES SHA 1358L AND SLB 2511B ON 14/01/2020
We refer further to your below email.

It was reported that Insured vehicle rear-ended TP vehicle.

As such, in view of BOLA 27, liability is not to our Insured’s favour.

We propose to offer to TP repairer “RICO 60 AUTO SERVICES PTE LTD"” as below:




TP CLAIMED REVISED - TO OFFER
Cost of Repair (w/gst) S 38,488.01 S 5,350.00
Loss of Rental w/gst ($120 x 8 days) $ 1,027.20 S 856.00 (5100 x 8 days)
LTA Search Fee S 7.45 S 7.45
GIA Search Fee S 29.00 S 29.00
Towing Fee S 60.00 S 60.00
TOTAL | $ 39,611.66 S 6,302.45

Breakdown of days is as follows:

Our surveyor’s recommended days to repair 5 days
Weekends / Downtime 3 days
TOTAL | 8 days

The above is for your approval and/or further instructions please.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Vic Alpeh | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2096 | email: vicalpeh@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

¥ IS v

This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the scle use of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by an
unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mail in error, please do not
read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the
sender that you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and any copies thereof. Thank you.

From: Vic (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 28 February, 2020 11:55 AM
To: Rachel Wu

Cc: Admin A; Vic (LKKAuto)

Subject: <EXPRESS SETTLEMENT> RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D20000403MFSH/1/SHA1358L. DOA 14-01-2020 - LKK

REF CC4/FCI20001074/Uha3
Dear Rachel,
Please find attached documents for your reference.

- Marked TP Estimate
- Preliminary Advice

Thank you.

SRR REZm W Shye the Earthe Print only when necessary:




RICO 60 AUTO SERVICES PTE. LTD.

Co. & GST Reg. No.: 201807623M
bki Bukit Avenue 4, Premier @ Kaki Bukit, #02-24
Singapore 415875 | Email: enquiry@rico60.com
Tel: +65 6286 6060 | Fax: +65 6286 7060

LETTER OF AUTHORISATION

W20 @ ARS | e punge DG gip Roid

Accident on

involving vehicles nos. SWBIBUE  w Q\‘\Pﬁ 1358 L

In consideration of Rico 60 Auto Services Pte, Ltd., 8 Kaki Bukit Avenue 4, Premier @ Kaki Bukit,

#02-24, Singapore 415875, repairing my/our motor vehicle no. QL35 e at my/our
request, [/We, & J!t’l{J Peny ‘ ("the claimant”)
or _ RIK G0 BATE Wity I R0d 13- 251 Tgapire ¥ty )

(address) bearing NRIC no. J’Pr 6 :f 38 :H)he owner of motor vehicle no. Ry L&) 61 Bv .
hereby authorise them to demand claim, settle and receive whatever amount settle payable by the
insurance company or third party or commence legal proceeding for cost of repairs, loss of use and
etc, to any of their appointed advocates 1o act of me/us in respect of the said accident/claim and all
the amount claimed or settled shall belong and make payable to them absolutely by the insurance
company of the third party. I/We further authorised them to give an absolute discharge on my/our
behalf and to sign discharge voucher(s) and any other documents necessary or incidentals to the
conduct and disposal of my/our above claims,

I/We further agree to fully co-operate and attend all court hearings that are necessary to prosecute
the claims maintained by Rico 60 Auto Services Pte. Ltd. |/We further agree and undertake to
Indemnify them against my/our c'aim for costs which arise therewith. In the event that my/our claim
is unsuccessful, I/we undertake to pay to Rico 60 Auto Services Pte. Ltd. the cost of repairs of
my/our vehicle. In the event that settlement cheque were to be drawn in my/our favour, I/we
hereby give my/our instruction to clear the said cheque on my/our behalf by presenting the same
for payment directly into Rico 60 Auto Services Pte. Ltd. account. Upon dearance of the said cheque,
I/we further authorise Rico 60 Auto Services Pte. Ltd. and/or their appointed law firm to utilise the
monies to pay their charges without further reference to me. | confirm that the payment to Rico 60
Auto Services Pte. Ltd. shall amount to a good discharge of Rico 60 Auto Services Pte. Ltd. and/or
their appointed law firm’s obligation to me in respect of the settlement monies.

Dated this : L/ day of /1 (month) 70}0 {year).
‘ﬂ’ﬁe"EEimarft's" Signature Rico 60 Ws Pte Ltd
h
Name: _ Ches, Suwd ?u,\f Name: 0{ vt

NRICNo.. _SWr63133¥ D




MS @ FirstCapital

CLAIM REFERENCE
ACCIDENT DATE
ACCIDENT LOCATION
INSURED

INSURED DRIVER
INSURED VEHICLE
INVOLVED PARTY

SETTLEMENT SUM

MS First Capital Insurance Limited Co.Reg. No. 195000106C GST Reg. No. M2-0001676-9

6 Raffles Quay #21-00 Singapore 048580
Tel: (65) 6222 2311 Fax: (65) 6222 3547

Ciaims & Motor Underwriting Dept: 36 Robinson Road #16-01 City House Singapore

DISCHARGE RECEIPT

D20000403MFSH

14/01/2020

JLN EUNOS EXIT SLIP ROAD
COMFORT TRANSPORTATION PTE LTD
WONG KAH KOOI

SHA 1358L

SLB 25118

$6,300.00

“My execution of this Discharge
Voucher is only for my claim
for property damage and not
Prejudicial to any other claims”

|/We, the undernoted CLAIMANT being the person/entity entitled to receive the compensation in relation to the accident,
hereby agree to accept the SETTLEMENT SUM as full and final settlement of all claims for damages, costs &
disbursements arising out of the ACCIDENT, and I/WE also agree that the said settlement sum:

1. is paid without admission of liability on the part of MS First Capital Insurance Limited and/or its
INSURED and/or its INSURED DRIVER in respect of the said loss and for damage whether
now or hereafter to become manifest,

2. is accepted by me/us to the intent that the said MS First Capital Insurance Limited and /or its
INSURED and/or its INSURED DRIVER be absolutely and finally discharged from all claims
whatsoever which I/WE now or hereafter may have arising out of or connected with or
traceable o the said accident.

I/WE acknowledge that this DISCHARGE RECEIPT is not to be construed as an admission of liability on the part of MS
First Capital Insurance Limited and/or its INSURED and /or its INSURED DRIVER and it shall not be used as evidence
in any claims or actions which may be made against them or any of them.

CLAIMANT : QJA.LV\. g;'l.:bw P-L..\& %‘U’\ﬂb Signature and Date :

WITNESS - Huﬂ'fwu, Twh 7 ylt

Signature and Datie :




RICO 60 AUTO SERVICES PTE. LTD.
Co. & GST Reg. No.: 201807623M

8 Kaki Bukit Avenue 4

Premier @ Kaki Bukit

#02-24, Singapore 415875

Tel: +65 6286 6060 | Fax: +65 6286 70860
Email: enquiry@rico60.com

UOB Bank -Current : 371-310-641-9

TJAX INVOICE
Invoice No.  : 12020021562
Invoice Date : February 25, 2020

MS First Capital Insurance Ltd. Vehicle No. : SLB2511B
Make & Model : NISSAN NOTE
6507 3848 Chassis No. : JN1TBAE12Z0982408
Mileage -
Terms : Due within 90 days
NO. DESCRIPTION QUANTITY P'fgé-'o';" AMOUNT (SGD)
1 To Camy Out Repair & Respray on Accident 1 5,000.00 5,000.00
Corresponding to Supply on Spare Parts & Labour
Charges
7% GST $350.00
GRAND TOTAL (INCLUSIVE OF 7% GST) $5,350.00
Amount Paid $0.00
Balance Due $5,350.00

Signature/Company Stamp

! agree to the price as listed above and affirm that the goods are received in good condition.



CARS FOR RENT (2016) PTE LTD

Mailing Address:

10 Kaki Bukit Ave 4 #09-60 Premier@Kaki Bukit, Singapore 415874

Tel Nos.: +65 6970 9119 / 6789 5155
Co. Reg'n No.: 201609732N
GST Reg'n No.: 201609732N

Bill To:

Rico 60 Auto Services Pte Ltd
For the account of:

Tax Invoice #: E2001052
Date: 14-01-20

1
Ship Te:

Rico 60 Auto Services Pte Lid
For the account of:

Chen Siew Peng Chen Siew Peng

Blk 601 Bedok Reservoir Road Blk 601 Bedok Reservoir Road
#12-522 #12-522

470601 470601

Description

Vehicle Rental for period 14.01.2020 to 22.01.2020
(Billing for days 8 X $120.00/per day)
(Vehicie No.. SLB2511B)

Your Order #: E16172

Amount Job No.

$1,027.20. SML9310D

SR

Terms: Net 30th after GST: $67.20

COMMENT CODE RATE GST SALE AMOUNT  Total Inv Amt: $1,027.20
SR 7% $67.20 $960.00 Amount Applied: $0.00

Balance Due: $1,027.20



i —
CARS FOR RENT (2016) PTELTR. © " K/ 0 %
swsymbcnossrnae (X)  NoE 16172
ROC No: 201B09732N VEHICLE RENTAL AGREEMENT

HIRER'S PARTICULAR vehicla Now =M L 12 1 0 Feplpos Veh No:

! CHEn Sieul PEnit Mileage Cut: Milesge Out
:;"'c,’,f:;:',,ﬁm SI7e73al Make 8 Model: . - (Auto 3 Manual
Address (Reg A7 (Sl EC| BEPC fb = oo .

REBER Ve Rowy ¥(2 =522 547 (gpur:vas (401 [2C 1me: 20 oo M
HIRE/PERIOD EXPIRY:

Name & Address of Emplayer ,
- COLUSION DAMAGE WAIVER Bxcess . () () O YES/NO
: , . PERSONAL ACCIDENT INSURANCE YES/NO
Occupation: Driving Exp: :
Do Lot e ———— 0L Ves: Lottt oy @01 136 e Sl o0 o)
Tel: (0) Gl HP/PG Weekly per week
ADDITIONAL DRIVER'S PARTICULARS Monthly
Name: {as In I/C) Hours
NRIC/PASSPORT No: p
i cOW

per month
per hour

per day/month
per day/month

Detving LicenceNo:____________ DA Type:: Local / Intemational | PAl
lssue Date: Dats of Birth: Delivery
| Occupation: DrivingExp: SUB-TOTAL $

_§aasasa

m

out | E [y 1/2 | /4
n |E [[va |2 | ¥ |F

Collection Service i
Misc. R S e

TowALcHARGES 8|70l | *°

I

Rented out by :

Hirer's Signature

Addition bﬁwﬂ Signature

[ Radio/ Giass [Jco [] Catridges = |

1 have read
that all anfoint payal smant and for parking sind trafffc infiringemantsmay be Gilied ta that acoolnt and my Sgnaiure Sbdr
*ﬁm “’gjﬂ son Tyle.on the charge/cretit card voucher. All nformation Wmﬁm GARS FORRENT ROIB) PTELTD /in.

azmlormmm:mamTowmm@mmwmimmmwﬁmmmmmmm
BE THE DY AND Tl THE VEHIOUE 8 RETURMED TO CARS FOR RENY [2018] PTE LTD AND THE SAME BRALL BE ACCEFTED AS COMOLUSVE SRISNOE OF THE SAME AND BHALL WO

BE CHALLENGED OR QUESTIONED ON ANY ACCCSTT WHATBOEVER.
DATEIN | TIMEIN | MILEAGE CHEEKER BY REMARKS M’L
”1' ' f = '__”{M U\,MJ\ o SIGNATURE OF HISERVDRIVER

oo



) GENERAL INSURANCE ASSOCIATION OF SINGAPORE
GENERAL  RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE

6 Raffles Quay #18-00, Singapore 048580
INSURANCE Phone: +65 6224 0010 Fax: +65 6224 0030
ASSOCIATION Operating Hours: Monday to Friday 9am to 5pm
GST Registration No: M400017735

RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE

TAX INVOICE

Our Ref No: GR-20-021378
Date of Request: 06/02/2020 Your Ref No: WALK IN ROY

RICO 60 AUTO SERVICES PTE LTD
8, KAK| BUKIT AVENUE 4, #02-24, PREMIER @ KAKI BUKIT
SINGAPORE 415875

Dear Sir/Madam,

Date of Accident: 14/01/2020
Vehicle No: SLB2511B
Place of Accident: JLN EUNOS EXIT SLIP RD
Involving Vehicle No: SHA1358L

With reference to your application for the accident report, we have attached the following accident reports as requested:

DOCUMENTS ACCIDENT LOCATION PER DOC (S8) ‘QTY  |AMOUNT (S$)

SHA1358L JLNEUNDS EXIT SLPRD 14.00[1 | 13.08
GST Amount _ i 0.82
Total Amount Due (GST Inclusive) - B 14.00,

The images provided to you are taken from the original reports forwarded lo thé centre by the members of the General
Insurance Association of Singapore and we take no responsibility for their accuracy or contents and shall be under no liability
whatsoever for any loss or damage arising out of or in connection with the reports or their images.

Thank You.

This is a computer generated document and requires no signature.

For GIARMC Official use:
Date:
[]1 GIRO [X] Cash [ ] Cheque



R
2T et

~ ﬁyGENERAL RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE
6 Raffies Quay #18-00, Singapore 048580
= INSURANCE Phone: +85 6224 0010 Fax: +65 6224 0030
S Operating Hours: Monday to Friday 9am to 5pm
RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE ' e St

P

TAX INVOICE

Our Ref No; GR-20-021377
Date of Request: 06/02/2020 Your Ref No: WALK IN ROY

RICO 60 AUTO SERVICES PTELTD
8, KAKI BUKIT AVENUE 4, #02-24, PREMIER @ KAKI BUKIT
SINGAPORE 415875

Dear Sir‘Madam,

Your Vehic'e No: SLB25118
Date of Accident: 14/01/2020
Place of Accident JLN EUNCS
Involving Vehicle No. SHA1358L

GENERAL INSURANCE ASSOCIATION OF SINGAPORE

DESCRIPTION AMOUNT (S$%)

E-File Search Fee (Public) 14.02
GST Amount 0.98
Total Amount Due (GST Inclusive) 15.00

Thank You.

This is a computer generated document and requires no signature,

For GIARMC Official use:
Date:
[1GIRO [X] Cash [ ] Chegque




> Back to OneMotoring

Land Trunsporw%\uthoriry

Land Transport Authority

10 Sin Ming Drive

Singapore 575701

GST Regis'ration No. : M4-0006529-2

Print Date/Time : 15 Jan 2020/ 17:28:46
Receipt Date/Time : 15 Jan 2020/ 17:28:46
Tax Invoice/Receipt
Receipt No. : ITNET-00000-200115-003058

Previous Receipt No. :

S/N Item Description/ Amount GST Amount
Business Transaction Reference Before Amount After GST
No. GST (S$) (S%) (s$)

Result of Insurance Enquiry - SHA1358L

As at 14 Jan 2020/19:10:00

Insurance Co: MS FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LIMITED
1 Insurance Enquiry - SHA1358L

Enquiry Fee 7.00 0.49 7.49
20200115172816365127
Sub-Totai 7.00 0.48 7.49
Total Before Rounding 7.00 0.49 7.49
Rounding Difference 0.04
Total Amount Payable 7.45
Paid By '
PSR S \?‘ggdgsa{:éard L
Total 7.45
Cash Change 0.00
Tendered Amount 745
Excess Refundable Amount 0.00

THANK YOU AND HAVE A NICE DAY!

Please ensure that all payments to the Authority are good and promptly settled by the payment service
provider / financial institution, Otherwise, the transaction and receipt is considered void and late fee

may apply.



ISLAND TOWING S]ERVEC]ES

6747 7400 islandrecovery@ymail.com
65844 7233 www.islandrecover_v.com.sg
Co. Reg. 532692104

| e L 25
JS_‘_ w\\ - -
Vehiczle Na: '%’__B 15“ g

__ Model MNissomn _
= g
From:_2>L5\ Ubldel Time S‘Eflj——
; - . /
rém Ji-} [
To Premitr KOED Lutit T Time £fd q
. /
4y ) .t
Remarks: __ L Tl 7. _
AT,
= 7
Fi
[ Change Tyres /Jump Start J Accident ‘ L) Use Car Carrier
( Basement / Muiti Carpark () Crane Up / Winch Out (] Open Door
] Using King Doliey [ Dismantle Shaft / Brake [ Loaded
AMOUNT S$ 56
Received By

] Island Recovery Services
Vehicle is transported at owner's risk. The company accepts no responsibility for damaged or other misdemeanour to your

vehicle whilst being fransported.



