
From:
Sent:
To:
Cc:

Subject:

Merina Chia <MerinaChia@msfirstcapital.com.sg>

Tuesday, 25 February 2020 5:16 PM

Jia Le (LKK Auto)
Admin A
RE: SEEK MANDATE APPROVAL ON QUANTUM [Express Settlement via LKK] -

D2OO0O402M FS H/ 1 / / O ur r ef : CC4 /tCl?OO 1 069 /T1 d a3 IACC I DENT I NVOLVI NG

SHC272X AND SHC7798A ON 14/01/20201

Dear Jia Le,

Your approval to negotiate from 5u!lq9Jqgj5&3541!!.

o Loss of rental - s117.00 x 5-6.5 days (vehicle check in on 15.01.2020 O830hrs. check out on 27.07'2020

1407hrs)
o Loss of income - 550.00 x 5-5.5 days

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Merina Chia (Ms)

Motor Claims DePartment

N4S First Capital lnsurance Ltd | 36 Robinson Road, city House #16-01 Singapore 068877 | Tel:6507 3848 I DID :6507 3856

lFaxNo.:65073849lEmail:merinachia@msfirstcaDital'comselCompanyRegn'No'195000106C
A Member of EIEMIE lnsurance GrouP

Personol Data Protection Act 2012 ("PDPA"):

ui:,ii, ini popa, there are various reiquiremLnts thot regutote the Proce.ssing of your personal dato' Pleose refer to

itli ti**n,.tfirttcopitat.ro.sqfo;detoilsofPDPAPetsonolDotoCollectionstotement'

canfidentiality Notice: This e-moil is confidentiol. lt moy olso be LegoLIy privi.leged. ll you orc not the oddr.essee,or to whom it is intended' you

.,ay not copy, forwotd, disctose or use'oiliiiifii'ti. tii'vi, ii,.: ,iiti{a tnit k"ttig" in 
"rror, 

pteose delete the messose ond oLt copies from

yoir system'ond notify the sender inmediotely by return e-mail'

From: Jia Le (LKK Auto) <JiaLe@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Friday, 21 February 2020 11:47 AM

To: Merina Chia <MerinaChia@msfirstcapital.com'sg>

Cc' Admin A <admin-a @ lkkauto.com>

subiect: RE: SEEK MANDATE AppRovAL oN QUANTUM [ExpresS Settlement via LKK] - D2OOOO4O2MFSH/! l/ Our ref:

Cci/FC;5orO1s/t1da3 [ACCtDENT INVoLVtNG SHC272x AND SHc7798A oN t4/otl2o2ol

Claim No: D20000402MFSH/1

LKK Ref : CC4lFC12001069/T1da3

Dear Sirs/Madam,

ACCTDENT TNVOIVING SHC 272X AND SHC 7798A ON t4lol'l2o2o

We refer to the above matter.

The said chain collision involved 3 vehicles whereby our insured was the 2"d vehicle. ln accordance to the McF

guidelineforchaincolllsion,wehavetosettlethefrontvehicle'sclaimatTOO%



claimed
Amount

Proposed Amount Revised Amount

1. Cost of Repair (W/GST) 5 7,266.63 s 7,266.63 S 7,266.63

2. Loss of Rental (7days x $117) s 819.00 S 585.00 (Sdays x

i 117)

S 819.00 (7days x 5117)

3. Loss of lncome (7daYs x $80) 5 s60.00 S 250.00 (Sdays x

isol
s 3so.0o (7days x Ss0)

4. LTA/GlA Search Fee S 7.4s 5 7.4s 5 7.4s

lotal s 8,6s3.08 s 8,109.08 s 8,443.08

we seek your approval to offer Third Party repairer "Rlco 60 AUTO SERVICES PTE LTD" at s8,443.08(all-in)'

The summary is as follows:-

Surveyor recommended 05 days for repair + lsunday + 1PRS = Tdays'

Enclosed here with all the relevant documents for your perusal'

Kindly let us have your approval/instruction.

Best Regards,

Chan Jia Le I Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6749 57gz I email: Jiale@lkkauto.com I fax: 674t-41'o8

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 I S(4o8933)

From: Merina Chia Imailto:MerinaChia @ msfirstcapital com'ssl

Sent: Monday, 10 FebruarY 2020 4:47 PM

To: Jia Le (LKK Auto)
Cc: Admin A
subject: RE: pRoposAl oN LIABILITY [Express settlement via LKK] - D20OOO4O2MFSH/7 // Our reI:

CcilF1tzo1ro6s/T1da3 [ACctDENT tNVoLVtNG SHC272X AND SHc7798A ON t4lo2/2o701

Dear Jia Le,

We are agreeable with your proposal on liability.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Merina Chia (Ms)

Motor Claims Department

MS First Capital lnsurance Ltd I 36 Robinson Road, city House #16-0L Singapore 068877 | Tel:6507 3848 | DID :6507 3856

I Fax No. :6507 3849 I Emait:merinachia@msfirstcapital com sq I Company Regn No 195000106C

a Member of EIEEII lnsurance GrouP

Personol Doto Protection Act 2012 ("PDPA"):

ui,ii, lne popa, there ore various requirements thot regulote the processin7 of your personol doto. Pleose refer to

itli: t iwww.nifirstcopitat.com.se for detoils of PDPA Personol Doto collection stotement'

conlidentiality Notice: This e.moil is confidentiol. tt may olso be LegoLLy privileged. lf you ore not the addrcssee.ot to whom it is intended' you

mav not .opy, forwara, dirctor" o, us"'oililiif.i ti. tiiiiiiir" i"iti"Z tn* krttog;, in 
"rror, 

please delete the messose ond all copies lrom

yoir system'ond notify the sender irnmediately by return e'mail'
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From: Jia Le (LKK Auto) <Jia Le@lkkaulo.com>
Sent: Friday, T February 2020 11:11 AM

To: Merina Chia <MerinaChia @msfirstca pital.com.sg>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>
subject: RE: PROPOSAL ON LlABltlTY [Express settlement via LKK] - D2O000402MFSH/7 // Our ref:

CC4/FC]2OO7O61/T1da3 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING SHC272X AND SHC7798A ON 1'4102/20201

Claim No: D20000402MFSH/1

LKK Ref : CC4lFC12001069/T1da3

Dear Sirs/Madam,

ACCTDENT INVOLVING SHC 272X AND SHC 7798A ON L4lO2l2O2O

We refer to the above matter.

Lia bility: 100%

Remarks: The said chain collision involved 3 vehicles whereby our insured was the 2nd vehicle. ln accordance to the

MCF guideline for chain collision, we have to settle the front vehicle's claim at 100%.

Kindly let us have your approval on liability

ii {istrinl y€lt o ltaPpy anct Prosperous Unar New yszr"

Best Regards,

Chan Jia Le I Case Handler

LKKAuto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone 6749 5792 | email: Jiale@lkkauto.com I fax: 674t-4ro8

Blk 5r, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(4o8933)

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 24 January 2o2O 10:11 AM

To: 'Merina Chla'; Jia Le (LKK Auto)

Cc: Admin A

SUbJECt: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D2OOOO4O2MFSH/1 // EXPRESS SETTLEMENT

YOILR REF: D2O0O0402MFSH
LKK REF : CC4 /FCI 2 0 O 0 7 0 69 /T 7 da3

Dear Sir / Madam,

We refer to the above matter'

We had inspected TP vehicle SHC 7798A on a WP basis and TP repairer proposed for a direct settlement'

Enclosed for your perusal is:
. TP estimated cost ofrePair
. Preliminary advice

Please take note that the case handler in-charge is )ia Le and she can be contacted at DID:6749 S79Z'

To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned'
3



i Wlching yfr! o Happy ano Prosperaus Lunar New Year,

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Mei Kwan I Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366 oo55 | email: MeiKwan@lkkauto.com I fa:x: 674l^4108

Blk 5r, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(4o8933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-d@lkkauto.com>
Sent: Thursday, 16 January, 2020 3:20 PM

To: 'CWS Motor Claims' <cwsmotorclaims(A msfirstcapital.com.sg>; assiBnments <assignments@ lkkauto.com>

Cc:'Merina Chia'<MerinaChia(amsfirstcapital.com.sq>; Admin A <admin-a (olkkauto com>

subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D20000402MFSH/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,

Thank you for the assignment.

., Wiriing yoat o ,lappy atn rrotPeraus u'ttor Na}, Yeai"

Best Regards

G.NI\7TTIIA

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phonet 684t-tg72 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com lfa"t: 6256-4315

Blk 5r, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(4o89$)

From: CWS Motor Claims Imailto:cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com ss]

Sent: Thursday, 76 )anuatY 2020 2:27 PM

To: ASSIGNMENTS@LKKAUTO.COM

Cc: CWS Motor Claims <cwsmotorclaims(amsfirstcapital.com.sp>; Merina Chia <MerinaChia @ msfirstca pital.com.sq>

Subject: PRI: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D20000402MFSH/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,

We refer to the above reference.

Please find attached the necessary documents for survey'

Kindly submit your report via CWS within the next 14 days.

Note: All the accident reports are uploaded into cws for your perusal.

Best Regards,
Admin Team



Claim Workflow System
Motor Claims Depaxtrnent
MS First Capital Insurance Limited
Tel : 6507 3848
Fax : 6507 3849

PS: This is a system generated mail. Please do not reply to this mail.

This email has been checked for viruses by AVG antivirus software.

www.ave.com
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ffiH DING AUTOMOTIVE PTE LTD
Blk 10 #01-20 Sin Ming
lndusflal Est Sec C
Singapore 575645'qF Without Preiudice to our

driver's Infury claims
OUR REF: 501!2365 lTP /sHc7798A/ AD / L4 loUZOZo lsld.r
YOUR REF: SHC0272XlDz000040zMrSH

11 February 202 0
To: MOTOR CLAIMS DEPARTMENT
MS FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE
36 ROBINSON ROAD
#16-01 CITY HOUSE
SINGAPORE 068877

ACCIDENT INVOLVING : SHC7798A AGATNST sHC02ZZx t4 / OtlZOZo
LOCATION ALONG : PIE TOI{ARDS CHANGT AIRPORT

The accide[t was caused solely by Ore negllgence ofyour lnsured/driver and as a results, We had
lncBrred ttre followlng costs ofrepair and losses ofour insurer;

Our client has autlorized DING AUTOMOTM PTE LTD to deal wlth the claim in this accldent case and
also to receive and deal/negodate witl all payment as stated above
Please look into our client's clalm and revert soonest as posslble.

Your Slncerely,
SELOSIIINAH
DING AUTOMOTIYE
TELt +65 q2394128

we refer to the above matter:

Rate Per
Day

Repalr/
Claims
Day

Anount Before
GST

GST
7o/o

Amount After
GST

Cost ofReoair s 7 g 6,797.24 $ 475.39 s 7266.63
Loss Of Rental s 117.00 7 $ 819.00 $ s 819.00

Loss Of Income $ 80.00 7 $ s60,00 $ $ 560.00

LTA/GIA Search
Fee $ 0 $ 6.96 $ 0.49 $ 7.,15

Towins Fee $ 0 s $

Surveyor Fee $ 0 $ $ $

Total $ 197.00 7 $ I,r77.20 $ 475.88 $ &6s3.08

LTA 3.d Partv Search Fee

FAXt+65 6452 O6L4



IETTER OF AUTHORITY

Accident invoh.fine
gza towwd< ci

:s'{{-tc_tqqs g_,a S(tcz1l X. *on | ill koro Btons

I/We, $l e Ltd' NRIC/ Co.Reg Number 199S02839G registered owner
of vehicle ,Na, gltc-?!'qgA . . wliich was ,untua to Hirer/Driver

NF.Jic S ?//??]o /" , hereby
authorize Dihg Autorhotive Fte Ltd on this date ,tS/!/Zo2o to submit,
'correspond , negQtiate and settle my/our claim for cost of repair and
unineured losses arlsing from the above accident and without prejudice ofour
driver's injuriy claim.

I/we furthef authorize that agreed settlement sum for cost of repair, Ioss of
income and irental, survey report fee or any Iegal fee , third parry vehicle
insurance pqrrttculars enquiry fee etc. , be made in frvour of Ding Automotive
Pte Ltd and,that the said payment be forward,ed to them as full ,and final
discharge of my/our clalms,

:

' Owner Signature/Co,Chbp 
'

4p{

i

Hirer/Driver ;Si gnature



MlfFirstCapital

CLAliil REFERENCE

ACCIDENT DATE

ACCIDENT LOCATION

INSURED

INSURED DRIVER

INSURED VEHICLE

INVOLVED PARTY

SETTLEIV]ENT SUM

CLAIMANT :

wrNESs :tdtq D,y

DISCHARG= RECEIPT

D20000402MFSH/1

14t01t2020

PIE TOWARDS CHANGI AIRPORT

CITYCAB PTE LTD

TAN YEW SENG

sHc 272X

sHc 77984

$ 8,350.00

Signature and Dale I

Signaiure_glrlqate :

< \n"

I.4S Firs: Capital Insurance Limited co Reg. No tesooolo6c Gsr Req. N. M2'00016r6_9

6 Raffles Ouay #21-00 Singapore 048580
Toi: (65) 6222 2311 Fax:165) 62223547

crrims & Motor und.Britirs D.pr 36 Robinson Road #1 6-01 C lty H oLJse Singapore 068877

Tel: (65)6507 3848 Fax (65) 6507 3849
www.msfirstcapltal.com.sg

Without Prejudice
to our driver's lnjury claim

b\Ltor/ccPL/95

ffi+'*
t+|4,n

Approved For PaYment
By I Date

lM,/e, the undernoted CLAItulANT being the person/entity entitled to receive the compensation in relation to the accident,

hereby a9re6 to accept tho SETTLEMENI SUI\4 as full and final settlement of aal claims for damages, costs &

disbursements arising oul of the ACCIDENT, and I,M,/E also agree that the said settlement sum:

1. is paid without admission of liability on the pan of MS First Capital lnsurance Limited and/or its

INSURED and/or its INSURED DRIVER in respect of the said loss and for damage whether

now or hereafter to become manifest,

2. is accepted by me/us to the intent lhat the said iils First Capital lnsuranc€ Limited and /or its

INSURED and/or its INSURED DRIVER be absolutely and tinally discharged from all claims

whatsoeverwhich I/wE now or hereafter may have arising out of or connected with or

traceab:e to the said accident.

t^n E acknowtedge that this DISCHARGE RECEIPT is not to be construed as an admission ol Iiability on the part of [,4S

First Capiial lnsurance Limited and/or its INSURED and /or its INSURED DRIVER and it shall not be used as evidence

i. any claims or actions which may be made €gainsl them or any ol them.

CiD.

, @,1.,1,,,, ,",



ptN0 AuT*lYlorlvx rYr LfD
Buoin*ss Reg. No : 201$1922?G

eLK 10, #01-t0 $lll MING ltlD E$T. SEC C, SINGAPTRE t?$645
Tel: 6452 1208 Fax 64520614

TAX IX1'OIC€

r,4S r:KSl CAPttrL INSUn*ilCE U!*:TrD
36 ROBtllsoN IOAO .*:.6-01

alTY HOUsr {$0S8877)

ATTni : noToR Cr,AiiqS Di'rA9.TMEN:
I Fr- | 6749 579? rAX

rtrlr t{o,

Ilrvo:cf
OATE
ssTRE6 rito
YIRHS
po rao
oqs nGF
PA6:

1-000944

26-A2'2A24
231619222G

5HCi?.7)-\
SHCTTS8A

itlI

SUB IOTAL : 6,791.24

63T : {75.39
REPIAftKS :

lob card: 10112365
Y.ur rllti 5llc0z72x
oicr Ms. .]ia k
ora:14/0U:0?0

TOTAL SSn : 7,26463
oEpoglT :

Customer Slgnah.lre
I ha\! ir6p.il€, .r{ hor.! codlnrEd th.t

d€rob doru ad *B an'.!nt ** &re'n
al? elltl.e t5 mY *tl3rrftk'l



Our Ref: CC20010349

Date: 1 5 January 2020 .!g,rqcoo

TO WHOM IT MAY CONCERN

Dear Sir/Madam

ACCIDENT ON 1410112020 @ 10:00 hrs
ALONG ALONG PIE TOWARDS CHANGI AIRPORT
INVOLVING SHC272X, SHD3O33U

Wo refer to the above-mentioned accident and wish to inform that Citycab Pte Ltd is
the registeEd owner of the taxi bearing vehicle registration number 

-SHCZZSae 
ltfre

Taxi"). The Taxi was hired to NEO THTAM HUAT tC NO SXXXXo7oH a registered
^r hirer-operator of Citycab Pte Ltd at tho time of occunence of the aforementioned

accident at a rental rat6 $125.19 p€r day (inclusive of GST).
fi n+'fi (t//, (?t1)

Please be advised that the Taxi was insured with MS First Capital lnsurence Ltd on
a third party basis at the material time of the accident.

We wish to confirm that the aforesaid hirer-operator had obtained our permission to
undertake repairs for damage on the Taxi arising from the said accident with a motor
workshop of his choice.

Please lialse with the said hirer-operator or his authorized workshop directly for
settlement of claims with third party's insurance company in respect of the said
accident.

Yours faithfully

1 Christine Tay
Manager, Fleet Safety

This is a compuler generated letter, No signature is required.

383 Sin Ming Drive Singapora 5757.17 Mainline +65 6555 1188 Facsimile +65 6453 3183
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l..and't ran sporr,R\thoritJ
Land Transport Authorlty
10 SIn lr4ing Driye
Slnsapore 575?01

GST Regishalion No. I i,r4-000652S2

Receipt No. : ITNEr-00000-200115-002518

Prcvious Receipt No- i

Print Date/Tlme :

Rec€ipt Date/nme :

Tax lnvolco/Rocelpt

15 Jan 2020 / l5:49:04

15 Jan 2020I15:48:40

As at 14 Jan 2020/22:00:00
Insu.anc6 Co: MS FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LIMITED

1 ln6urance Enquiry - SHC272X
Enquiry Foe
20200115154743169410

,. ' ii.r:

TotrlAmount Payable

Pald Bil,: .i : :,,..'-..

- xloeoooopoi$l4T2

Total

Cash Ci.n0e

Tendered Amounl

Exg€ss Refu ndtble Amount

7.OO

7.OO . O.4gi

7,00 0.49
-: / 1;:.

7.49

7./9

7.49

0-04

7.45

,7,45

7.45

.010D

7.45

.1r1:,. ' 0:00

THANK YOU AN? HAVE A NICE DAY!

good qnd irorirpiry


