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Celine ang [L!(KAutu!

From; Audrey Hwee Ling GOH <audreygoh@dbs.com=
Sent Friday, 17 January 2020 10:46 AM

To: LKE Valuation

Cc Shiau Chan (LEKAuto); Teline Fong (LKKAuto)
Subject: Valuation Request

Hi Celine/Shiau Chan,
Ple:ase assist to provide valuation for the following vehicles:-

1) 5GF1221H- Road tax expiry 6 Jun 2020, Dec 2012 Mini Cooper 5 Countryman
2) SKL6363U - Road tax expired 27 Sept 2019, Mae 2013 Mazda 6 2.5A

We had faxed the above the registration details, please acknowledged.
Thank you.

Audrey Goh
AMG-Consumer Credit
DBES Bank Ltd

Tel - GB78 9026

CONFIDENTIAL NOTE:

The information contained in this email is intended only for the use of the individual or entity named above and may
contain information that is privileged, confidential and exempt from disclosure under applicable law. If the reader of this
message is not the intended recipient, you are hereby notified that any dissemination, distribution or copying of this
communication is strictly prohibited. If you have received this message in error, please immediately notify the sender
and delete the mall. Thank you.



» Back to OneMotoring

Enquire Vehicle Transfer Fee

Vehicle Details

Viehicle No.
SKL&363U

Make / Mode|
MAZDA / MAZDAG 4-DOOR SEDAN 2.5L SP.GEAT SR HID

Vehicle Type:
P10 - Passenger Motor Car

Vehicle Attachment 1 :
With Sun Roof

Vehicle Scheme
Normal

Chassis No.:
IM6GJ1031D0106791

Propellant :
Petrol

Engine No, :
PY20204938

Motor No.:

Engine Capacity :
2488 cc

Power Rating :
Maximum Power Output :
138.0 kW (185 bhp)



Maximum Laden Weight :
1965 kg

Unladen Welght :

1498 kg

Year Of Manufacture :
2013

Original Registration Date :
28 Mar 2013

Lifespan Expiry Date
COE Category:
B - Car (1601cc & above)

Quota Premium:
$92,901.00
COE Expiry Date:
27 Mar 2023

Road Tax Expiry Date :
27 Sep 2019

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date :
27 Mar 2023

Inspection Due Date :
27 Mar 2020

Intended Transfer Date:
17 Jan 2020

CO2 Emission :

153.00 (g/km)

CEV/VES Rebate Utilised Amount :
$5,000.00

CO Emission:

HC Emission:

MNOx Emission ;

PM Emission :



> Back to OneMotoring

Engquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

MImmhmm

Jhwner I_D 'TWr

Swiner Dy

vehicle Details

.Fnhi_.:i_&-b}n.:

wehiche to be Exported:

Inténded Deregistration Date:

Wishicie Make:

Juhitle Mndel

Primary Colowr:

Manufacturing Year:

Ehgline No.:

Chassls Now

S p—— anur Output:

_:tp:nmmw;uut

Originat Registration Date:
*jrst Registration Date:
Transfer Count:

Actual ARF Paid:

Intended PARF Rebate Detalls

PARF Eligibility:

OARF Elgiily Expiry Date:

PARF Rebate Amount:

Intended COE Rebate Details

COE Expiry Date.

COE Category:

COE Period(Years):

P Paid!

Tﬂnm:ruf uwshipmdureginntlun is ot allowed tor this vehicle.

The Jnfurm:ﬂnn mﬂuinﬂd herein s correct as at 17 Jan 20‘2ﬂ

Singapore NRIC
T35F

SKL&EIEIU

07 Febr 2020

MAZDA

MAZDAS 4-DOCR SEDAN 250 SPSEAT SR HID
Grev

2013

PY20204938
IMEGII03100106771
138.0 kW (185 bhp)
£27.065.00

28 Mar 2013

EEI Mar 2013

mu-amo 107 \/

Yes
27 Mar 2023
£14,344.00

27 Mar 2023
8 - Car (1601cc & above)
10

$92,901.00

£29,143.00
$43.487.00
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» Back to OneMatoring

Emulre PARF/COE Rebate for Iﬁsﬂmd Vehicle ]
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Celine Faﬂ [utl{nutu!

From: Audrey Hwee Ling GOH <audreygoh@dbs.com>
Sent: Tuesday, 4 February 2020 5:20 PM

To: Celine Fong (LKKAutD)

(o= Shiau Chan (LKKAuto); LKK Valuation

Subject: RE: Valuation Reqguest

Hi Celine,

Please proceed to submit the valuation report for SKL6363U.
Thank you.

Audrey Gah
AMG-Consumer Credit
CBS Bank Ltd

Tel - 6878 9026

From: Audrey Hwee Ling GOH

Sent: Monday, February 3, 2020 2:07 PM

To: Celine Fong [LKKAuto) <calinefong@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) <siewsc@Ikkauto.com=; LKK Valuation <valuation@lkkauto.com>
Subject: RE: Valuation Reguest

ki Celine,

You may proceed to submit valuation report for 5GF1221H.
As for the other vehicle, will update you on 5 February 2020.
Thank you.

Audrey Goh
RMG-Consumer Credit
DB8S Bank Ltd

Tel - 6878 9026

From: Celine Fong (LKKAuto) <celinefong@Ikkauto com>

Sant: Monday, February 3, 2020 11:58 AM

To: Audrey Hwee Ling GOH <audreyeoh@dbs.com>

Ce: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) <siewsc@lkkauto.com>; LKK Valuation <valuation@ [kkauto.com>
Subject: [External] RE: Valuation Request

VT
o ]'

Dear Audrey,

Can we proceed to submit the valuation reports?



Celine Fﬂl‘_l—ﬂ !LI{KAutaJ

From: Celine Fong (LKKAutO)

Sert: Maonday, 20 January 2020 2:24 PM

To: Audréy Hwee Ling GOH; LEK Vaiuation
Ce Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

Subject RE: Valuation Request

Dear Audrey,

Th= Valuation of vehicles as below:

1) SGF1Z21H MY S43K FS: $39.8K
2) SKL6363U MV: $45K FS: $43.5K
As at January 2020
Bt Regnatls,
Celine Fong

LEK Auto Consultants Pte Lid
phane: 6256-3561 | email: pelinefong@lkkauto.com | fix: 6256-4315
Blk: 51, Paya Ubd Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, 202-25 | 5(408933)

From: Audrey Hwee Ling GOH <audreygoh@dbs.com>

Sent: Friday, 17 January 2020 10:46 AM

To: LKK Valuation <valuation@lkkauto.com=

Ce: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) <siewsc@lkkauto.com>; Celine Fong (LKKAuto) <celinefong@lkkauto.com>
Subject: Valuation Request

Hi Celine/Shiau Chan,
Please assist to provide valuation for the following vehicles:-

1) S$GF1221H - Road tax expiry 6 Jun 2020, Dec 2012 Mini Cooper § Countryman
2) SKL6363U - Road tax expired 27 Sept 2019, Mae 2013 Mazda 6 2.5A

We had faxed the above the registration details, please acknowledged.
Thank you,

Audrey Goh

RMG-Consumer Credit

DBS Bank Ltd
Tel - 6878 9026

CONFIDENTIAL NOTE:

The information contained in this email is intended only for the use of the individual or entity named above and may
contain information that is privileged, confidential and exempt from disclosure under applicable law, If the reader of this

1
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