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Celine anﬂ SLI(I{Autu!

From: Audrey Hwee Ling GOH <audraygoh@dbs.com>
Sent: Eriday, 17 January 2020 10:46 AM

To LKK Valuation

Cc: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto); Celine Fong (LKKAUta)
Subject: Valuation Reguest

Hl Celine/Shiau Chan,
Please assist to provide valuation for the following vehicles:-

1) SGF1221H - Road tax expiry 6 Jun 2020, Dec 2012 Mini Cooper S Countryman
2) SKL6363U - Road tax expired 27 Sept 2018, Mae 2013 Mazda 6 2.5A

Wi had faxed the above the registration details, please acknowledged.
Thank you,

Audrey Goh
RMG-Consumer Credit
DES Bank Ltd

Tel - GR7E 9026

CONFIDENTIAL NOTE:

The information contained in this email is intended only for the use of the individual or entity named above and may
contain Infarmation that is privileged, confidential and exempt from disclosure under applicable law. if the reader of this
massage is not the intended recipient, you are hereby notified that any dissemination, distribution or copying of this
communication is strictly prohibited. If you have received this message in error, please immediately notify the sender
ard delete the mail. Thank you.
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> Back to OneMotoring

Enquire Vehicle Transfer Fee

Vehicle Details

Vehicle Ne.
SGF1221H

Make / Madel
MINI / COOPER S COUNTRYMAN 1.6 FWD HID DSC D/AB

Vehicle Type :

P11 - Passenger Station Wagon/Jeep/Land Rover
Vehicle Attachment 1:

No Attachment

Vehicle Scheme :

Normal

Chassis No. :
WMWZC32050WNO02851

Propellant :
Petrol

Engine No. :
AD45J319N18B16A

Motor No.:
Engine Capacity :
1598 cc

Power Rating :

Maximum Power Output:

135.0 kW (181 bhp)



Maximum Laden Weight :
1805 kg

Unladen Weight :
1335 kg

Year Of Manufacture :
2012

Original Registration Date.:
07 Dec 2012

Lifespan Expiry Date:

COE Category:
A -Car (1600cc & below)

Quota Premium :
$78,523.00

COE Expiry Date :
06 Dec 2022

Road Tax Expiry Date:
06 Jun 2020

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date:
06 Dec 2022

Inspection Due Date :
06 Dec 2021

intended Transfer Date :
17 Jan 2020

CO2 Emission :
175.00 (g/km)

CEV/VES Rebate Utilised Amount ;

CO Emission :

HC Emission :

MNOx Emission :

PM Emission :



> Back to OneMaotoring

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

\fuhl‘:du Owner Pﬂﬂﬂlhﬂ
Cwner 1D Type:

Owiner 1D:

Vehicle Details

VehlcleNo.:

Vehicle to be Exparted:
Intended Deregistration Date:
Vehicls Make:

Vehicle ML‘IdEI

Primary Colour;
Manufacturing Year:

Engine Mo -

Chassls No.

aximum intrt)u'lpu_t =
omuhhdm Value:

Oiriginal WL‘

First Registration ﬂata
Transfer Count:

Actual ARF Paid:

Intended PARF Rebate Details
PARF EIJ:IHHtr

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date:
COFE Expiry Date:

COE Category:

COE Period{Yearsk

QP Paid:

COE Rebate Amount:
Tuhlﬂnlg._uuhmunt

The informatian contained hergin is correct 25 at 17 Jan 2020

Singapore NRIC
3B1C

5GF1221H

Np

31 Jan 2020

MINI

COOPER S COUNTRYMAN 1.5 FWD HID DSC D/AB
Red

2012
AO4SI319N18B16A
WMWZCIZ0STWNOZES1
1350kW (181 H_'.;I}
iﬂﬁ.ﬂzm

'u?beczﬂﬂ

ﬂ? Dec 2012

iZP;ﬁZiﬂﬂ IL'g I

Yes
06 Dec 2022
$17413.00

06 Dec 2022
A- Car!i&ﬂﬂ:l:&belcw!
L S
$78.523.00
$22.974.00
$39,787.00
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> Back to OneMotoring
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Celine Fong !LKKAutu}

From: Audrey Hwee Ling GOH <audreygoh@dbs.com>
Sent: Monday, 3 February 2020 207 PM

Ta: Celine Fong (LKKAuto)

Ce Shiau Chan (LKKAuto); LKK Valuation

Subject: RE; Valuation Request

Hi Celine,

You may proceed to submit valuation report for SGF1221H.
#is for the other vehicle, will update you on 5 February 2020.
Thank you,

Audrey Goh
FEMG-Consumer Credit
NBS Bank Ltd

Tel - GETE 9026

From: Celine Fong (LKKAuto) <celinefong@lkkauto.com:

Sent: Monday, February 3, 2020 11:58 AM

To: Audrey Hwee Ling GOH <audreygoh@dbs.com>

Ce: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) <siewsc@lkkauto.com>; LKK Valuation <valuation@Ilkkauto.com:
Subject: [External] RE: Valuation Request

Dear Audrey,

Can we proceed to submit the valuation reports?

Fest Regards,

Celine Fong

LEKK Auto Consultanis Pte Lid

phone: 6256-3561 | email: celinefong@®lkkiuto com | fix: 6256-4315
Flk 51 Pava Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenoe 1, #oz-25 | S{a08933)

From: Celine Fong (LKKAuto) <celinefong@lkkauto.com>
Sent: Monday, 20 January 2020 2:24 PM

To: Audrey Hwee Ling GOH <audreygoh@dbs.com>; LKK Valuation <valuation@lkkauto.com>
Cc: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) <siewsc@lkkauto.com>
Subject: RE: Valuation Request

Diear Audrey,



The Valuation of vehicles as below:

1) SGF1221H MV: $43K FS: 539.8K
2) SKLB363U MV: S45K FS: 543.5K
As at January 2020
Hest Regards,
Celine Fong

LEK Aulo Consultants Pte Lud

phone: 6256-3561 | email: celinefong@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubl lndistrinl Park, Ubl Avenue 1, #o2-25 | S{4080951)

From: Audrey Hwee Ling GOH <audreypoh@dbs.com>

LSent: Friday, 17 January 2020 10:46 AM

To: LKK Valuation <valuation@lkkauto.com>

Ce: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) <siewsc@lkkauto.com>; Celine Fong (LKKAuto) <calinefong@|kkauto.com>
Lubject: Valuation Regquest

Hi Celine/Shiau Chan,
Flease assist to provide valuation for the following vehicles:-

1) S5GF1221H-Road tax expiry 6 Jun 2020, Dec 2012 Mini Cooper 5 Couritryman
2) 5KL6363U - Road tax expired 27 Sept 2019, Mae 2013 Mazda 6 2.5A

We had faxed the above the registration detalls, please acknowledged.
Thank you.

Ludrey Gah
EMG-Consumer Credit
[BS Bank Ltd

Tel - GBR78 8026

CONFIDENTIAL NOTE:

The information contained in this email is intended only for the use of the individual or entity named above and may
contain information that is privileged, confidential and exempt from disclosure under applicable law. if the reader of
tiis message Is not the Intended recipient, you are hereby notified that any dissemination, distribution or copying of
this communication is strictly prohibited. If you have received this message in error, please immediately notify the
sznder and delete the mail. Thank you.

CONFIDENTIAL NOTE:

The information contained in this email is intended only for the use of the individual or entity named above and may
cantain information that is privileged, confidential and exempt from disclosure under applicable law. if the reader of
this message is not the intended reciplent, you are hereby notified that any dissemination, distribution or copying of
this communication is strictly prohibited. If you have received this message in error, please immediately notify the
sander and delete the mail. Thank you.



Celine Fo LKKAuto

From: Celine Fong (LKEAUID)

Sent: Moniday, 20 January 2020 2:24 PM

Teo: Audrey Hwee Ling GOH; LKK Valuation
Cc; Shiau Chan [LKKAuto)

Subject: RE! Valuation Request

Dear Audrey,

The Valuation of vehicles as below:

1) SGF1221H MV: $43K F5: $39.8K
2] SKLe3e3U MV: 545K F5: 543.5K

As at January 2020

Best Regards,

Celine Fong

LEK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

phone; 62s6-a561 | email: celinpfong@ kkasto.com | fak: Ga56-4315
Blk 51, Payy Ubk Industrial Park, Ubl Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408931)

From: Audrey Hwee Ling GOH <audreygoh@dbs com>

Sent: Friday, 17 January 2020 10:46 AM

Ter: LKK Valuation <valuation@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) <siewsc@Ikkauto.com>; Celine Fong (LKKAuto) <celinefong@lkkauto.com>
Subject: Valuation Request

Hi Celine/Shiau Chan,
Pl=ase assist to provide valuation for the following vehicles:-

1) SGF1221H— Road tax expiry 6 Jun 2020, Dec 2012 Mini Cooper S Countryman
2) SKLE363U - Road tax expired 27 Sept 2019, Mae 2013 Mazda 6 2.54

We had faxed the above the registration details, please acknowledged.
Thank you.

Audrey Goh

RiNG-Consumer Credit

DAS Bank Ltd
Tel - 6878 9026

CONFIDENTIAL NOTE:

The information contained in this email is intended only for the use of the individual or entity named above and may
contain information that is privileged, confidential and exempt from disclosure under applicable law. If the reader of this
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