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COMFORIDELGRO

ENGINEERING

OurJobRefNo . 305375174

. ComfortDelGro Engineering Pte Ltd
Date :_23.Jan.2020 59 Loyang Drive. Singapors 508989

Fax: 6546 8156

FINALIZATION FORM
To LKK Fax:
Attn  : RAM
Vehicle RegNo. : SHAB080R Date of Accident: 15. Jan. 2020

The survey and estimates of the repairs of the above-mentioned vehicle are as follows:-

1. The repair job shall bill to: MSIG EV7G

2. The finalized amount shall be:
(a) Spare Parts after List discount

(b) Labour Charges

Total for Part-By-Part Repair Cost

(c.) Lumpsum Repair (if applicable)
Total for Lumpsum repair cost after Less:
Final Lumpsum Repair cost

$5,950.00

3. Estimated normal period for repairs: 4 working days.

4, We shall treat the above amount as Correct and Confirmed if there is no reply from you
within 7 working days

5. Thank you for your assistance. We confirm the estimates and
finalized amount

Signature : ‘4 “/‘ Signature : <
,

Name : Larry No Name / Loy~

Tel : 6214 8316 Date  : 241202

Fax . 6546 8156

For Official Use Onl

Bocumant
Item Amount Attached
Yes or No

Rental Rate P/Day YES

Loss of Income Paid

Confirm By

(Signature) Remarks

Survey Fees

LTA Search Fee $7.49

Medical Fees (on behalf
of driver, if applicable)

6 Overrun

Lol Bl E2 [l o

Remarks:




& LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (co.reg.No:199607198R)
51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25, Paya Ubi Industrial Park
Singapore 408933
Tel: 6256-3561 Fax: 6844-8805 Email: sur@lkkauto.com;assignments@Ikkauto.com

To: MSIG Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd. From: LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
4 Shenton Way 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25
#21-01 SGX Centre 2 Paya Ubi Industrial Park
Singapore 068807 Singapore 408833

Attn: Christina Wong Date: 21 Jan 2020

Preliminary Advice

Insured Vehicle No EVTG

TP Vehicle No : SHAB080R Accident Date : 15/01/2020
Make : HYUNDAI 140 Assignment Date :17/01/2020
Date of Inspection 1 17/01/2020 Est. Duration of Repair :4.00
Inspection At - COMFORTDELGRO ENGINEERING PTE LTD (LOYANG)

59 LOYANG DRIVE

SINGAPORE 508969

Point of Impact / General Description of Damages
The vehicle sustained impact / damages front portion and parts claimed are consistent to the accident.

Repairer's Estimate (Gross) :S§ 12,147.14
Revised Amount :S$ 8,030.04
Check Items (Estimated) :S% 2,826.75
Total :S% 10,856.79
Lump Sum Repair :S$

Total Loss Consideration

New for Old Value :S$
Pre-Accident Value 5§
COE / PARF Rebate :S%
Salvage Value :S$
Margin for Repair :5%

Remarks
( ) The vehicle is economical/not economical for repair.

( x ) The above survey was conducted on a 'without prejudice’ basis.



-

Summer Lee (LKK Auto)

From: Crystal Lee <crystal_lee@sg.msig-asia.com>
Sent: Friday, 17 January, 2020 10:52 AM

To: Admin-D (LKKAuto); assignments

Cc: Ong Zi Hui

Subject: Survey Request - Manual Assigned
Attachments: 2985_001.pdf

SHA8080R VS EV7G (MSIG) DOA: 15.01.2020 (Vehicle in w/shop)

Manual Assigned

Dear LKK,
Refer to the email below, please arrange survey the vehicle.
We'll assign via Merimen once we receive the assignment from Motor Team.

Please contact us ASAP if you cannot attend this assignment.

Thank you & Best regards,

Crystal Lee

Admin Officer, Claims Services (In-House Survey)

D: +65 6594 2535 | F: +65 6643 1349 | crystal lee@sg.msig-asia.com

MSIG

MSIG Insurance (Singapore) Pte Ltd 16 Raffles Quay, #24-01 Hong Leong Building, Singapore 048581 | T: +65 6220
9644 | F: +65 6225 6371 | Co. Reg. No. 200412212G | msig.com.sg o @ o

AMemberof IRRENNE INSURANCE GROUP

From: Motor Survey <motorsurvey@sg.msig-asia.com>

Sent: Thursday, 16 January 2020 5:43 PM

To: Crystal Lee <crystal_lee@sg.msig-asia.com>; Ong Zi Hui <zihui_ong@sg.msig-asia.com>

Cc: Helene Phua <heIene__phua@sg.msig—asia.com>; Winnie Chua <pingping_chua @sg.msig-asia.com>
Subject: FW: SHA8080R VS EV7G (MSIG) DOA: 15.01.2020

Dear Crystal/ Zi hui,

Kindly confirm with repairer if the taxi is in.

If yes, outsource this case.

Thanks.

Best Regards



'Lee Wee Ho
Assistant Manager, Claims Services (In-House Survey)
D :'+65 6643 1347 | F : +65 6225 7402 | weeho lee@sg.msig-asia.com

MSIG

MSIG Insurance (Singapore) Pte Ltd 16 Raffles Quay, #24-01 Hong Leong Building, Singapore 048581 | T: +65 6220
9644 | F: +65 6225 6371 | Co. Reg. No. 200412212G | msig.com.sg o

AMember of RIERTENNE INSURANCE GROUP

From: Ng Nyuk Phin <ngnp@cdge.com.sg>

Sent: Thursday, 16 January 2020 3:42 PM

To: Motor Survey <motorsurvey@sg.msig-asia.com>
Cc: Lim Kwok Eng <limke @cdge.com.sg>

Subject: SHA8080R VS EV7G (MSIG) DOA: 15.01.2020

LEXTERNAL EMAIL: Be careful when you click any links or open any attachment(s).

Dear Motor Claims,
Please see attached Repair Estimate and SAS. Kindly arrange to survey the taxi at 59 Loyang Drive.

Regards,

Larry Ng

ComfortDelgro Engineering Pte Ltd
Loyang Taxi Crash Repair

6214 8316

&9 Think Before Printing

From: canon@comfortdelgro.com.sg <canon@comfondelgro.com.5g>

Sent: Thursday, 16 January 2020 3:39 PM
To: Ng Nyuk Phin
Subject: Scan Image

This message and any attachments may contain confidential, privileged or proprietary information. If you are not the intended recipient, kindly notify
us and delete this message and its attachments immediately, and please be advised that using, copying. distributing or disclosing any contents
therein 1s not allowed. Statements pertaining to any matter outside our business are not to be taken as endorsed by ComfortDelGro Comoration
Limited or its related companies. The comments/proposals provided are for discussion purposes only and are subject 1o approvals Nothing herain
shall constitute a binding agreement between the parties Neither party shall be bound in any way to any term or condition except as agreed in a
wiitten agreement signed by the duly authorised representatives of both parties

ComiontDelGro - a Green Office cerlified by the Singapore Enviranment Council - is committed to preserving the environment. We encourage you
to print this only if necessary



Co;nfcerelGro Engineering Pte Ltd [Registration No. 199506048W)

CONFIDENTIALITY NOTICE

This e-mail (including any attachments) may contain information that is privileged or confidential. The sending of this e-mail to any
person other than the intended recipient is not a waiver of the privilege or confidentiality that attaches to it. If you are not the intended
recipient, please notify the sender immediately, delete the email and do not copy, distribute or disclose its contents.
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' MCDB20007229 / ComfortDelGro Engineering Pte Lid - Loyang
ENTRY DATE & TIME: 16/01/2020 11:41
SUBMITTED BY: Janet Lim Siang Gek

SINGAPORE ACCIDENT STATEMENT
IMPORTANT NOTICE

1. Please report ccrreclly the details of the acciden! to speed up the claims process
2. This Form must be completed by the Policyholder and/or the Authorised Driver
3. Information provided must be as truthful and accurate as possible. Any wilful misrepresentation or witholding of material facts may allow insurance companies to

repudiate policy liability.

4. The issue and acceptance of this Form by Insurance companies is not an admission af policy liability on the part of the insurance companies
5. Any false reporting may be referred to the Police for investigation.

6. This report will be forwarded by the insurers of the GIA Records Management Centre established by the General Insurance Association of Singapore (GIA) for
archiving and that coples of this report will, for a fee, be made available upon application by interested parties
7. By the lodgement of this report to the insurers, you hereby consent to the archiving of this report at the centre and to copies of the report being made avallable

aforesaid

ACCIDENT STATEMENT

Date Of Report
Date Of Accident

Exact Location Of Accident

16/01/2020 11:41
15/01/2020 19:40
PIE(AIRPORT) NEAR LP434

Country/State of Loss SINGAPORE
Vehicle Registration Number SHAB8080R
Insured/Policyholder

Name Of Registered Owner CITYCAB PTELTD
Co Reg No 1XXXXX839G

Email Address
Mobile Phone No
Alternative Phone No
Vehicle Particulars
Manufacturer

Model

Exact Purpose for which vehicle was being used at
time of accident

Are you claiming under your own insurance policy
for repair to your vehicle?

If No, Please state action to be taken
Vehicle Category

Insurance Company

Name of Insurance Company
Type Of Coverage

Fleet Policy

Policy Number

Cover Note Number

Driver

Name of Driver

NRIC No

Date Of Birth

Occupation

Date Of Driving Pass

Driving Experience

Gender

Mobile Number

Fax Number

Contact Number

EMail Address

FLEETSAFETY@CDGTAXI.COM.SG

OFFICE-65508768

HYUNDAI
140

NO

THIRD PARTY
TAXI

MS FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LTD
THIRD PARTY FIRE AND/OR THEFT
YES

D-18088936MFSH

CHEE KIAN YEQ
SXXXX8B4G

10/08/1956

OUTDOOR

15/06/1978

41 YEARS AND 7 MONTHS
MALE

(LOCAL) +65-94573187

NOEMAIL

Page 1 of 25



Address

Postcode
Was driver an employee of the Insured's Company
If No, Relationship of the Driver with the Insured

Vehicle Registration Number of Driver's Own
Vehicle

Insurance Company of Driver's Own Vehicle

General Information of the Accident

Type Of Accident

Weather Conditions

Road Surface

Other Information

Was any foreign vehicle involved in this accident?

Number of vehicles (including own vehicle)
involved in the accident

Was any body injured in the Accident?

Was any injured conveyed to hospital by
ambulance?

Was any other material or property damaged?

| have been approached by unknown person(s)
soliciting/offering accident claims assistance.

Number of Passengers (Including Driver)

Passenger 1

Passenger 2

Details of Police Action

Was the accident reported to the police?

If Yes.Please state which Police Station

Was notice of intended Prosecution given?

If Yes,against whom?

Circumstances of Accident

REFER ATTACHED

Attachment(s)

Are accident photos available for attachment?
Was there any video captured by Car Camera?
Remarks/ Reasons

Was there any audio recorded?

BLK 544 WOODLANDS DRIVE 16

#10-93
730544
NO

OTHER - TAXI DRIVER

CHAIN COLLISION

CLEAR
DRY

NO
3

NO

YES

NO

3
NAME:

GENDER:

NAME:
GENDER:

NO

NO

YES
YES

NO

: MALE

FEMALE

DETAILS OF OTHER VEHICLE PROPERTY 1

Vehicle Registration Number
Vehicle Make/Model/Colour
Details Of Properties
Vehicle Category

Name of Driver
NRIC/Passport Number
Contact Number

Address

EV7G

PRIVATE CAR
AARON GAN

Page 2 of 25



P;)s'tcode

Insurance Company Name

Nature Of Damage FRONT

No. Of Passenger (Including Driver)

Vehicle Registration Number SMD2627D
Vehicle Make/Model/Colour

Details Of Properties

Vehicle Category PRIVATE CAR
Name of Driver ADONIS CORDELIEUS
NRIC/Passport Number

Contact Number

Address

Postcode

Insurance Company Name

Nature Of Damage REAR

No. Of Passenger (Including Driver)

Page 3 of 25



Sketch Plan Pg. 1

IMPORTANT NOTICE

™~

Please report correctly the details of the accident to speed up the claims process

This Form must be eted b Pol r or the ed Dri
Information provided must be as truthful and accurate as possible Any wilful misreprasentation or withholding of material

3
facts may allow insurance companies to repudiate policy liability.
4 The issue and acceptance of this Form by insurance companies Is not an admission of policy liability on the part of the insurance
companies.
5 false re referred
& The report will be forwarded by the insurers of the GIA Recards Managament Cantra established by the General insurance
Association of Singapore (GIA) for archiving and that coples of this report will for a fes be made available upon application by
incerasted parties,
7 By the lodgment of this report to the Insurers, you Rareby consent to the archiving of this report at the cantre and to coples of
the report being made available aforesaid.
8. Consent under the Personal Data Protection Act (PDPA)
lunderstand, acknowledge, agree and consent that
[a] My insurer, my workshop and the General Insurance Association of Singapore ["GIA”) may/are permitted to collect, use,
disclose and/or pracess my personal data/personal information set out in this [form] and anv other personal information
provided by me or possessed by my insurer (collectively the "Personal Information”) and disclose and transfer such

Personal Information to all insurer(s} who have insured vehicle(s) invalved in this accident [all insurer{s) who have insurad

vehicte(s] invalved in this accident shall be collactively referred to as the “Insurers”) the [nsurers’ lawyers/law firms, the

Monetary Autherity of Singapore and any rievant government agen;v/authariw {such as the police), for the purpose(s]

of

(I} processing, handling and/or dealing with my claims including the settlement of the claims and any necessary
investigations relating to the claims,

(1} investigating the accident and/or my claims,

|1ii) carrying out and/or dealing with my instructions or responding to any enguirias by me;

(iv) administering my claims (including the mailing of correspondence, statements. invoices, reports or noticas to me,
which could involve disclosure of certain personal data about me to bring about delivery of the same as well as on the
external cover of anvelopes/mail packages); and/or

[v) compiying with applicable law in administering, brocessing, handling and/or dealing with my claims (collectively the
"Purposes”)

{b)  allinsurer(s) who have insured vehicle(s) involved in this accident and the Insurers’ lawyers/law firms, may/are permitted
to collect, use, disclose and/or process my Personal information for one or mere of the above Purposes; and

(e} my Personal Information may/can be disclosed by any of tha insurers and/or GIA to their third party service providers or
agents(including their lawyers/taw firms), which may be sited outside of Singapore, for one or more of the above Purposes

{d} my Personal infoermation will also be collected and used to compile claims history for the purpose of fraud detection,
investigation and management in present and 3!l future claims.

ie) the information so collected under (d) above may be shared / disclosed:

(1} toallinsurersand/or any other third parties that assist in evaluating, investigating, controlling or managing fraud,
regulators, law enforcement and government agencies as reasonably required for the purposes stated, or

(i} for complying with requirements upder any regulations, laws or court orders \

CITYGAR PTELTD m «‘
CO), SEG: 110 150185380 V'
? 4,
o OO.-—”’
- Sa " —
Policyholder's Signature Driver's Signatu Reporting Centre Persannel’s Signature
Date & Time* (If driver is not thelgelicyholder) Name
NRIC/FIN No

[h]

Date & Time

Page 4 of 25



Sketch Plan Pg. 2
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DESCRIBE CIRCUMSTANCES OF THE ACCIDENT
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A

DECLARATION

|/We declare the foregoing particulars are true irf gve

respect

TR o ]
I

CLY, RE (3048390

Policyholder's Signature
Nate & Time

Driver’s S}gnﬁu re

(I drmver is nnk the nolicyhnider)
Dale & Thoe .

13

Reporting Centre Personnel’s Signature
Name:
NRIC/FIN Nu
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COMFORTDELGRO ENGINEERING PTE LTD
" REPAIR ESTIMATE*
VEHICLENO  : SHAB080R DATE: 16.Jan.2020 ~
MAKE : HYUNDAI i - )
MODEL : 140 DOA:  15.Jan. 2020 MSIG
Qty Parts Description/ Labour Type Unit Price Amount
1|Front Bumper Cover % N $562.30
10/Front Bumper Clips v $2.20 $22.00
1|Radiator Grille &v™ $417.10
1/Headlamp Support Panel % XA $907.40
Headlamp Support Top Cover Xw\ $222.60
1|Bonnet “uC $2,265.90
1/Bonnet Lock T Xne . $36.90
| AlHeadlamp —kH7 RH o'y G o $1,388.00  $2,776.00
1|A/c condenser Y &4~ $927.50|
1|Radiator Assy e X $698.30
1|Radiator Fan, Motor, Cowling \ W~ $792.95 |
2[Horn units — High / Low \ A $73.80 $147.60
1|Rear Bumper Dei- $553.00
1|Rear Bumper Sponge P $103.50
1|Rear Bumper Undercover Xn A $228.00
10[Rear Bumper Clips [/\Q’(_/ $2.20 $22.00
[Fromi LY ferae mesm < Q&\ | otify S
SUB TOTAL., vefore atdr soray samiin J $10,683.05
LESS 20%| $2,136.61
DISCOUNTE% TOTAL . || $8,546.44
£2447.45% .
1|Reverse Sensor "7( Xnn ' i $135.70 |Nett
1|Front License Plate & Casing (V. =~ $55.00 |Nett
1|Front License Plate Trim Cover {;f/ $30.00 |[Nett
1{Advertisement — Rear Bumper ineC $50.00 [Nett
4fAdvertisement — Rear Fenders RH/LH ¢ ( -~ 9P $100.00 $200.00 [Nett
1|ADvertisement — Front Bumper y\e£ " ,),N \ B $50.00 |Nett
Q—QW\ QU‘QC . $520.70
Labour Charge \\\ e Pal \kaw &
1|Panel Beating N '4@\,0‘50 $1,800.00 81120
1|Spray Painting Charge rgﬁ;”w \/-@ $1,000.00 ffbo©
1|Wiring Ch S e , 150
g Charge %(,))L ¢ \)\.—0 $80.00
1|[Remove/Refix A/C and top up gas /,3,__ g \/.4@ $120.00 | # Xh1)
1|Tuff Kote "\ 0\.9" $80.00 [»==
14 @%« v ﬁ $Go
TOTAL LABOUR NS $3,080.00
ESTIMATE TOTAL $12,147.14
nY4bs 3y
This is an initial estimate based on a visual inspection of the above vehicle. The final repair quantum will
be prepared after the vehicle is surveyed by a motor Surveyor appointed by the insurance company.




~ COMFORIDELGRO
ENGINEERING

VEHICLE NO.: SHA8080R

MODEL . 140

JOB NO . 305375174

TYPE OF CLAM : 3P | MSIG
SURVEYED BY LKK / RAM
DATE 23.01.2020

SUPPLEMENTARY OF PARTS AND LABOUR COSTS
S/No DESCRIPTION QTyY ESTIMATE REMARKS
1 Front Bun;p_er Reinforcement 1 $402.10 | (1

TOTAL:




Merimen e-Claims Page 1 of 1

...CLAIM SUBFOLDER...(Pending for Survey Report)

CLAIM SUBFOLDER TRACKING

Case Notified Est Submitted Adj Assigned Adj Rpt Adj Submitted Ins Auth'ed Status
17 Jan 2020 Pending for Surv
Main | 16Jan 2020 11:18 5$$5,950.00 $$5,950.00 e poﬂ' i
Edit Adj Rpt I Edit Estimates I View Rpt Cancel Case I

Reference Claim Details Show All

CLAIM SUBFOLDER DETAILS | [Created by insurer]

Insured: AARON GAN WEI TAT, ID: S7938090C, Tel: +5597607607, Email: GANAARON@GMAIL.COM
Main .
Claimant: CITYCAB PTE LTD, Co. Reg. No.: 199502839G

Vehicle Reg. . |15/01/2020 19:00 - :59
No.: SHAS080R Pate of Loss: | (37 Months and 22 Days From LTA Reg Date (Man Yr)]
. Policy/Cover |B29125694QMY (Comprehensive)
Ok Type: |[TR/i617701 Note No.: _|Coverage: 24/05/2019 - 31/05/2020
Vehicle Reg. Policy No
No. EV7G '
(Insured): (Claimant):
Excess: $%$1,500.00
Repairer: ComfortDelGro Engineering Pte Ltd (Loyang) 59 Loyang Drive, 508969 Loyang - Tel: 6214 8300

Handling
Insurer:

MSIG Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd. (HQ) - Tel: +65 6827 7888 ... [Handled by Christina Wong - 6643 1311]

Adjuster: LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) - Tel: 6256-3561 ... [Handled by PARASURAM SHANMUGAM] ... [Final Rpt due
) 16/02/2020]

Driver/Custo

dian AARON GAN WEI TAT (40 / Male) , NRIC: S793B090C, Tel: +6597607607 Email: GANAARON@GMAIL.COM

(Insured):

ggf_:;ﬁ;, on WP Manual assigned to LKK via email on 17/01/2020. (Manual Assign). Liab: NR. Contact: Larry Ng @ 6214 8316.

ASSOCIATED MAIL RECEIVED view All |  compose case Mail |

There are no mail for this case.

ALL ASSOCIATED TASKS™ view All | Search Tasks | Create New Task | Complete |

Due Date Priority Type Task Group Subject Handler Assigned By Completed On Created On Done?
No results,
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[AARON GAN WEI TAT]
ComfortDelGro Engineering Pte Ltd
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (coregno:1s9s071988)
51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25, Paya Ubi Industrial Park
Singapore 408933
Tel: 6256-3561 Fax: 6844-8805 Email: sur@lkkauto.com;assignments@Ilkkauto.com

VEHICLE DAMAGE INSPECTION REPORT

Our File No: CS/MSG20001059/FTF3E2

Date: 07/02/2020
REFERENCE
Handling Insurer: MSIG Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd. Policy No: B29125694QMY
Claimant Vehicle s1ag080r Insured Vehicle No: EV7G
Date of Loss: 15/01/2020 Nature of Claim: TP Claim No: 617701
DESCRIPTION & IDENTIFI | F VEHICLE
Reg No: SHAB8080R
Make & Model: :'R';UNDA' 140, 1.7 DCRDIFA.ABSAIRBAG4DR £ 45n0 No: D4FDGU693926
Reg. Date: 24/11/2016 (Man. Year: 2016) Chassis No: KMHLB41UMHU097118
Colour: Yellow Odometer: 346345 km
Engine Capacity: 1685 cc
Market Value/New Car Price: N/A
Sum Insured (S$): Market Value/New Car Price
NDI N OF VEHICLE THE TIM F Y-
General Condition: Steering (Serviceable): Yes Footbrake (Serviceable): Yes
Handbrake (Serviceable): Yes Engine Modification: No Pre-accident Condition:
CONDITION OF TYRES
Front Tyre Size: 205/60 R16 Rear Tyre Size: 205/60 R16
Front Left Side: Hankook 6 mm Rear Left Side: Hankook 6 mm
Front Right Side: Hankook 6 mm Rear Right Side; Hankook 6 mm
The above values represent the remaining tyre treads depth
COST OF CLAIMS Repairer's Adjuster's Difference  Diff %|
Parts 9,388.82 5,632.92 3,755.90 40.00
Miscellaneous Items 0.00 0.00 0.00
Labour 3,080.00 1,820.00 1,260.00 40.91
Paintwork Labour 0.00 0.00 0.00
Towing 0.00 0.00 0.00
Calculated Gross Total (S$) 12,468.82 7,452.92 5,015.90 40.23
Approved Total (Overridden) (S$) 5,950.00
(S8) 12,468.82 5,950.00 6,518.82 52.28
+ GST 7.00/7.00% (S$) 872.82 416.50 456.32 52.28
Nett Amount (S$) 13,341.64 6,366.50 6,975.14 52.28
INSPECTION
Date of Assignment: 17/01/2020
Date Inspected: 17/01/2020 Inspected At: ComfortDelGro Engineering Pte Ltd
(Loyang)
59 Loyang Drive
Singapore 508969
Estimated Period of Repair: 4.0 days
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Adjuster: PARASURAM SHANMUGAM Manager: DENISE TAY KWEE CHENG

NOTE: This report represents our findings at the time and place of inspection stated herein. Such inspection has been carried out lo the best of our
knowledge and ability but any other liability under any other circumstances is hereby expressly excluded.
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REPAIR DETAILS

!Reference

|Part Source: MRM-SG Version: 1.0 (Last Synchronised: 07 Feb 2020)

Parts: 143 HYUNDAI 140 1.7 D CRDI F/L ABS AIRBAG 4DR (A) (Catalogue:Merimen Singapore 1.0)
Labour: Repairer's (Price-denominated Standard List)

Print Code: (Unsubmitted, no print-code for SHA8080R)

Validity:

These estimates are valid only if they contain the print code (above) on all estimate pages, running page
numbers with the END OF ESTIMATES marker on the last estimate page

Further Info: Items/values not in reference catalogue are prefixed with an asterisk *.

Recommended Parts

No. Qty Part No. Particulars Condition Repairer's Amount
1 1 *FRONT BUMPER COVER Cracked 562.30FL *562.30 FL
2 10 *FRONT BUMPER CLIPS Necessary 22.00FL *22.00FL
3 1 *RADIATOR GRILLE Broken 41710FL *417.10FL
4 1 *HEADLAMP SUPPORT PANEL Not Necessary 907.40FL *-FL
5 1 *HEADLAMP SUPPORT TOP COVER Not Necessary 222.60FL *-FL
6 1 *BONNET Buckled 2265.90FL *2,265.90FL
7 1 *BONNET LOCK Not Necessary 36.90FL *-FL
8 1 *HEADLAMP -LH/RH O/S Scratched 2,776.00FL *1,388.00FL
9 1 *A/C CONDENSER Bent 927.50FL  *927.50FL
0 1 *RADIATOR ASSY Not Necessary 698.30FL *-FL
11 1 *RADIATOR FAN, MOTOR, COWLING Not Necessary 792.95FL *-FL
12 2 *HORN UNITS - HIGH / LOW Not Necessary 147 60 FL *-FL
13 1 *REAR BUMPER Deformed 553.00FL *553.00 FL
14 1 *REAR BUMPER SPONGE Not Necessary 103.50 FL *-FL
15 *REAR BUMPER UNDERCOVER Not Necessary 228.00FL *-FL
16 10 *REAR BUMPER CLIPS Necessary 22.00FL *22.00FL
17 1 *FRONT LH FENDER (NPA) Repair 0.00FL *~FL
18 1 *FRONT BUMPER REINFORCEMENT Cut 402.10FL *402.10FL
19 1 *REVERSE SENSOR Not Necessary 135.70FS *-FS
20 1 *FRONT LICENSE PLATE & CASING Cracked 55.00FS *55.00FS
21 1 *FRONT LICENSE PLATE TRIM COVER Broken 30.00Fs *30.00FS
2 1 *ADVERTISEMENT - REAR BUMPER Necessary 50.00FS *50.00FS
23 2 *ADVERTISEMENT - REAR FENDERS RH/LH Necessary 200.00FS  *200.00FS
24 1 *ADVERTISEMENT - FRONT BUMPER Necessary 50.00FS *50.00FS

F=Franchise part. S=SpcNett. L=ListitemDisc

Sub Total (S$§) 11,605.85 6,944.90

- List Item Discount on L Items 20.00/20.00% (S$) 2,217.03 1,311.98

Total Parts (S§)  9,388.82 5,632.92

Report was unsubmitted during this print-out.
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Recommended Miscellaneous ltems

There are no new miscellaneous items selected.

Recommended Labour

Page 4 of 4

No Particulars Lab.Type Repairer's Amount
Labour items
1 PANEL BEATING New 1,800.00 1,120.00
2 SPRAY PAINTING CHARGE New 1,000.00 600.00
3 WIRING CHARGE New 80.00 50.00
4 REMOVE / REFIX A/C AND TOP UP GAS New 120.00 0.00
5 TUFF KOTE New 80.00 50.00
Gross Labour Cost (S$) 3,080.00 1,820.00

Report was unsubmitted during this print-out.

< END OF ESTIMATES >
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