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Denise Tax (LKKAuto)

From: Denise Tay (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 17 January 2020 8:56 AM

To: Chan, Shu Hui Agnes; SUR; assignments

Subject: RE: Enquiry on Market Value of SKW6321H; Our ref: CMTD20000182; DOA:
10.01.2020

Dear Agnes,

The market value for SKW 6321H is $54K — $55K(est) as at Jan 2020

Best Regards,

Denise Tay | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | $(408933)

From: Chan, Shu Hui Agnes <agnes.chan@sompo.com.sg>

Sent: Thursday, 16 January 2020 12:11 PM

To: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>; assignments <assignments@Ilkkauto.com>

Subject: Enquiry on Market Value of SKW6321H; Our ref: CMTD20000182; DOA: 10.01.2020
Importance: High

Dear LKK

Please advise the market value of SKW6321H as at 10.01.2020.

Thank you.

Best Regards
Agnes Chan

Claims Divison
D: 6329 5327| T: 6461 6555| F: 6221 3147

oy Innovation for Wellbeing
e/ SOMPO A Century of Trust

Sompo Insurance Singapore Pte. Ltd.
50 Raffles Place, #05-01/06 Singapore Land Tower, Singapore 048623
Website: www.sompo.com.sq | Facebook: www.facebook.com/SompoSG

#  Downiodd on the h AT IO
& App Store Jll P> Google Play




Denise Taz (LKKAuto)

From: HO Kow Wai <kowwai.ho@axa.com.sg>
Sent: Thursday, 16 January 2020 8:11 PM
To: bhtay@autoprobe.com.sg; admin@autoprobe.com.sg; nick@Ibs-auto.com;

benson@Ibs-auto.com; jimmy.lee@priorityservices.sg;
cynthia.ong@priorityservices.sg; LKK Valuation; Admin A;
edwardchowl@yahoo.com; mail@vpappraisal.com

Cc TEO Kitty
Subject: SMK2391X Check MV
Attachments: LOG CARD - SMK 2391X.pdf

Dear partners,
As per attached, pls assist to check MV and forward your finding to Ms. Kitty Teo.
Tks.

This message may contain confidential information intended solely for the use of the named addressee. If you are
not the intended recipient, you should not read, use, disclose or reproduce the content of this message. If you have
received this message by mistake, please notify the sender immediately. Any views or opinions presented in this
message are solely those of the author and do not necessarily represent those of AXA Insurance Pte Ltd or any other
entity of the AXA Group, unless otherwise stated by the sender and duly authorized by the said companies.
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> Back to OneMotoring

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Vehicle Owner Particulars
Owner ID Type:

Owner ID:

Vehicle Detalls

Vehicle No.:

Vehicle to be Exported:
Intended Deregistration Date:
Vehicle Make:

Vehicle Madel:

Primary Colour:
Manufacturing Year:

Engine No.:

Chassis No.:

Maximum Pawer Output:
Open Market Value:

Original Registration Date:
First Registration Date:
Transfer Count:

Actual ARF Paid:

Intended PARF Rebate Details
PARF Eligibility:

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date:
PARF Rebate Amount:
Intended COE Rebate Details
COEExpiry Date:
COE Category:

COE PerioH(Yearé):

QP Paid;

COE Rebate Amount:

Total Rebate Amount:

The information contained herein s correct as at 14 Jan 2020

m

Singapore NRIC
400G

SMK2391X

No

14 Jan 2020
HONDA

VEZEL 1.5X CVT
Green

2018
L15B5561262
RU11311252
96.0 kW (128 bhp)
$22,786.00
01Apr 2019
01Apr 2019

0
$13,901.00 [ 9 J’O

Yes
31Mar 2029
$10,425.00

31Mar 2029

A-Car up to 1600cc & 97kW (130bhp)
10

$26,659.00

$24,559.00

$34,984.00

OK



