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Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

From: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 16 January 2020 3:44 PM

To: Monica Chung

Cc: SUR

Subject: RE: Market Value of SGQ3822C  Our Ref: 617348

Dear Monica,

The MV of SGQ 3822C is $55K-556K(est) as at Jan’20.

« Wishing you @ Happy ana rrosperous Lunar New Yegr »

Best Regards,

Shiau Chan (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: siewsc@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Monica Chung <Monica_Chung@sg.msig-asia.com>
Sent: Wednesday, 15 January 2020 2:37 PM

To: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: Market Value of SGQ3822C Our Ref: 617348

Dear all,
Please let us have the market value. Date of accident - 10/01/2020.
Thanks.

Regards,

Monica Chung
Executive, Claims Services
D: +65 6594 2552 | F: +65 6225 7402 | monica chung@sg.msig-asia.com

MSIG

MSIG Insurance (Singapore) Pte Ltd 16 Raffles Quay, #24-01 Hong Leong Bu1ld1ng, S1ngapore 048581 | T: +65 6220
£

;‘“‘ 3' |
9644 | F: +65 6225 6371 | Co. Reg. No. 200412212G | msig.com.sg & ©

A Member of EYNaAH] INSURANCE GROUP

CONFIDENTIALITY NOTICE
This e-mail {including any attachments) may contain information that is privileged or confidential. The sending of this e-mail to any




Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

From: Monica Chung <Monica_Chung@sg.msig-asia.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 15 January 2020 2:37 PM

To: SUR

Subject: Market Value of SGQ3822C  Our Ref: 617348
Attachments: SGQ3822C_PARF_COE Rebate Enquiry.pdf

Dear all,

Please let us have the market value. Date of accident - 10/01/2020. M
Thanks.

Regards,

Monica Chung
Executive, Claims Services
D: +65 6594 2552 | F: +65 6225 7402 | monica chung@sg.msig-asia.com

MSIG

MSIG Insurance (Singapore) Pte Ltd 16 Raffles Quay, #24-01 Hong Leong Building, Singapore 048581 | T: +65 6220

9644 | F: +65 6225 6371 | Co. Reg. No. 200412212G | msig.com.sg W

aMember of IETA10] INSURANCE GROUP

CONFIDENTIALITY NOTICE

This e-mait (including any attachments) may contain information that is privileged or confidential. The ing of this e-mail to any
person other than the intended recipient is not a waiver of the privilege or confidentiality that attache it. If you are not the intended
recipient, please notify the sender immediately, delete the email and do not copy, distribute or disclose its contents.




> Back to OneMotoring

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Vehicle Owner Particulars
Owner 1D Type:

Owner |D:

Vehicle Details

Vehicle No.:

Vehicle to be Exported:
Intended Deregistration Date:
Vehicle Make:

Vehicle Model:

Primary Colour:
Manufacturing Year:

Engine No.:

Chassis No.:

Maximum Power Output:
Open Market Value:

Original Registration Date:
First Registration Date:
Transfer Count:

Actual ARF Paid:

Intended PARF Rebate Details
PARF Eligibility:

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date:
PARF Rebate Amount:
Intended COE Rebate Details
COE Expiry Date:

COE Category:

COE Period(Years):

QP Paid:

COE Rebate Amount:

Total Rebate Amount:

The information contained herein is correct as at 15 Jan 2020

Dep 1) ?6-'[’(/')‘

é‘é-g}/wf.,

c — 56k

OK

Singapore NRIC
1101

$GQ3822C

Yes

15 Jan 2020

HONDA

JAZZ 1.3 CVT ABS D/AIRBAG 2WD
Silver

2016

L13B11020067
JHMGK3850HX200117
73.0 kW (97 bhp)
$15,963.00

16 Aug 2016

16 Aug 2016

0

$10,963.00

Yes
15 Aug 2026
$8,222.00

15 Aug 2026

A - Car up to 1600cc & 97kW (130bhp)
10

$53,694.00

$35,348.00

$43,570.00



1/15/2020 Used Honda Car & Used Cars & Vehicles Singapore - sgCarMart
SGCARMART.CONM Login  Sign up
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W ¥ Credit Pte Ltd S an
> Low prices guaranteed
> Specialist in Japanese cars

Post an Advertisement
Sell it yourself! Advertise it at just

$58 until it's SOLD!

GV Credit > Easy loan approval
Post an Ag Advertiser Login Ways of Selling ! > All terms are negotiable
Browse by Category ¥ «Back (1234 ) Next» \Sor?bv Reg_ -5 !rz_buresultsjaage ]
66 vehicles H__o_nda Jazz . 1 i ~
Price Depreciation eq Date Eng Cap Mileage Veh Type Status
Search Selection Honda Jazz Any Any 2016 Any Any Any All
Honda Jazz 1.3A $55,000 $7,990 fyr 04-Apr-2016 1,318 cc 39,000 km Hatchback Available

Posted: 10-Jan-2020  Tags: 2016 Honda Jazz, 2016 honda jazz, Honda Jazz, honda jazz, Honda, Jazz, jazz, Used Honda

Honda Jazz 1.5A RS $58,000 $8,450 /yr 29-Mar-2016 1,498 cc 75,000 km Hatchback Available

Pristine And Low Mileage Honda Jazz 1.5A RS, Fuel Efficient And Easy To Handle. Upgraded Entertainment System And Added 3 Piece Anti
Roll Bar. Still Under Kah Motors Warranty, Direct Seller, View To Believe, Drop Me A Call Or Text For A No-Obligation Viewing!

DIRECT OWNER |

Posted: 15-)an-2020  Tags: 2016 Honda Jazz, 2016 honda Jazz, Honda Jazz, honda jazz, Handa, Jazz, jazz, Used Honda

Honda Jazz 1.3A - N.A 29-Mar-2016 1,318 cc - Hatchback SoLb

Buy Now! Comes With 2 Years Free Servicing & 1 Year Free Maintenance In Our In House Warkshop! Full Vicom Evaluation Report
Provided To Understand The Condition Of The Car, To Give Every Purchase With Assurance & Peace Of Mind.

Yong Lee Seng Motor

Posted: 09-Jan-2020  Tags: 2016 Honda Jazz, 2016 honda Jazz, Honda Jazz, honda jazz, Honda, Jazz, jazz, Used Honda

Honda Jazz 1.3A = N.A 29-Mar-2016 1,318 cc - Hatchback SoLD
Consignment Code: AS39. Flexible And Attractive Loan Available. Trade In Available For Your Car! No Hidden Costs, For Further
Information Or If You Have Any Questions Please Do Not Hesitate To Contact Us,

Posted: 09-Dec-2019  Tags: 2016 Honda Jazz, 2016 honda Jazz, Honda Jazz, honda jazz, Honda, Jazz, jazz, Used Honda

Strut / Stabilizer Bar
Honda Brio 1.2 (2011) Strut/ Stabilizer Bars

More info about this product

Honda Jazz 1.5A RS - N.A 29-Mar-2016 1,498 cc - Hatchback SOLD

Max Loan Amount Available As Advertised! 1 Owner Only! Meticulously Well Maintained Sporty Yet Attractive Pear| White Jazz. Fully
Serviced By Agent (Kah Motors) With Warranty Till August 2021! Guaranteed Accident Free! Look No Further & Wait No More! Our Com...

Creative Auto
Posted: 23-Oct-2019  Tags: 2016 Honda Jazz, 2016 honda Jazz, Honda Jazz, honda jazz, Honda, Jazz, jazz, Used Honda

Honda Jazz 1.5A RS - N.A 24-Mar-2016 1,498 cc - Hatchback SOLD

1 Owner, Nice Number, Low Mileage, Seldom Use, 5 Yrs Warranty By Kah Motor, Original Paintwork, Accident Free, Nice Interior, Flexible
Loan, Hurry Before It's Gone!

Posted: 16-Nov-2019  Tags: 2016 Honda Jazz, 2016 honda jazz, Honda Jazz, honda jazz, Honda, Jazz, jazz, Used Honda

Honda Jazz 1.5A RS = N.A 22-Mar-2016 1,498 cc - Hatchback SOLD

Interest From 1.99% Sporty Pearl White Agent Unit With Genuine Mileage. Fully Agent Serviced. Best Selling Model And Best Fuel Efficient
Hatchback. Awesome Choice For You And Your Family, Superb Handling And Condition. No Repairs Needed. WhatsApp Me For More Inf...

Car Times Automobile Pte Ltd

Posted: 28-0ct-2019  Tags: 2016 Honda Jazz, 2016 honda jazz, Honda Jazz, honda jazz, Honda, Jazz, jazz, Used Honda

https://www.sgcarman.com/used_cars/listing.php?BRSR=40&MOD=Honda&MMO=Jazz&RPG=20&VEH=O&RGD=201 6&0ORD=RGD_DESC 1/3



