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Yvonne Wong (LKK Auto)

From: Yvonne Wang (LKK Auto)

Sent: Friday, January 17, 2020 12:34 PM

To: Premiumauto Claims; SUR

Subject: RE: OD CLAIM FOR SMN 7397 G ON 20/09/2019
Dear Sir

Error mistake of excess. The excess should be S0 for this case.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Yvonne Wong (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: yvonnewong@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Yvonne Wong (LKK Auto)

Sent: Friday, January 17, 2020 12:15 PM

To: Premiumauto Claims <claims@premiumauto.com.sg>; SUR <sur@Ilkkauto.com>
Subject: RE: OD CLAIM FOR SMN 7397 G ON 20/09/2019

Dear Sir,

As instructed by our client, please proceed to repair the insured vehicle SMIN7397G (excess $600/-).

If there are any check items or supplementary items please inform our office’s Assignment Team at Tel: 6741 8434 to

arrange our surveyor for inspection.

All supplementary items and unconfirm items are subjected to further approval from insurance company before

completion of the repair.

*Our client reserve their right_not to pay if there is no valid approval obtained before repair.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Yvonne Wong (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: yvonnewong@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | $(408933)

1



From: Premiumauto Claims [mailto:claims@premiumauto.com.sg]

Sent: Friday, January 17, 2020 8:11 AM

To: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>; assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>; Yvonne
Wong (LKK Auto) <yvonnewong@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Claims <claims@premiumauto.com.sg>

Subject: RE: OD CLAIM FOR SMN 7397 G ON 20/09/2019

Dear all,
Approval please? Owner is chasing every day.

Best Regards,
Kee Siang
Claims Advisor

Premium Automobiles Pte Ltd ®egNo 199902271W)
55 Ubi Road 1 Road Singapore 408699
p. +65 6388 2323 d. +65 6768 9911 f.+65 6841 1183

e._claims@premiumauto.com.sg w. WWw. audi.com.sg
Audi Showroom, Audi Centre 281 Alexandra Road Singaporc 159938 p. +65 6836 2223

WELCOME TO THE
8TH DIMENSION.

THE ALL-MNEW AUDI Q8.

FIfND OUT MCORE |

Email Disclaimer
This email, including any attachment. is confidential and may also be priv
If vou have received it in error, please notify us mumediately by reply ema

wssage from your system
Please do not copy 1 or use it for any purpose, or disclose il contents or any attachment to any ot hL [

son. Thank vou

From: Claims [mailto:claims@premiumauto.com.sg]

Sent: Thursday, 16 January, 2020 11:55 AM

To: 'Admin A' <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; 'Nivitha (LKK Auto)' <admin-d@lkkauto.com>; 'SUR' <sur@Ikkauto.com>;
'assignments' <assignments@lkkauto.com>; 'Yvonne Wong (LKK Auto)' <yvonnewong@lkkauto.com>

Cc: 'Claims' <claims@premiumauto.com.sg>

Subject: RE: OD CLAIM FOR SMN 7397 G ON 20/09/2019

Dear Yvonne,
Kindly assist to expedite to approval the claims.
Thank You.

Best Regards,
Troy Geoh
Claims Advisor



View Received Message

This mail is associated with :

*SMN7397G (64671770965G)
oD
Sep 20 2019 9:00FM
[NUR SHAMSUDIN BIN MD ESA]
Premium Automobiles Pte Ltd

| Reply ! Reply Al | Mark as Unread [ Print Mes;sage | Delete Message | Forward ]

From AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd. (AIG_SG), sent on 17/01/2020 11:42 AM.
To LKK_HQ

Subject Alert - Adj Mandate Ap_prov_e_;i_t_s:_ﬁé1_.5.6_6_-)_: _SMN739-?G" - Claim Handler: Mithoo Singh, Aashweenjeet Kaur

Approved:3315.00:Re-inspection to be done for damage check and supplementary items / labour.

' DOCUMENTS SUMMARY

There are no documents,




View Received Message

This mail is associated with :

*SMN7397G (64671770965G)
[a]s}
Sep 20 2019 9:00PM
[NUR SHAMSUDIN BIN MD ESA]
Premium Automobiles Pte Ltd

Reply Reply All ] Mark as Unread“f Print MessageJ Delete Message ] Forward !

From AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte, Ltd, (AIG_SG), sent on 17/01/2020 11:00 AM.
To LKK_HQ

Subject SMN7397G / OD / 20/09/2019 / Coverage & Excess update

Dear LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd -

Please note that policy is in force and excess amount is $0.00

Thank you
|Mithoo Singh, Aashweenjeet Kaur

DOCUMENTS SUMMARY - -
There are no documents.




View Received Message

This mail is associated with :

*SMN7397G (64671770965G)
oD
Sep 20 2019 9:00PM
[NUR SHAMSUDIN BIN MD ESA]
Premium Automobiles Pte Ltd

| Reply | Reply All i Mark as Unrea-d_i _Pnnt Message i Delete Message l Forward E

From  AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte, Ltd. (AIG_SG), sent on 16/01/2020 14:28 PM.
To LKK_HQ

Subject SMN7397G / OD / 20/09/2019 / Coverage & Excess update

Dear LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Please note that policy is in force and excess amount is $600.00

Thank you
Mithoo Singh, Aashweenjeet Kaur

DOCUMENTS SUMMARY - ' =W

There are no documents.,




Note: This document has not been finalised.

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (coregnosgsorissr)
51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25, Paya Ubi Industrial Park
Singapore 408933
Tel: 6256-3561 Fax: 6844-8805 Email: sur@lkkauto.com;assignments@lkkauto.com

To: AlG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd. From: LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
AIG Building 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25
78 Shenton Way #08-16 Paya Ubi Industrial Park
Singapore 079120 Singapore 408933

Attn:  Azlan, Syazairdina Date: 16 Jan 2020

Preliminary Advice

Vehicle No : SMN7397G Accident Date : 20/09/2019
Make : AUDI A3 Palicy No. : 1900152820
Assignment Date : 16/01/2020 Excess : 5%0.00
Date of Inspection : 15/01/2020 Est. Duration of Repair :3.00
Inspection At : PREMIUM AUTOMOBILES PTE LTD (UBI)

55 UBI ROAD 1

SINGAPORE 408699

Point of Impact / General Description of Damages
The vehicle sustained impact / damages rear ofs portion and parts claimed are consistent to the accident.

Repairer's Estimate (Gross) 5% 7,703.00
Revised Amount :S$ 3,315.00
Check Items (Estimated) :S% 321.00
Total :S$ 3,636.00
Lump Sum Repair 88

Total Loss Consideration

New for Old Value 8%
Pre-Accident Value 8% 115,000.00
COE / PARF Rebate 5% 70,900.00
Salvage Value :S$
Margin for Repair :S$ 44,100.00

Remarks

( X ) The vehicle is repairable at our adjusted amount. We have also confirmed excess and policy coverage. Kindly let us
have your authorisation.

( ) The vehicle is uneconomical to be repaired, you are advised to invite tender for the wreck.

( ) Other comments :



MPAT18125788-05 | Premium Automehbiles Ple Ltd - UBI
ENTRY DATE & TIME: 23/09/2019 15:08
SUBMITTED BY: Tony Foong Chin Fang

SINGAPORE ACCIDENT STATEMENT

IMPORTANT NOTICE

1, Please report correctly the details of the accident to speed up the claims process.
2. This Form must be completed by the Policyholder and/or the Authorised Driver.

3. Infermation provided must be as truthful and accurate as possible. Any wilful misrepresentation or witholding of material facts may allow insurance companies to

repudiate policy liability.

4. The issue and acceptance of this Form by insurance companies is not an adrmission of policy liability on the part of the insurance companies.
5. Any false reporting may be referred to the Police for investigation.

6. This report will be forwarded by the insurers of the GIA Records Management Centre established by the General Insurance Assaciation of Singapore (GIA) for
archiving and that copies of this report will, for a fee, be made available upon application by interested parties.

7. By the lodgement of this report to the insurers, you hereby consent to the archiving of this report at the centre and to copies of the report being made available

aforesaid.

ACCIDENT STATEMENT

Date Of Report

Date Of Accident

Exact Location Of Accident
Country/State of Loss

23/08/2019 15:06
20/08/2019 21:05

ALONG BUKIT TIMAH ROAD
SINGAPORE

DETAILS OF OWN VEHICLE

Vehicle Registration Number
Insured/Policyholder
Name Of Registered Owner
NRIC No

Email Address

Mobile Phone No
Alternative Phone No
Vehicle Particulars
Manufacturer

Model

Exact Purpose for which vehicle was being used at
time of accident

Are you claiming under your own insurance policy
for repair to your vehicle?

If No, Please state action to be taken
Vehicle Category

Insurance Company

Name of Insurance Company
Type Of Coverage

Fleet Policy

Paolicy Number

Cover Note Number

Driver

Name of Driver

NRIC No

Date Of Birth

Occupation

Date Of Driving Pass

Driving Experience

Gender

Mobile Number

Fax Number

Contact Number

EMail Address

SMN7397G

NUR SHAMSUDIN BIN MD ESA
SXXXX473B
NUR_SHAMSUDIN@YAHOO.COM
(LOCAL) +65-97869563
OFFICE-97869563

AUDI
A3 SEDAN 1.0 TFSI 8V

PRIVATE USE

YES

PRIVATE CAR

AlG ASIA PACIFIC INSURANCE PTE. LTD.
COMPREHENSIVE

NO

1900152820

ROHANI BINTI HASSAN
SXKAX8041

11/11/1969

INDOOR

12/04/2004

15 YEARS AND 5 MONTHS
FEMALE

(LOCAL) +65-81279767

DINI6O6@HOTMAIL.COM

Page 1 of 29



Address

Postcode
Was driver an employee of the Insured's Company
If No, Relationship of the Driver with the Insured

Vehicle Registration Number of Driver's Own
Vehicle

Insurance Company of Driver's Own Vehicle

General Information of the Accident

Type Of Accident

Weather Conditions

Road Surface

Other Information

Was any foreign vehicle involved in this accident?

Number of vehicles (including own vehicle)
involved in the accident

Was any body injured in the Accident?

Was any injured conveyed to hospital by
ambulance?

Was any other material or property damaged?

| have been approached by unknown person(s)
soliciting/offering accident claims assistance.

Number of Passengers (Including Driver)

Passenger 1

Details of Police Action
Was the accident reported to the police?
If Yes Please state which Police Station

Police Station Name
Police Station Address

Police Station Contact

Was notice of intended Prosecution given?
If Yes,against whom?

Circumstances of Accident

958 DUNEARN ROAD
#01-22

589485
NO
SPOUSE

HIT AND RUN / VANDALISM / DAMAGED WHILST PARKED
CLEAR
DRY

NO
2
NO
NO
YES
NO
2

: YASMIN
: FEMALE

NAME:
GENDER:

YES

CLEMENTIN.P.C

ROAD: 20 CLEMENTI AVE 5, POSTCODE: 129858 , COUNTRY:

SINGAPORE
TEL NO: - FAX NO:
NO

PLEASE REFER BACK TO POLICE REPORT T/20190920/2217

Attachment(s)
Are accident photos available for attachment?
Was there any video captured by Car Camera?

Was there any audio recorded?

YES
YES
NO

DETAILS OF OTHER VEHICLE PROPERTY 1

Vehicle Registration Number
Vehicle Make/Model/Colour
Details Of Properties
Vehicle Category

Name of Driver
NRIC/Passport Number
Contact Number

SLT8949M

PRIVATE CAR

Page 2 of 29



Address

Postcode

Insurance Company Name
Nature Of Damage

No. Of Passenger (Including Driver)

Page 3 of 29



Sketch Plan

SKETCH PLAN

IMPORTANT NOTICE

Please report correctly the detaile of the srodent 1o speed up the daims process
Tt Form must oe completed by the Policybolder and/or the Authorised Driver

3 Inlormation provided mast be as truthful and Any willul misrepresentalion or withhelding of material
facts may aliow \nwrance companies to repudiate policy liability.

[

4. The issue and acceptance of this Farm by insurance companies is not an admission of pokicy hiability on the part of the insurance
tompanies

& The repont will be forwarded by the insurers of the GIA Records Management Centre established by the General Insurance
Association of Singapare {Ga) for archiving and that copies of this report will for a fee be made available upon application by
Interested parties

7. By the lodgment of this report to the msurers, you hereby consent 1o the archaving of this report at the centre and (o coples of
the report being made available aloresaic

B mmmnmlmﬁmmmtmn
I understand, acknowledge, agree and consent that:

(8) My insurer, my workshop and the General insurance Association of Singapore (“GIA”) may/are permitted to collect, use,
disclose and/or process my personal data/perscnal information set out in this [form] and any other personal information
provided by me of possessed by my insurer (collectively the “Personal Information”) and disclose and transfer such
Personal Information to all insurer{s) who have insured vehicle[s] involved in this accident (all insurer(s) who have insured
vehicle{s) involved in this accident shall be collectively referred to as the “Insurers”), the insurers’ lawyers/law firms, the
Monetary Authority of Singapore and any relevant government agency/autherity [such as the palice), for the purpose(s)
of :

{1} processing, handiing and/or dealing with my claims including the settlement of the claims and any necessary
investigations relating o the claims,;

(it} investigating the accident and/or my claims;
(iif) carrying out and/or dealing with my instructions or responding to any enquiries by me;

(rv] administering my claims (including the mailing of correspondence, statements, invoices, reports or rotices to me,
which could involve disclosure of certain personal data about me to bring about delivery of the same as well as on the
external cover of envelopes/mail packages); andfor

fvh complying with applicable law in administering, processing, handting and/or dealing with my claims [coliectively the
"Purposes |

(b)  ail insurer(s) who have insured vehicle(s) involved in this accident and the Insurees’ lavwyers/law firms, may/are permitted
to coflect, use, disciose and/or process my Personal information for one or more of the sbove Purposes: and

{c)  my Personal Information may/can be disclosed by any of the Insurers and/or GIA to their third party service providers or
agentsfincluding their lawyers/law firms), which may be sited outside of Singapore, for one or more of the above Purposes.

{d]  my Pessonal Information will also be collected and used to compile claims history for the purpose of fraud detection,
investigation and management In present and all future claims

(&) the information so collected under (d) above may be shared / disclosed

(i} to all insurers and/or any other third parties that assist in evaluating, investigating, controlling or managing fraud,
‘regulators, law enforcement and government agencies as reasanably required for the purposes stated, ar

{H) for complying with recuirements under any regulations, laws or eaurt orders

IS L/ =
Polcyholoer's Signature Driver's Signature Reporting ﬁs Signature
Date B Time {1 driver is nat the policyhotder) Name (- Tm
Qate & Time NRIC/FIN No: CREE G
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Sketch Plan #2

SKETCH PLAN

1;

f r”i’

f
r '-') |

DESCRIBE CIRCUMSTANCES OF THE ACCIDENT

Aap SmA :?-"Jr-’:-‘(;‘

g —= =T 9 bam

Peass Beliy back 4  fly Gavi  T)20909% [3213

DECLARATION
I/We declare the foregoing particulars are true in every respect

.
N

Diriwer's Signature
| deiver i nat the policyhinide)

Date & Time

Policybolder's Signature
Date & Time:

Rénartmg :rzjermn el's Sngralur:
Mo £L - 3
NRIC/FIN No: Gk ?:H'Jk
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Accident Photo
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LAk

Cectnos Nuerbes 359728041

Narme
ROHANI BINTI HASSAN Bk

& Date 11 Nov 1969
- ‘“WD“-‘IZAprmq,

[

etz

Class 3  Motor Cars and Molor Tractors the weighl of 12 Apr 2004
which unladen does nol exceed 2500 kilograms



Co Reg Mo 2010008040 | Copynghi & 2015 ANG Asia Pacific nsurance Pla Lld
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Name of Policyholder @ NUR SHAMSUDIN BIN MD ESA Vehicle No. : SMN7387G
Period of Insurance 1 27 Aug 2019 To 26 Aug 2020 Policy No. 1900152820
Engine No. 1 CHZ C29115 Endorsement No,
Chassis No. : WAUZZZ8V0K1026710 Issued Date : 03 Sep 2018

ABOUT THE COVER
| Make/Model . AUDI AZ Sedan 1.0 TFSI S tronic

Engine Capacity/Tonnage : 999.00 CC Sum Insured @ Market Value First Year of Registration : 2019
| Driver Restriction CNA Off Peak Car =~ No Insuring with COE/PARF : Yes

Person or Classes of Persons Entitled to Drive* :

3} The Policyhalder

B Any other person who 1§ dnwing on (he Policyholder's order or with hisfher permission

Thus Pohcy will incemnify the Policyholger o any authonsed driver only if he/she meels the specified age condition

| Younave Io pay an aodihonal sum of £3 000 as “Young andfor inexperienced Driver Excess™ ("YIDR") il You are or Your Authonsed Driver (named or unnamed) is under the age of 22 andlor has less
| than 2 years' dnving expenence

Age Condition

Limitaticn as to use*

Use only for social, domestic and pleasure purpeses and for the Palicyhalder's business.
This Policy goes nol cover use lor hire or reward, driving tuition, driving lest, racing, pace-making. reliability trial ar speed-lesting, the carriage of goods other than samples in connection with any Irade or

business or wse for any purpose in connectian with Motor Trade

- All Age Condition

Loss of Use 1800c: - 2000cc Optional
* Limitations rendered inaperative by Section & of the Motor Venicles {Thira-Party Risks and Compensation) Act (Cap. 188), Seclion 95.of the Road Transport Aci, 1987 (Malaysia) and Road Transport
(Amendment) &cl 2015, are nof 1o be included under these headings

EXCESS . .

Section 1
Fire - 30 Own Damage

- $1600 Thefl - $0 Flood Cover - $0

Section 2
Propety Damage  §C

Windscreen : $100

Named Driver and EXCESS {where appiicabie)

NUR SHAMSEUDIN BIN MD ESA - §1600 (Cwn Damage)

APPROVED REPORTING CENTRES/AUTHORISED REPAIRERS (FOR CLAIMS RELATED REPAIRS)

1 Audi Customer Service Cenler Add: 55 Ubi Road 1 Singapore 4085699 63662323

Forother Approved Reporting Centres/AIG Authorised Repairers, please contact our 24-hour acciden! emergency hotline at 465 6338 6200. Allernatively, you may refer o AlG websile www.aig.com sg
or AIG 8G Mabile App. Simply search and downlead “AIG SG” from iTunes or Goagle Play.

IMPORTANT NOTES'

Hire Purchase Company/Employer's Loan: United Overseas Bank Limited

1"We hereby cenify thal the policy 1o which thiz Cerfificate of Insurance relates Is isswed in accordance with the pr of the Molor Vehicies(Third Party Risks and Compensation) Act {Cap. 188), Par IV of
lhe Road Transpar Acl, 1987 (Malaysia), Road Transpor [Amendment) Acl 2012 and Mator Vehicles (Third Parly Risks) Rules, 1959 (Malaysia).

0504125200

PREMIUM LEASING - AP

281 ALEXANDRA ROAD AUDI CUSTOMER SERVICE CENTRE
SINGAPORE 159538

Underwritten by AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd.

AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd.
AUTHORISED REPRESENTATIVE

Stetiany Loh




> Back to OneMotoring

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Owner |D Type: Singapore NRIC
Owner ID: 473B
R e e e e
Vehicle No.: SMN7397G
Vehicle to be Exported: Yes
Intended Deregistration Date: 15 Jan 2020
Vehicle Make: AUDI
Vehicle Model: A3 SEDAN 1.0 TFSISTRONIC (LED & NAV)
Primary Colour: Grey
Manufacturing Year: 2019
Engine No.: CHZC28451
Chassis No.: WAUZZZ8V4K1026449
Maximum Power QOutput: 85.0 kW (113 bhp)
Open Market Value: $23,355.00
Original Registration Date: 27 Aug 2019
First Registration Date: 27 Aug 2019
Transfer Count: o}
Actual ARF Paid: $24,697.00
Entended PARF ReaiE Deta i e e e e ey
PARF Eligibility: Yes
PARF Eligibility Expiry Date: 26 Aug 2029
PARF Rebate Amount: $18,522.00
e COr R e D e e e e
COE Expiry Date: 26 Aug 2029
COE Category: A - Carup to 1600cc & 97kW (130bhp)
COE Period(Years): 10
QP Paid: $31,917.00
COE Rebate Amount: $25,533.00
Total Rebate Amount: $44,055.00

The information contained herein is correct as at 15 Jan 2020

OK
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Premium Automobiles

55 Ubi Road 1, Singapore 408699
Tel : 6366 2323 Fax: 6841 1183 WIP : 13384
Email: Nora.khai@premiumauto.com.sg / claims@premiumauto.com.sg

Telefax

Estimate :  Accident Repairs
Workshop : UbiRoad1

Contact No : 63662323

Fax No : 68411183

Reference :  PA/OD/1148/2019/NS
Date : 23-Sep-19

Vehicle NOT IN workshop. Kindly arrange for survey.

AlG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd
78 Shenton Way

#07-16 AIG Building
Singapore 079120

Attn: Motor Claims Dept
Tel: Fax 6338 1504

Owner's Name :  Mr NurShamsudin Bin Md Esa
Address i 958 Dunearn Road
#01-22

Singapore 589485

Telephone HP +65 97869563
Type of Claim Own Damage Claims
Policy No. 1900152820
Vehicle No SMN 7397 G
Model Code : A3 5Sedan 1.0 TFSI 8V
Model / Year : Aug-19

Engine No :  CHZ (28451

Chassis No » WAUZZZ8V4K1026449
Mileage

Date In -

Estimated By :  JohnnyBoo / Allan Wu

Accident Date :  20-Sep-19
Place of Accident :  Along Bukit Timah Road



Premium Automobiles

55 Ubi Road 1, Singapore 408699
Tel : 63662323 Fax:68411183

Telefax

Estimated Labour Charges for Accident Vehicle. SMN 7397 G

Estimated Surveyor's
S/n Nature of Jobs Charges Recommendations
To remove and transfer rear parking aid. A
1 Check function and renew accordingto  s/n §$ 280.00
damage.

To dismantle and renew rear bumper. To

repair end panelling. Re-organise crash < Y
z management components. Reinstall all > 1’400;_96/ 22

parts removed.

3 To respray rear bumper and end s 2’0% SS
panelling.

4 To carry out diagnostic check. s/n $ 192.00 L/I
TOTAL LABOUR CHARGES $ 3,872.00




Premium Automobiles

55 Ubi Road 1, Singapore 408659
Tel: 6366 2323 Fax:68411183

Telefax

Material List for Accident Vehicle Regn No. SMN 7397 G

Damaﬁed Parts & Prices
S/Nett

S/N _Parts Description Remarks
1 REARBUMPER Det_d $ 1,793.00 —
2 REAR BUMPER STICKY PAD ™M™ 4 s 2100%
3 REAR BUMPER FIXING PARTS < co $ 175.00 +
4  REAR BUMPER WHEEL HOUSING LINER ADAPTER= $  34.00 L
5 REARBUMPER GUIDESECTION-LH/RH? 2 $  30.00 *

6 REAR BUMPER LOCKING MECHANISM f Y2 s 53007
7  REAR BUMPER SPOILER - LH $  216.00 4
8 REARLIGHT REFLECTOR - RH %X $  38.00
9  REAR BUMPER SIDE REINFORCEMENT BEAM $  522.00 t
10 REAR BUMPER BRACKET - LH / RH w2 S 5100/
11 REAR BUMPER GUIDE SECTION - RH T s 60.00*
12 REAR PARKING AID SENSOR - INNER / OUTER! 2 $  462.00
13 REAR PARKING AID SEALRING ™ “- 4 %  12.00"
14 VENT TRIM Jrt st S  64.00 *
15 SUNDRIES P Al $  300.00 X
TOTAL SPARE PARTS CHARGES . $ 3,831.00
TOTAL LABOUR CHARGES $ 3,872.00
GRAND TOTAL $ 7,703.00

All charges are not inclusive of GST.
Legen Remarks (OK) = Approved, Remarks (X) = Not approved
Spare parts are Special Nett.



Premium Automobiles

55 Ubi Road 1, Singapore 408699
Tel : 6366 2323 Fax : 6841 1183

Telefax

Name

Surveyed Date
Authorised Date
Excess Cost
Liability
Remarks

Please Note

Yours faithfully,

LKK Auto Consultz

the Repairer of

» To resurvey before painting
» To display damage 's) during resurvey
e Parts prices are subject to confirmation

* Third party suivey 15 on a “Wit

* No illegal m
/H / : * Supplementary item(<) must be rsurveyed and
1076 -U'AQ . i5 subject to final approvai from insurance Company
1 ‘5{ Ol ))-D Acknowledged by Repairer
Signature:
Date:

MR WM"&EA i \9,7/\

This estimate is based on visual inspection of the affected vehicle.
Should we require further labour charges and spare parts in the
progress of repair, we shall inform you accordingly.

For inspection of vehicle, please refer to Ms Norah Khai at

Tel:6768 9828 for appointment.

Premium Automobiles Pte Ltd

Johnny Boo
Body Repair Manager

Allan Wu
Claims Consultant



Premium Automobiles

55 Ubi Road 1, Singapore 408699
Tel: 6366 2323 Fax: 6841 1183 WIP : 13384
Email: Nora.khai@premlumauto.com.sg ! claims@premiumauto.com.sg

Telefax

Estimate ! Accident Repairs
Workshop :  UbiRoad 1

Contact No ;. 63662323

Fax No ;68411183
Reference . PA/OD/1148/2019/NS
Date : 23-Sep-19

Vehicle NOT IN workshop. Kindly arrange for survey.

AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd
78 Shenton Way

#07-16 AIG Building
Singapore 079120

Attn: Motor Claims Dept
Tel: Fax 6338 1504

Owner's Name
Address

Telephone
Type of Claim
Policy No.
Vehicle No

Model Code
Model / Year
Engine No
Chassis No
Mileage

Date In
Estimated By
Accident Date
Place of Accident

Mr Nur Shamsudin Bin Md Esa
958 Dunearn Road

#01-22

Singapore 589485

HP +65 97869563

Own Damage Claims
1900152820

SMN 7397 G

A3 Sedan 1.0 TFSI 8V
Aug-19

CHZ C28451
WAUZZZ8V4K 1026449

Johnny Boo / Allan Wu
20-Sep-19
Along Bukit Timah Road



Premium Automobiles

55 Ubi Road 1, Singapore 408699
Tel : 6366 2323 Fax: 6841 1183

Telefax

Estimated Labour Charges for Accident Vehicle. SMN 7397 G

Estimated Surveyor's

S/n Nature of Jobs Charges Recommendations
To remove and transfer rear parking aid.

1 Check function and renew according to s/in § 280.00 280.00
damage.
To dismantle and renew rear bumper. To

o Tepair end panelling. Re-organ_lse crash $ 1,400.00 500.00
management components. Reinstall all
parts removed.

3 To respray rear bumper and end panelling. $ 2,000.00 550.00

4 To carry out diagnostic check. s/in $ 192.00 192.00
TOTAL LABOUR CHARGES $ 3,872.00 1,522.00




Premium Automobiles

55 Ubi Road 1. Singapore 408699
Tel . 6366 2323 Fax: 6841 1183

Telefax

Material List for Accident Vehicle Regn No. SMN 7397 G

Damaged Parts & Prices
SIN__Parts Description S/Nett Remarks
1 REAR BUMPER $ 179300 §  1,434.40
2 REAR BUMPER STICKY PAD $ 21.00
3 REAR BUMPER FIXING PARTS $ 175.00
4  REAR BUMPER WHEEL HOUSING LINER ADAPTER-RH  § 34.00
5  REAR BUMPER GUIDE SECTION - LH/RH $ 30.00
6  REAR BUMPER LOCKING MECHANISM $ 53.00
7 REAR BUMPER SPOILER - LH $ ©216.00
8  REAR LIGHT REFLECTOR - RH $ 38.00
9  REAR BUMPER SIDE REINFORCEMENT BEAM $ 522.00
10 REAR BUMPER BRACKET - LH / RH $ 51.00
' REAR BUMPER GUIDE SECTION - RH $ 60.00
12 REAR PARKING AID SENSOR - INNER / OUTER 462.00
13 REAR PARKING AID SEAL RING $ 12.00
14 VENTTRIM $ 64.00
15 SUNDRIES $ 300.00
TOTAL SPARE PARTS CHARGES $ 3,831.00 $  1,434.40
TOTAL LABOUR CHARGES $ 387200 $  1,522.00
GRAND TOTAL $ 7,703.00 $  2,956.40

All charges are not inclusive of GST.

Legend Remarks (OK) = Approved, Remarks (X) = Not approved

Spare parts are Special Nett.




Premium Automobiles

55 Ubi Road 1, Singapore 408699
Tel : 6366 2323 Fax: 6841 1183

Telefax

Name

Surveyed Date
Authorised Date
Excess Cost
Liability
Remarks

Please Note . This estimate is based on visual inspection of the affected vehicle.
Should we require further labour charges and spare parts in the
progress of repair, we shall inform you accordingly.

For inspection of vehicle, please refer to Ms Norah Khai at
Tel:6768 9828 for appointment.

Yours faithfully,

Premium Automobiles Pte Ltd

Johnny Boo Allan Wu
Body Repair Manager Claims Consultant



