




EXPRESS SETTLEMENT 

DISCHARGE VOUCHER 

Ill- Direct Settlement (PODS) 

India Ref: 

Claimant Ref : 

We/I,  ("the workshop") hereby confirm that we/I have reached an agreement 

with the appointed Surveyor of India International Insurance Pte Ltd    (name 

of Surveyor) with  respect  to  the  amount  claimed  for  S$      (repair  cost),  S$   (loss of 

use/rental), S$ _______ (search fee), vehicle no. _________ that was damaged pursuant to the accident which occurred

  on    (date) at                                                                                    (location) involving vehicle no.  _________ (insured

  vehicle). This is pursuant to the inspection conducted on _____________ (date) at “the workshop”. 

We/I confirm that we/I are/am authorized by the owner                                                                                ("the third party 

claimant") of vehicle no. _________ to make the claim as set out in the above paragraph and we/I have full authority to settle 

the matter on his/her behalf in a manner that we/I deem fit. We/I enclose herein the letter of authority given by "the third 

party claimant". 

We/I further confirm that we/I will indemnify India International Insurance Pte Ltd for all damages, loss and/or expense that 

they will or have already incurred in the event that "the third party claimant" after the above said agreement lodges a 

further claim against the former for any loss and expenses suffered pertaining to cost of repairs and/or rental and/or loss 

of use pursuant to the damage to                      (vehicle no.) as a result of the accident. 

We/I confirm that the agreement reached above is in full and final settlement of all claims of "the third party claimant" 

pursuant to the accident and that further this settlement is reached on a without prejudice and without admission of liability 

basis. 

This agreement is subject to the application of Singapore law and the Singapore Courts have exclusive jurisdiction over any 

dispute arising out of the same. 

We/I authorize you to pay the total amount of S$ to  . 

Dated this .......... day of  ........................................ 20 ..... 

CLAIMANT:  WITNESS: 

Signature: Signature: 

 Signed by "the workshop" (with chop)    Signed by appointed Surveyor 

Name: Name: 

NRIC: NRIC: 

Address: Address: 

Nationality: Nationality: 

Occupation: Occupation: 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

199607198R

 51 Ubi Avenue 1

#01-25 Paya Ubi Ind. Park S(408933) 

MCT20010156
 SMF9487J

Lai Huat (Meng Kee) Motor Pte Ltd 
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

2,390.68 300.00
383.09 SMF9487J

08/01/2020 Junction of AMK St 31 & AMK Ave 6  SHD3162E

14/01/2020

Goh Yong Khian
SMF9487J

SMF9487J

3,073.77 Lai Huat (Meng Kee) Motor Pte Ltd 

Jenny Lim

S6927273H

c/o 160 Sin Ming Drive #04-01, 
#04-02, #07-03 Sin Ming Autocity
Singapore 575722

Singaporean

Admin

02 July 21
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RE: Your Ref: SHD 3162E / Our Ref: SMF 9487J (Date of Accident: 08.01.2020) //LKK REF:
CC4/III20000941/Kps3

Jenny Lim <jenny.lim@laihuat.com.sg>
Tue 1/6/2021 10:41 AM
To:  Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>

Dear Hsiao Tong
 
We have confirmed with our client that there will be no further medical claim or injury claim.
 
Thank you.
 
Kind regards.
 
Jenny Lim
for LAI HUAT (MENG KEE) MOTOR PTE LTD
160 Sin Ming Drive
#04-01, #04-02 & #07-03
Sin Ming Autocity
Singapore 575722
Tel: 64538110
Fax: 64596267
 
From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>  
Sent: Thursday, 1 April 2021 9:24 am
To: Jenny Lim <jenny.lim@laihuat.com.sg> 
Subject: RE: Your Ref: SHD 3162E / Our Ref: SMF 9487J (Date of Accident: 08.01.2020) //LKK REF:
CC4/III20000941/Kps3
 
6th REMINDER                                          Without Prejudice
 
Hi Jenny,
 
We refer to our email dated 03/08/2020.
 
For the medical claim, can you assist to confirm that the passenger will not be claiming further for injury? If so,
kindly let us have a copy of authorisa�on to act signed by the passenger for our further ac�on. Thanks.
 
 
“Kindly note that this nego�a�on between par�es on this ma�er is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole inten�on of
resolving the ma�er amicably without par�es resor�ng to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed /

inferred from this nego�a�on of terms/se�lement.

 
In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the
issues of liability/damages, either party is not bound, therea�er, by the nego�a�on terms/se�lement.”
 

 
Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
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Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com | Fax: 6741 4108

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 |

S(408933)

 
 

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>  
Sent: Sunday, 31 January 2021 11:59 AM 
To: Jenny Lim <jenny.lim@laihuat.com.sg> 
Subject: RE: Your Ref: SHD 3162E / Our Ref: SMF 9487J (Date of Accident: 08.01.2020) //LKK REF:
CC4/III20000941/Kps3
 
5th REMINDER                                          Without Prejudice
 
Hi Jenny,
 
We refer to our email dated 03/08/2020.
 
For the medical claim, can you assist to confirm that the passenger will not be claiming further for injury? If so,
kindly let us have a copy of authorisa�on to act signed by the passenger for our further ac�on. Thanks.
 
 

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole
intention of resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability,
whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

 

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially
affect/influence on the issues of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation
terms/settlement.”

 

Best Regards,
Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Phone: 6742 3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741 4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> 
Sent: Saturday, 14 November 2020 2:01 PM 
To: Jenny Lim <jenny.lim@laihuat.com.sg> 
Subject: RE: Your Ref: SHD 3162E / Our Ref: SMF 9487J (Date of Accident: 08.01.2020) //LKK REF:
CC4/III20000941/Kps3
 
4th REMINDER                                          Without Prejudice
 
Hi Jenny,
 

mailto:chewht@lkkauto.com
mailto:chewht@lkkauto.com
mailto:jenny.lim@laihuat.com.sg
mailto:chewht@lkkauto.com
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We refer to our email dated 03/08/2020.
 
For the medical claim, can you assist to confirm that the passenger will not be claiming further for injury? If so,
kindly let us have a copy of authorisa�on to act signed by the passenger for our further ac�on. Thanks.
 

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole
intention of resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability,
whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

 

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially
affect/influence on the issues of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation
terms/settlement.”

 

*Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email.
 Submission of claim related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much
regretted.

 
 
Best Regards,
Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Phone: 6742 3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741 4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) 
Sent: Friday, 9 October 2020 10:12 AM 
To: Jenny Lim <jenny.lim@laihuat.com.sg> 
Subject: RE: Your Ref: SHD 3162E / Our Ref: SMF 9487J (Date of Accident: 08.01.2020) //LKK REF:
CC4/III20000941/Kps3
 
3rd  REMINDER                                          Without Prejudice
 
Hi Jenny,
 
We refer to our email dated 03/08/2020.
 
For the medical claim, can you assist to confirm that the passenger will not be claiming further for injury? If so,
kindly let us have a copy of authorisa�on to act signed by the passenger for our further ac�on. Thanks.
 
 
“Kindly note that this nego�a�on between par�es on this ma�er is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole inten�on of
resolving the ma�er amicably without par�es resor�ng to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed /
inferred from this nego�a�on of terms/se�lement.
 
In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the
issues of liability/damages, either party is not bound, therea�er, by the nego�a�on terms/se�lement.”

 

mailto:chewht@lkkauto.com
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Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com | Fax: 6741 4108

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 |

S(408933)

 
 
From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>  
Sent: Saturday, 19 September 2020 1:29 PM 
To: Jenny Lim <jenny.lim@laihuat.com.sg> 
Subject: RE: Your Ref: SHD 3162E / Our Ref: SMF 9487J (Date of Accident: 08.01.2020) //LKK REF:
CC4/III20000941/Kps3
 
2nd REMINDER                                          Without Prejudice
 
Hi Jenny,
 
We refer to our email dated 03/08/2020.
 
For the medical claim, can you assist to confirm that the passenger will not be claiming further for injury? If so,
kindly let us have a copy of authorisa�on to act signed by the passenger for our further ac�on. Thanks.
 

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole
intention of resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability,
whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

 

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially
affect/influence on the issues of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation
terms/settlement.”

 
 
Best Regards,
Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Phone: 6742 3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741 4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) 
Sent: Monday, 31 August 2020 10:34 AM 
To: Jenny Lim <jenny.lim@laihuat.com.sg> 
Subject: FW: Your Ref: SHD 3162E / Our Ref: SMF 9487J (Date of Accident: 08.01.2020) //LKK REF:
CC4/III20000941/Kps3

mailto:chewht@lkkauto.com
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REMINDER                                          Without Prejudice
 
Hi Jenny,
 
We refer to our email dated 03/08/2020.
 
For the medical claim, can you assist to confirm that the passenger will not be claiming further for injury? If so,
kindly let us have a copy of authorisa�on to act signed by the passenger for our further ac�on. Thanks.
 
 
“Kindly note that this nego�a�on between par�es on this ma�er is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole inten�on of
resolving the ma�er amicably without par�es resor�ng to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed /
inferred from this nego�a�on of terms/se�lement.
 
In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the
issues of liability/damages, either party is not bound, therea�er, by the nego�a�on terms/se�lement.”
 
Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email.  Submission of claim related
documents will be in so�copy. Any inconvenience caused is much regre�ed.
 

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com | Fax: 6741 4108

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 |

S(408933)

 
 
From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>  
Sent: Monday, 3 August 2020 11:14 AM 
To: Jenny Lim <jenny.lim@laihuat.com.sg> 
Subject: Re: Your Ref: SHD 3162E / Our Ref: SMF 9487J (Date of Accident: 08.01.2020) //LKK REF:
CC4/III20000941/Kps3
 
Without Prejudice
 
Hi Jenny,
 
Thank you for your email.
 
For the medical claim, can you assist to confirm that the passenger will not be claiming further for injury? If so,
kindly let us have a copy of authorisa�on to act signed by the passenger for our further ac�on. Thanks.
 
 

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole
intention of resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability,

mailto:chewht@lkkauto.com
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whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

 

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially
affect/influence on the issues of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation
terms/settlement.”

 
Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email.  Submission of claim related
documents will be in so�copy. Any inconvenience caused is much regre�ed.
 
Best Regards,
Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Phone: 6742 3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741 4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
 

From: Jenny Lim <jenny.lim@laihuat.com.sg> 
Sent: Wednesday, 29 July 2020 1:40 PM 
To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: Your Ref: SHD 3162E / Our Ref: SMF 9487J (Date of Accident: 08.01.2020) //LKK REF:
CC4/III20000941/Kps3
 
Dear Hsiao Tong
 
Please find enclosed documents for your kind attention.
 
Thank you.
 
Kind regards.
 
Jenny Lim
for LAI HUAT (MENG KEE) MOTOR PTE LTD
160 Sin Ming Drive
#04-01, #04-02 & #07-03
Sin Ming Autocity
Singapore 575722
Tel: 64538110
Fax: 64596267
 
From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>  
Sent: Tuesday, 16 June 2020 4:27 pm 
To: Jenny Lim <jenny.lim@laihuat.com.sg> 
Subject: RE: Your Ref: SHD 3162E / Our Ref: SMF 9487J (Date of Accident: 08.01.2020) //LKK REF:
CC4/III20000941/Kps3
 
Without Prejudice
 
Hi Jenny,
 
Could you please scan and email a copy of your LOD with all the relevant docs to me?
 

mailto:chewht@lkkauto.com
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Thanks.
 
“Kindly note that this nego�a�on between par�es on this ma�er is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole inten�on of
resolving the ma�er amicably without par�es resor�ng to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed /
inferred from this nego�a�on of terms/se�lement.
 
In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the
issues of liability/damages, either party is not bound, therea�er, by the nego�a�on terms/se�lement.”
 
Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email.  Submission of claim related
documents will be in so�copy. Any inconvenience caused is much regre�ed.
 

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com | Fax: 6741 4108

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 |

S(408933)

 
 
From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>  
Sent: Wednesday, 27 May 2020 12:51 PM 
To: Jenny Lim <jenny.lim@laihuat.com.sg> 
Subject: Re: Your Ref: SHD 3162E / Our Ref: SMF 9487J (Date of Accident: 08.01.2020) //LKK REF:
CC4/III20000941/Kps3
 
Without Prejudice
 
Hi Jenny,
 
Could you please scan and email a copy of your LOD with all the relevant docs to me?
 
Thanks.
 
 

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole
intention of resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability,
whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

 

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially
affect/influence on the issues of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation
terms/settlement.”

 

mailto:chewht@lkkauto.com
mailto:chewht@lkkauto.com
mailto:jenny.lim@laihuat.com.sg
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Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email.  Submission of claim related
documents will be in so�copy. Any inconvenience caused is much regre�ed.
 
Best Regards,
Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Phone: 6256 3561 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741 4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
 

From: Jenny Lim <jenny.lim@laihuat.com.sg> 
Sent: Tuesday, 26 May 2020 12:52 PM 
To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: Your Ref: SHD 3162E / Our Ref: SMF 9487J (Date of Accident: 08.01.2020) //LKK REF:
CC4/III20000941/Kps3
 
Dear Hsiao Tong
 
Documents was sent on 29.04.2020 to your office.
 
Thank you.
 
Kind regards.
 
Jenny Lim
for LAI HUAT (MENG KEE) MOTOR PTE LTD
160 Sin Ming Drive
#04-01, #04-02 & #07-03
Sin Ming Autocity
Singapore 575722
Tel: 64538110
Fax: 64596267
 
From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>  
Sent: Tuesday, 26 May 2020 9:27 am 
To: Jenny Lim <jenny.lim@laihuat.com.sg> 
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: Re: Your Ref: SHD 3162E / Our Ref: SMF 9487J (Date of Accident: 08.01.2020) //LKK REF:
CC4/III20000941/Kps3
 
Without Prejudice
 
Hi Jenny,
 
Further to our below email.
 
Pls send the LOD & all the docs to us (LKK).
 
Thanks.
 

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole
intention of resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability,
whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

mailto:chewht@lkkauto.com
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In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially
affect/influence on the issues of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation
terms/settlement.”

 
Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email.  Submission of claim related
documents will be in so�copy. Any inconvenience caused is much regre�ed.
 
Best Regards,
Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Phone: 6256 3561 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741 4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
 

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> 
Sent: Wednesday, 29 April 2020 10:41 AM 
To: Jenny Lim <jenny.lim@laihuat.com.sg> 
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: Re: Your Ref: SHD 3162E / Our Ref: SMF 9487J (Date of Accident: 08.01.2020) //LKK REF:
CC4/III20000941/Kps3
 
Without Prejudice
 
Hi Jenny,
 
Pls send the LOD & all the docs to us (LKK).
 
Thanks.
 

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole
intention of resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability,
whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

 

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially
affect/influence on the issues of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation
terms/settlement.”

 
Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email.  Submission of claim related
documents will be in so�copy. Any inconvenience caused is much regre�ed.
 
Best Regards,
Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Phone: 6256 3561 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741 4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
 

mailto:chewht@lkkauto.com
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From: Jenny Lim <jenny.lim@laihuat.com.sg> 
Sent: Wednesday, 29 April 2020 10:39 AM 
To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: Your Ref: SHD 3162E / Our Ref: SMF 9487J (Date of Accident: 08.01.2020)
 
Dear Hsiao Tong
 
We refer to the above.
 
Please advise whether LOD to send to LKK or direct to India.
 
Thank you.
 
Kind regards.
 
Jenny Lim
for LAI HUAT (MENG KEE) MOTOR PTE LTD
160 Sin Ming Drive
#04-01, #04-02 & #07-03
Sin Ming Autocity
Singapore 575722
Tel: 64538110
Fax: 64596267
 

mailto:jenny.lim@laihuat.com.sg
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Claim Audit

 

 
AUDIT TRAIL
No. On Audit Remarks By

1
15 Jan
2020
15:04

Clm Dtl
Modified Claimant's Name: -> GOH YONG KHIAN. [A] Lee Su

Li

2
15 Jan
2020
15:04

Clm Veh
Model
Changed

(204804) NISSAN QASHQAI 1.2 DIG-T CVT ABS 2WD 5DR (A). [A] Lee Su
Li

3
15 Jan
2020
15:04

Clm
Created

Reg No: SMF9487J. Acct Date: 2020/01/08. Claim Type: TP. Insurer: India International Insurance Pte Ltd (H
Q). Workshop: Lai Huat (Meng Kee) Motor Pte Ltd (Sin Ming)

[A] Lee Su
Li

4
15 Jan
2020
15:04

Adj Co
Assigned LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ): [A] Lee Su

Li

5
15 Jan
2020
15:04

Adj Next
Rpt
Changed

Next Rpt:Final Rpt.Due Date:2020/01/24 [A] Lee Su
Li

6
15 Jan
2020
15:04

Adj
Mandate
Set

Approved:0.00.Reinsp:Adj decides. [A] Lee Su
Li

7
15 Jan
2020
15:05

Adj
Adjuster
Assigned

[None] -> KENNETH KONG [A] Lee Su
Li

8
15 Jan
2020
15:05

Label
Added (30653):Direct Settlement. [A] Lee Su

Li

9
18 Jan
2020
08:48

Adj
Mandate
Request

Cur.Req:0.00:PODS
Liability: 100%(BOLA 27)
[A] CHEW

HSIAO
TONG

10
20 Jan
2020
09:39

Adj Next
Rpt
Changed

Next Rpt:Final Rpt.Due Date:2020/01/24 [I] Sherini
Pillai

11
20 Jan
2020
09:39

Adj
Mandate
Set

Approved:0.00. [I] Sherini
Pillai

12
21 May
2020
16:56

Adj Rpt
Initiated

[A]
JOANNE

LEE KHANG
MIN

13
21 May
2020
16:56

Clm Dtl
Modified Insured Name: -> -. Insured ID: -> -. Claim Conclusion: -> 3.

[A]
JOANNE

LEE KHANG
MIN

14
21 May
2020
16:56

Clm Dtl
Modified JPJ Reg. Date: -> 2016/12/20.

[A]
JOANNE

LEE KHANG
MIN

15
21 May
2020
16:56

Clm
Details
Notified

[A]
JOANNE

LEE KHANG
MIN

16
15 Jul
2020
12:20

Adj
Mandate
Request

Cur.Req:3073.77:PODS
Liability: 100%
*Quantum: (a)CORw/GST: $2,390.68 + (b)LOR(3days x $100.00):
$300.00 + (c)LTA/GIA search fee: $7.49 +(d)Medical Fee:$375.60 = Total: $3,073.77
*Vehicle Model: Nissan
Qashqai (1197cc)
*3recommendation repair day

[A] CHEW
HSIAO
TONG

17
16 Jul
2020
13:36

Adj Next
Rpt
Changed

Cur Rpt:Final Rpt. Cur Due Date:2020/01/24. Mandate Remarks: Can we confirm passenger will not be claimi
ng further for injury?

[I] Sherini
Pillai

18
16 Jul
2020
13:36

Adj
Mandate
Set

Approved:3073.77:Can we confirm passenger will not be claiming further for injury? [I] Sherini
Pillai

19
02 Jun
2021
10:08

Adj
Mandate
Request

Cur.Req:3073.77:Hi, 3rd party confirmed that no further injury claim via email. Kindly let us have your mand
ate, Thanks.

[A] CHEW
HSIAO
TONG

20
02 Jun
2021
17:44

Adj
Mandate
Set

Approved:3073.77. [I] Sherini
Pillai

Date From       Date To       Audit Type None Go



ACTIVITY
No record



Merimen Billing for this case - Transaction History

Bill Ref No Bill Date Bill Type Acc Type Acc Name Co Name
(Branch) Ref 1 Ref 2 Amount

2507772 21 May 2020
16:56:38

OD/TP Case
(Adjuster) Motor

LKK Auto
Consultants

Pte Ltd

LKK Auto
Consultants
Pte Ltd (HQ)

SMF9487J SHD3162E 11.00

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRroot&fuseaction=dsp_home&setlogin=0&CFID=85797727&CFTOKEN=1c7b005d830f35fa-EF5AF653-C247-8F30-9A7154B5BE432FD5&USID=3251&RID=3304030
https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRroot&fuseaction=dsp_home&setpersonal=0&CFID=85797727&CFTOKEN=1c7b005d830f35fa-EF5AF653-C247-8F30-9A7154B5BE432FD5&USID=3251&RID=3304030
https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRroot&fuseaction=dsp_home&setpersonal=1&personal=1&CFID=85797727&CFTOKEN=1c7b005d830f35fa-EF5AF653-C247-8F30-9A7154B5BE432FD5&USID=3251&RID=3304030
https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=SVCmail&fuseaction=dsp_composemail&mode=0&CFID=85797727&CFTOKEN=1c7b005d830f35fa-EF5AF653-C247-8F30-9A7154B5BE432FD5&USID=3251&RID=3304030&urlback=/claims/index.cfm%3Ffusebox%3DMTRadjuster%26fuseaction%3Ddsp_viewhistory%26caseid%3D906933%26extid%3D328783%26
https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/undefined
https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRsec&fuseaction=act_logout&CFID=85797727&CFTOKEN=1c7b005d830f35fa-EF5AF653-C247-8F30-9A7154B5BE432FD5&USID=3251&RID=3304030


7/2/2021 Merimen e-Claims

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=dsp_viewhistory&caseid=906933&extid=328783&CFID=857… 2/2







