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Mote: This document has not been finalised.

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd icoregno1esor108r)
51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25, Paya Ubi Industrial Park
Singapore 408933
Tel: 6256-3561 Fax: 6844-8805 Email: sur@lkkauto.com;assignments@lkkauto.com

Tor: ERGO Insurance Pte. Lid. From: LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
5 Temasek Boulevard 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25
#04-01 Suntec Tower Five Paya Ubi Industrial Park
Singapore 038985 Singapore 408833

Attn: Date: 03 Feb 2020

Preliminary Advice

Insured Vehicle No  : GBFT486H

TP Vehicle No . SKVEBBEA Accident Date S 12/01/2020
Make : HONDA CBR Assignment Date : 15/01/2020
Date of Inspection : 31/01/2020 Est, Duration of Repair 04
Inspection At

Point of Impact | General Description of Damages
The vehicle sustained impact / damages rear portion and parts claimed are consistent to the accident.

Repairer's Estimate (Gross) 5% 4.445.00
Revised Amount 55 4,155.00
Check Iters (Estimated) 5% 0.00
Total et 4,155.00
Lump Sum Repair 55

Total Loss Consideration

Mew for Old Value 8§
Pre-Accident Value 5§
COE | PARF Rebate it
Salvage Value 8%
Margin for Repair 5%

Remarks

{ ] The vehicle is repairable at our adjusted amount. We have also confirmed excess and policy coverage. Kindly let us
have your authorisation.

[ }  The vehicle is uneconomical to be repaired, you are advised to invite tender for the wreck.

( X } Othercomments : THE ABOVE SURVEY WAS CONDUCTED ON A WITHOUT "PREJUDICE" BASIS.



Nivitha (LKK Auto)
E

From: ERGO Insurance Pte. Ltd. (Claims Department) <claims@ergo.com.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, 15 January 2020 9:55 AM

To: Ivy Yong; jenny.lim@laihuat.com.sg; Admin-D (LKKAuto (admin-d@lkkauto.com);
Admin A (admin-a@Ikkauto.com); Mei Kwan (LKKAuto (Meikwan®@lkkauto.com)

Cc Zheng Hanyang; Phoebe Xie

Subject: FW: Claims ref no. (P) CDMCG20000084 Request for Survey (TP) - Your Ref: GBF
7486H / Our Ref: SKV 686A (DOA: 12.01.20)

Attachments: 15012020085143.pdf

Date Classification : Confidential, C3

** NOTE: Please submit case, upload all related survey documents and input our claim no. into
Merimen. Payment invoices shall be ignored for cases that are not submitted via Merimen.

Hi LKK,

Please conduct this survey request.
(Note: Survey vehicle only, LOD will be handled by Ergo)

Kindly inform us if you are not able to attend it.

Thank you.

ERGO Insurance Ple. Ltd

*k Boulevard #04-05 Suntec Towar Five
noanore NA9A5
DIty  +55 6529 3104

paulinge soh@ergo com. sg

ERGO

JF Ine ma|or insurance groups I'1 sermmany and E.JI_‘IL-’ Waridwide, ERGO is represented in more than 30 countries and concentrates
Asia ERGO is parl of Munich Re (Group!. ane of the world's leading risk carrers
ended anly h il adoressee, and may De pnvikeged I you are not the intended recgment. wou
¥o £ i .

From: Jenny Lim [mailto:jenny.lim@laihuat.com.sg]

Sent: Wednesday, 15 January 2020 8:55 am

To: ERGO Insurance Pte. Ltd. (Claims Department)

Subject: Request for Survey (TP) - Your Ref: GBF 7486H / Our Ref: SKV 686A (DOA: 12.01.20)

Dear Sir



We refer to the above matter.

Please can you arrange to survey our client's vehicle no. SKV 686A7
Supporting documents are enclosed for your reference.

Thank you,

Kind regards.

Jenny Lim

for LAl HUAT (MENG KEE) MOTOR PTE LTD
160 Sin Ming Drive

#04-01, #04-02 & #07-03

Sin Ming Autocity

Singapore 575722

Tel: 64538110

Fax: 64596267





