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~ Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuta)

Sent: Friday, 17 January 2020 12:00 PM

To: Dynamic Autowork; SUR

Subject: SDM 6288G-D0OA: 11/1/2020 (UOI o)
Attachments: OD Claim - DV (UOI).pdf

Dear Michelle,

As instructed by our client , please proceed to repair the insured vehicle SDM 6288G, Not Exceeding
Lump Sum Repair $12,500/-or whichever lower, (Excess $500).

If there are any check items or supplementary items please inform our office’s Assignment Team at Tel:
6741 8434 to arrange our surveyor for inspection.

All supplementary items and unconfirm items are subjected to further approval from insurance company
before completion of the repair.

*Our client reserve their rights not to pay if there is no valid approval obtained before repair.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-2561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)



Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: WONG JOSEPHINE <josephinewong@uoi.com.sg>

Sent: Friday, 17 January 2020 11:16 AM

To: WVeron Chen (LKKAuto)

Cc: SUR; LEE KATIE

Subject: RE: SDM6288G (OD CLAIM) DOA: 11/01/2020 Conduct Survey Our ref:
M12D12542001

without Prejudice

Dear Veron
We refer to your email of 16 January 2020.
Kindly proceed to authorise repair at 512,500.

Claim no: M12D12542001 AND Excess is 5500.0

Josephine Wong
Execulive
Claims

United Overseas Insurance Limited

1 Anson Boad, #28-01 Springleaf Tower. Singapore 072909
Main » (651 6222 7733 | DID » (65) 6490 9329 | Fax « (65) 8327 30868 | Email » jozephinewong@uoi. com.sg

UOE EMAIL DISCLAIMER

Any person receiving this email and any attachment(s) contained, shall treat the information as confidential and not misuse, copy
disclose, distribute or retain the information in any way that amounts to a breach of confidentiality. If you are not the intended
recipient, please delete all copies of this email from your computer system. As the integrity of this message cannot be guaranteed,
neither UOB nor any entity in the UOB Group shall be responsible for the contents, Any opinion in this email may not necessarily
represent the opinion of UOB or any entity in the UOE Group,

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) [maiH:o:uemnchen@ikkautu.coml

sent: Thursday, January 16, 2020 12:09 PM

To: WONG JOSEPHINE <josephinewong@uoi.com.sg>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>
Cc: LEE KATIE <katielee@uoi.com.sg>

Subject: RE: SDM6288G (0D CLAIM) DOA: 11/01/2020 Conduct Survey

Dear Josephine,

Enclosed preliminary revised of vehicle SDM 6288G
Date of survey: 15/1/2020

Number of days (estimated) : 6 days

Repairer agree repair cost Not Exceeding $12,500/-

We have Not authorise repair.

Kindly let us have your approval, provides claim number and policy excess



Best Regards,
_ Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@Ilkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-d@Ilkkauto.com>

sent: Wednesday, 15 January 2020 10:52 AM

To: "WONG JOSEPHINE' <josephinewong@uoi.com.sg>; assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>
Cc: 'LEE KATIE' <katielee@uoi.com.sg>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: SDM6288G (0D CLAIM) DOA: 11/01/2020 Conduct Survey

Dear Sir/Mdm,

Thank you for the assignment.

Best Regards

G.NIVITHA

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6841-1072 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: WONG JOSEPHINE [mailto:josephinewong@uoi.com.sg]

sent: Wednesday, 15 January 2020 9:09 AM

To: visionautowork@gmail.com

Cc: LEE KATIE <katielee @uni.com.sg>; assignments@|kkauto.com; sur@lkkauto.com
Subject: FW: SDM6288G (0D CLAIM) DOA: 11/01/2020 Conduct Survey

Without Prejudice

Dear Michelle

We refer to your email of 14 January 2020.

We will appoint LKK Auto Consultants for the survey.

Kindly forward us the estimate or give a copy to the surveyor.

LKK- Please attend to the survey .

Josephine Wong

Executive
Claims

United Overseas Insurance Limited



3 Anson Road, #28-01 Springleaf Tawer, Singapore 079809
Main = (65) 222 7733 | DID - (65) 8480 9323 | Fax + (85} 6327 3868 | Email « josephinewonafuoi.com.5g9

UOB EMAIL DISCLAIMER
Any person receiving this email and any attachment(s) contained, zhall treat the information as confidential and not misuse,; Copy,
disciose. distribute or retain the information in any way that amounts to a breach of confidentiality If you are not the intended
recipient, please delete all copies of this email from your computer system. As the integrity of this message cannot be guaranteed,
neither UOE nor any entity in the UOB Group shall be responsible for the contents. Any opinion in this email may not necessarily
represent the opinion of UOE or any entity in the UOB Group.

From: Vision Autowork [mailto:visionautowork@gmail.com]

Sent: Tuesday, 14 January, 2020 11:34 AM

To: LEE KATIE <katielee@uoi.com.sg>; LEE KATIE <katielee @uoi.com.sg>; LEW JENNY <jennylew @ Uoi.com.sg>
Subject: SDM6288G (OD CLAIM)

Dear Person In Charge,

Please arrange surveyor to survey the above OD CLAIM (SDM6288G)

Thank You
Yours faithfully,

Michelle
Hp: 9856 4815

8 Kaki Bukit Avenue 4,
#08-09,Premier (@ Kaki Bukit,
Singapore 415875

Tel: 6341 6789

Fax: 6341 6778

This email has been checked for viruses by AVG antivirus software.
WWW. AvEe.co m



EMIM—__—__-_

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 16 January 2020 12:09 PM

To: "WONG JOSEPHINE'; SUR

Cc: ‘LEE KATIE'

Subject: RE: SDM6288G (OD CLAIM) DOA: 11/01/2020 Conduct Survey
Attachments: MARK EST.pdf; PRELI REVISED.pdf

Dear Joscphine,

Enclosed preliminary revised of vehicle SDM 6288G
Date of survey: 15/1/2020
Number of days (estimated) : 6 days

Repairer agree repair cost Not Exceeding $12,500/-
We have Not authorise repair.

Kindly let us have your approval, provides claim number and policy excess

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | emall :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-d@Ikkauto.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 15 January 2020 10:52 AM

To: '"WONG JOSEPHINE' <josephinewong@uoi.com.sg>; assignments <assignments@Ilkkauto.com>
Cc: 'LEE KATIE' <katielee@uoi.com.sg>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: SDMB6288G (OD CLAIM) DOA: 11/01,/2020 Conduct Survey

Dear Sir/Mdm,

Thank you for the assignment.

« wishing you a Happy ana rrosperous Lunar New Yeqr -

Best Regards

G.NIVITHA

LEKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-1972 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S{408933)



From: WONG JOSEPHINE [mailto:josephinewong@uoi.com.sg]

Sent: Wednesday, 15 January 2020 9:09 AM

To: visionautowork@gmail.com

Cc: LEE KATIE <katielee@uoi.com.sg>; assignments@lkkauto.com; sur@|kkauto.com
Subject: FW: SDM6288G (0D CLAIM) DOA: 11/01/2020 Conduct Survey

Without Prejudice

Dear Michelle

We refer to your email of 14 January 2020.

We will appoint LKK Auto Consultants for the survey.

Kindly forward us the estimate or give a copy to the surveyor,

LKK- Please attend to the survey .

Josephine Wong

Executive
laims

United Overseas Insurance Limited

5 Anson Road, #28-01 Springleaf Tower, Singapore 079805
Main = (85) 6222 7733 | DID « (65) 6490 8329 | Fax - (63} £327 3860 | Email - josephinewong@uol com.sg

UOB EMAIL DISCLAIMER

Any person receiving this email and any attachment(s) contained, shall treat the information as confidential and not misuse, copy,
disclose. distribute or retain the information in any way that amounts to a breach of confidentiality. If you are not the intended
recipient, please delete all copies of this email from your computer system. As the integrity of this message cannot be guaranteed,
neither UOB nor any entity in the UOB Group shall be responsible for the contents. Any opinion in this email may not necessarily
represent the opinion of UOB or any entity in the UOB Group.

From: Vision Autowork [mailto:visionautowork@gmail.com]

Sent: Tuesday, 14 January, 2020 11:34 AM

To: LEE KATIE <katielee@uoi.com.sg>; LEE KATIE <katielee@uoi.com.sg>; LEW JENNY <jennylew@uoi.com.5g>
Subject: SDM6288G (0D CLAIM)

Dear Person In Charge,

Please arrange surveyor to survey the above OD CLAIM (SDM6288G)

Thank You
Yours faithfully,

Michelle
Hp: 9856 4815



8 Kaki Bukit Avenue 4,
#08-09,Premier (@ Kaki Bukit,
Singapore 415875

Tel: 6341 6789

Fax: 6341 6778

. AVG This email has been checked for viruses by AVG antivirus software.
; WWW.avg.com
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Bk WA Fie Lid Company Reglistration No. 199607198R

51 UBLAYE 1, #02-25 PAYA UBI INDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 08933 TEL: 1065 62563561 FAX : (065) 62564313

Your ref: PLEASE ADVISED

Our ref: CS/UOI20000927/Avd3 Date : 16/1/2020

The Motor Claims Department
UNITED OVERSEAS INSURANCE LTD

Dear Sir,

PRELIMINARY ADVICE OF VEHICLE NO.SDM 6288G

We thank you for your instruction on 15/1/2020

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the above mentioned vehicle on

15/1/2020 at the premises of M/s DYNAMIC AUTOWORK PTE LTD
and have the following to report:-

Workshop Estimate Amount : §$32,848.70
Revised Estimate Amount 1 5813,823.00
"Check"” Items Amount : S$4.815.95

Total : S$18.638.95
Market Value : $$56.000.00
LTA Reimbursement Value 1 5$43,048.00
Nett Value : §%12,952.00

Description of Damage:

The vehicle sustained damages at the
front n/s portion and undercarriage

Comments/Present Status:
Damages Consistent
Repair Cost Economical

Repairer agree repair cost Not Exceeding $12,500/-
Yours faithfully, [‘5 b Hj__:&;'.,__'}ﬁ}"'?.
ADRIAN LING WAI PING

B.Eng AMSOE,AMIRTE,AMSAE-A,M.MATAI|
Licensed Appraiser



Nivitha (LKK Auto)
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From: WONG JOSEPHINE <josephinewong@uoi.com.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, 15 January 2020 5:09 AM

To: visionautowork@gmail.com

Cc: LEE KATIE; assignments@lkkauto.com; sur@Ilkkauto.com

Subject: FW: SDM6288G (OD CLAIM)  DOA: 11/01/2020 Conduct Survey
Attachments: 0Ol - SDM6B288G.zip

Without Prejudice

Dear Michelle

We refer to your email of 14 lanuary 2020,

We will appoint LKK Auto Consultants for the survey,

Kindly forward us the estimate or give a copy to the surveyor.

LKK- Please attend to the survey .

Josephine Wong

United Overseas Insurance Limited

3 Anson Road. #28-01 Sprngleaf Tower, Singapore 078508

e e T A

Main » (6536222 V3| DID « (B5) 5490 9329 | Fax « (65) 6327 3860 | Email » josephinewongEuoi com.sg

UOB EMAIL DISCLAIMER

Any person receiving this email and any attachment(s) contained, shall treat the information as confidential and not misuse, copy,
disclose, distribute or retain the information in any way that amounts to a breach of confidentiality. If you are not the intended
recipient, please delete all copies of this email from your computer system. As the integrity of this message cannot be guaranteed,
neither UOB nor any entity in the UOB Group shall be responsible for the contents. Any opinion in this email may not necessarily
represent the opinion of UOEB or any entity in the UOB Group

From: Vision Autowork [mailtovisionautowork@email.com]

Sent: Tuesday, 14 January, 2020 11:34 AM

To: LEE KATIE <katfielee@uoi.com.sg>; LEE KATIE <katielee@uoi.com.sg>; LEW JENNY <jennylew@ugi.com.sg>
Subject: SDME288G (0D CLAIM)

Dear Person In Charge,

Please arrange surveyor to survey the above OD CLAIM (SDM6288G)

Thank You
Yours faithfully,

Michelle
Hp: 9856 4815



8 Kaki Bukit Avenue 4,
#08-09,Premier @ Kaki Bukit,
‘Singapore 415875

Tel: 6341 6789

Fax: 6341 6778



> Back to OneMotoring

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Vehicle Owner Particulars
Owner D Type:

Crwner 1D

Vehicle Details

Wehicle Mo

Vehicle ta be Exported:
Intended Deregistration Date:
Wehicla Make:

Wehicle Madel:

Primary Colour:
Manufacturing Year:

Engine No.:

Chassis Mo

Maximurm Power Qutput:
Open Market Value:

Original Registration Date:
First Registration Date:
Transfér Count:

Actual ARF Paid:

Intended PARF Rebate Details
PARF Eligibility:

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date:
PARF Rebate Amount:
Intended COE Rebate Details
COE Explry Date:

COE Category:

COE Period(Years):

QP Paid:

COE Rebate Amaount:

Total Rebate Amount:

The information contained herein is correct as at 16 Jan 2020

Singapore NRIC
4201

SDMEZBBG

Mo

16 Jan 2020

B.MMW.

3281 2.0 AT DVAB 4DR ABS HID DSC
Grey

2012
ASIE01Z23NZ0B20A
WEAIASZI040F253644
180.0 kW (241 bhp)
$39.705.00

04 May 2012

04 May 2012

1

$39,705.00

Yes
03 May 2022
$23.823.00

03 May 2022

E - Open Category
10

$84,590.00
$19,225.00
$43,048.00



> Back to OneMotoring

Enguire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Chwner |D Type:
Chwner 1D:;

Singapore NRIC
4201

Vehicle No,

Vehicle to be Exported:
Intended Deregistration Date:
Wehicle Make:

Vehicle Model;

Primary Colour:
Manufacturing Year
Engine Mo.:

Chassis Mo,

taximum Power Output:
Open Market Value:
Original Registration Date:
First Registration Date:
Transfer Count:

Actual ARF Paid:

SDM&2BEG

Yes

15 Jan 2020

B

3281 2.0 AT D/AB 4DR ABS HID DSC
Grey

2012
AS3&01Z3INZ0B204A
WEAJAS2040F253544
1800 kW (241 bhp)
£39,705.00

04 May 2012

04 May 2012

1

$39.705.00

PARF Eligibility:
PARF Eligibility Expiry Date:
PARF Rebate Amount

Yes
03 May 2022
$23.823.00

COE Expiry Date:
COE Category:
COE Perigd(Years):
QP Paid:
COE Rebate Amount:
Total Rebate Amount:
The information centained herein is correct as at 15 Jan 2020

03 May 2022

E - Open Category
10

384 ,590.00
£19,248.00
$43,071.00

OK



»

Enguire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

" » Back to OneMotoring

Vehicle Owner Particulars
Chwnier [D Type:

v 10

Vehlcle Details

Wehicle No.:

‘ehidle to be Exported:
Intended Deregistration Date:
Wishicle Make!

Vehicle Modsl:

Primary Colour:
Manufacturing Year

Engine Mo

Chassis Mo

Miimurn Power Output:
Cpen Markst Value:

Criginal Registration Date:
Firss Registration Date:
Transfer Count:

Actual ARF Paid:

Intended PARF Rebate Details
PARF Eligibility:

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date:
PARF Rebate Amount:
Intended COE Rebate Details
COE Exgiry Date:

COE Category:

COE Periood{Years]:

aF Pald:

COE Rebate Amount:

Total Rebate Amount:

The information contained herein is correct a8 at 13 Jan 2020

Sinpapore NRIC
4201

SOMEEERG

Mo

13 Jan 2020

B.MW

A28) 2.0 AT D/AB 4DR ABS HID DSC
Grey

2012
ASIE0123MNI08204
WEAINSZ0L0F253444
180.0KWY 1241 bhph
£36,705.00

O By 2012

0 oy 2002

1

£35. 705,00

Yes

03 May 2022
$23,823.00

03 May 2022

E - Open Category
10

BE4.550.00
$19.295.00
$43,118.00

OK
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bimws 328 Aniy Ary vy Ay My Hryt Availablo
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PML Unit! Sporty 3 Senes Looking For Its Mext Owner, Under Warranty By Optima Carz Pte Ltd Till 06/06/2022 Still. Many Parts Replaced &

with Receipts, Alr Con Compressor, Power Steering Racks, Absorbers,roof Lining Repicaed Etc, Flexible Loan Options With High Trade In... e et
[[] eMw 3 Series 328 Sport $70,000 $19,910 fyr 12020132 1,967 ox 133,100 km Lunury Avallabie
1 Cwimer/PML Unit! Sportiest And Aggressive Snout Front Grill Stand Out From The Crowds. Bidded Double-Digit Plate Wil B2 Handed

Crer. Sublime Handling Makes Your Dady Drive Pleasurable. Well Maintain By Owner, Brake Rotors Replaced By PML Less Than & Month..,  reannen 10 ]

Car Buyers Autsmative Pte Lid

[] BMW 3 Series 31Bi M-Sport $65,800 $1B,300 fyr 15-Jun-2011 1,997 cx 63,292 km Lunury Available

Low Milzage Done At 83,293 Km Only! PML Unit! Full M-5eries With M Body-Kit. 197 BMW Sport Steggered Rims With New Tices, Upgraded
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] BMW 3 Series 328i Sport 68,888 $16,890 fyr 07-Mov-2012 1,997 oc 145,000 km Lumury Available

PML Unit. Mo Worrias On Oil Leak, 100% Accident Free, Never Bean To Tradk, View To Appreciate, et commin

Mirage Motorwerkz Pte Ltd - Specialty Workshops
Mirage Motorwerkz Fle Lid is a one-stop car workshog which 1o provide friendly, reliable and prices compelitig molaring Senacses,

Mora infy about this shop

!? BMW 3 Series 3281 M-Sport S70,000 517,150 fyr 05-Nay-2012 1,997 cc Q6,000 km Loy Available

RARE Hed Lnterior Linit? Sportiest M-Sport!? Front Grill 2tand Out From The Crowds. Sublime Handiing Makes Your Daily Drive Pleasurable,
‘Wil Maintain By Owner, Zero Mishap! MO Repairs Needed! Superb Condetion Uinit! View To Bedlievel Whatsapp To View Now! By Appoint...

360 ¥R Cars

[] BMw 3 Serdes 3281 Gran $105,800 $15.470 fyr 15-Nov-2014 1,967 cc 24,000 km Lumuary Avallabie
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& Manths Warranty, Excellent Condition, Bank Loan/Tn House Loan Available, Trade In Weloome,

[] BMw 2 Series 328i M-Sport $112,BE8 $15,880 fyr 02-Apr-2015 1,957 75,000 km Lusury Available
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KAMAA 20006050 ! Matkonal Accessmant Centre Sendces « Bukit Merah
ENTR: DATE & TIME: 140712020 10052
SUSMITTED BY: ROSLI BIN ASDUL WAHRE

Your NCD will be affected due to late reporting
Actual e-Filling Submission Date & Time: 14/01/2020 11:02

SINGAPORE ACCIDENT STATEMENT

IMPORTANT NOTICE

1. Please report I:GI'I‘ECJ.I! the details of tha accicen! to speed up the claims process

2. This Fosm must be completad by the Policybalder andior the Authorised Driver.

3, Wformabon provided must ba as truthful and accurale as possible. Any wilful misrepresentation or wiholding of material facts may allow inserancd companes o
repudiate policy liability.

4. The issue and acceptance of this Form by inswrance companies i not an admission of pokcy ksbility on the part ol the insurance companias.

5. Any false reporting may be referred to the Police for investigation.

&, This repart will be forwarded by the insurers of the GIA Records Maragement Centre established by the General Insurance Association of Singapore (GL&) far
archiving and that copies of this report will, for a fes, be made avalable upon application by imeresied parties

7. By the lodgemant of this repaort to the insurers, you hereby consant to the archiving of this report at the centre and 1o copies of the report being made available
aforesaid

ACCIDENT STATEMENT

Date OF Report 14/01/2020 10:52

Date Of Accident 11/01/2020 01:35

Exact Location OF Accident ALONG KEW DRIVE
Country/State of Loss SINGAPORE

Vehicle Registration Number SDME2B8G
Insured/Policyholder

Mame Of Registered Owner LEE LIAN YAP

NRIC No SHO004201

Email Address HAN-TANSSE@HOTMAIL.COM
Mobile Phone No (LOCAL) +65-97386288
Alternative Phone No QOTHERS-98196288
Vehicle Particulars

Manufacturer BMW

Model 328l

Exact Purpose for which vehicle was being used at

time of accident PRIVATE USE

Ara you claiming under your own insurance policy

far repair to your vehicle? i

If Mo, Please state action to be taken

Vehicle Calegory FRIVATE CAR

Insurance Company

Name of Insurance Company UNITED OVERSEAS INSURANCE LTD
Type Of Coverage COMPREHENSIVE

Fleet Policy MO

Folicy Number DHOM120037401800

Cover Note Number
Driver

Name of Driver
NRIC Mo

Date Of Birth
Ccoupation

Date Of Driving Pass
Driving Experience
Gender

Maobille Number

Fax Mumber
Contact Number
EMail Address

TAN SOCK HAN (CHEN SHUHAN)
SAREXIL2C

18/09/1988

INDOOCR

29/10/2007

12 YEARS AND 2 MONTHS

MALE

(LOCAL) +85-97388288

CTHERS-98196288
HAN-TANSE@HOTMAIL.COM
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Address

Postcode

VWas driver an employee of the Insured's Company
If Mo, Relationship of the Driver with the Insured
Vehicle Registration Number of Driver's Own

Vehicle

Insurance Company of Driver's Own Vehicle

General Information of the Accident

Type Of Accident
Weather Conditions
Road Surface
Other Information

Was any foreign vehicle involved in this accident?
MNumber of vehicles (including own vehicle)

Invalved in the accident

Was any body injured in the Accident?
VWas any injured conveyed to hospital by

ambulance?

Was any other material or property damaged?

| have been approached by unknown person{s)
soliciting/offering accident claims assistance,

MNumber of Passengers (Including Driver)

Details of Police Action

Was the accldent reported to the police?
If Yes,Please state which Police Station
Was notice of intended Prosecution given?

If Yes,against whom?
Circumstances of Accident

15 PASIR RIS RISE
#05-40

518089
NO
CHILDREM

COLLIDED INTO PARKED VEHICLE
CLEAR
DRY

NO
2

NO
NO

YES

NO

NO

PLEASE REFER TO SKETCH PLAN AND ATTACHMENT

Attachment(s)

&rg accident photos available for attachment?
Was thera any video captured by Car Camera?

Vas there any audio recorded?

Vehicle Registration Number
Vehicle Maka/Model/Colour
Detalls Of Properties
Vehicle Category

MName of Driver
NRIC/Passport Mumber
Contact Number

Address

Postcode

Insurance Company Name
Mature Of Damage

Mo, Of Passenger (Including Driver)

YES
NO
NO

DETAILS OF OTHER VEHICLE PROPERTY 1

SJVB931P

PRIVATE CAR
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SKETCH PLAN
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Sketch Plan #3

On 11.01.20 at about 01:35hrs,! was driving along Kew Heights on my way
home, while driving on Kew Drive I accidentally bang into a stationary car
parking at 112 Kew Drive. Immediately | came down to access the damage
and notify the owner.

Vehicle (A) : SDM6288G
Vehicle (B) : SIv6931pP -

g
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Dynamic Autowork Pte.Ltd.
( ROC /GST Reg. No. 201436361C)

8 Kaki Bukit Ave 4, #08-09 Premier@Kaki Bukit
Singapore 415875

Tel

. 6341 6789

Fax: 6341 6778

E-mail:dynamicautowork@gmail.com

TO
VEHILEND : SDM6288G
MODEL : BMW 328I
DATE OF ACCIDENT + 11.01.20
TIME OF ACCIDENT  * 01:30HRS

e,

w

DATE : 14..1.20
: UOI MOTOR CLAIMS DEPTS (OD CLAIM)

WE APPEND HEREUNDER THE ESTIMATED COST OF REPAIRS TO BE CARRIED OUT TO THE ABOVE VEHICLE
CLAIM DETAIL : PARTS

SIN DESCRIPTION aTty ”';:];ET TD;::;:'E'ST
1|FRONT BUMPER  Detas i (A 1 |$ 1,595.00|%  1,595.00 |
2|FRONT BUMPER SIDE AIR VENTLH  ~ 1 /s 67.95 | § 67.95 |~
3|FRONT BUMPER FOGLAMP LH 3¢ &= 1 |8 545.00 | § 545.00 [
4|[FRONT BUMPER FOGLAMP coverLH M | 1 |3 105.00 | § 105.00 [
5|FRONT BUMPER BOTTOM GARNISH LH 1 |3 310.00 | § 310.00
6/FRONT BUMPER SIDE RETAINER R4 Hie 5 | % 75.00 | § 150400 [/
7|FRONT BUMPER PROTECTOR CHROME LH s~ | 1 | 170.00 | § 170.00 |~
8/FRONT BUMPER CENTER GRILLE /™7 “~ 2 |s 185.00 | § 470.00
9|FRONT BUMPER REINFORCEMENT %4 “— 1 |8 890.00 | 890.00 |4

10|FRONT HEADLAMP (HID8LED) ) &7 2 |s 2604005 538800 L° 7f
11|FRONT HEADLAMP LOWER BRACKET 2 |s 125.00 | § 250.00 | ~
12|FRONT HEADLAMP HID CONTROL UNIT A~ “~ | 2 |§ 94500 | §  1,890.00 |
13|FRONT HEADLAMP NOZZLE " o | § 435.00 | s 87000 |
14|FRONT HEADLAMP NOZZLE COVER 592~ | 2 |s 140.00 | § 28000 '*°
15|FRONT NOZZLE TUBE A I 5 |s 120.00 | § 240.00 | *
16|FRONT FENDER LH 2o 1 |s 124500|5 124500
17|FRONT FENDER INNER COWLING LH 19/~ 1 | % 295.00 | 8 295.00 |~ ;
18|FRONT WHEEL RIM LH ik 1 |s  1ssors|s  1.seeas] 7S )
19|FRONT KNUCKLE LH i 1 |s 735.00 | § 735.00 | 7
20|FRONT SHOCK ABSORBER LH 113 783.00 | % 783.00 | 7
21|FRONT WHEEL HUP WITH BEARING LH  * 1 |s 780.00 | § 780.00 |
22|FRONT WHEEL ABS SENSOR LH P"““"r 1 |$ 365.00 | § 365.00 |
23|FRONT STEERING RACK AND PINION 52 1 |$ 3879008  3879.00 o
24/FRONT LINKAGE LH i B 1 ]s 195.00 | § 195.00 |
25|FRONT LOWER ARM (sTRAIGHT)  Bet | 1 |g 79000($ (_ ) ?_BI:E_JE P
26|FRONT LOWER ARM (BENT) : 1 |s 96000 |5 960.00 | ~

TOTAL PRICE $ 2500870

LESS 0% 5 c

SUBTOTALPRICE §  25,008.70



TO : UOI MOTOR CLAIMS DEPTS (OD CLAIM)
VEHICLE NO . SDM6288G

MODEL : BMW 328I

DATE OF ACCIDENT  : 11.01.20

TIME OF ACCIDENT @ 01:30HRS

SIN DESCRIPTION QTY | UNIT SINETT | TOTAL SINETT
1|FRONT NUMBER PALTE ~ AL{ to- 1 |8 50.00 | § s0.00 | T
472
2|FRONT BUMPER CLIP (SET) "~ 1 |8 80.00 | § 80.00 30
b | 3
3|FRONT BUMPER BOTTOM GARNISH CLIP LH(SET) - | 1 |8 60,00 | & 8000 | -
4|FRONT FENDER INNER COWLING CLIPLH (SET) | 1 | s 50.00 | § 50007 >~
5|FRONT WHEEL TYRELH Lok 1 |s 850.00 | § 850-00 | 20
6/BRAKE OIL N 1 |s 40,00 | § 4000 | -
TOTAL $  1,130.00
CLAIM DETAILS: LABOUR AND SPRAY PAINTING
SIN JOB DESCRIPTION PRICE ADJUSTED COST
|~
PANEL BEATING, REMOVING AND S0
1|REPLACING PARTS $ 1400000 g
7
2|SPRAY PAINTING TO AFFECTED AREA | § 1.413,046 5 C
‘.z’
3|TUFF COAT $  250.00
4|WIRING CHECK $ 150,00 4
& ’_k
5|REFOCUS HEADLAMP BEAM g 80.00
REMOVE AND REFIX FRONT - g0
6|UNDERCARRIAGE $  1,200.08” s
4
REMOVE AND REFIX POWER L S0,
7|STEERING RACK AND PINION § 65000 |
8{FOUR WHEEL ALIGNMNET s 1sgoo| oV
9|RESET ABS LIGHT $ 650.00 ol
TO CHECK DIAGNOSTICS OF VEHICLE
MANAGEMENT/CONTROL UNITS RESET L Lo
10|MEMORIES TO SPECIFICATIONETC. |$ 750087
7
TOTAL $6,710.00 1) Sy
ESTIMATE REPORT L’g ";)ull 1"9.&
TOTAL PARTS COST  : § 26,138.70 _.
TOTAL LABOUR COST : § 6,710.00 AN Getlonse d
TOTAL REPAIR COST : & 32,848.70

EXcn | To L:{ iiQ] W l'{_:'_\l
NB: THIS IS ONLY AN ESTIMATE AND SHOULD ADDITIONAL WORK BE FOUND NECESSARY TO BE

CARRIED OUT IN THE COURSE OF REPAIRS, EXTRA MATERIALS AND LABOUR COST WILL BE CHARGED 06 Povys
ACCORDINGLY WHICH HOWEVER, YOU WILL BE INFORMED FRIOR TO ACTION TAKEN /

PARTS PRICES ARE SUBJECT TO CHANGES.



