Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Mui Hong @ Ah Lim Motor <muihong@ahlimmotor.com.sg>
Sent: Tuesday, 7 July 2020 2:03 PM

To: Guo Qiang (LKKAuto)

Cc: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: Draft Finalisation - SJH1419)

Dear Guo Qiang,
Noted and Thanks
Best Regards,

Kee Mui Hong

Ah Lim Motor @ AMK

10, Ang Mo Kio Industrial Park 2A
#01-09 AMK Autopoint S568047
Tel : 6483 1244 Fax: 6483 6170

From: Guo Qiang (LKKAuto) [mailto:GuoQiang@lkkauto.com]
Sent: Monday, 6 July 2020 5:29 PM

To: Mui Hong @ Ah Lim Motor <muihong@ahlimmotor.com.sg>
Cc: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: [1] & : Draft Finalisation - SJH1419)

Dear Mui Hong,

Finalize COR $350 before GST @ 2 working days.
Subject to SPF approval.

Regards,
Guo Qiang

BAFEA: Mui Hong @ Ah Lim Motor <muihong@ahlimmotor.com.sg>
RILHTE]): 2020 7 H 3 H 17:26

etk A : Guo Qiang (LKKAuto) <GuoQiang@lkkauto.com>

FE: Draft Finalisation - SJH1419)

Dear Guo Qiang,
Pls see attached the Draft Finalisation - SJH1419)
Pls advise

Best Regards,



Kee Mui Hong

Ah Lim Motor @ AMK

10, Ang Mo Kio Industrial Park 2A
#01-09 AMK Autopoint S568047
Tel : 6483 1244 Fax : 6483 6170



