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Nivitha (LKK Auto)

From: Claims <claims@premiumauto.com.sg>
Sent: Monday, 13 January 2020 2:49 PM

To: '‘Admin A'; 'Nivitha (LKK Auto)'; 'SUR'

Ce! ‘Claims'’

Subject: OD CLAIM FOR SKE 6183 J ON 13/1/2020
Attachments: SKE 6183 J - 13012020.pdf

Dear All,

Kindly register OD claim for this vehicle. Attached is the GIA report for your reference.
We will forward you the estimate once it is available.
Kindly arrange survey on 14/1/2020. Vehicle is in our compound.

Best Regards,
Svafiq
Claims Admin Assistant

Premium Automobiles Pte Ltd (Reg No 199902271W)

55 Ubi Road 1 Road Singapore 408699

p. +65 6388 2323 d. +65 6768 9911 f +656841 1183

e. claims@premiumauto.com.sg w. www.audi.com.sg

Audi Showroom, Audi Centre 281 Alexandra Road Singapore 159938 p. +65 6836 2223
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> Back to OneMotoring

‘Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle
o

wner |D Type: Singapore NRIC
Owner |D: 684H
Vehicle No.: SKE6183)
Vehicle to be Exported: Yes
Intended Deregistration Date: 14 Jan 2020
Vehicle Make: AUDI
Vehicle Model: A6 1.8 TFSI ULTRA (PI) (NAV)
Primary Colour: Silver
Manufacturing Year: 2017
Engine No.: CYG023275
Chassis No.: WAUZZZ4G3IN036761
Maximum Power Output: 140.0 kW (1B7 bhp)
Open Market Value: $43,963.00
Original Registration Date: 17 Aug 2018
First Registration Date: 17 Aug 2018
Transfer Count: 4]
Actual ARF Paid: $53,549.00
PARF Eligibility: Yes
PARF Eligibility Expiry Date: 16 Aug 2028
PARF Rebate Amount: $40,161.00
COE Expiry Date: 16 Aug 2028
COCE Category: B - Car above 1600cc or 97kW (130bhp)
COE Period(Years): 10
QP Paid: $34,381.00
COE Rebate Amount: $27,504.00
Total Rebate Amount;: $67,665.00

The information contained herein is correct as at 14 Jan 2020
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‘ shiriéz Hiew (LKK Auto)

From: Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto)

Sent: Thursday, 16 January 2020 3:24 pm

To: Claims

Ce Admin-D (LKKAuto); SUR

Subject: RE: OD CLAIM FOR SKE 6183 J ON 13/1/2020
Dear Troy,

As instructed by our client, please proceed to repair the insured vehicle SKE 6183 (Excess $ 400/-).

If there are any check items or supplementary items please inform our office’s Assignment Team at Tel: 6741 8434 to
arrange our surveyor for inspection.

All supplementary items and unconfirm items are subjected to further approval from insurance company before
completion of the repair.

*QOur client reserve their right not to pay if there is no valid approval obtained before repair.

+ Wishing you @ Happy ana rrosperous Lunar New Yeqr »

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Shirley Hiew | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Sur@|kkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Claims <claims@premiumauto.com.sg>

Sent: Thursday, 16 January 2020 9:12 am

To: Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto) <ShirleyHiew@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-d@lkkauto.com>; SUR <sur@Ilkkauto.com>; 'Claims'
<claims@premiumauto.com.sg>

Subject: RE: OD CLAIM FOR SKE 6183 J ON 13/1/2020

Dear Shirley,

Kindly assist to expedite the claims for approval.



1/28/2020 Merimen e-Claims

View Received Message

This mail is associated with :
*SKE6183] (16422417155G)
oD
Jan 13 2020 7:00AM

[SEOW YEN CHOON KELVIN]
Premium Automobiles Pte Ltd

IEEI'{ f Reply Ail_l Mark as Unread I Print Message | Delete Message I Forward |

From AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd. (AIG_SG), sent on 28/01/2020 12:22 PM.
To_ LKKHQ e ) _
Subject  Alert - Adj Mandate Approved (S$34938.00) - SKE6 1831 - Claim Handler: Nadaraja, Deeban

Approved:34938.00:Note: Authorise repair. A6 factory time for Bonnet, bumper, grille, LH/RH headlamps at 7hrs. x2 labour should be at 14hrs = 2.5
days at $1250, Add support panel at 10 hrs x 2 18hr - 3.5 days @%1750.00 Kindly re-negotiate, Supplem

DOCUMENTS SUMMARY
There are no documents.

Sw-'{lﬁ—r) Bonuk . H('.hcl‘—-‘, koL 3 %‘Dq &

hoclk Cecnles % 23 D‘j >

htips://singapore.merimen.com/claimsfindex.cim?fusebox=8VCmail&fuseaction =dsp_view&mode=1&iinboxid=1622284&Domainld=11&i0bjld=7415&i... 1/2




1/16/2020 Merimen e-Claims

View Received Message

This mall is associated with :
*SKE6183) (16422417155G)
oD
Jan 13 2020 7:00AM

[SEOW YEN CHOON KELVIN]
Premium Automobiles Pte Ltd

[Reply | Reply All | | Mark as unread | Print Message | Delete Message | Forward |

From _ AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd. (AIG_SG), sent on 16/01/2020 14:15 PM.
To  LKK_HQ

Subject  Alert - Adj Mandate Approved (5$33128.00) - SKE61837 - Claim Handler: Nadaraja, Deeban ) -

Approved:33128.00:Note: Authorise repair. A6 factory time for Bonnet, bumper, grille, LH/RH headlamps at 7hrs. x2 labour should be at 14hrs = 2.5
days at $1250. Add support panel at 10 hrs x 2 18hr - 3.5 days @%1750.00 Kindly re-negotiate. Re-insp

DOCUMENTS SUMMARY
There are no documents,

htlps:lp‘singapore.mariman.conﬂdaimsﬂndex.cfm?fusebox=SVCmail&1useaction=dsp_view&mods=1 &iinboxid=1616712&iDomainld=11&i0bjld=7415&i... 1/2




LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (Co.Reg.No:199607198R)
51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25, Paya Ubi Industrial Park
Singapore 408933
Tel: 6256-3561 Fax: 6844-8805 Email: sur@lkkauto.com;assignments@lkkauto.com

To: AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Lid. From: LKK Autc Consultants Pte Ltd
AIG Building 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25
78 Shenton Way #08-16 Paya Ubi Industrial Park
Singapore 079120 Singapore 408933

Attn:  Nadaraja, Deeban Date: 23 Jan 2020

Preliminary Advice

Vehicle No : SKEB183J Accident Date 1 13/01/2020
Make : AUDI A6 Palicy No. : 1800098325
Assignment Date : 14/01/2020 Excess : S$400.00
Date of Inspection  : 14/01/2020 Est. Duration of Repair 110 days
Inspection At : Premium Automobiles Pte Ltd (UBI)

55 Ubi Road 1

Singapore 408699

Point of Impact / General Description of Damages
The vehicle sustained impact / damages front portion and parts claimed are consistent to the accident.

Repairer's Estimate (Gross) 5% 74,115.00 (inclusive supp)
Revised Amount 5% 34,938.00 (inclusive supp)
Check Items (Estimated) :S§ 20,668.00

Total :S% 55,606.00

Lump Sum Repair :S%

Total Loss Consideration

New for Old Value :S§
Pre-Accident Value 5% 152,000.00
COE / PARF Rebate 5% 67,665.00
Salvage Value 5%
Margin for Repair :S% 84,335.00

Remarks

( X ) The vehicle is repairable at our adjusted amount. We have also confirmed excess and policy coverage.
Kindly let us have your authorisation.

( ) The vehicle is uneconomical to be repaired, you are advised to invite tender for the wreck.

( X ) Other comments : Supplementary amount is $ 1,810.00.



1/15/2020 Adjuster Immediate Advice
Note: This document has not been finalised.

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (co.regNo:1s9607198R)
51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25, Paya Ubi Industrial Park

Singapore 408933
Tel: 6256-3561 Fax: 6844-8805 Email: sur@lkkauto.com;assignments@lkkauto.com

To: AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd. From: LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
AIG Building 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25
78 Shenton Way #08-16 Paya Ubi Industrial Park
Singapore 079120 Singapore 408933

Aftn: Date: 15 Jan 2020

Preliminary Advice

Vehicle No : SKE6183J Accident Date : 13/01/2020
Make : AUDI AB Policy No. : 1800098325-01
Assignment Date : 14/01/2020 Excess : §$0.00
Date of Inspection : 14/01/2020 Est. Duration of Repair : 10 days
Inspection At : Premium Automobiles Pte Ltd (UBI)

55 Ubi Road 1

Singapore 408699

Point of Impact / General Description of Damages
The vehicle sustained impact / damages front portion and parts claimed are consistent to the accident.

Repairer's Estimate (Gross) :8% 70,805.00
Revised Amount :S% 33,128.00
Check Items (Estimated) :8% 20,668.00
Total :5% §3,796.00
Lump Sum Repair 5%

Total Loss Consideration

New for Old Value :S%

Pre-Accident Value :S% 162,000.00
COE / PARF Rebate :S% 67,665.00
Salvage Value 8%

Margin for Repair :8% 84,335.00

Remarks

{ X ) The vehicle is repairable at our adjusted amount. We have also confirmed excess and policy coverage. Kindly let us
have your authorisation.

{ ) The vehicle is uneconomical to be repaired, you are advised to invite tender for the wreck.

{ } Other comments :

Qf‘f}' i\l

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=8VCdoc&fuseaction=dsp_viewersmart&docid=50778052&preview=1&nolayout=1&CFID=6...
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. MPA120006368 / Premium Automobiles Pte Lid - UBI

ENTRY DATE & TIME: 13/01/202¢ 13.18
SUBMITTED BY: Khoo Zhen Wei

SINGAPORE ACCIDENT STATEMENT

IMPORTANT NOTICE
1. Please report correctly the delails of the accident to speed up the claims process

2. This Form musl be completed by the Policyholder andlor the Authorised Driver.
3. Information provided must be as truthful and accurate as possible. Any wilful misrepresentation or witholding of material facts may allow insurance companies to

repudiate policy liability.

4. The issue and acceptance of this Form by insurance companies is not an admission of palicy liability on the part of the insurance companies.

o3 faise reporti

may be referred to the Palice for investigation.

8. This repart will be forwarded by the insurers of the GIA Records Management Centra established by tne General Insurance Association of Singapore {GIA) for
archiving and that copies of this report will, for a fee, be made available upon application by interested parties.

7. By the lodgement of this report to the insurers, you hereby consent to the archiving of this raport at the centre and to copies of the report being made available

aforesaid.

Date Of Report

Date Of Accident

Exact Location Of Accident
Country/State of Loss

Vehicle Registration Number
Insured/Policyholder
Name Of Registered Owner
NRIC No

Email Address

Mobile Phone No
Alternative Phone No
Vehicle Particulars
Manufacturer

Model

Exact Purpose for which vehicle was being used at

time of accident

Are you claiming under your own insurance policy
for repair to your vehicle?

If No, Please state action to be taken
Vehicle Category

Insurance Company

Name of Insurance Company
Type Of Coverage

Fleet Policy

Policy Number

Cover Note Number

Driver

Name of Driver

NRIC No

Date Of Birth

Occupation

Date Of Driving Pass

Driving Experience

Gender

Mobile Number

Fax Number

Contact Number

EMail Address

ACCIDENT STATEMENT
13/01/2020 13:19
13/01/2020 07:45
ECP SLIP ROAD ONTQO MCE ENTRANCE
SINGAPORE
DETAILS OF OWN VEHICLE
SKE6183J

SEOW YEN CHOON KELVIN
SXXXX684H
MIKELVIN@GMAIL.COM
(LOCAL) +65-83687687
OFFICE-83687687

AUDI
A6 1.8 TFSI $ TRONIC

PRIVATE USE

YES

PRIVATE CAR

AIG ASIA PACIFIC INSURANCE PTE. LTD.
COMPREHENSIVE

NO

1800098325-01

SEOW YEN CHOON KELVIN
SXXXX684H

03/06/1980

INDOOR

02/01/2003

17 YEARS AND 0 MONTHS
MALE

(LOCAL) +65-83687687

OFFICE-83687687
MIKELVIN@GMAIL.COM
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84 ST PATRICK'S ROAD
#01-39

Postcode 424183
Was driver an employee of the Insured's Company NO
I No, Relationship of the Driver with the Insured OWNER

Vehicle Registration Number of Driver's Own -
Vehicle »

Address

Insurance Company of Driver's Own Vehicle -

General Information of the Accident

Type Of Accident CHAIN COLLISION
Weather Conditions CLEAR
Road Surface DRY
Other Information

Was any foreign vehicle involved in this accident? NO
Number of vehicles (including own vehicle) 3
involved in the accident

Was any body injured in the Accident? NO
Was any injured conveyed to hospital by NO
ambulance?

Was any other material or property damaged? YES

| have been approached by unknown person(s) NO
saliciting/offering accident claims assistance.

Number of Passengers (Including Driver) 2

Haisunger'l NAME: . TEY SHUWEN
GENDER: : FEMALE

Detalls of Police Action

Was the accident reported to the police? NO

If Yes,Please state which Police Station

Was notice of intended Prosecution given? NO

If Yes,against whom?

ON SLIP ROAD LEADING TO MCE FROM ECP, DRIVING AT ABOUT 50+ KMPH, VOLVO S60 BRAKED ABRUPTLY. NO 3RD
BRAKE LIGHT (OF VOLVQ) WORKED. AUDI A6'S EMERGENCY AUTOMATIC BRAKED KICKED IN, JUST PRIOR TO ME
STEPPING ON BRAKES FULLU. AUDI A6 WAS UNABLE TO STOP IN TIME TO PREVENT A COLLISION. PICK UP TRUCK
WAS NOT DAMAGED, AND DROVE OFF SHORTLY AFTER. SEE PHOTOS, AND IN-CAR CAMERA FOOTAGE OF INCIDENT.

Are accident photos available for attachment? YES
Was there any video captured by Car Camera? YES

Was there any audio recorded? NO
DETAILS OF OTHER VEHICLE PROPERTY 1
Vehicle Registration Number SDMBB738D
Vehicle Make/Model/Colour VOLVO S60 SEDAN/BLACK
Details Of Properties
Vehicle Category PRIVATE CAR
Name of Driver TAN LAI THIAM
NRIC/Passport Number SXXXX8112
Contact Number 96951340
Address
Posicode

Page 2 of 35



Insurance Company Name
Nature Of Damage
No. Of Passenger (Including Driver)

Vehicle Registration Number
Vehicle Make/Model/Colour
Details Of Properlies
Vehicle Category

Name of Driver
NRIC/Passport Number
Contact Number

Address

Postcode

Insurance Company Name
Nature Of Damage

No. Of Passenger (Including Driver)

DETAILS OF OTHER VEHICLE PROPERTY 2

SLVBB3X
HYUNDAI ECANTRA/GREY

PRIVATE CAR
GOH MINGHAI
SXXXX818B
56776951

Page 3035



Sketch Plan

SKETCH PLAN

IMPORTANT NOTICE

L Please rieport corractly the detads of the sceident to speed up the chams Brocess

d Drive:

2 This form must be complete

3 Information provided must be as leuthful and accurate as possible 4, willul misrepresentation or withholding of materal
facts may allow imsurance companies to repudiate pokicy liability

Lhe Fokcynoioy Df_Live AUTHOT:

nd

4. The ssue and acerptance ol this Form by msurance companies i not an admission of policy lizbiity on the past of the msurance
companies

6. The report will be forwarded by the insurers of the GIA Records Management Centre established by the General Insurance
Association of Singapore (GIA] for archiving and that copies of this report will lor a fee be made avalable upon applhication by
interested parties

7. By the lodgment of this report to the insurers, you hereby consent 10 the archiving of This repart at the cente and to copies of
the report being made available aforessid

8 Consent under the Personal Data Protection Act [PDPA)
T understand. acknowledge, agree and consent that-

(a) My insurer, my workshop and the General Insurance Association of Singapore ("GIA") may/are permitted to collect, use,
disclose and/or process my pensonal data/personal information set out in this {form] and any other petsonal information
provided by me or possessed by my insurer (collectively the “Personal Information™) and disclose and transfer such
Personal Information to all insurer(s) who have insured vehicle(s} involved in this accident {all insurer(s) who have nsured
vehicle(s) involved in this accident shall be collectively reterred to as the “Insurers™), the Insurers’ lawyers/law firms, the

Monetary Authority of Singapore and any rei government agency/authority (such as the police), for the purpose|s)

of :

(i) processing, handling and/or dealing with my claims including the settlement of the claims and any necessary

investigations relating to the claims,

{ii} investigating the accident and/or my daims;
(i) carrying out and/or dealing with my instr of responding to any enquinies by me;

{ivhadministering my claims (inciuding the mailing of correspondence, statements, invoices, feports or notices to me,
which couid involve disclosure of certain personal data about me to bring about delivery of the same as well as on the
external cover of envelopes/mail packages); and/or

(¥) complying with applicable law in administering, procesung, handling and/or dealing with my claims [coliectively the
“Purposes’|

(b} @il insureris) who have insured vahicle(s) involved in this accident and the ndurers’ Lawyers/law firme, may/are permittee
to wollect, wie, divclose and/far process my Personal inlormation for ane of more of 1he above Purposes. and

(el my Personal Information may/can be disclosed by any of the Insurers and/or GIA to their third party service providess or
agents{including their lawyers/iaw firms), which may be sited outside of Singapore, for one or more of the above Purposes.

(d)  my Personal Information will aiso be collected and used to compile claims history for the purpase of fraud detection,
Investiganion and management in present and all future claims

(e} the information so collected under (d) above may be shared / disclosed:

(i} te at insurers and/or any other third parties that assist in evaluating, investigating, controlling of managing fraud,
regulators, law enfarcement snd government agencies as reasonably required for the purposes stated, or

[i#} for complying with requirements under any regulations, laws or court orders

o

e
Foltyhelder's Signature Driver's Signature Mpo#}" tre fer - £l's Signature
Date & Time: {H driver is nat the policyholder) Marme ‘!HE( ao,

18 Yan 2020 Date B Tima: NRIC/FN Mo (yee a2l
1" 104Lrs
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Sketch Plan #2

SKETCHPLAN  £C0 Sip Loadh 1o ME

DECLARATION
W diclate the 10regoing particulars are Lrue in every respect.

= A § il : F it 54
Folcyholder's Signature Drivet's Signature Refarts lw\!nf\mrq Signature
Date & Time: 1t driver is not the palicyhalder| mm;“&z Jﬂ aad)

13 JAN 180 Date & Time NRIC/FINNG - ANEE 335 %

5 xS
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Accident Photo

.
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Accident Photo
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Accident Photo
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