Jaslin Kok (LKK Auto)

From: Nicole Chong <nicole@casgarage.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, 30 December 2020 6:35 PM

To: Jaslin Kok (LKK Auto)

Cc: Admin A

Subject: Re: LOD - SME 5757L DOA 09.01.2020 - TP AIG *** LKK REF: CC6/AIG20000855/Ars3
Attachments: D862EF136C444122B91B6444F42ECAFA[248964].jpg; 5757dv.pdf

WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Dear Jaslin,
Attached signed DV.

Kindly arrange payment in favor CAS GARAGE PTE LTD

Regards,
Nicole Chong
Admin and Finance Officer

CAS Garage Pte. Ltd.
Tel : 9791 6119
UEN : 201828067M

Address: 1 Kaki Bukit Ave 6
#02-22/21/20

Autobay Block D

Singapore (417883)

On Wed, 30 Dec 2020 at 16:39, Nicole Chong <nicole@casgarage.sg> wrote:

WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Dear Jaslin,

We accept the offer of total $ 9,227.45

Kindly arrange DV to us.



Regards,
Nicole Chong
Admin and Finance Officer

CAS Garage Pte. Ltd.
Tel : 9791 6119
UEN : 201828067M

Address: 1 Kaki Bukit Ave 6
#02-22/21/20

Autobay Block D

Singapore (417883)

On Tue, 29 Dec 2020 at 17:19, Jaslin Kok (LKK Auto) <jaslinkok@lkkauto.com> wrote:

Your Ref: SME 5757L

LKK Ref: CC6/AIG20000855/Ars3 Without Prejudice
Dear Sirs/Mdm,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKT 9442M AND SME 5757L ON 09.01.2020

We refer to the above matter.

We propose settlement as follows: -

1. Cost of Repair $ 8,800.00

2. Loss of Use (7 days x $60.00) $ 420.00

3. LTA/GIA Search Fee $7.45
Total | $9,227.45

Please confirm acceptance.

"Best Wishes for Merry Christmas & Happy New Year 2021"

Thank you.



Best Regards,

Jaslin Kok | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841 2157 | email: JaslinKok@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741 4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 8 April 2020 3:25 PM

To: Nicole Chong; Jia Le (LKK Auto)

Cc: Admin A; Allan Goh; CAS Garage Garage

Subject: RE: LOD - SME 5757L DOA 09.01.2020 - TP AIG *** LKK REF: CC6/AIG20000855/Ads3

Dear Sir / Madam,

Thank you for your email.

Our respective case handler will look into the matter and get back to you in due course.

Hi Jia Le,

Kindly assist.

To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned.

"Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via
email. Submission of claim related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much
regretted.

Thank you.



Best Regards,

Mei Kwan | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@lkkauto.com | fax: 67414108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Nicole Chong [mailto:nicole@casgarage.sqd]
Sent: Wednesday, 8 April 2020 11:00 AM

To: Admin A; Allan Goh; CAS Garage Garage
Subject: LOD - SME 5757L DOA 09.01.2020 - TP AIG

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Sir/Madam,

Please find the attached LOD.

Kindly arrange for settlement.

Regards,

Nicole Chong

Admin and Finance Officer
CAS Garage Pte. Ltd.

Addr: 1 Kaki Bukit Ave 6, #02-22



Autobay. Singapore (417883)
Hp: 9791 6119
Office: 6484 2220

UEN: 201828067M



