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Khanchna (LKK Auto)

From: STK STK <stkautosg@gmail.com>
Sent: Friday, February 7, 2020 11:38 AM
To: Khanchna (LKK Auto)
Subject: Re: Reject claim - SLQ3215X Against SKU258H DOA : 10/01/2019 - AIG Ref: 

1046706321SG-003

Dear Khanchna  
 
Please closed the case the owner change to cash repair. 
 
Thank you  
 

 

Yours sincerely 

  

Tan Guohua 

Chief Executive Officer 

  

STK AUTO (S) PTE LTD | www.stkauto.com.sg 

Mobile: (65) 9123 7949 | Tel: (65) 63860669 

8 Kaki Bukit Ave 4 #03-21 Singapore 415875 @PREMIER 

 

To help protect you r priv acy, Microsoft Office prevented automatic download of this picture from the Internet.

 

 
 
Khanchna (LKK Auto) <khanchna@lkkauto.com> 于2020年2月6日周四 下午12:02写道： 

WITHOUT PREJUDICE 
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Dear Sir/Madam, 

  

We refer to the above matter. 

  

Based on all documents at hand and damage profile, we noted that the third party vehicle had head to rear end our 
Insured vehicle. 

  

We append below accident photo from our Insured which shows that our Insured vehicle was within his lane. 
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As such, we opine that liability is down against your client and we have our principal’s instruction to reject the claim 
and we are unable to look into your client’s claim.  
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We will close file accordingly. 

  

Thank you. 

  

"Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving the 
matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred from this 
negotiation of terms/settlement. 

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues of 
liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement." 

  

  

  

 

Best Regards, 

Khanchna| Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

DID: 6841 2360| email: Khanchna@lkkauto.com|Fax: 6741-4108  

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

  

From: STK STK <stkautosg@gmail.com>  
Sent: Monday, 3 February 2020 12:09 PM 
To: Khanchna (LKK Auto) <khanchna@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: Re: Re: SLQ3215X Against SKU258H DOA : 10/01/2019 - AIG Ref: 1046706321SG-003 

  

Dear Khanchna  

  

Please advise the liability as soon as possible. 

  



5

Thank you  
 

  

Yours sincerely 

  

Tan Guohua 

Chief Executive Officer 

  

STK AUTO (S) PTE LTD | www.stkauto.com.sg 

Mobile: (65) 9123 7949 | Tel: (65) 63860669 

8 Kaki Bukit Ave 4 #03-21 Singapore 415875 @PREMIER 

  

 

  

  

STK STK <stkautosg@gmail.com> 于2020年1月15日周三 下午1:03写道： 

 Dear Khanchna  

  

Please refer to  the winess statement . 
 

  

Yours sincerely 

  

Tan Guohua 
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Chief Executive Officer 

  

STK AUTO (S) PTE LTD | www.stkauto.com.sg 

Mobile: (65) 9123 7949 | Tel: (65) 63860669 

8 Kaki Bukit Ave 4 #03-21 Singapore 415875 @PREMIER 

  

 

  

  

Khanchna (LKK Auto) <khanchna@lkkauto.com> 于2020年1月15日周三 下午12:16写道： 

  
Without Prejudice 
  
Dear Sirs/Mdm, 
  
We refer to the above matter. 
  
Please be informed that liability is unclear for this matter. 
  
We would like to request a copy of accident video/police investigation result/independent witness SD/accident scene 
photos (if any). 
  
Thank you. 

  
“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving 
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred from 
this negotiation of terms/settlement. 
  
In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues 
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.” 
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Best Regards, 

Khanchna| Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

DID: 6841 2360| email: Khanchna@lkkauto.com|Fax: 6741-4108  

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

  

From: Tan, Bennie-WZ <Bennie-WZ.Tan@aig.com>  
Sent: Wednesday, 15 January 2020 9:28 AM 
To: STK STK <stkautosg@gmail.com>; Khanchna (LKK Auto) <khanchna@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: Ler, Bernard-JQ <Bernard-JQ.Ler@aig.com> 
Subject: RE: Re: SLQ3215X Against SKU258H DOA : 10/01/2019 - AIG Ref: 1046706321SG-003 

  

Hi Khanchna 

  

  

Below email from repairer: STK Auto (S) Pte Ltd, please assist. 

  

Thanks. 

  

  

Best Regards 

  

Bennie Tan 
AIG 
Senior Complex Claims Examiner 

Claims | AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd  
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78 Shenton Way #08-16 Singapore 079120 
Tel +(65) 6419 1718 

 
Bennie-WZ.Tan@aig.com | www.aig.sg 

  

From: STK STK [mailto:stkautosg@gmail.com]  
Sent: Tuesday, January 14, 2020 3:54 PM 
To: Tan, Bennie-WZ 
Subject: [EXTERNAL] Re: SLQ3215X Against SKU258H DOA : 10/01/2019 

  

This message is from an external sender; be cautious with links and attachments. 

Dear Mr Tan  

  

The above mentioned vehicle survey by LKK, Please advise the liability as soon as possible. 

  

Thank you  
 

  

Yours sincerely 

  

Tan Guohua 

Chief Executive Officer 

  

STK AUTO (S) PTE LTD | www.stkauto.com.sg 

Mobile: (65) 9123 7949 | Tel: (65) 63860669 

8 Kaki Bukit Ave 4 #03-21 Singapore 415875 @PREMIER 
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