Khanchna (LKK Auto)

From: TeamAutoPro North <teamautopl@gmail.com>

Sent: Wednesday, January 15, 2020 2:52 PM

To: Khanchna (LKK Auto)

Cc: TeamAuto Pro; Admin A

Subject: Re: Accident between SLQ 3215X & SKU 258H [AIG] on 10/01/2020
Attachments: WhatsApp Image 2020-01-15 at 2.12.33 PM,jpeg; 0.05 impact.mp4

Dear Khanchna,

Attached is the video to show that why Mr Sim jammed brake, as the vehicle on the left (mazda 3) cuts into our client's
lane hence he had to apply its brake to avoid a collision.

Vehicle SLQ3215X sketch and statement is not accurate. Enclosed a scene photo which Mr Sim took right after the
accident, both vehicle not shifted.

Mr Sim's vehicle is still within its lane. While SLQ3215X 2/8 of its vehicle is in SKU258H's lane.

Unless SLQ3215X is trying to cut into Mr Sim's lane too.

*The above settlement is in respect of our client for damage pertaining to his motor vehicle and shall not
prejudice our client’s claim in respect of damages and consequential loss in relation to his personal
injuries.*

Wishing you & your family a wonderful New Year

Cheers,

Peach

Team AutoPro Pte Ltd
Tel: 6258 1955

Fax: 6258 1956

(Newly Shifted) Main Office: 160 Sin Ming Dr, #02-12 Sin Ming AutoCity Singapore 575722
Workshop/Survey Venue: 160 Sin Ming Dr, #01-14 Sin Ming AutoCity Singapore 575722

On Wed, Jan 15, 2020 at 1:28 PM Khanchna (LKK Auto) <khanchna@lkkauto.com> wrote:

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

OUR REF: CC6/A1G20000781/ks3

Dear Sir/Madam,

We are acting on behalf of our mutual client (SIM GUAN MOH/ SKU258H).

We were informed by our Insured that you are helping him to file a Third party property damage claim against the
insurer of SLQ3215X .

Kindly let us have a copy of the accident video.



Thank you.

=]

Best Regards,
Khanchna| Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

DID: 6841 2360| email: Khanchna@lkkauto.com | Fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)



