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From:
Sent:
To:
Cc:

Subied:

Yvonnev!ong ILKK Auto)
Wednesday, January'15, 2020 3:11 PM

KKH; Survey KKH

SUR

VEHICLE NO: SMG9767X DOA: 09/01/2020

DearSir,

As instructed bv our client, please proceed to repairthe insured vehicte SMG9767X (excess 5700/-).

tfthere are any check items or supplementary items please inform our office's AssignmentTeam atTeli 67418434 to

arrange our surveyor for inspection.

AII supplementary items and unconfirm items are subjected to further approval from insurance company before

completion of the repair.

*Our ctlent reserve their right not to pav ifthere is no valid approvatobtained before repair.

Thank you.

Best Regads,

Yvonne wong(Ms) | case Handler

LKKAuto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phorc: 62s6-3561 email: wonnewon!@lkkauto.com I fax: 6256-4315

Bik s1, Paya t bi Indlstrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1 *02-25 | S(4o8933)



Yvonne Wong (LKK Auto)

r

From: Motor Claims <motorclaims@sg-9aig.com>
Sen* Wednesday, January 15,2020 11:51 AM
To: Yvonne Wong (LKK Auto)
Cc SUR

Subje<e RE: Our Ref:C1N4OMVP000001050, PRI - ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLS 5719KAND SMG
9767X ALONG BARTLEY RD ON 09,01,2020

Follow Up Flag: Follow up
Flag Status: Flagged

DearYvonne

OD authorized, please verifu on check items. Excess 5700.00

Regards

sharon
Claims

From: Yvonne WonB (LKK Auto) <!ry9-!-!C!Cq!C@llta-Uq49!0>
Sent: 1.4 January 2020 4:22 PM

Cc: SUR <5!I1@l!t3!l!9.!qE>; Ngian, Kelvyna <lgly@.lgi3ll@sgjaiglgn0>
Sub.ie.t: IExternal] RE: Our Ref:C1MOMVP000001050, PRI - ACCIDENT INVOLVING SL5 5719K AND sMG 9767X ALONG
BARTLEY RD ON 09,01.2020

Dear Sir/ Madam

Enclosed preliminary revised of vehicle SMG9767X
Date of survey : 13/0V2020
Numberofdays:6 days

We did not authorise repair.

Thank you.

Best Regdils,

Yvonne wong (Ms) Case Handler

LKKAuro Consulranb 
"te 

Lrd
Phons 6256-3561 email: yvonnewon€@lklauto.com I la: 6256-4315

Blk 5l Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Uti A!,enue 1, #02-25 | S(4o89$)



5IUIIAVE r,J0t-zr ItAYAUETlVXFEI{trati,lI,{OApOtaaCt3 rE_: &6t) 6ra@ar r,rx. (@) 6r5t €r!

Your Ref: CLMOIVIVP00000l05 0

Our Ref: CS/GAI2000 07 6llKyd3

The Motor Claims Deparhnent
GREAT AMERICAN INSURANCE COMPANY

Dear Sirs/Mdm,

PRELIMINARY {)\'ICE OF \'EEICLE NO. SMG9767X

D^te: 1 4/01 /2020

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection ofthe above-mentioned vehicle
on 1310U2020 at the premises oflvl/s K KIM HIN AUTO PL and have the
following to report: -

Workshop Estima& Amount
Revised Estimate Amount
Check' Items Amout
Total
Market Value
LTA Reimbursemeot Value
Nett Vahre

Description ofDamage:
The vehicle sustained at the front portion

Commentr/ Present Strtrs:
Damage consistent
Repair cost ecolomical

Yours faithfully
Kenneth Kong
Licensed Appraiser

s$ 8.047.68
s$ 6.716.78
s$ 731.50
s$ 7.448.28
s$ 70.000.00
s$ 34.021.00
s$ 35.979.00



Yvonne Wong (LKK Auto)

From:
Sent:
To:

Subiect

Attachments:

Yvonne Wong (LKK Auto)
Tuesday, January 14,2020 4,22 PM

'Motor Claims'
SU&'Ngian, Kelvyna'
RE: OUT ReICLMOMVPOOOOOI O50, PRI - ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLS 5719K AND SMG
9767X ALONG BARTLEY RD ON 09.01.2020
5MG9767X-18.pdf; 5MG9767X EST|MATE.pdf; SMG9767X DOA 09012020 REVERT.pdf

Dear Sir/ Madam

Enclosed preliminary revised of vehicle 5MG9767X
Date of survey : 13/01/2020
Numberofdays :6 days

we did not authorise repair.

Thank you.

Best Regads,

Yvonne wong (Ms) | case Hadler

LKKAuto Consultants Pte Ltd
Phone:6256-3561 | email: wonn€won.@lkkauto.com fax: 6256 4315

Blk s1, Pa}? Lrbi Industrial Pa*, lrbi Avenue 1, #()2-28 | S(4o8933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday,lanuarV 10,2020 10:54 AM
To: 'Motor Claims' <motorctaims@sg.gaig.com>j assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>
Cc: SUR<sur@lkkauto.com>;'Ngian, Kelvyna' <kelvyna.ngian@sg.gaig.com>

Subiect: RE: Our Ref:C1MOMVP000001050, PRI - ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLS 5719K AND SMG 9767X ALONG BARTLEY RD

oN 09.01.2020

DearSir/Mdm,

Thank you for the assignmenl.

?-*Hilrt toa, c tsFyst t nq.,o.ta u, tat,la faar,.



From:
Sent:
To:

Cc:

Subject:

Atta.hmenls:

HiSandra,

Noted on the request.

MotorClaims <motorclaims@sg.gaiq.com>
Monday, 13 January 2020 2:11 PM
service; service@kkimhin.com.sg; Sandra (Gmail); admin-d@lkkauto.com;
sur@lkkauto.com
Ngian, Kelvyna
Our Ref:C1MOMVP000001050, Own Damage Claim (Great American) SN,4G9767X -
veh in
Estimaie 9767.pdf; GlAreport 9767.pDF

P. +65 68046077 I F. +65 62353354 | sherv.wono@so.saig.com

Dear IKK,

Please accept assignment for OD survey under same accident as Tp survey for StS5719K.

Thank you.

'l:ao

Regards
Shery !Jong, Executive, Claims I

-
Gnrnl4ys[;qa1'

fisrarrcEsorpfiir Clai.nsl 3 Temasek Avenue +16-01 Ceniennial Tower Sinqapore 039190

Moody's
A1 (Good)

Publlshad o€.elnbor to18
A+ {Superior)

Aflkrnsd Ar0ust 17,2010

For more ntorm.ton on our financlalraUnqs, visir GAic.com/Financiatshenoih.

From: service <service@kkimhin.com.sg>

Sent: 13 January 2020 12:35 PM
To: Motor Claims <motorclaims@sg.gaig.com>

Cc: service@kkimhin.com.sg; Sandra (Gmail) <sandrakhont@gmajl.com>
SubjecE IExternal] Own Damage Claim (creat American) SMG 9767 X - veh ;n

ffi
Slafldad & Poor's

A+ (Strong)
Altlmed FeOiiary 23, 2018



Deai Officer

Good alay io you.

Enclosedthe GIA report and estimateforsMG 9767 X (DOA:9 Jan 2020) doing Own Damage Ctaim_

Vehicle is n our wo*shop for survey and repairs.

Please arrangeforsuruey (without prices frsl as no stock andwe are stillchecking).

I\.1any thanks
Sandra
4452701A
9622 2116
K. Kim l.lin Auto Pte Ltd

'ftc mdht ofthis emil m*age ud ey atuchmots e mnlidenthl d nay b€ lecatly pnvibged, i.rended slely for 6d{ld].€s@.Ifrlu e noltbe imended
recipio! be adv6ed tlElov u& dissdintlid, disribuliorl or opyi.e ofdc e-m l i! ;iicny p;hibited. rf you ;ive lhlr nsase in e@, d6e Dotiry thd sendq
imme'iiahly by eply email a.d il*roy dE m$rse dd i6 alrachnd



SINGAPORE ACCIDENT STATEII4ENT
MPORTANT NOTICE
1 P 4F repod !!Itgg! rhe d€b'rs or rhe accdenr ro speed up rhe claims proDess

2 Ths Form mud be compl€ted byrhe Po icvho der aid/or lhe Authonsed Driver
lnTorfia1onprD]dadmU\bE3SfuthfUlanda..urateaspo
repud':le por, hab

s Fo.m by iRsuBnce.onpan es s noran adm ss on ofpotcy ab ily on the pa( of the nsuratr€ @mDan es
' Anvralre rcoorlino m.v be rel
6 Ths reporrw rbe r.earded by rrrs isurcrs ofthe clA Recods Manaseme cenre eslabtished by ots nsaporc lctA) ror

bte upon app cat on by nteresred padies
7 aythe lodqemenl oltr s epodr beiis made ava ab e

Exact Locat on Of Accid-.ni

Country/Stale of Loss

1410112020 14:41

09/01/2!2015:30

SL P ROAD TO BARILEY ROAD EAST

S NGAPORE

Vehicle Reg stralion N!mber

lnsured/Policyholder

Name Of Registered Owner

NRiC No

Altemai ve Phone No

Exacl Purpose forwh ch veh c e was being used al

Are you clairnins under your own insurance po cy
ior repair lo yourveh cle?

ll No. Pease slate action to be taken

Insumnce Company

Name or lnsuraice Company

NRIC No

Date oi Bidh

s1,,1G9767X

CHONG J NG HUI

SXXXXs59J

xlAo_JING @HOTLjA L.COt\.4

(LOCAL) +65-91s19591

oFFrcE-9r 5T9591

SUZUKI

SWIFT 1,OT GLX AT

YES

PRIVATE CAR

GREAT AI\IERICAN INSURANCE COMPANY

COMPREHENSIVE

NO

MT20200008

LEE CHENG HOWA

SXXXX,]O8E

r7108/1956

INDOOR

13/04/1978

4,1 YEARS AND 8 N4ONTHS

FE[,1ALE

(LOCAL) +65 91s1407!

cHENGHOWA I 956@GMA|L COM



Was drver ah employee of lhe lnsu.ed s Company

1i No, Relalonship orthe D.iverwith lhe lnsured

Vehrce Reg stration Number ofDriveas Own

lnsurance Company of Drveis Own Vehice

General lnformation of rheAccider(

Othei lrfo.mation

Was anyioreign vehrcle involved in this acc denl?

Number oivehicl€s ( nclud nq own vehicle)
involved in the accideni

Was any body injured in the Accident?

Was any njured conveyed 10 hospitalby

Was any other mateialor property damaged?

I have been approached by unknown person(s)
soliciting/otrer ng accidenl cla ms assistance.

Number of Passengerc (lncluding Dnvea

Detalb ol Police Action

Was ihe accident repoded to the polce?

lfYes Please state whi.h PoLi.e Slalion

Was nolce olint€nded Prosecution g ven?

lf Yes,aga nstwhom?

Circumslances of Accid€nt

PLEASE REFER TO SKETCH PLAN,

ArGchment(s)

Are acc dent photos available lor attachmenl?

Was lhere anyv deo caplured by Car Canrera?

Was lhere any aLdio recorded?

84 EDGEDALE PLAINS #14.10

a28T3T

NO

:

COLLISION

CLEAR

DRY

NO

2

NO

NO

YES

NO

1

NO

NO

YES

NO

NO

Veh cle Reg stration Number

Veh cre \4ake/N4odel/Colour

NRlc/Passporl Nuhber

lnsurance Company Name

No. Ol Passenger (lncludlng Driveo

SLS57,I9K

LA] L YU

sxxxx167J



F Sketch Plan Pg. 1

SXETCH PI"AII

IMPOKTA$T NOTICE

1. Please.epdd.orE dyth€detaikottheaddetritoep.cduplaedaim5proEs.

2. rhi' .orm nun b. @!E!e!ed!x!!erel!did!e!3!cle(!te4u!ig!j!e!lq!cr.
3. rirordation provided must be 6 S!S!fufl!C-a!!!I!493!!e:aiD!e AnY v/{rul disrepresent tion or Mthhordrns o, materiar

racts mav allou inslrnnce @mpani* to lspdtslejqliry.lirliIE
4. Iteisue and accepiance of this Fom bvansurancecmprdGis not.n admisdon.f polic-v llsbililYon the pad ofthe insurane

5 Anv tuke rcloliin! mav be refered h rfie Polle tor hverddandn.

6Iherplortwillbeloe.rdedbVtheinsu.e6ofth.GARsordsManagemeniC€ntreesbblishedbvtheGenenilBurahce
a$o.ra rio D oI si. sapore (6 ra) td a rch rvlnc ah d th ar mp.es of this € le up.n apd,cation bv

7. Bvrhelodsmenrofthis report l. the insure6, you herebyconentiDthearchrvi4 ofthls rcpod at the cent€ 3nd to opies of
rlre iepo beine made availabre afo.6aid.

3 .onsst utrdcr lhe pe6oNl oar, ,bE.tao. A.t ipDPA)

I underibnd, acknowledge, asre,nd consent thal:

ta) My insurer, my workshop and the ce..ral hsurance A55ciano, or sins.pore l"6rA'l nav/ar€ p€mitted to colle.!, Be'
dhdo* and/orprocess hy p€rs.ar data/peBo na I inrorm a lion sei ooi,n rhj3 lroml and.iYothe. peEonar inro.mation
prdided by me or po$6*d by mv insrer {colle.tlv€ly the "p€B6al hforn.tlolf) and dkclose and tansfers,ch
Pe6onalLnrormation toalLinsurer(s){ho h.k in red vehl.LeGl involwd in th.s acodent (all insu Gr (sl uhd have inrured

vdhicleis) involved in this accide.t shalr be coll*ti€ry rcfeiied to as rhe "rne'ss'), ihe insu.€rJ laq€6/law firms, th€

Moneiarvatrthority ofsinclpo.e andanyreldanrcovernment asencv/authofitv (su.h ai the p6lj@), for ihe purposeG)

(il pro.ss n& handlincaod/ordeallhewnh my daim5 i.cludins th€ setlementofth€ claih! and anv neFs.rv
i €stisations r€lating to lhe claimri

(ail investigatinc th. a..id€nt andlor my claimr;

(iii)€rryins our and/or dea ins with fryinstructionsor rnpondiry toanyenquniEbvne;

{iv)administsinsnyclaihs{includi.sthe ailins or dtrapdd*c, statemeits, invoc6, repo sornolicestom€,
which could involve di$losu.eof.er-taih lersonal dataabolt mero bring.boutieliuervofthe 5ame aswe las on th.
ex l er tul .over or e,v.ropes/mair p kaser; aid/or

{v) rcmplvinswlth applioble lawin adminhtding, procesin& h.ndlinsand/ord€alin€ with my.Lai6s Golle.tivery the

(h) arli*!€(s)who hav€ in{renwhi.laG)inrclved in ihisr@denrahd th.l.rurers'la$vers/lawtumr, h4/a,. pcmnr
to collect, use, di..lore and/orpro@ssmy Pe/snallnformation for one or more of the above Purpos€s, and

(r) my peEonal rn,ormation may/6n be d,sdosed by ahY or the rntureu and/or 6ra to th.ir thid pa4v setuie p.ovid€6 or

agenrs{includins thek lawye.s/4aw tirmr, which may h€ sited outide ufSinszpoie,6tr one d nore ofthe abde PuEoses

(d) my Pe6onarhrornation willalso becoll*ted and used to compile dai63 nirto,v ror the purp6e or rriud dete.tion,
lnvestisarion and manasementi. prsenta.d all future.laims

(e) the nrorhatidnBo.ole.t.dunder(d)abovemaybesh...d/dislosed:

{ii to allinsu'e6and/or a.y otherthnd panie!thrta*in in daluatin& investigatins, contolfttBUr hanagine fra!0,
rcCUIatoB,law sfofteme.t and g@rhment a8*.ies a5 reasonablvrequred lor rhe pu.poses srrted, or

(iil forcomplyihgwith r.quremerts underanypgulations, taws orouno.de^.

- I , \--'w)ry:# \.\\h,'i
&*&s4d* 

-\{p!-

|1, dnve/r nol lhe pokYno def) \, \



Sketch Plan Pg. 2
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, > Back to OneMotoring

Enouire PARF/COE

The information @rtained herein is .orret as at 10 Jan 2O2O

OK

Rebate for Vehicle
Vehicle owner Particulars
Owner lD TyFe: SiBaporeNRlC

sMG9767X

Intended Dmsistration Datei lOJan 2020

SUZUKI

2014

klm1194735
JSMZC13500255361

Maximum Po@rOutputi a2.O kW (109 bhp)

$14,789.00
Orisinal Registation Date:

o

lntended PARF Rebate Detaits
$14789.00

PARF ElEibility Expiry Date:

lotended COE Rebate Details
$11,091.0O

A - Car up to ftmcc & 97kW

$25,50r00

$22,93OnO

t3t,021.0o
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Uflm IIfir CO. REG. NO: 199402370D
GST NO: M2-0123250-3

OD ,,
firntn 

' a rrrral
eE(E)'5Hr /l€ FEe\-a
160 Sin Ming Drive, #02-20.
Sir Ming Autocity, Singapore 575722
Tel: 6452 7018 Fax: 6458 3895
Email: ser,,ice@klimlin.com.sg

: CovER N0TE MT2 02 00008
: 0g-.lan-2020

No.

Date

PAGE .1Our Ref : 020017 / QUEK

GRNAT AMORICAN ]NSURANCN COUP,ANY
3 TnMASFtX AVF, #16-01
CENTENNI AL TOWER
S insapor e 039190

Your Reference
Acc ident Da le

1pc
1 pc
1 pc
lpc

30960

13- J ao-2020

::IYit::=:::t=::=:::i1:=r:i=:!111=!5T=t=91=1191:l=:!::1!lr
1 pc front bumper 

'kt 
"'-

2 pcs front blrmpea side retainer ,/) '-"''
18

1

1

2

pcs front bumper clips;;" i;;;; ;;il;:; ;;;i;" "o,J rt;t-- e
pc front buoper 1o!rer gri11e
pcs front bumper fog co;er (LH,/RH) v/J /"7 1-'f

(LHlRH)
,4e. -.-

pc front bumper reinforcement 8/ '-pc fronl bunper top beam bracket 7
pc front bumper top seal /4 -/
pe front bumper reinforcetuent 7

bracket
f ront sr i 11e c //1-'
front gri1le logo i4+ "/'

2
2

2
16

pcs
pc s
PC
pc
pc
pc s
pcs

front gri1le inner cowling-top cA4- ,

front gri1le inner cowling C fZP
-lol'er
r-o,ltorp "ssy r Lr'rlRql m(lcLt4
h-dd ldarp lowpr brd, t -r ( LH/RH ) '/
'urbo ' ooler t*.- I

' rroo oolp. inner .; , ., op. {f?1-.- |
front srrppo.t panel-top n I
I ror r l";otrr {iH/RH, 4r" J
Iront fender inner shre-td
'lrp' /1'L< r'

1 pc bonne I 6ut--.-'
2 pcs bonnet ininges \LH/R11) lZl
1 DC bcnnet lock fZ X
1 pc ai1 con co denser '2

paZ ,4u.A,-.+_/
fr.*r", 6?Va,,.V

N, ghcL
.. fl

N J 1\



ffiS SS&m KS&,mlla tllrrr
CO. REC. NO: 199402370D
GST NO: M2-01232s0-3

6@(E)itHt/.,t€'FEA-A
160 Sin Ming Drive, #02-20,
Sin Ming Autocity, Singapore 575722
lel: 6452 7018 l-axi 6458 1895
Email: service@kkimhin.com.sg

COVER NOTF N{T2O2OOOO8Your Reter_ence i
our Ref : 020017

Page i 2
No. | 30960

pc air con discharge pipe 7
r-r con liauid oioe 4

;" rad,olor *ti 4/.v.-.,/
pc radiator spate tank ,421
pc radiator farr cowling 7
pc radiator fan blade ?
pc radiator fan motor ?
pc radiator top hose
pc radiator lower hose

t^. x
pc fronl erhaust heat shield 7

Add ',l0% :

l pc front number plate
I pc radia t or coolatlt

To remove, cut out damaged parts,
panel beat ing, welding, a1ign,
refix and to renew affected paats.

To reflove air.or .onopr's.., IjipLs
afld driers. \raccum and recharge gas

Tc pLrity and resp.a!' on affected
port ions.

To focus headlamps, To check front
riir-ing a d l ight ing ope.ation.

/,
,L

S i ngapcr e Dolla.s 0ne
E ight y Eishi 0n1y

).j!te i rtmortnt quol:ed abc...e

:o_ _o_'_ 
2"/

Tota l : s$ 1 ,988.00

Tho Lr s anC N"ine Hun.1.ed arld

is subjecl to preva:ilin8 CST al line of ta\ lnvcice.

,,i.," ..1-, Ct

i\{

0. c0.0.00

150.ao tra.(

100.00 L--l

,aoa.oo ?ca1

0.00

40.00 snr
18-00 sn ?-,



&8II &m 669^w#tl
CO. REG. NO: 199402370I)
GST NOr M2-0123250-3

a Irtr frrrl

: 30960

+' @ GE) rt H fA /r. €' tJR 
/z^\ pl

160 Sin Ming Drive, #02-20,
Sin Ming Autocity, Sinl.gaporc 575722
Tel: 6452 7018 Fax:6458 3895
Email: servioe@kkimhin.com.ss

No.
Youf Refere[ce : CoyER NOIE UT2020000B
Acc ident Date , Og-Jan-2020

our Ref : 020017 / SANDRA

GREAT AMERICAN INSORANCE COIIPANY
3 IXMASEK AVI #16-01
CENTENNIAf, TOWER
Sinaapore 039 r 90

Date : 13-Jan-2020

PAOE:1
,4-/aZ /.41 ,t--.4,/

c11ps
1 pc bonnet
2 pcs boonet hinges (LulRfl)
1 pc bonnet lock ., xS
1 pc air con condenser 
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(2018) SMC9767X

1 pc front bumper 48O.OO c,/_
2 pcs Jront bumper side retainer 0 S$ .l5.OO 3O.OO c za

( I-HlRH )
18 pc6 front bumper clips @ Sg 2.20 39,60 a..1 pc front bumper towing cover 3O.OO c,/
1 pc front bumper lower grille OS.OO d{. -2 pcs front bumper fog cover (IEIRE) @ Sg 35.00 7O,OO c t)'-1 pc front bumper reinforcement 

- 
NU Slo C_-E_ lfZO ,a

1 pc lront bumper top beam bracket 35.00 cX.
1 pc f.oot bumper top seal 35.00 c/
1 pc front bunper re-inforc(

brecket uent 
{- No slock' - /\L'

1 pc front grille J 9S.OO c,/-
1 pc front grilIe logo ZS,OO c,,,.

1 i: fl:ll Eiiii: 1l#; cowlins-top )."' *t?^/.,_lower .tins Qz_ lo g-auL l@/
2 pcs headLanp assy (LBIRH) @ 91250.00 Z,5OO,OO czl
2 pcs headlamp lower lracket (LHIRH) G S$ 30.00 60.00 c/
1 pc turbo cooler /' 't }.1O /1 pc turbo cooler .inner air scope \/- Va SALV tl6./
1 pc front support panel-top lX2 pcs ffont fender (LHIRH) G 5$195,00 39O.OO cz'

16 pc6 front fender inne. shield G Sg 2.ZO 35,2O c,-

G s$ 60.00
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CO. REG. NO: 19102370D
GST NO: M2-012325G3
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160 Sin Ming Drive, #02-20,
Sin Miry Autocity, SilLgapore 575722
^le],: 6452'7018 Fax: 6458 3895
Email: service@klimhin.com.sg

Your Reference : CoVER NOTE I,T2O2O0OO8
our Ref I 020017
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pc air con discharge p.ipelyl;; ;i; ;;; ii;;;;';;,;-'"j,/- No stucrL
pc raolalor
pc radi.ator spare tankpc radiator fan cowl ingpc radiator fan bladepc radlator fan motorpc radiator top ho6epc radiator lower hose
pc front exhaust heat shteld 
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t,gs.oo c,/ bh4/Y
50. OO cx ' '

100.00 cX
65. OO c{

340.00 cX
34.00 c.r1
35,00. c!

=-____!i5,508.80
550..88

6 ,059 . 68
Add 10u :

1 pc front number plate
1 pc radiator coolart
To remove, cut out danaged partB,
palel beat ing, lreIding, allgn,
reflx and to renew affected parts.

To remove aircon condeoser, pipes
aod drier6. Vaccum and recharge gas

To putty and reEpray on affected
por t ions .

1o focus headlamps. To check front
wirirg and I ighting operation.

Total:

Singapore Dollars Xight Thousand aod Forty Seven
and cents sixty Eight 0n1y

4O,OO sn/
48.00 sn.roN

7 50.oo e00

1OO.oo ,/

l,OOO.OO qo\r

so.oo xol-
s$ I,047.68

Note: Amount quoted above l€ subject to prevalllna GST at t1[e of tax i.tvoice,


