2Em

: AS:"S.IUE,C..-BY: l P\EFZQg ) M620000448 / dgiSpania] in:'nmcl-imu

Sunvupr - ASSIGNMENT (Office)
« From (Person); lpmm Far\ of Al a Date/Time: t%\ ol ‘ QOZO@GI‘SSO\M ,A
smated Cost: Bill to:
"IPTWSTTP RES/ OD RES /EVA/INV | MV /CS
- To Inspect Vehicle - A FBM 468 e q Insoped: =~
“at Workshop m/ Rike Pmdu@'f"or'\ Te 6392 2555
of 610 QQWWIIOOA {ola m— o
Policy No: : Claim No: -
Sum Insured: _ Pxeess:_ 1B H -
Make of Vel: . D.OA
(Client's Record)
CA 1’@ ! REP, / REV 24 HRS HODALndorsement:
Date/Time; .Qﬁg%hﬂ_—h;@ Bl mhoza’crsfm Coniacied: MV\(an ... Vehicl ur
Date/Time Act‘ion/]mllmhrm Tatimnty Co!

i FBV M q= SRLU — X
23| dulled viv- fvers and hesaid_owrer olvendy WMTB«Pccwm
..*:“.“_,__MMML\ omul| cl Mamtmen: \;})?9' :;@A-Am_________,___h_____,

—_— i = _—




Wivitha (LKK Auto)

From:

Sent:

To:

Cc:

Subject:
Attachments:

Hi LKK,
Kindly assist to survey.

Winnie Fan
AlG

Claims Service Associate

AIG SGP, Claims-Survey <AIGSGP_ClaimsSurvey@aig.com>
Monday, 13 January 2020 9:55 AM

Admin A; assignments

Fong, Andy-SY

Aigencypt Re: NEW OD CLAIM - FBEM9588U
20200111_122751.jpg

Claims | AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd.

78 Shenton Way #08-16 Singapore 079120

winnie-lw.fan@aig.com | www.aig.sg

IMPORTANT NOTICE:

The information in this email (and any attachments) is confidential. If you are not the intended recipient, you must
not use or disseminate the information. If you have received this email in error, please immediately notify me by
"Reply" command and permanently delete the original and any copies or printouts thereof. Although this email and
any attachments are believed to be free of any virus or other defect that might affect any computer system into
which it is received and opened, it is the responsibility of the recipient to ensure that it is virus free and no

responsibility is accepted by AIG for any loss or damage arising in any way from its use.

From: Shk E <sbk5643e@yahoo.com>

Sent: Saturday, January 11, 2020 12:31 PM

To: AlG SGP, Claims-Survey <AIGSGP_ClaimsSurvey @aig.com>
Subject: [EXTERNAL] Re: NEW OD CLAIM - FBM9588U

This message is from an external sender; be cautious with links and attachments.

Dear Sir,

Please arrange PRI for own damage claim. Thanks.

Regards,

Kwan S. H.
Director
Bike Production Pte Ltd



View Sent Message

This mail is associated with :

*FBM9588U (563277117356)
oD
Jan 9 2020 6:00PM
[MUHAMMAD RUZAINI BIN JOHAR]
Bike Production Pie Ltd

_Resend | View Recipients | Print Message | Delete Message | Forward | _ﬁiwmﬁ_ﬁﬂ
From LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (LKK_HQ), sent on 27/02/2020 11:15 AM,

To AIGSGP_ClaimsSurvey @aig.com

cc Andy-SY.Fong@aig.com

Subject FBM9588U

’Eear Sir/Mdm,

Please be informed that our Surveyor went to survey this bike today and repairer informed him that owner already reverted to TP claim and no more
claiming for OD.

We will close this file at our end without billing.

Best Regards

G.NIVITHA

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-1972 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256
|-

ot

DOCUMENTS SUMMARY

-4315 Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)
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Nivitha (LKK Auto)

From: : Nivitha (LKK Auto) <admin-d@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Thursday, 27 February 2020 4:15 PM

To: 'AIG SGP, Claims-Survey'; ‘assignments’

Cc: 'Fong, Andy-SY'; 'SUR'

Subject: RE: Aigencypt Re: NEW OD CLAIM - FBM9588U

Dear Sir/Mdm,
Please be informed that owner already reverted to TP claim and no more claiming for own damage claim.
No survey was done for this case.

We will close this file at our end without billing.

Best Regards

G.NIVITHA

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-1972 | email: assignments@Ikkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue
1, #02-25 | S(408933)

----- Original Message-----

From: Nivitha (LKK Auto) [mailto:admin-d@lkkauto.com]
Sent: Friday, 17 January 2020 3:40 PM

To: 'AlG SGP, Claims-Survey'; 'assignments’

Cc: 'Fong, Andy-SY'

Subject: RE: Aigencypt Re: NEW OD CLAIM - FBM9588U

Dear Sir/Mdm,

Please be informed that our surveyor went to survey this bike today and repairer informed him that owner already
reverted to TP claim and no more claiming for OD.

Kindly advise.

Best Regards

G.NIVITHA

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-1972 | email: assignments@Ikkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue
1, #02-25 | $(408933)



