Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto)

From: Boo seng yak <boojohnny@gmail.com>

Sent: Monday, 13 July 2020 6:19 pm

To: Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto)

Subject: Re: FINAL REVISION - SKK1215C - OD AIG - SURVEYED 20 MAR 20
Hi Shirley

S9105CD - REPAIRED pending some outstanding parts not cleared.
I will finalise soon the file is with me.

SMM9173 - JUST REPAIRED
I will finalise soon when file is with me.

SMH1725P - Owner still considering to claim or to withdraw.
Will let yu know once owner make a decision.
Thank you n best regards - jb

On Mon, Jul 13, 2020 at 6:02 PM Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto) <ShirleyHiew @|kkauto.com> wrote:

Hi Mr. Boo,

Thanks and noted.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Shirley Hiew | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email. Submission
of claim related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted.



