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Nivitha (LKK Auto)

From: Nivitha (LKK Auto} <admin-d@lkkauto.com>
Sent: Monday, 24 February 2020 10:38 AM

To: ‘Motor Claims'; assignments@Ilkkauto.com
Co 'SUR'

Subject: TEMPQORARILY CLOSE FILE FOR YP 9736X
Dear Sir/Mdm,

Please be informed that we are unable to conduct the inspection for YP 9736X after some attempts to inform the
warkshop to present the vehicle.

This case has been pending for a long time due to the unavailability of the owner, therefore we decided to
temporarily close this case.

Kindly advise us if there is any arrangement made and will be glad to re-open the case accordingly.

st Regards

GNIVITHA

LKE Auto Consultants Pre Lid

Phione: 6841-1972 | email: assignments@lkkouto.com | fax: 6256-415
Blk 51, Paya Ubl Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

. AVG This ermail has been checked for viruses by AVG antivirus software.
WWW.avg.com



Nivitha (LKK Auto)

From: Motor Claims <motorclaims@sg.gaig.com>

Sent: Thursday, 9 January 2020 4:22 PM

To: ASM Jaclyn; assignments@Ikkauto.com; sur@lkkauto.com

Ce Mg, Sharon

Subject: RE: Our Ref.CLMOMVCO00003780, Third Party Claim: YP9736X - DOA: 06,12.2019
Without Prejudice

[rear laclyn,

Noted on your request, our client has yet to report the accident so we will survey on a without prejudice basis.

Dear LKK,

Flease accept assignment for TP survey, Thank you,

F.egards
Shery Wong, Executive, Claims | P. +65 68048077 | F. +65 62353354 | sherv.wongiisg, gaig.com

GREATAMERICAN.
INBIRAREE COMPRNY Claims| 3 Temasek Avenue =16-01 Centennial Towear Singapore 033190
Moody's Standard & Poor's
A1 (Good) A+ (Strong)

Published Decamber 2018 Mfirmed February 23, 2018

%0,
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For mdee infidrmibtor ool aur finencis Fatitagl, visit GAIG. comyFinsciatStrangth.

A+ (Superior)
Affirmed August 17, 2018

From: ASM Jaclyn <jaclynlai@asmauto.com.sg>

Sent: 09 January 2020 2:45 PM

To: Motor Claims <motorclaims@sg.gaig.com>

Cc: Ng, Sharon <sharon.ng@sg.gaig.com=

Subject: [External] RE: Qur Rel:CLMOMVCODD003780, Third Party Claim: YP2736X - DOA: 06.12.2019

Cear Sherry,
We would like to choose LKK Autg Consultants.

Thank you

Best Regards,

Jackyn Lai



Assiatant Manager

Clalms & Operation

ASM Automotive Services Pte Ltd

Wo. 13, Floneer Sector 1, Singapore 628424,

Hp: 9236 8218 | DID: 6265 0026 | Fax: 6265 6068

Web: www.asmauto.com.sg
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From: Motor Claims

Sient: Thursday, 9 January 2020 2:36 PM

To: ASM Jaclyn

Ce: Ng, Sharon

Siubject: Our Ref:CLMOMVCO00003780, Third Party Claim: YP9736X - DOA; 06.12.2019

Without Prejudice

Ciear Sirs,

Ciur client has not reported accident,

Ve append the following list of our panel surveyors:-
1. AJAX Adjusters & Surveyors Pte Ltd

2. A-PAC Adjusters & Surveyors Pte. Ltd.

3 Priority Services

4 RT Appraisal Pte Ltd

5  LKK Auto Consultants

K ndly let us know which SJE is selected for the survey to be carried out.

Ragards ] )
Shery Wong, Executive, Claims | P. +65 68046077 | F. +65 62353354 | shery.wora®sg galo cam

,/_2_>

GREATAMERICAN .
wsunANCE company  Claims] 3 Temasek Avenue £16-01 Centennial Tower Singapore 035190
M Moody's Standard & Poor's
5 e , A1 (Good) A+ (Strong)
| —_ Published Dacember 2018 Affirmed February 23, 2018
; j A+ (Superior)
. Affirmed August 17, 2018



Far more nformation g our financlal retings, visit GAIG com/FivancialStrength.

From: ASM laclyn <jaclynlai 2] >
sent: 09 Janyary 2020 1:44 PM
To: Motor Claims <metorclaims@sg gaig.com>

Subject: [External] Third Party Claim: YP9736X and YN8042G (your ref.) - DOA: 06.12.2019
ear Sir / Madam,

Dur client, the owner of YP 3736 X wishes to file claim for the damages sustained from the above-stated accident,
against your insured, YN 8042 G.

We hereby append a copy of our estimate and SAS for your kind perusal.

Kindly advise on liability and arrange for survey. Thank you.

Best Regards,

Jackyn Lai

Assistant Manager

Claims & Operation

ASM Automotive Services Pte Ltd

Mo. 13, Pioneer Sector 1, Singapore 628424,

Hp: 9236 8218 | DID: 62650026 | Fax: 6265 6068
Web: www.asmauto.com.sg
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