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OPTIMA WERKZ PTE LTD
Co. Reg. No. EDNR12458W

”; SINGAPORE AW OW. ST 0 FOptirmaiWeric @ fopumavencs
Date: 07/01/2020 Third Party Insurer:  AIG
Vehicle No: SMQ8134B Third Party Veh No: SLG5161G
Model: HONDA SHUTTLE HYBRID 1.5 Date of Accident: 03/01/2020
Chassis:  GP72003513-2018 oy Arthorze ”
Reg.Year: 2019
/%W.y B paisy
ESTIMATE (= Lty
NO. DESCRIPTION Qry UNIT 55 AMOUNT 5% B
1 |REAR BUMPER 1 $783.70
2 |REAR BUMPER CLIPS 8 $5.80 $46.40 | 7
3 |REAR BUMPER SIDE BRACKET RH 1 sa780| 7
4 |REAR BUMPER REFLECTOR RH 1 fi. S6560| X
5 |REAR END PANEL 1 REPAIR
SUB TOTAL 5983.50
LESS 20% .5196.70
PARTS TOTAL 5786.80
LABOUR CHARGES:
LABOUR CHARGES TO REMOVE,REPLACE, REPAIR,READJUST REAR ACCIDENT AREAS & 5400,00 2~
ETC.
LABOUR CHARGES FOR PAINTING & TO SUPPLY PAINT & FURNISHING MATERIALS AT 5450.00 2"‘(
REAR BUMPER, REAR END PANEL & ETC.
LABOUR CHARGES TO REMOVE & REFIX REAR BUMPER REVERSE SENSOR & ETC. TO $80.00 7
EFFECT REPLACE OF REAR BUMPER.
LABOUR TOTAL $930.00
ONG TOTAL 5$1,716.80
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* » Back to OneMotoring

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Vehicle Owner Particulars
Owner |D Type:

Owner ID:
Vehicle Details

Vehicle No.:

Wehicle to be Exported:
Intended Deregistration Date:
Wehicle Make:

Viehicke Model

Primary Colour
Manufacturing Year:

Engine Na.:

Chassis No.;

Masimum Power Output:
Cpen Market Value:

Original Registration Date:
First Registration Date:
Transfer Count;

Actual ARF Paid:

Intended PARF Rebate Details
PARF Eligibility:

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date:
PARF Rebate Amount:
Intended COE Rebate Detalls
COE Expiry Date:

COE Category:

COE Perlod|Years):

QP Pald:

COE Rebate Amaunt:

Total Rebate Amount;

The information contained herein is correct as at 06 Jan 2020

Campany
ASTH

SMOB1348

Mo

06 lan 2020
HOMNDA

SHUTTLE HYBRID 1.5 AUTOD
Black

2018

LEB7104571
GP72003513

101.0 kW (135 bhp)
$23.094.00

02 Dec 2019

02 Dec 201%

o

$14,33500

Yes
01 Dec 2029
$10.751.00

01 Dec 2029

B - Car above 1600cc or 57kW (130bhp)
10

£37.000.00

$34.635.00

$47.390.00

OK



Hsiao Tunﬂ ‘I.I{KAutu!

From: Karen Chan Siau Chin (Auto Svcs/Claims & |A/Claims & |A/Buses)
<ChanSiauChin@smrt.com.sg>

Sent: Friday, 22 November 2019 12:13 PM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Cc Admin A

Subject: RE: OUR REF:BUS/10/19/1040 - ACCIDENT ON 17/10/19 INVOLVING 5G5784B

AND SLC9184K ALONG AT JUNCTION OF SLIP RD AYE AND SOUTH BUONA VISTA
RD AFT BS:18101 ( PSB SCIENCE PK BLDG )

Importance: High

Without Prejudice
Dear Hsiao Tong,

We regret that CCTV footage is not available on this matter.
Kindly look into he matter & let us have your offer soon.

Thanks & Regards,
Karen Chan

Claims Department
Tel: 6556 3523

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) [mailto:chewht@lkkauto.com]

Sent: 18/11/2019 17:50

To: Ong Hua Yen [Auto Sves/Claims & |A/Claims & |1A/Buses)

Cc: Chong Fei Yuan (Auto Sves/Claims & IA/Claims & IA); Balgish Binte Abdul Halll (Auto Sves/Claims & IA/Claims &
IA/Buses); Tan Wei Teck (Auto Sves/Claims & IA/Claims & IA/Buses); Karen Chan Siau Chin (Auto Svcs/Claims &
IA/Claims & |A/Buses): Admin A

Subject: RE: OUR REF:BUS/10/19/1040 - ACCIDENT ON 17/10/19 INVOLVING SG5784B AND 5LC9184K ALONG AT
JUNCTION OF SLIP RD AYE AND SOUTH BUONA VISTA RD AFT BS:1B101 ( PSB SCIENCE PK BLDG )

LKK REF: CC3/EQI19018712/Epa3 Without Prejudice

Dear Sirs/Mdm,

We refer to the above matter.

Please be informed that liability is unclear. Attached is a copy of our insured accident report for your easy reference.

As per EQ instruction, we would like to request for evidences (ie: video footage/ scene photos / PIR) for our
necessary action.

Appreciate an early reply.

*Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter s purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / Inferred
from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues
ol liabllity/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

1



1)
2)

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@|kkauto.com | fax: f741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Ong Hua Yen (Auto Sves/Claims & IA/Claims & IA/Buses) <OngHuaYen@smrt.com.sg>

Sent: Monday, 18 November 2019 2:47 PM

To: Admin A <admin-a@Ikkauto.com>; CS A Team <¢s-a@lkkauto.com>

Ce: Chong Fei Yuan {Auto Svcs/Claims & IA/Claims & |A) <FeiYuan@smrt.com.sg>; Balgish Binte Abdul Halil (Auto
Sves/Claims & IA/Claims & 1A/Buses) <BalgishBAH®@smrt.com.Sg>; Tan Wei Teck (Auto Sves/Claims & 1A/Claims &
|A/Buses) <TanWeiTeck@smrt.com.sg>; Karen Chan Siau Chin (Auto Sves/Claims & IA/Claims & |A/Buses)
<ChanSiauChin@smrt.com.sg>

Subject: OUR REF-BUS/10/19/1040 - ACCIDENT ON 17/10/19 INVOLVING 5G57848 AND SLC9184K ALONG AT
JUNCTION OF SLIP RD AYE AND SOUTH BUONA VISTA RD AFT B5:18101 | PSB SCIENCE PK BLDG )

Dear 5irs,

We claim on behalf of SMRT Buses Ltd, owner of the vehicle registration number SG5784B. Your client's
negligent driving has caused the above accident. As a result, my client has suffered the following losses,

Cost of Repair $1,924.00
Loss of Use $875.00 ( 2.5 daysx 5350.00 )
LTA search fee 57.00
Total $2,806.00

We enclose the following
documents,

1) Repair Invoice

2) GIA report

3) LTA search

We look forward to your confirmation to settle our claims within 15 days from the date of this email.
Payment by cheque shall be crossed and made payable to SMRT Buses Ltd.

Thanks & Regards
Hua Yen



Asher Sng (LKKAuto

From: Loh, Chee-Heng <Chee-Heng Loh@aig com>

Sent: Tuesday, 21 January 2020 11:29 AM

To: Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: [REJECT CLAIM] Your ref: 745510938556, ACTIDENT INVOLVING 5LG 51616 (O1) &
SMC B134B (TP) ON 03/01/2020

Follow Up Flag: Fallow up

Flag Status: Flagged

Dear Asher,

You may proceed to reject claim under BOLA 15 as suggested.
Thank you.

Best regards,

Lah Chee Heng

AlG

Sanor Complex Claima Examiner

Clairms | ANG Asla Pacilic Insurance Pie Lid

AlG Building, 78 Shenlan Way #08-18 Singapore{079120
Tel +(65) 64189 1881
Ches-Heng.Lan LCOM | wWww.aig.sq
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From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) [mailto:AsherSng@Ikkauto.com]
Sent: Monday, 20 January 2020 2:18 PM
To: Loh, Chee-Heng <Chee-Heng. Loh@aig. com>

Subject: [EXTERNAL] [REJECT CLAIM| Your ref: 745510938556, ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLG 5161G (O1) & SMC 81348 (TP
ON 03/01/2020

This message is from an exteérnal sender; be cautious with links and attachments

Your ref: 74551093855G

Dear Sir/Madam,

INVOLVING & SMQ 81348 03/01/2020



We refer to the above matter

TP reported that Ol rear ended his vehicle after he completed the lane changed

01 reported that TP changed into his lane and jam break causing the accident.

Insured video uploaded in merimen clearly show that third party make a lane changed into our insured
We are of the opinion that the liability In not third party favour

In view of the above, we are intending to reject TP claim.

For your approval/ comments/ instruction.

Thank You

Asher 3ng | Cowe Handle

LEK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

b



Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto)
Sent: Friday, 6 March 2020 11:08 AM
To: Lily Lol
Cc Sharon Ten; Ling Ting An; Ong Hock Kang
Subject: RE: PRI - SMQB1234B CLAIMING AGAINST SLG5161G DOA 03/01/2020 (AIG) *** LKK
REF: CCH/AIG20000636/Kea3
Attachments: Video - Accident [online-video-cutter. com) mp4
‘WITHOUT PREJUDICE"
SAVE AS TO COSTS
Hi Sir/Mdm,

We refer to the above matter.
ACCIDENT INVOLWVI B AND 5L
We attached here with a copy of our insured’s video for your easy reference.

Our principal has reiterated that the accident was caused due to the entire negligence of your client changed into our
insured lane.

We are of the opinion that liability is not in your client's favor.

Under such a circumstances, we regret to Inform you that we have our principal instruction to deny liability and unable
to look into your client’s claim,

Thank You.

Bexf R=gords

Asher Sng | Coss Hondler

LEE Auto Comsullants Fle Lid

pnone: 684 1-6051 | emal: gseang @S o com | ox &741-4108

Blk 51, Poya Ubl Industrial Park. Uk Avenue |, 802-25 | ${428%33)

From: Lily Loi <lily loi@ow.sg>

Sent: Thursday, 6 February 2020 12:16 PM

To: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com>; Mel Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@lkkauto.com>

Ce: Sharon Ten <sharon@ow sg>: Ling Ting An <tingan ling®ow.sg>; Ong Hock Kong <hockkong. ong@ow sg>; Admin A
<admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: PRI - SMO81348 CLAIMING AGAINST SLG5161G DOA 03/01/2020 [AIG) *** LKK REF:
CCH/AIG20000636/Keald

Hi Asher,

Till to date, we have no yet recelved your insured video footage.
1




Thank you.

Best Regards,

Lily Lol [Ms.)
Senlor Claims Executive, Motor Claims Department
[ +65 6481 1522 | F- +65 6481 1011
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From: Lily Loi

Sent: Tuesday, 4 February 2020 4:04 PM

To: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@|kkauto com>; Mel Kwan (LKKAuto) <Melbwan@|kkauto com>

Cc: Sharan Ten <sharon@ow.sg>; Ling Ting An <tngan. ling@ow sg>; Ong Hock Kong <hockkong.ong@ow.sg>; Admin A
<gdmm-a@lkkauto com>

Subject: RE: PRI- SMO8134B CLAIMING AGAINST 5LG5161G DOA 03/01/2020 (AIG) *** LKK REF:
CCB/AIG20000636/Kea3

Dear Asher,

Please provide us your insured video footage and sketch plan,
Thank you

Best Regards,

Lily Lol (Ms.)
Senlor Claims Executive, Motor Claims Department
D: +65 G4B1 1522 | F- +65 6481 1011

OPT/MALERHZ ereuo

bttt @ Mg Chong Rosd Segagors B4 T TIE Faa ienm

s Gk SAENQODN MOAIN AvE B SINQADOTS SEANO0  Ter (<05 G484 SRS Fax (<00 S48 01
B s ABZ Tairs Inchaiirial dve Sngepors TOTASD  Tat (-66) G457 GAGE Fas:

weweey e st | wwew facebook.com/OptimaWerks

Frvdngad, Confidential imtarmation may be contarsd o T mesage. 1 yoo e nol The imtended recipent, you must sot copy, dismnoutes or wee 1t tor sny purpose
i dbunloree 1y inetends to ey ORer petann
Pioase motify the sender o you receive this emed e 0reor, Bn0 oFiete The emad 5pd i CoRlEn wnrnedistoly alter wiaps

From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng @Ikkauto.com>
Sent: Monday, 20 January 2020 2:09 PM

To: Lily Loi <lily lol@ow.sg>; Mei Kwan (LEKAuto] <Meikwan 0. >

Cc: Sharan Ten <sharon @ow.sg>; Ling Ting An <tingan ling@ow sg>: Ong Hock Kong <hockkong.ong@ow.sg>; Admin A
<gdmin-aE@| kkauto com>




Subject: RE: PRI - 5SMQB81348 CLAIMING AGAINST 5LG5161G DOA 03/01/2020 (AIG) *** LKK REF:
CCH/AIG20000636/Kea3

SAVE AS TO COSTS

Dear Sirs,
We refer to the above matter,

Please be informed that liability s unclear for this matter. Our insured driver reported that your client encroach into his
path and collided with our insured vehicle

We are in a course of investigating into the circumstances of the accident, After verifying further with our O1 we will
revert with our opinion on the cause of the accident. Kindly do not refer to any party for legal assistance until you heard

further from us.

Meanwhile, we would like to request a copy of video footage/witness statement/scene photos(if any) in order for us to
loak into the matter

We shall revert upan hearing from you

Thank You

Bl = )

Asher Sng | i P
LEK Auto Consultants Ple Lid
Ghone: A8L]-40581 | 2amoill gthenngSkkauto con fom: &741-4108

Al - Fovo U incusingl Nork, U Avenue n i . EE K]

From: Lily Loi <lily. lol@ow si>

Sent: Monday, 20 January 2020 2:02 PM

To: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwani@lkkauto caom>; Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <Achersnp@lkkauto.com>
Cc: Sharon Ten <sharoni@ow sg>; Ling Ting An <tingan ling@ow sg>; Ong Hock Kong <hockkong ong@ow sg>; Admin A

<admin-ai@kkauto. coms>

Subject: RE: PRI - SMOB1348 CLAIMING AGAINST 5LG5161G DOA 03/01/2020 (AIG) *** LKK REF:
CCB/AIG20000636/Kead

Dear Asher,

We would like to check liability
Thank you



Best Regards,

Lily Lol [Ms.)
Senior Claims Executive, Motor Claims Department
D: +65 6481 1522 | F: +65 6481 1011
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From: Mei Kwan [LKKAuto) <Meikwan@ikkauto.com:>

Sent: Tuesday, 14 January 2020 9:17 AM

To: Lily Loi <lily lol@ow.sg>; Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto. coms>

Cc: Sharon Ten <sharon@ow s>, Ling Ting An <tingan ling®ow sg>; Ong Hock Kong <hockkong ongi@ow sg>; Admin A
<admin-a2@ | kkauto com>

Subject: RE: PRI - SMQ8134B CLAIMING AGAINST 5LG5161G DOA 03/01/2020 (AIG] *** LKK REF;
CCB/AIG20000636/Kead

Dear Sir / Madam,
We refer to the above matter.

Please be informed that Ol has reported. Please refer to the below O1's sketch plan and statement,

(vics fheek

AL6STbly B imO #1348 .



Foncrne (i mmtmce of e A s — —

Tié Hawl au v Ay e Mt | Srivinr L | howr Wit i""""r-rlmuu‘rﬁ.-k'l Anhe m‘j}
ke o) e’ [Vruaiind 1* bt iy o oxgay bas dugvediat (1A Aal ok
Nt N il ad Mt A7 M Lane "*“‘”“'{WHHH-W&MHM
A A gl ) O g AveAnbilly b Wate g ol apy i GO0 Wity
He aa 2 i v vl Lot TN F mad AbrolfIV of o 5 o8 it pilo i g
Ataml rml aiedpet b bogrii il iy frosd Logte

Please note that for liability, claim negotiation and settlement, please contact Asher at 6841 6051,
Our respective case handler will look into the matter and get back to vou in due course.

To check availability of the case handler, yvou may contact the undersigned,

« Wishing you a Happy ana Frosperous Lunar New Yeq, ~

Thank you.,

Best Regards,

Mei Kwan | Admin

KK Auto Consultants Pre Lid

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiEwanilkkauto.com | fax: 67404108
Hik 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408533)

From: Lily Loi <lily lol@ow sg>

sent: Friday, 10 January, 2020 10:14 AM

To: assignments <assignments@|kkauto com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto com>

Cc: Sharon Ten <sharon@ow.sg>; Ling Ting An <tingan.ling @ ow.sg>; Ong Hock Kong <hockkong ong@ow.sg>
Subject: RE: PRI - SMOB134B CLAIMING AGAINST SLG5161G DOA 03/01/2020 (AIG])

Dear Mei Kwan,

Enclosed marked estimate for your perusal.
Kindly advise on liability,
Thank you

Best Regards,

Lily Lol (Ms.)
Senior Claims Executive, Motor Claims Department
D: +65 6481 1522 | F: +65 6481 1011

OPT/MAIERHKZ ereuo
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From: Lily Lol
Sent; Thursday, 9 January 2020 11:04 AM
To: assgnments{@|kkauto.com

Ce: Sharon Ten <sharon@ow sg>; Ling Ting An <tingan ling[@ow.sg>; Ong Hock Kong <hockkong ang@ow. sg>
Subject: PRI - SMO8134B8 CLAIMING AGAINST SLG5161G DDA 03/01/2020 (AIG)

Dear Officer,

We had conducted PRI on 09/01/2020, 10.30am.
Please advise on liability and officer in charge.
Thank you.

Best Regards,

Lily Loi (Ms.)
Senior Claims Executive, Motor Claims Department
0: +65 6481 1522 | F: +65 6481 1011
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...CLAIM SUBFOLDER...(Pending for Survey Report)

Rewobed | No settioment

CLAIM SUBFOLDER TRACKING
Case Motifiwd Est Submitted Adj Assigned Agj Rpt Ad) Subrritted Ins Auth'sd Status
|07 32 2020 w200 sye00.00 $$400.00 et T By
— Edit ad) rpe | o estimates | | view ot Cancel Case |

Hain

CLATM SUBFOLDER DETAILS

|[Created by adjuster]

Insured: WG XTAD HUTL, LINDA, 10: SE3299%4)
Main
Elaimanti INSPIRED EMPIRE AUTO LEASTNG PTE LTD
Vehicls . |o30L/2020 14:00 - 159
No.: SMQB1348 Date of LoSS: |13 sesniths and 1 Darys From LTA Reg Date (Man ¥ri]
Ciaim Type: | TP / 745510938556 NOREVICOVEL | (Comprenensive)
Vehicle Reg.
Poficy Mo
Mo SLES161G . |5113397340-0000100C
[Tnsured) {Clakmant):
Excess:
Repairer: Optima Werks Pte Ltd (HQ) & Kung Chong Road, 159143 Leng Ke= - Tel: 84721313
ﬂ:f:,'? AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pta. Ltd, (Exprass) - Tel: £5-5415-3000 _. [Mandled by Lok, Chee-Heng] Ches-Hang Loh @aig.com
E:LT::“ NTUC Income Insurance Co-operative Ltd (HQ) - Tel
Adjuster: LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) - Tel 6256 3561 .. [Handied by KENNETH KONG] __[Final Rpt due 21/01/2020]

ASSOCIATED MAIL RECEIVED

Vigw AR I Compase Case Mail I

There are no mail for this cose.

No resufts.

ALL ASSOCIATED TASKSS
Due Date  Priority Type

view Al | Searcn Tasks | Croate wew Tusk | Compiese |
Subject Handler Assigned By Completed On Created On Done?

Task Group

hitps://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=d... 11/3/2020
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Claim Documents

*SMQB134B (74551093855G)
[5LG5161G]
TP
INSPIRED EMPIRE AUTO LEASING PTE LTD
Jan 3 2020 2:00PM
[NG XIAD HUT, LINDA]
Optima Werkz Pte Ltd

Upsoad Docamants | upioad phoms | Composs New ener | upised vides | Upiosd sudis | View [view in Srowser <]
Video [perpage V]| &
Ne | Finalized On AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd. (SG) | Thumbnall | Print
1 [13/01/2015:16 | Video - Accident @ | e av
Photos/Images oepe 1| 2
[to [Relsbel/Recrder | LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HG) Thumbnall | Print
1 |06/0320 1106 | General View 0| sows | &
2 |06/0320 1008 | Ganersl View @ | wedws | A
3 |06/0320 11:06 | Genersl View __ﬂ Load 06 | B
4 | D6/O3/20 11:06 General View 0| cwaws | B
5 |o6/0%/20 1106 | General View 0| losdirc | &
B |06/03/20 11:06 | General View 0| s | B
7 |06/03/20 1106 | Geners] View Q| owars | M
B |06/03/2011:06 | Odometer Reading 0 | waows | B
% |D6/03/20 11:06 | Chassis Number g Load 3G | B
Documentation :P"PE u! ¥
No | Relabel/Reorder | LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HG) Thumbmall | Print
1 |10/01/20 10:43 | TP ESTIMATE - MARMED Load POF
2 10/01/20 10:43 TP GIA REPORT Load PO¥
3 |06/03/20 11:08 | APPROVAL TO REJECT TP CLAIM Load POF
4 [06/03/2011:08 | EMAIL WSP TO REJECT TP CLATM Load PDF
No_| Fimalized G AlG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte, Ltd. (5G) Thumbinall | Print
1 [13/01/20 15:12 | O GIA REPORT @ | Load ¢

Documents Checklist
DOCUMENTS CHECKLIST neset | Save | prim |

There are no document checkists configured

Our Checklist Remarks - LKK Auto Consultants Pie Ltd 1

Show Remarks To: ] Handiing Insurer
i AErARLE @ PeivEle UsERE pOU Ehew I B othee parten.

https:/singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRdoc&fuseaction=dsp_... 11/3/2020



Adjuster Report

Page | of 3

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (co reg Ne 1sss071ssm)

51 Ubl Ave 1 #01-25, Paya Ubi Industrial Park
Singapore 408033

Tel: 6256-3561 Fax: 6544-8805 Email sur@lkkauto.com;assignments@lkkauto.com

VEHICLE DAMAGE INSPECTION REPORT

Our File No; CCB/AIG20000D636/KEAZQ2

Date: 11/03/2020
REFERENCE
Handling Insurer: AlG Asia Pacific Insurance Ple. Lid.  Policy No:
Claimant i
Vehicle No - SMQB8134B Insured Vehicle No: SLGS181G
Date of Loss: 03/01/2020 Nalture of Claim: TP Claim No: 745510838556
DESCRIPTION & IDENTIFICATION OF VEHICLE
Reg No. SMQ81348
Make & Model: HONDA SHUTTLE HYBRID, 1.5 (A) Engine No. LEBT7104571
Reg. Date; 02/12/2019 (Man. Year. 2018) Chassis No: GP72003513
Colour Metallic Black Odometer: 12852 km
Engine Capacity: 1456 cc
Market Value/New Car Price: N/A
Sum Insured (SS): Market Value/New Car Price

CONDITION OF VEHICLE AT THE TIME OF SURVEY

General Condition: Stearing (Serviceable): Yes Foolbrake (Serviceable). Yes
Handbrake (Serviceable): Yes Engine Modification: No Pre-accident Condition:
CONDITION OF TYRES
Front Tyre Size: 185/55 R15 Rear Tyre Size: 195/55 R15
Froni Lefl Side: Dunlop 8 mm Rear Left Side: Dunlop 8 mm
Fronl Right Side: Duniop 8 mm Rear Righl Side: Dunlop B mm
The above viluwes represent the remmnng fyre ireads deph
(COST OF CLAIMS Repairer's Adjuster's Difference  Diff %|
Parts 786.80 0.00 T8E6.80 100.00
Miscellaneous llems 0.00 0.00 0.00
Labour 830.00 400.00 530.00 56.89
Paintwork Labour 0.00 0.00 0.00
Towing 0.00 0.00 0.00
Gross Total (S§) 1,716.80 400.00 1,316.80 T6.70
+ GST 7.00/T.00% (S%5) 120.18 28.00 9218 T6.T0
Nett Amount (S§) 1,836.98 428.00 1,408.98 76.70
Global Sum Settlement [S5) 0.00
INSPECTION
Date of Assignment: 08/01/2020
Date Inspected: 09/01/2020  Inspecied At Optima Werkz Pte Lid (HQ)
6 Kung Chong Road
Singapore 159143
Estimatled Period of Repair: 2.0 days

Adjuster: KENNETH KONG

Manager: Asher Sng Rong Yi

NOTE Thig report represants our findings st the ime and pisce of inspection stated hersin, Such inspection has boen camied olt 1o the best of our
knowledge and ability but ary other labilly under any offer circumstances is hersby expressly axcluded

https://singapore. merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster& fuseaction=g... 11/3/2020



Adjuster Report Page 2 of 3

REPAIR DETAILS
Recommended Parts
No. Qty Pari No. Particulars Condition Repalrer's Amount
1 1 "REAR BUMPER *Check T83.7T0FL “FL
2 B *REAR BUMPER CLIPS *Check 4640 FL “FL
3 1 *REAR BUMPER SIDE BRACKET RH *Check B7.BOFL .
4 1 *REAR BUMPER REFLECTOR RH Serviceable B5.60FL ~FL
5 1 *REAR END PANEL (NPA) Repair 0.00FL “FL
F=Franchise par. LeListhemleac
Sub Total (S5) 983.50 0.00
- List ltam Discount on L Items 20.00/20.00% (S$) 196.70 0.00
Total Parts (S$) 786.80 0.00
| Report was unsubmitied during this print-out |

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=g... 11/3/2020



Adjuster Report

Recommended Miscellaneous Items
Thera are no now miscellansous Items selected.

Recommended Labour

Page 3 of 3

No Particulars Lab.Type Repairer's Amount
Labour ltems
1 LABOUR CHARGES TO New 400.00 200.00
REMOVE ,REPLACE ,REPAIR ,READJUST REAR
ACCIDENT AREAS & ETC
2 LABOUR CHARGES FOR PAINTING & TO SUPPLY PAINT Mew 450.00 200.00
& FURNISHING MATERIAL AT REAR BUMPER ,REAR END
PAMNEL & ETC
3 LABOUR CHARGES TO REMOVE & REFIX REAR BUMPER  MNew B0.00 0.00
REVERSE SENSOR & ETC.TO EFFECT REPLACE FOR
REAR BUMPER (*Check )
Gross Labour Cost [S5) 830.00 400.00

Report was unsubmitted during this print-out.

< END OF ESTIMATES >
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