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Vic (LKKAuto)

From: Vic (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 14 January, 2020 3:35 PM

To: Nitha

Cc: 'Enny'; 'Billy'; 'Nabilah'; Admin A; Vic (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: TP CLAIMS - SKR5442A AGAINST GBE4991M DOA 06/01/2020 AT BUKIT BATOK 

WEST AVE 2 [External Confidential] *** LKK REF: CC4/LPC20000600/R1ha3

Without Prejudice 

 

Dear Nitha, 

 

We refer to your below email. 

 

Please be informed that we are still pending for our Insured’s GIA Report. 

 

We will follow up on the matter and will get back to you for an update in due course. 

 

Thank you. 

 

 

 

 

 

 

Best Regards, 

Vic Alpeh | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6841-2096 | email: vicalpeh@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

Save the Earth. Print only when necessarySave the Earth. Print only when necessarySave the Earth. Print only when necessarySave the Earth. Print only when necessary.... 

 

 

This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by an 
unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mail in error, please do not 
read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the 
sender that you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and any copies thereof. Thank you. 
 

 

From: Nitha [mailto:nitha@mova.com.sg]  

Sent: Tuesday, 14 January, 2020 12:13 PM 
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To: Vic (LKKAuto) 

Cc: 'Enny'; 'Billy'; 'Nabilah' 

Subject: RE: TP CLAIMS - SKR5442A AGAINST GBE4991M DOA 06/01/2020 AT BUKIT BATOK WEST AVE 2 [External 

Confidential] *** LKK REF: CC4/LPC20000600/R1ha3 

Importance: High 

 

Dear Vic,  

 

Please revert us the liability.  

 

 

 

Thank you,  

 
Best Regards, 

Nitha 

Claims Officer  
Mova Automotive Pte Ltd 

Tel: 6272 3892 Fax: 6270 8314 

 

 

 

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) [mailto:Meikwan@lkkauto.com]  

Sent: Tuesday, 14 January 2020 11:39 AM 
To: Nitha; Vic (LKKAuto) 

Cc: 'Enny'; 'Billy'; 'Nabilah'; Admin A 
Subject: RE: TP CLAIMS - SKR5442A AGAINST GBE4991M DOA 06/01/2020 AT BUKIT BATOK WEST AVE 2 [External 

Confidential] *** LKK REF: CC4/LPC20000600/R1ha3 

 

Dear Sir / Madam, 

 

Thank you for your email. 

 

Our respective case handler will look into the matter and get back to you in due course. 

 

Hi Vic, 

 

Kindly assist. 

 

To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned. 

 
Thank you. 

Best Regards, 

Mei Kwan | Admin  

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@lkkauto.com | fax: 67414108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
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From: Nitha <nitha@mova.com.sg>  

Sent: Tuesday, 14 January, 2020 11:38 AM 

To: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 

Cc: 'Enny' <enny@mova.com.sg>; 'Billy' <billy@mova.com.sg>; 'Nabilah' <nabilah@mova.com.sg> 

Subject: RE: TP CLAIMS - SKR5442A AGAINST GBE4991M DOA 06/01/2020 AT BUKIT BATOK WEST AVE 2 [External 

Confidential] 

Importance: High 

 

Dear All,  

 

I understand from Lonpac officer that TP reported,  

Kindly assist to revert us liability for the above mention case. 

 

Thank you,  

 
Best Regards, 

Nitha 

Claims Officer  
Mova Automotive Pte Ltd 

Tel: 6272 3892 Fax: 6270 8314 

 

 

 

From: GERALD POH WEE BIN [mailto:geraldpoh@lonpac.com]  

Sent: Thursday, 9 January 2020 8:22 AM 
To: 'assignments@lkkauto.com' 

Cc: MT_Claim_SG; 'Nitha' 

Subject: FW: TP CLAIMS - SKR5442A AGAINST GBE4991M DOA 06/01/2020 AT BUKIT BATOK WEST AVE 2 
[External Confidential] 

 

Lonpac External - Confidential 
 

Dear Nivitha, 

 

Kindly proceed accordingly. 

 

Our insured has not lodged the accident report.  

 

 

Best Regards 

Gerald Poh 

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd 

300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555 

Tel: (65) 6250 7388 Ext.255 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706 

 
 
Lonpac External - Confidential data is for use by authorised external parties only. 

 

From: Nitha [mailto:nitha@mova.com.sg]  

Sent: Wednesday, 8 January 2020 5:48 pm 
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To: MT_Claim_SG 

Cc: 'Billy'; 'Enny'; 'Nabilah' 

Subject: TP CLAIMS - SKR5442A AGAINST GBE4991M DOA 06/01/2020 AT BUKIT BATOK WEST AVE 2 

 

Dear Sir/Madam,  

Good day 

 

REF : GBE4991M  

Kindly assist revert officer in charge and arrange survey on 09/01/2020 Thursday at Fan Yoong. 
 

Thank you 

 
Best Regards, 

Nitha 

Claims Officer  
Mova Automotive Pte Ltd 

Tel: 6272 3892 Fax: 6270 8314 

 

 

 


