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Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

From: Vic Alpeh S. Sanghilan <VicSanghilan@msfirstcapital.com.sg>

Sent: Monday, 3 May 2021 3:23 PM

To: Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

Cc: Admin A

Subject: [MANDATE GIVEN] RE: [LOD] MSFCIL REF: D20000225MFSH/1 - RE: Accident 

involving SGT5033J & SHD4190S Along CTE on 6 January 2020

Dear Asher, 

 

We refer to your below email. 

 

You have our mandate to settle the matter from $5,622.45 - $5822.45 (all in). 

 

Kindly start to offer LOU @ $80 x 10 days first. 

 

Thank you. 

 

Kind Regards, 

 

Vic Sanghilan 

Motor Claim Department 

 
MS First Capital Insurance Ltd | 36 Robinson Road, City House #16-01 Singapore 068877  

| Tel: 65073848 | DID : 65073846 |  Fax No. : 65073849 |Email: vicsanghilan@msfirstcapital.com.sg | Company Regn. No. 

195000106C  

A Member of  Insurance Group 

 
Personal Data Protection Act 2012 ("PDPA"): 

Under the PDPA, there are various requirements that regulate the processing of your personal data. Please refer to 

http://www.msfirstcapital.com.sg for details of PDPA Personal Data Collection Statement. 

 

Confidentiality Notice: This e-mail is confidential. It may also be legally privileged. If you are not the addressee or to whom it is 

intended, you may not copy, forward, disclose or use any part of it. If you have received this message in error, please delete the 

message and all copies from your system and notify the sender immediately by return e-mail. 

 

From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com>  

Sent: Monday, 3 May 2021 3:14 pm 

To: Vic Alpeh S. Sanghilan <VicSanghilan@msfirstcapital.com.sg> 

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: RE: [MANDATE REQUEST] RE: [LOD] MSFCIL REF: D20000225MFSH/1 - RE: Accident involving SGT5033J & 

SHD4190S Along CTE on 6 January 2020 

 

Hi Vic, 

 

Enclosed the LTA rebate details for your easy reference. 

 

Thank You.  

  

Best Regards, 

Asher Sng | Case Handler  

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

email: ashersng@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108| did: 6841-6051 
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Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
 
Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email.  Submission of claim related 

documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted. 

 

From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto)  

Sent: Monday, 3 May 2021 3:12 PM 

To: 'Vic Alpeh S. Sanghilan' <VicSanghilan@msfirstcapital.com.sg> 

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: RE: [MANDATE REQUEST] RE: [LOD] MSFCIL REF: D20000225MFSH/1 - RE: Accident involving SGT5033J & 

SHD4190S Along CTE on 6 January 2020 

 

Hi Vic, 

 

We refer to the email below. 

 

Enclosed below the ERV recommended by our surveyor for your easy reference. 

 

Market Value $34,000 

LTA Rebate $11,233 

Nett Value $22,767 

 

 

Thank You.  

  

Best Regards, 

Asher Sng | Case Handler  

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

email: ashersng@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108| did: 6841-6051 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
 
Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email.  Submission of claim related 

documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted. 

 

From: Vic Alpeh S. Sanghilan <VicSanghilan@msfirstcapital.com.sg>  

Sent: Thursday, 29 April 2021 10:25 AM 

To: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com> 

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: RE: [MANDATE REQUEST] RE: [LOD] MSFCIL REF: D20000225MFSH/1 - RE: Accident involving SGT5033J & 

SHD4190S Along CTE on 6 January 2020 

 

Dear Asher, 

 

We refer to your below email. 

 

Kindly advise the ERV of the TP vehicle for record purposes. 

 

Thank you. 

 

Kind Regards, 

 

Vic Sanghilan 

Motor Claim Department 
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MS First Capital Insurance Ltd | 36 Robinson Road, City House #16-01 Singapore 068877  

| Tel: 65073848 | DID : 65073846 |  Fax No. : 65073849 |Email: vicsanghilan@msfirstcapital.com.sg | Company Regn. No. 

195000106C  

A Member of  Insurance Group 

 
Personal Data Protection Act 2012 ("PDPA"): 

Under the PDPA, there are various requirements that regulate the processing of your personal data. Please refer to 

http://www.msfirstcapital.com.sg for details of PDPA Personal Data Collection Statement. 

 

Confidentiality Notice: This e-mail is confidential. It may also be legally privileged. If you are not the addressee or to whom it is 

intended, you may not copy, forward, disclose or use any part of it. If you have received this message in error, please delete the 

message and all copies from your system and notify the sender immediately by return e-mail. 

 

From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com>  

Sent: Monday, 26 April 2021 6:47 pm 

To: Vic Alpeh S. Sanghilan <VicSanghilan@msfirstcapital.com.sg> 

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: [MANDATE REQUEST] RE: [LOD] MSFCIL REF: D20000225MFSH/1 - RE: Accident involving SGT5033J & 

SHD4190S Along CTE on 6 January 2020 

 

Your ref : D20000225MFSH 
Our ref : CC4/FCI20000599/Kea3q2 
  
Dear Sirs, 
  
ACCIDENT INVOLVING SHD 4190S (OI) AND SGT 5033J (TP) ON 06/01/2020 
  
We refer to the above matter. 
  
The accident occurred when our insured rear ended third party vehicle. 
  
Basing on the reports of the circumstance of the accident, we propose to settle third-party claim at 100% liability. 
  
We seek your approval to offer repairer " K KIM HIN AUTOMOTIVE PTE LTD " at $ 5,822.45 (all-in). 
  
The summary is as follows: - 
  

  Amount Claimed Amount Revised   
1. Cost of Repairs (w/GST) $  10,296.02 $ 4,815.00   
2. Loss of Use (10days x $150) $    1,500.00 $ 1,000.00 (10days x $100) 
3. LTA Search Fee $           7.45 $        7.45 

Total $  11,803.47 $ 5,822.45   
  
Surveyor recommended 7days for repair. 
  
Enclosed here with all the relevant documents for your perusal. 
  
Kindly let us have your approval / instruction. 
 

Thank You.  

  

Best Regards, 

Asher Sng | Case Handler  

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

email: ashersng@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108| did: 6841-6051 
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Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
 
Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email.  Submission of claim related 

documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted. 

 

From: margaret@kkimhin.com.sg <margaret@kkimhin.com.sg>  

Sent: Tuesday, 30 March 2021 9:02 AM 

To: 'Vic Alpeh S. Sanghilan' <VicSanghilan@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com> 

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: RE: [LOD] MSFCIL REF: D20000225MFSH/1 - RE: Accident involving SGT5033J & SHD4190S Along CTE on 6 

January 2020 

 

Our Ref: 020004/01 

 

Thanks Vic, we will wait for LKK to get back to us. 

 

Rgds 

 

Margaret 

K. Kim Hin Auto Pte Ltd 

160 Sin Ming Dr #02-20 

Sin Ming AutoCity 

Singapore 575722 

Tel:  64527018 

 

----------------------- 

 

From: Vic Alpeh S. Sanghilan <VicSanghilan@msfirstcapital.com.sg>  

Sent: Monday, March 29, 2021 3:32 PM 

To: margaret@kkimhin.com.sg; Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com> 

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: [LOD] MSFCIL REF: D20000225MFSH/1 - RE: Accident involving SGT5033J & SHD4190S Along CTE on 6 

January 2020 

 

WITHOUT PREJUDICE 

 

Your Ref:  020004/01 

MSFCIL Ref  :  D20000225MFSH/1 

 

Dear Margaret, 

 

Accident involving SHD4190S & SGT5033J on 06.01.2020 

 

We acknowledge receipt of your letter of claim dated 29.03.2021. 

 

Please be informed that this matter is handled by LKK and they will get back to you for an update/offer in due 

course. 

 

Thank you. 

 

 

Dear Asher, 

 

FYNA please. 

 

Thank you. 
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Kind Regards, 

 

Vic Sanghilan 

Motor Claim Department 

 

MS First Capital Insurance Ltd | 36 Robinson Road, City House #16-01 Singapore 068877  

| Tel: 6507 3848 | DID : 6507 3846 |  Fax No. : 6507 3849 |Email: vicsanghilan@msfirstcapital.com.sg |Company Regn. 

No. 195000106C  
A Member of  Insurance Group 

 
Personal Data Protection Act 2012 ("PDPA"): 

Under the PDPA, there are various requirements that regulate the processing of your personal data. Please refer to 

http://www.msfirstcapital.com.sg for details of PDPA Personal Data Collection Statement. 

 

Confidentiality Notice: This e-mail is confidential. It may also be legally privileged. If you are not the addressee or to whom it is 

intended, you may not copy, forward, disclose or use any part of it. If you have received this message in error, please delete the 

message and all copies from your system and notify the sender immediately by return e-mail. 

 

 

 

From: margaret@kkimhin.com.sg <margaret@kkimhin.com.sg>  

Sent: Monday, 29 March 2021 3:23 pm 

To: CWS Motor Claims <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg> 

Cc: claims@kkimhin.com.sg 

Subject: Accident involving SGT5033J & SHD4190S Along CTE on 6 January 2020 

 

 

Your Ref: D20000225MFSH 

Our Ref:  020004/01 

 

Dear Sirs, 

 

We are enclosing the Letter of Demand documents for your processing of the abovementioned claim: 

 

1) Letter of Demand 

2) Cost of Repair Invoice 

3) LTA Search Fee 

4) Letter of Authorization 

 

We look forward to hearing from you. 

 

 

Thanks and regards 

 

Margaret 

K. Kim Hin Auto Pte Ltd 

160 Sin Ming Dr #02-20 

Sin Ming AutoCity 

Singapore 575722 

Tel: 64527018 

 


