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Summer Lee !LKK Auto!

From: summer Lea (LKK Auto) <admin-d@lkkauto.com:>

Sent: Thursday, 9 January, 2020 2:36 PM

To: 'ONG U LI'; assignments@lkkauto.com; sur@lkkauto.com

Ce: ‘MT_Claim_SG°

Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING OUR INSURED VEHICLE SIAGDSEX & XE2631E ON

16/12/2019 Our Ref: 19/19/20/vC00/022796 [External General]

Cear Li Li,
Thank you for the email.
We will cancel this assignment from our side.

B2st Regards,

Summer Lee | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6741-8434 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue
1, #02-25 | 5{408933)

~—Original Message—---

From: ONG LI LI <llong@lonpac.com>

Sent: Thursday, 9 January, 2020 12:51 PM

To: Summer Lee (LKK Auto) <admin-d@Ikkauto.com>; assignments@Ikkauto.com; sur@lkkauto.com
Ce: MT_Clalm_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com>; Wahhong motors & credit pte Itd <motor@wahhong.sg>
Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING OUR INSURED VEHICLE SJA6058X & XE2631E ON

16/12/2019 Our Ref: 19/19/20/VC00/022796 [External General]

Lonpac External - General
Derar Summer

Sorry, please cancel this assignment.

Regards,

Ong Li Li

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd
300 Beach Road #17-04/07 The Concourse
Sirgapore 199555

Tel : (65) 6250 7388 Ext. 254 Fax: (65) 6296 2706

Lonpac External - Gerleral Hata Is for internal / external use.

—--0riginal Message--—

From: Summer Lee (LKK Auto) [mailto;admin-d@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Thursday, 9 January 2020 10:00 AM

To: ONG LI L; assignments@lkkauto.com: sur@lkkauto.com

Cc: MT_Clalm_5G

Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INV{}LWNG_ OUR INSURED VEHICLE SIAGDSSX & XE2631EON
16/12/2018 Our Ref: 19/19/20/VC00/022796 [External General)



Summer Lee (LKK Auto!

From: ONG U U <lleng@lonpac.com>

Sient: Thursday, 9 January, 2020 12:51 PM

“o: Summer Lee (LKK Auto); assignments@Ikkauto.com; sur@lkkauto.com

Ce: MT_Claim_SG; Wahhong motors & credit pte itd

Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING QUR INSURED VEHICLE S)AB0DS8X & XE2631E ON

16/12/2019 Our Ref: 19/19/20/VC00/022796 [External General)

Lonpac External - General
ear Summer

Sorry, ptease cancel this assignment.

Regards,

Ong Li L

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd
300 Beach Road #17-04/07 The Concourse
Singapore 199555

“el : (65) 6250 7388 Ext. 254 Fax: (65) 6296 2706

L.onpac External - General data is for intarnal / external use.

~—-0riginal Message----.

From: Summer Lee (LXK Auto) [mailto;admin-d@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Thursday, 9 January 2020 10:00 AM

Ta: ONG LI LI assignments@lkkauto.com; sur@lkkauto.com

e MT_Claim_SG

Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING OUR INSURED VEHICLE SIAGDS58X & XE2631E ON 16/12/2019 Our Ref:
19/19/20/vC00/022796 [External General]

Dear SirfMadam,
Thank you for the assignment.

Please be informed that vehicle currently niot in the workshop, repairer will arrange.

3est Regards,

summer Lee | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6741-B434 | email: assignments@Ilkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubl Avenue
L, #02-25 | 5(408933)

-—-Original Message----—

“rapri; ONG LI LI <llong@lonpac.com>

sent: Thursday, 9 January, 2020 9:44 AM

Te: assignments@lkkauto,com; Nivitha (LKK Auto) <admin-d@lkkauto.com>

Ze: MT_Claim_5G =mt_claim@lonpac.com>

5ubject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING OUR INSURED VEHICLE SIAED58X & XE2631EON

i



Nivitha (LKK Auto)
e e e e —e —————— - ———————

From:; QNG LI LI <llong@lonpac.com:

Hent: Thursday, 9 January 2020 9:36 AM

To: Wahhong motors & credit pte Itd; assignments@®Ikkauto.com; Nivitha (LKK Auto)

L= > MT_Claim_SG

Subject: RE:! ACCIDENT INVOLVING QOUR INSURED VEMHICLE SJABDS58X & XE2631E ON
16/12/2019 Our Ref: 19/19/20/VC00/022796 [External General)

Attachments: SIAGOSBX.MP4

lLonpac External - General
Without Prejudice

Dear fenny

Our Insured has reported the accident. Please liaise with LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd for survey and assessment of
liability.

[year Nivitha

FYA

Fegards,

Ong Li Li

Senjor Clalms Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd
300 Beach Road #17-04/07 The Concourse
Singapore 189555

Tel: (65) 6250 7388 Ext, 254 Fax: (65) 6296 2706

Lonpac External - General data is for internal / external use.

-—-:0riginal Message--—-

From: Wahhong motors & credit pte Itd [mailto:motor@wahhong.sg)

Sent: Thursday, 26 December 2019 9:37 AM

To:ONGLIL

Subject: Re: ACCIDENT INVOLVING OUR INSURED VEHICLE SIABD5BX & XE2631E ON 16/12/2019 Our Ref:
19/19/20/VCO0/022796 [External Genaral)

Hi Li Li

Attach is the video evidence from the owner of SIAGDSEX for your perusal.
Kindly inform me once 3rd party has done the reporting.

Thank you & regards
lenny

8778 3555



On 2019-12-18 16:12, ONG LI Ll wrote:
» Lonpac External - General
» Without Prejudice

» Dear lenny
> Qur |nsured has not reported the accident.
.

» Do you still want us to arrange survey?

: Regards,

=0ng L LI

= Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd
: 300 Beach Road #17-04/07 The Concourse

> Singapore 199555

> Tel : (65) 6250 7388 Ext. 254 Fax: (65) 6296 2706

v

Lonpac External - General data is for internal / external use.

oy oy

L7

> ——QOriginal Message—--

> From: Wahhong motors & credit pte ltd [mailto:motor@wahhong.sg]
> Sent: Wednesday, 18 December 2019 2:34 PM

> To: MT_Claim_SG

> Cc: GERALD POH WEE BIN

> Subject: ACCIDENT INVOLVING OUR INSURED VEHICLE SIAG0S8X & XE2631E ON
> 16/12/2019

-

> Dear Sirs/Madam,

>

> Please find the attached GIA REPORT for your perusal.

2

> Kindly advise me about the liability for this CASE and inform your

> client XE2631E to file GIA REPORT. Do note that our client's vehicle
> SJABOSEX is not in our warkshop currently.

o> e

> Thank You and Best Regards;

>

> Jenny Ng

> Admin Manager

> WAH HONG MOTORS & CREDIT PTE LTD

> ROC:199806235M

> ENTERPRISE HUB

> 38 TOH GUAN ROAD EAST

> #01-57 S{608581)

> Tel:(65)67737377

> HP :(p5)87783555

> Website: www wahhong.sg

> Mail : motor@wahhong.sg



Thank You and Best Regards,

Jenny Ng

Admin Manager

WAH HONG MOTORS & CREDIT PTE LTD
ROC:199806235M
ENTERPRISE HUB

38 TOH GUAN ROAD EAST
#01-57 S{608581)
Tel:{65)67737377

HP :(65)87783555

Website: www.wahhong.sg
Mall : motor@wahhong.sg



