Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

From: jenny chong <jenny@esteemperf.com.sg>

Sent: Monday, 23 March, 2020 11:18 AM

To: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

Cc: Vic (LKKAuto); carmen lim; serence ctc; Admin A

Subject: Re: Liability Check - Accident involving SLM8472H & EP323A(AIG) on 05.07.2019
Categories: HMK

HI Mei Kwan

We would like to withdraw this case.

Thank you

Freundliche GriiBe / Best Regards

Jenny Chong
Senior Operation Executive | Operation Division
Esteem Performance Pte Ltd

P: 6484 1221
F: 6484 7829
E: jenny@esteemperf.com.sg

5033 Ang Mo Kio Industrial Park 2 #01-259
(Head Office)

385 Sin Ming Drive Vicom Inspection Centre
(Showroom)

www.esteemperformance.com

On Mon, Jan 13, 2020 at 10:33 AM Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@Ikkauto.com> wrote:

Dear Sir / Madam,

We refer to the above matter.

Please be informed that OI has reported. Please refer to the below OI's sketch plan and statement.
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SHETCH PLAN

DESCRIBE CIRCUMSTANCES OF THE ACCIDENT

REFER TO POLICE REPORT MO, T20150725/2028

Brief Details.
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Please note that for liability, claim negotiation and settlement, please contact Vic at 6841 2096.
Our respective case handler will look into the matter and get back to you in due course.

To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned.

« Wishing you a Happy ana rrosperous Lunar New Yeq, »



Thank you.

Best Regards,

Mei Kwan | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@lkkauto.com | fax: 67414108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: jenny chong <jenny@esteemperf.com.sg>

Sent: Tuesday, 7 January, 2020 3:35 PM

To: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@I|kkauto.com>

Cc: carmen lim <carmen@esteemperf.com.sg>; serence ctc <serence@esteemperf.com.sg>
Subject: Liability Check - Accident involving SLM8472H & EP323A(AIG) on 05.07.2019

Dear Mei Kwan

We refer to the above matter.

Kindly let us know case liability asap.

Thank you.

Freundliche GriiBe / Best Regards

Jenny Chong
Senior Operation Executive | Operation Division
Esteem Performance Pte Ltd

P: 6484 1221
F: 6484 7829
E: jenny@esteemperf.com.sg

5033 Ang Mo Kio Industrial Park 2 #01-259
(Head Office)




385 Sin Ming Drive Vicom Inspection Centre
(Showroom)

www.esteemperformance.com




