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Adn WA ™ PeLm Comparry Ruglstration No. 199607188R

S0 LI AVE | #0228 FAYA URT INDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 40935 TEL : f3) A2563501 FAN © 1065) p25ad015
Your Ref: D200001 8 IMFSH
Our ref: CS/TFCI200005 19/UvT3 DATE: 14/1/2020
The Motor Claims Department WITHOUT PREJUDICE

MS FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LTD

Dear SirMadam
INITIAL INSPECTION REPORT OF VEHICLE NO PA 6808C

We thank for your instruction on 8/1/2020

Please be informed that we had conducied the inspection of the above mentioned vehicle on

vehicle an 9/172020  at the premises of M/s TICK HAI MOTOR

Workshop Estimuate Amount : §§7.561.05

Revised Estimate Amount : §54,150.00 (LUMP SUM)
"Check” Items Amount - 5%

Market Value ;8%

LTA Reimbursement Value : 53

Nett Value - 88

Description of Damage:

The vehicle sustained damages at the rear

n/s front portion.

Comments/Present Status:

Damages Consistent

Yours faithfully,

MARCUS CHUA
Licensed Appraiser



’ . Ms .Fimtcapltal M5 First Capital insurance Limited (s seg an (940000080 631 pg e 7 SEO1ETH Y

5 Raffies Quay #2100 Singapore 048580
Tl (65)6222 2311 Fax (556222 3547

Clotmg & Puster Unsierwtting Depy 35 Robineon Boad 816-01 City Mowse Singapare 058877
Tel (65) 6507 3848 Fax: [65) E507 3840
wharel mafirricapital comoag

MOTOR SURVEY ASSIGNMENT
Date 07-01-2020 QOur Ref No. D20000181MFSH
Accident Date 03-01-2020 Claim Type. Third Party
Insured Vehicle SHAB250S Third Party Vehicle. PAGBOBC
Survey Location BLK 1 KAKI BUKIT AVENUE 6 #01-54 AUTOBAY @ KAKI BUKIT
Contact Person. CONNIE
Contact No. 65842 9089/ 0 Fax No. 0
Survey Type WITHOUT PREJUDICE:
Appointed LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD
Surveyor
Contact Person MNA, Fax No. 68416315
Contact Number. NA,

FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT

Please submit to us the Tax Invoice together with letter of claim for Rental OR Loss of use (based on
NIMA Benchmark rates) together with your survey report.

THIRD PARTY SURVEY REQUEST

TICK HAI MOTOR &

Cc : Workshop WELDING SERVICES Attention. NIL
Cc : TP Solicitor ARIDAS & ASSOCIATES TP Solicitor Fax No. NA
Officer Incharge RACHELWU LIMEI

IMPORTANT NOTE

Kindly submit the survey report via CWS within 14 days for survey assignmeni and 7 days for re-inspection
This Is a compuler generated letter, no signature required.




Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAutD)

Sent: Tuesday, 14 January 2020 9:13 AM

To: ‘CWS Motor Claims’; SUR

Cc: ‘Rachel Wu’

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D20000181MFSH/1-PA 6808C
Attachments: PA 6B0BC PRELI ADVISED, pdf

Dear Sir/Madam,

Enclosed preliminary revised of vehicle PA 6808C
Date of survey: 9/1/2020
Number of days (estimated) : 5 days

Best Regards.

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@Ikkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubl Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

sent: Thursday, 9 January 2020 3:43 PM

To: 'CWS Motar Claims’ <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>
Cc: 'Rachel Wu' <RachelWu@msfirstcapital.com.sg>

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D20000181MFSH/1-PA 6BUBC

Dear Sir/Madam,
Please be informed that we have inspected the vehicle PA 6808C on 9/1/2020

We are pending estimate from repairer.

Besl Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handier

LKK Auto Consultants Pie Lid

Phone: 6256-3561 | emall -sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-3315

Bik 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubl Avenue 1, #02-25 | S{408933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-d@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 8 January 2020 2:37 PM

To: 'CWS Motor Claims' <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com sg>; assignments <assignments@|kkauto.com>; SUR
<suri@|kkauto.com>

Cc: 'Rachel Wu' <RachelWu@msfirstcapital.com.sg>

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D20000181MFSH/1




Dear Sir/Madam,

Thank you for your assignment.

Best Regards,

Summer Lee | Admin

LEK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6741-8434 | email: assignments@ kkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park. Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | Sl408039)

From: CWS5S Motor Claims <cwsmotorclaims@mslirsicapital.com.sg>

sent: Wednesday, 8 January, 2020 2:18 PM

To: ASSIGNMENTS@LKKAUTO.COM

Cc: CWS Motor Claims <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital. com.sg>; Rachel Wu <RachelWu@msfirstcapital.com.sg>
Subject: PRI: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D20000181MFSH/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,

We refer to the above reference.
Please find attached the necessary documents for survey.
Kindly submit your report via CWS within the next 14 days.

Note: All the accident reports are uploaded into CWS for your perusal.

Best Regards,

Admin Team

Claim Workflow System

Motor Claims Department

MS First Capital Insurance Limited
Tel : 6507 3848

Fax : 6507 3849

PS: This is a system generated mail. Please do not reply to this mail.



‘Veron Chen SLI{[{Autn!

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuta)

Sent: Thursday, 9 January 2020 3:43 PM

To: 'CWS Motor Claims'; SUR

Cc 'Rachel Wu'

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D20000181MFSH/1-PA 6808C
Dear Sir/Madam.,

Please be informed that we have inspected the vehicle PA 6808C on 9/1/2020

We are pending estimate from repairer.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone; 6§256-3561 | emall :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubl Industrial Park, Ubl Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-d@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 8 January 2020 2:37 PM

To: 'CWS Motor Claims' <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; assignments <assignments@Ikkauto.com>; SUR
<sur@lkkauto.com=

Cc: 'Rachel Wu' <RachelWu@msfirstcapital.com.sg>

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D20000181MFSH/1

Dear Sir/Madam,

Thank you for your assignment,

Best Regards,

Summer Lee | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pe Lid

Phome: 6741-84534 | email: pssignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6a56-4315
Blk 51, Pava Ubi Indostrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #o2-25 | S(408933]

From: CWS Motor Claims <cwsmotarclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, 8 January, 2020 2:18 PM

To: ASSIGNMENTSELKKAUTO.COM

Cc: CWS Motor Claims <cwsmotarclaims@msfirstcapital.com sg>; Rachel Wu <RachelWu@msfirstcapital.com.sg>
Subject: PRI: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D20000181MF5H/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,



We refer to the above reference.
Please find attached the necessary documents for survey.
Kindly submit your report via CWS within the next 14 days.

Note: All the accident reports are uploaded into CWS for your perusal.

Best Regards,

Admin Team

Claim Workflow System

Motor Claims Department

MS First Capital Insurance Limited
Tel : 6507 3848

Fax : 6507 3849

PS: This is a system generated mail. Please do not reply to this mail.



Used Toyota Hiace Car for Sale in Singapore, ABWIN Bus Ple Ltd - sgCarMan Page | of 2

sGCARMART.COM Lok 5

New Cars Used Cars Rental Cars Eall My Car Directory Products intsurance Articies Farum Herources

Enjoy fun in 2020.

Mace Price Range w | Deprecation v_| » 10 year), v | |Vehick Type = N sSubmiti

Toyota Hiace 2.5A (COE oll 07/2027)

ORIt Financial ACCESSOrIES Siemvilnr Ressarch Photos Map
L]
T TR
Price $40,800 Lifespan 11-Now-2027
Depreclation £5,400 fyr Reg Date 12-Nov-2007
[?yrs 6mths 22days COE left)
Milzage NA Manufactured 2007
Road Tax NA, Transmission Auto
Dereg Value $25,763 a5 of twday (change ] oMy 517 544
COE £34.070 No. of Owners 5
Engine Cap 2494 cc
ik

Curb Weight 2,120 kg Location Mag
Type of Vehicle
Features

View specs of the Tovota Hig

Saller Enformiatian

m*ml‘l
" ABWIN Bus Pte Ltd

$0 Drive Away, Warranty Provide, Excallent Condition, In House Loan Avalable, Come Ta Yiew And Balieve, Call
Paira

¥ 172 Sin Ming Drive
Category Tet HIETR414

& Eng GESTRS11 @
Status fan A3213003 @
Avallable
Resources

m Vehicia Evaluanon

_—— Afraid of lemons™ Request to have tha car evaluated profiessiconally., F

& Car Valuation - Free
o %\ Fing oue the maret value of your exisung car for free. Get Sarted

Upfrant Payment
Comipars

https://www.sgearmart.com/used_cars/info.php?ID=853691&DL=3259 09-Jan-20



Used Toyota Hiace Car for Sale in Singapore. Think One Automobile & Trading - sgCarMant Page | of 2

Iﬁcmm‘l‘-cm Ligin Sicpr un

*

Now Carn | Used Cars Rental Cars Sall My Car Directory Products Innurancs Articles Farum Renources

Get More Cash for Your Car, Post an Ad Today
Receive a higher selling price by selling your car yourself
Advertise it for sale at just $58. list till sold

face Price Hange | | Deprecation \-_| » 10 year( v | | Vemce Type il E submiti

Toyota Hiace Commuter 3.0A (CQE bl 05/2028)

OreEriidv Financial Accessories Similar Hessarch Photos Map

a—- 1 i hH‘ A=
/. Think One Automobile (; '-x} o=

Price 545 800 Lifespan 14-May-2028

Depreciation £5, 480 (yr Reg Date 15-May-2008
[Byrs 4miths Sdays CDE left)

Mileage ME B35 km (29.9% fyr) Manufactured 208
Road Tax A, Transmission Ao
Dereg Value $29,836 as of today (chanoe) oMy 41,160
COE £35729 ARF §2,058
Engine Cap 2,987 ot No. of Owners 3
Curb Weight 2,180 kg
Type of Vehicly
Saller Infarmation

Features Think One Automobile & Trading
View spers of the Tovots Fiace High Hoof {2005 t

Category
- & 3T Uke Rpag &
Think One Busing
Status Tel: GEG53IO0
Available i
= Shails PE BT
Resources Waong LEAA 1%
Erc GIEINETG D

LY Car Valuation - Free
k- % Find ot the market vshue of your existing car for fres. Got wats

m Vehicle Evaluation

—_—— Afraad of lemons? Reguest to have this car evaluaned professionally. |

Upfront Payment

Transfer Fee { ¥

Down Payment 44,580 | )

1st Instalment $1.013
Compare

https://www.sgearmart.com/used_cars/info.php?ID=826492& DI =2356 09-Jan-20



PARF/COE Rebate Enquiry Page | of |
> Back to OneMotoring
Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle
Vehicle Owner Particulars
QOwner ID Type: Company
Owner |D: 992D
Vehicle Details
Vehicle No.: PA&8B08C
Vehicle to be Exported: No
Intended Deregistration Date: 09 Jan 2020
Vehicle Make: TOYOTA
Vehicle Model: HIACE25A
Primary Colour: White
Manufacturing Year: 2007
Engine No.: 2KD1665415
Chassis No.: KDH2220036284
Maximum Power Output:
Open Market Value: $29,370.00
Original Registration Date: 30 Aug 2007
First Registration Date: 30 Aug 2007
Transfer Count: 6
Actual ARF Paid: $0.00
Intended PARF Rebate Details
PARF Eligibility: No
PARF Eligibility Expiry Date: -
PARF Rebate Amount: $£0.00
Intended COE Rebate Details
COE Expiry Date: 31 Jul 2027
COE Category: C - Goods Vehicle & Bus
COE Period(Years): 10
PQP Paid: $34,070.00
COE Rebate Amount: $25.,753.00
Total Rebate Amount: $25,753.00

The information contained herein is correct as at 09 Jan 2020

OK

hutps://vrlla.gov.sg/la/vrl/action/enquireRebate By Public Before DeregInput ?FUNCTION _[D=F030... 09-Jan-20



159 TICK HAI MOTOR
I KAKI BUKTI AVE 6 #01-20 SINGAPORE 417883
TEL: 6842 9089 FAX: 6841 2869

REG NO

Vehicle Number: PAGRORC

Vehicle Model :

Tovota Hiace 2.5 A

Manufacturing Year : 2007

Chas

sis No, KDH2220036284

53033608A

WL ?//%n/

/,uf
Sf’

S/N. |Item Description Amount (S)
[Front Bumper DS s 57552 | —
2 Front Bumper Side Retainer x 2 pcs 129.20 N.fs c/la 5 10754 | 1PC
3|Front Bumper Clip x 6 pes Al | S 13.60 |~
A Headlamp (LH) LPD*EU CAr S 700.59 |
5|Small Radiator Eand [2uq ]S 1.263.70 | —
6] Same Radiator Fan Motor fnd_pq 5 578.90 ol
7|Front Door (LH) ﬁﬂh po |5 930.90 /
BlFront Door Hinge x 2 pes Sot. 1S 112.35 1 X
OlFront Door Weatherstrip ) 7'_;,\ 5 120.38 |~
10JFront Door Inner Lock Twy 5_[{-1 "IS 22470 L~
| I}Front Door Regulator 1 5 120.38
1 2}Front Door Inner Trimboard - 5 449 40
13[Front Dooglower SFep sead] ALl A lsm]s 272.85 b
14]Step Gamish (=64 AU Chs |$ 3025 b
(T80,
266111
Total :| § 5.841.06
Less 25% ¢ § 1.460.27
Amount :| § 4.380.80
SIN Special Nett Item { Amount (§)
| |Front Bumper Sensor (LH) g | S 80.25 X
2 [Radiator Coolant an s 100.00 | 3D
Total ;] § 180.25
Labour Amount (§)
To check front electrical winng system and focus headlamps S 20.00 lf)
To remove & reinstall radiator S 180.00 3 0
To remove & reinstall front bumper sensor S 80.00
To transfer door components from old door to new door S 80.00 6,}




202

£60

To remove, replace above listed parts and panel, to panel beat S 1.600.00

accident affected parts

To spray painting on affected area $ 980.00
_ Labour Total :| § 3.000.00
Total (Parts & Labour) § 7.561.05

T
—

I3



LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapors 408933

TEL @258 1581 FAX: B258 4315

Reg No: 199607188R GST Reg. No. 18-8607198-R

MS FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LTD

Rel : CS/FCI20000519/UvAN2

$16.01 CITY HOUSESINGAPORE 068877 Date - TeOTEE ”“l"l"ll"“l"l
Code: FCI2
1. Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. SHA B250S Veh. Inspected PA 6808C
Policy No. Coverage (§) 0.00
Claim No. D200001B1MFSH Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From RACHEL WU LI MEI Assign Date D8/01/2020
5 Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model TOYOTA HIACE (A) c.c 2454
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2007
Chassis No. KDH2220036284 Colour WHITE
Odomeater ararie Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification NIL
General GOOD
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make _ Balance
R/H Front Tyre |195 R15 CONDOR 7 mm
L/H Front Tyre |195R15 CONDOR 7 mm
R/H Rear Tyre |185R15 CONDOR 7 mm
L/H Rear Tyre |185R15 CONDOR 7 mm
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE N/S FRONT PORTION.
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS
5. = ‘General Information
Accident Date  03/01/2020 |inspection Date 09/01/2020
Survey held at  TICK HAI MOTOR & WELDING SERVICES
BLK 1 KAK] BUKIT AVE &
#01-54 AUTOBAY & KAKI BUKIT
SINGAPORE 41T7BB3
5a. Remarks
AJDAMAGES CONSISTENT TO ACCIDENT REPORT.
BJTHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS
C)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS
5b. il Estimate Days of Repair_

IESTIMATEﬂ NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR:

5 Working Days




' V V LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

e 51 Ubl Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industnal Park, Singapore 408833
- TEL: 6258 3581 FAX: 6258 4215

Aeg. No 199607188R GST Reg. No. 18-9607188-R Page No.:1 of 2
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. PA 6808C

REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|FRONT BUMPER DISTORTED 575.52 575562
2|FRONT BUMPER SIDE RETAINER M/S CRACKED 397 .54 12020
G|FRONT BUMPER CLIP NECESSARY 13.60 13.60
1|HEADLAMP [LH) CRACKED 700.58 680.50
1|SMALL RADIATOR BENT / PUNCTURE 1,263.70 1.263.70
1|SAME RADIATOR FAN MOTOR CRACKED / 578,90 &578.80
JAMMED
1|FRONT DOOR (LH) BADLY DENTED 930.90 830,80
2|FRONT DOOR HINGE SERVICEABLE 11235 -
1|FRONT DOOR WEATHERSTRIP TORN 120,38 120.38
1|FRONT DOOR INNER LOCK TWISTED / JAMMED 224,70 22470
1|FRONT DOOR REGULATOR NOT NECESSARY 120,38 -
1|FRONT DOOR INNER TRIMBOARD NOT NECESSARY 4498.40 -
1|FRONT DOOR LOWER STEF PANEL N/S BADLY DENTED 27285 2r285
1]STEP GARNISH N/S CRACKED 80.25 BO.25
LESS 25% DISCOUNT -1,460.26 -1,215.37
4,380.80 3,646.13
SPECIAL NETT ITEMS
1|FRONT BUMPER SENSOR (LH}{SN) SERVICEABLE 80.26 -
1|RADIATOR COOLANT (SEN) NECESSARY 100.00 30.00
180.25 30.00
LABOUR
TO CHECK FRONT ELECTRICALWIRING SYSTEM AND 80.00 20.00
FOCUS HEADLAMPS,
TO REMOVE & REINSTALL RADIATOR. ) 180.00 50.00
TO REMOVE & REINSTALL FRONT BUMPER SENSOR. ) 80.00 -
TO TRANSFER DOOR COMPONENTS FROM OLD DOOR B80.00 B60.00
TO NEW DOOR.
TO REMOVE.REPLACE ABOVE LISTED PARTS AND 1.600.00 800.00
PANEL.TO PANEL BEAT ACCIDENT AFFECTED PARTS.

Report Ref No. CS/FCI20000518/Uvf3n2



'Y 7d 74 LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

v 51 Ubl Ave 1 #0125 Paya Ubl Industrial Park, Singapore 408533
- TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg Mo 199607108R GST Reg. No. 19-8607198-R Page No2of 2

S ————— e e ——

........
criptionofParts = | Gondition

Report Ref No. CS/FCI20000519/Uvi3n2
MARKET VALUE: $38,000.00 {EBT]-LT.I. REIMBURSEMENT VALUE: $25,753.00=NETT VALUE: $12,247.00

CHUA KANG SENG
Licensed Appralser

DISCLAMER OF LIABILITY TO THIRD PARTIES - This Aepor is made sslely for ke use and bensfii of the Cliem named on the ront sege of his Resor

Empart o wihisle oo in past. doss 8581 his oo hec oo clak.




