Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto)

From: caymen@timotor.com.sg

Sent: Monday, 6 April 2020 3:30 pm

To: Hock Ann (LKK Auto)

Cc: ‘Wei Shong’; Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto); SUR
Subject: RE: GX 2385S FINALIZE (SECOND REMINDER)

Dear Hock Ann,
Confirmed.
Thank you.

Regards,

Tﬂﬂl lm Tan Lim Motor Pte Ltd

O. 4656858 5151 1 Defu Lane 6
Caymen F. +656858 0877 Singapore 539365
caymen@timotor.com.sg http://www.timotor.com.sg

Confidentiality Notice: This email (including any attachments) is intended for the recipient(s) named above and may contain information that is confidential to Tan Lim Motor
Pte Ltd. Any use of the information (including,but not limited to, total or partial reproduction, distribution or dissemination in any form) by persons other than the intended
recipient(s) is prohibited. If you are not an intended recipient of this email, please notify the sender immediately and delete it. While Tan Lim Motor has put in place anti-virus
programs, we do not accept responsibility for any damage caused by viruses passed on unwittingly.

From: Hock Ann (LKK Auto) <HockAnn@Ikkauto.com>

Sent: Monday, April 6, 2020 3:06 PM

To: caymen@timotor.com.sg

Cc: 'Wei Shong' <wei.shong@tlmotor.com.sg>; Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto) <ShirleyHiew@lkkauto.com>; SUR
<sur@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: Re: GX 2385S FINALIZE (SECOND REMINDER)

Dear caymen , wei shong,

Good day , Kindly attached refer GX 2385S NISSAN CABSTAR finalized after management checking
updated on 23.3.2020 your

total amount L/SUMP repair cost,



COR - $2100

DOR -4 DAYS

if agree total L/SUMP amount and repair days, will be to close case.

Please reply update soon asap.

Thanks.

Best Regards,

Hock Ann| Assistant Automotive Assessor

LKK Auto Consultants

Phone: 6741 3061 | Email: HockAnn@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933

From: Hock Ann (LKK Auto) <HockAnn@Ikkauto.com>

Sent: Monday, March 23, 2020 4:23 PM

To: caymen@timotor.com.sg <caymen@tlmotor.com.sg>

Cc: 'Wei Shong' <wei.shong@tlmotor.com.sg>; Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto) <ShirleyHiew@lkkauto.com>; SUR
<sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: Re: GX 2385S FINALIZE

Dear caymen , wei shong,

Good day , Kindly attached refer GX 2385S NISSAN CABSTAR finalized updated calculate adjustment on
23.3.2020



total amount L/SUMP repair cost,

COR - $2100

DOR -4 DAYS

if agree total L/SUMP amount and repair days, will be to close case.

Please reply update soon asap.

Thanks.

Best Regards,

Hock Ann| Assistant Automotive Assessor

LKK Auto Consultants

Phone: 6741 3061 | Email: HockAnn®@Ikkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(4089

From: caymen@tImotor.com.sg <caymen@tlmotor.com.sg>
Sent: Tuesday, February 25, 2020 2:20 PM

To: Hock Ann (LKK Auto) <HockAnn@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: 'Wei Shong' <wei.shong@tImotor.com.sg>

Subject: RE: GX2385S | FINALIZE

Dear Hock Ann,



Please find the attachment for after repair.
And we are still pending marking for the sticker for finalize from you.
Thank you.

Regards,

Tfll'll. lm Tan Lim Motor Pte Ltd

O. +656858 5151 1 Defu Lane 6
Caymen F. +656858 0877 Singapore 539365
caymen@tlmotor.com.sg http://www.tlmotor.com.sg

Confidentiality Notice: This email (including any attachments) is intended for the recipient(s) named above and may contain information that is confidential to Tan Lim Motor
Pte Ltd. Any use of the information (including,but not limited to, total or partial reproduction, distribution or dissemination in any form) by persons other than the intended
recipient(s) is prohibited. If you are not an intended recipient of this email, please notify the sender immediately and delete it. While Tan Lim Motor has put in place anti-virus
programs, we do not accept responsibility for any damage caused by viruses passed on unwittingly.

From: caymen@tlmotor.com.sg <caymen@tImotor.com.sg>
Sent: Wednesday, February 12, 2020 5:46 PM

To: 'Hock Ann (LKK Auto)' <HockAnn@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: 'Wei Shong' <wei.shong@tImotor.com.sg>

Subject: GX2385S | FINALIZE

Dear Hock Ann,

Refer to above vehicle.

Please let us have your marking on the sticker so we can finalize.

Thank you.

Regards,

Tﬂm ll'l'l Tan Lim Motor Pte Ltd

O. +656858 5151 1 Defu Lane 6
Caymen F. +656858 0877 Singapore 539365
caymen@tlmotor.com.sg http://www.timotor.com.sg

Confidentiality Notice: This email (including any attachments) is intended for the recipient(s) named above and may contain information that is confidential to Tan Lim Motor
Pte Ltd. Any use of the information (including,but not limited to, total or partial reproduction, distribution or dissemination in any form) by persons other than the intended
recipient(s) is prohibited. If you are not an intended recipient of this email, please notify the sender immediately and delete it. While Tan Lim Motor has put in place anti-virus
programs, we do not accept responsibility for any damage caused by viruses passed on unwittingly.




This email has been checked for viruses by Avast antivirus software.
www.avast.com




