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Sp.Reading 10 Z:g . T/Radio: Insured / Std / NI / NA
Eng/No: R -

CiNo: wAuqu‘vncA A02873]

Gen. Cond: Good [ Fair | Poor / Burnt

Steering: Inosder | Jammed | Leaked / Burnt or
Il@er | Jammed | Leaked / Burnt or

Brake:
Modi:  Nil / $fRigh / STD A/Rim or N
Tyre Size: F: 'LOSISS‘B.[L, - I

R 205 [5SRA -

BS /DUN/ EXNOVA / GY I FS | L|z@ / OHTSU / PIR / SUMI /
TOYO | YOKO or

Bal. or Market Value: ) ) 4/” Front Rear

IDAG Accident Rport: Consistent? : Yes or No | RBa d) p— R/Bal. o (9 i
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Nivitha (LKK Auto)

=
From: Claims <claims@premiumauto.com.sg>
Sent: Thursday, 2 January 2020 1:51 PM
To: 'Admin A’; 'Nivitha (LKK Auto)’; 'SUR'
Cc: ‘Claims'’
Subject: OD CLAIM FOR SJS 6122 Z ON 31/12/2019
Attachments: SIS 6122 Z - 31122019.PDF
Dear All,

Kindly register OD claim for this vehicle. Attached is the GIA report for your reference.
We will forward you the estimate once it is available.
Kindly arrange survey on 7/1/2020, 11am. Owner waiting.

Best Regards,
Syafiq
Claims Admin Assistant

Premium Automobiles Pte Ltd (Reg No 199902271W)

55 Ubi Road 1 Road Singapore 408699

p. +65 6388 2323 d. +65 6768 9911 f. +65 6841 1183

e. claims@premiumauto.com.sg w. www.audi.com.sg

Aud1 Showroom Audi Centre 281 Alexandra Road Singapore 159938 p. +65 6836 2223

WELCOME TO THE===i
L8TH DIMENSION

“THE ALI..-NEW AUDLQS: : pdi

e

R

Email Disclaimer

T'his email. including any attachment, is confidential and may also be privileged
I vou have received it in error. please notify us immediately by reply email and then delete this message from vour system
Please do not copy 1t or use it for any purpose. or disclose its contents or any attachment to any other person. Thank yvou



Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

e e
From: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)
Sent: Thursday, 19 March 2020 2:15 PM
To: Boo seng yak; SUR; Carrine Leong; Chang Chee Sing;
jiayee.yap@premiumauto.com.sg
Subject: RE: FINAL REVISION - SJS6122Z - OD AIG - SURVEYED 7 JAN 20
Dear Mr Boo,

WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Confirm final fig $4,466.00 before excess $600.00 & GST and 3 repair days.

Kindly expedite the discharge voucher and tax invoice to us for close case.

Best Regards,

Shiau Chan (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: siewsc@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Boo seng yak <boojohnny@gmail.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 4 March 2020 7:03 PM

To: Adrian Ling (LKKAuto) <adrianling@Ilkkauto.com>; Denise Tay (LKKAuto) <denisetay@Ikkauto.com>; SUR
<sur@lkkauto.com>; Carrine Leong <carrine.leong@premiumauto.com.sg>; Chang Chee Sing
<claims@premiumauto.com.sg>; jiayee.yap@premiumauto.com.sg

Subject: FINAL REVISION - SJS6122Z - OD AIG - SURVEYED 7 JAN 20

Hi Adrian and all,

Revised estimate and photographs is attached.

Please confirm repair cost of $4466.00 @ 3 days.

Your early closure is well appreciated.

Best regards - jb



‘Denise Ta! (LKKAuto)

From: Denise Tay (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 9 January 2020 11:10 AM

To: 'Claims'; Admin A; Admin-D (LKKAuto); SUR
Subject: RE: OD CLAIM FOR SJS 6122 Z ON 31/12/2019
Dear Sir,

As instructed by our client, please proceed to repair the insured vehicle SJS 61227 (Excess $600/-).

If there are any check items or supplementary items please inform our office’s Assignment Team at Tel: 6741 8434
to arrange our surveyor for inspection.

All supplementary items and unconfirm items are subjected to further approval from insurance company before
completion of the repair.

*Our client reserve their rights_not to pay if there is no valid approval obtained before repair.

Best Regards,

Denise Tay | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: denisetay@Ilkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5{(4083933)

From: Claims <claims@premiumauto.com.sg>

Sent: Monday, 6 January 2020 10:42 AM

To: Admin A <admin-a@Ilkkauto.com>; Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-d@Ikkauto.com>; SUR <sur@Ikkauto.com>
Cc: 'Claims' <claims@premiumauto.com.sg>

Subject: RE: OD CLAIM FOR SJS 6122 ZON 31/12/2019

Dear all,
attached is the estimate for your reference.

Best Regards,
Syafiq
Claims Admin Assistant

Premium Automobiles Pte Ltd (Reg No 199902271W)

55 Ubi Road 1 Road Singapore 408699

p. +65 6388 2323 d. +65 6768 9911 f. +65 6841 1183

e. claims@premiumauto.com.sg w. www.audi.com.sg

Audi Showroom, Audi Centre 281 Alexandra Road Singapore 159938 p. +65 6836 2223




View Received Message

This mail is associated with :

*$1S6122Z (97730411475G)
oD
Dec 31 2019 11:05AM
[NATTHANAN BOONJANSONG]
Premium Automobiles Pte Ltd

i Reply_l _Reply All | Mark as Unread 1 Print Message I Delete iqe_;sage ] Forward j

From AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd. (AIG_SG), sent on 09/01/2020 10:08 AM.
To LKK_HQ

Subject  Alert - Adj Mandate Approved (S$4807.00) - SJS6122Z - Claim Handler: Chan, Yoke Shi

Approved:4807.00:Re-inspection to be done for damage check and supplementary items / labour.

'DOCUMENTS SUMMARY

There are ne documents,




1/8/2020 Adjuster Immediate Advice
Note: This document has not been finalised.

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (coreg.no:1s9607198R)
51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25, Paya Ubi Industrial Park
Singapore 408933
Tel: 6256-3561 Fax: 6844-8805 Email: sur@lkkauto.com;assignments@Ikkauto.com

To: AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd. From: LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
AIG Building 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25
78 Shenton Way #08-16 Paya Ubi Industrial Park
Singapore 079120 Singapore 408933

Attn:  Chan, Yoke Shi Date: 08 Jan 2020

Preliminary Advice

Vehicle No 1 SJS6122Z2 Accident Date :31/12/2019
Make : AUDI A3 SPORTBACK Policy No. : 1900007896
Assignment Date : 07/01/2020 Excess : $$0.00
Date of Inspection  : 07/01/2020 Est. Duration of Repair :3.00
Inspection At : PREMIUM AUTOMOBILES PTE LTD (UBI)

55 UBI ROAD 1

SINGAPORE 408699

Point of Impact / General Description of Damages
The vehicle sustained impact / damages front portion and parts claimed are consistent to the accident.

Repairer's Estimate (Gross) :S$ 8,212.00
Revised Amount :S$ 4,807.00
Check Items (Estimated) :S$ 1,317.00
Total :S$§ 6,124.00
Lump Sum Repair :S$

Total Loss Consideration

New for Old Value :S%
Pre-Accident Value :S§ 96,000.00
COE / PARF Rebate :S% 40,305.00
Salvage Value :S$
Margin for Repair :S§ 55,695.00

Remarks

( X ) The vehicle is repairable at our adjusted amount. We have also confirmed excess and policy coverage. Kindly
let us have your authorisation.

( ) The vehicle is uneconomical to be repaired, you are advised to invite tender for the wreck.

( ) Other comments :

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=SVCdoc&fuseaction=dsp_viewersmart&docid=50633822&preview=1&nolayout=1&CFI...

17



> Back to OneMotoring

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Vehicle Owner Particulars
Owner ID Type:

Owner ID:
Vehicle Details
Vehicle No.:

Vehicle to be Exported:
Intended Deregistration Date:
Vehicle Make:

Vehicle Model:

Primary Colour:
Manufacturing Year:

Engine No.:

Chassis No.:

Maximum Power Output:
Open Market Value:

Original Registration Date:
First Registration Date:
Transfer Count:

Actual ARF Paid:

Intended PARF Rebate Details
PARF Eligibility:

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date:
PARF Rebate Amount:
Intended COE Rebate Details
COE Expiry Date:

COE Category:

COE Period(Years):

QP Paid:

COE Rebate Amount:

Total Rebate Amount:

Singapore NRIC
780F

§JS61227
No

08 Jan 2020
AUDI

A3 SPORTBACK 1.0 TFSI STRONIC (LED)

Grey

2018

CHZC25935
WAUZZZ8V7KA028731
85.0 kW (113 bhp)
$21,569.00

24 Jan 2019

24 Jan 2019

0

$22,197.00

Yes
23 Jan 2029
$16,647.00

23 Jan 2029
A - Car up to 1600cc & 97kW (130bhp)

10

$26,170.00
$23,658.00
$40,305.00

The information contained herein is correct as at 08 Jan 2020



> Back to OneMotoring

Enuire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

icle OWiBEPATE

Owner ID Type: Singapore NRIC
Owner ID: 780F

Vehicle No.:

5)56122Z
Vehicle to be Exported: Yes
Intended Deregistration Date: 07 Jan 2020
Vehicle Make: AUDI
Vehicle Model: A3 SPORTBACK 1.0 TFSIS TRONIC (LED)
Primary Colour: Grey
Manufacturing Year: 2018
Engine No.: CHZC25935
Chassis No.: WAUZZZ8V7KA028731
Maximum Power Qutput: 85.0kW (113 bhp)
Open Market Value: $21,569.00
Original Registration Date: 24 Jan 2019
First Registration Date: 24 Jan 2019
Transfer Count: 0

Actual ARF Paid: $22,197.00
“fntended PAREREES e DRtal
PARF Eligibility: Yes

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date: 23 Jan 2029

PARF Rebate Amount: $16,647.00
Intende OFRebato D
COE Expiry Date: 23 Jan 2029

COE Category: A - Car up to 1600cc & 97kW (130bhp)
COE Period(Years): 10

QP Paid: $26,170.00

COE Rebate Amount: $20,936.00

Total Rebate Amount: $37,583.00

The information contained herein is correct as at 07 Jan 2020

OK
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Renown World Uni Expo@ Suntec

Dountec Fr

-Opm. Meet World Top 100 UK R

5/2019 Bmw X4 XDrive20i X Line @ $203000

* Free VICOM evaluation
* Free grooming and 6 months maintenance

Post an Advertisement

Sell it yourself! Advertise it at just Wi Almost New! Agent Unit, -l"l"n-ho:u \:gr#:op ;nhniurn qu;liry service :
A ; i = Member o and hire purchase association
$ 58 until it's SOLD! ] 3 Laterest X4, Easy In-house/bank = 100% deposit refund for unapproved loan

& Loan Avail ! | AT

StarAd

Advertiser Login @ Ways of Selling

5![% YONG LEE SENG MOTOR PTE LTD

v |20 resultsfpage ¥

[ Sort by Date Posted

Search Selection  Audi A3 Any Any Any Any : Any Any Available
[7] Audi A3 Cabriolet 1.4A TFSI S-  $135,000 = $15,280 /yr 26-5ep-2017 1,395 cc 12,000 km Sports Available
tronic

Only Used As Recreation Car, Rarely Used, Very Low Mileage, Never Driven Qutside Singapore, Under Warranty (Expiring Sept 2022) And
Serviced Done By Audi Premium Automobiles, Perfect Car To Enjoy Breezing Wind!

$94,000 $10,000 /yr 01-Feb-2018 999 cc 40,000 km Luxury Available
tronic i
1 Careful Owner. Very Well Taken Care Of. Always Park In Sheltered. Regularly Serviced (Every 7500km) At Premium Auto. 1 More
Servicing Package At 45000 Km With Premium Auto PPS Was Done Since Day 1, Warranty Till 2023 Feb. Very Responsive And Fuel Effici.. st ouner ]
" | Audi A3 Sportback 1.0A TFSI $89,800 $9,530 /yr 01-Feb-2018 999 cc 32,600 km Hatchback Available
S-tronic

1 Owner, 5 Years Warranty By Agent, 100% Loan Available, Ex-Bankruptcy And Bad Credit Welcome, High Trade In.

Faster Auto Trading

i [] Audi A3 Sportback 1.0A TFSI $92,000 9,570 /yr 11-Apr-2018 999 cc 39,260 km Hatchback Available
ol B S-tronic
" e’ ; 5 Years Warranty By Agent Premium. Hot Sportback Version. Rarely Available. Originall Audi MMI, Consignment Unit! Trade In Welcome!
bt Loan/Insurance Available! Call Now For A Viewing Appointment!

Prem Roy Motoring

Juzz Performance Pte Ltd - Specialist for Audi Car repair, servicing & maintenance
Juzz Performance, a modern car garage filled with motorheads of over 20 years of experience in maintenance, repair & tuning of European makes,

More info about this shop

Audi A3 Sedan 1.0A TFSI S- $91,800 $9,410 fyr 11-May-2018 999 cc 36,000 km Luxury Available
tronic

100% Loan Available! Still Under Audi Agent Warranty! 1 Owner! Small CC Yet Powerfull Don Feel Like A 1.0L Test Drive To Believe!
Hurry And Call Us Now!

laxis
2018 Audi A3, 2018 audi a3; Audi A3; audi a3, Audi, A3, a3, Used A
Iﬁ Audi A3 Sedan 1.0A TFSI S- $93,800 $9,520 fyr 22-Jun-2018 999 cc 18,500 km Luxury Available
tronic

100% Full Loan Car Price Available! Promo 1.98% Interest Rate For This Month Only. 1 Owner, Full-Service History With 5 Years Warranty
From Premium Automobiles-Agent. Travel 900KM On A Single Tank Without Compromising Power, Flexible Bank/In House Financing. Ro...

Dynamic Motoring

Audi A3 Sportback 1.0A TFSI $92,000 $9,330 fyr 29-Jun-2018 999 cc 38,000 km Hatchback Available
S-tronic




Fully Agent Maintained With 5 Years Warranty! In Pristine Condition! Hot Hatchback Not To Be Missed! Up To 80% Loan Of Car Price
Available. Welcome Trade In/STA. Kindly Call/SMS For Viewing Appointment.

Bavarian Marques Pte Ltd

B ot ©° [ | Audi A3 Sedan 1.0A TFSI S- $101,500 $10,230 fyr 25-0ct-2018 999 cc 3,500 km Luxury Available
. on i tronic
i e *‘”‘*’f Extremely Low Mileage Done, As Good As New. Fully Stock, With 5 Years Warranty Package With Audi And 2 More Free Servicing, Very
iy 5 Well Maintained Brown Leather Seats Interior, Original White Paintwork, Don't Miss! Call Now To View! Showroom Ready.

360 VR Cars

| Audi A3 Sedan 1.0A TFSI S- $96,000 $9,420 /yr 27-Dec-2018 999 cc 10,000 km Luxury Available
tronic

100% Loan Available! Fully Agent Maintained With 5 Years Warranty, 100% Accident Free! One Of The Best Condition In Town!, Call Us
Now For Viewing And Test Drive Now!

[} Audi A3 Sedan 1.0A TFSI S- $118,000 $11,070 fyr 22-Aug-2019 999 cc 1,000 km Luxury Available
tronic
Lowns D

Save this search criteria, to get email alerts whenever a match is found. B Save Search
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