Su Li (LKK Auto)

From: AIG SGP, Claims-Survey <AIGSGP_ClaimsSurvey@aig.com>

Sent: Monday, 6 January 2020 2:21 PM

To: Admin A; assignments

Cc: Fong, Andy-SY

Subject: Aigencypt Accident involving SLP1551T and your vehicle SKU1639K on 2 January 2020
Attachments: SLP1551T MERCEDES S300L.pdf

Follow Up Flag: Follow up

Flag Status: Completed

Hi LKK,

Kindly assist to survey.

Winnie Fan

AlIG

Claims Service Associate

Claims | AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd.

78 Shenton Way #08-16 Singapore 079120

winnie-lw.fan@aig.com | www.aig.sg

IMPORTANT NOTICE:

The information in this email (and any attachments) is confidential. If you are not the intended recipient, you must not use or disseminate the
information. If you have received this email in error, please immediately notify me by "Reply" command and permanently delete the original and any
copies or printouts thereof. Although this email and any attachments are believed to be free of any virus or other defect that might affect any computer
system into which it is received and opened, it is the responsibility of the recipient to ensure that it is virus free and no responsibility is accepted by AlG
for any loss or damage arising in any way from its use.

From: JKS Accident Claims <accidentclaims@jksmotorworks.com.sg>

Sent: Thursday, January 2, 2020 5:45 PM

To: AIG SGP, Claims-Survey <AIGSGP_ClaimsSurvey@aig.com>

Cc: Lee, Ming-Yao <MingYao.Lee@aig.com>

Subject: [EXTERNAL] Accident involving SLP1551T and your vehicle SKU1639K on 2 January 2020

This message is from an external sender; be cautious with links and attachments.

Without Prejudice

Dear Sir / Madam :



We have instructions from our client to seek repair cost and loss of car rental from you through Direct
Settlement.

Attached is the GIA report for your consideration.

Please let us have your confirmation that you agree that the liability is clear and we may proceed with Direct
Settlement.

The vehicle is already in the workshop at 8 Kaki Bukit Avenue 4, Premier @ Kaki Bukit 03-45 Singapore and
ready for PRS.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Leslie Enriquez
JKS Motor Works Pte Ltd
HP : 88119996

8 Kaki Bukit Avenue 4
Premier @ Kaki Bukit
#03-45, Singapore 415875

Disclaimer : Confidential Information may be contained in this message. If you received this message in error please notify our office at 67026828 and delete it
immediately. You should not disclose its contents to anyone and shall not retain the message at all.



