Vic (LKKAuto)

From: Hock Ann (LKK Auto)
Sent: Thursday, 16 January, 2020 1:29 PM
To: sirina@successunited.com.sg
Cc: Vic (LKKAuto)
Subject: RE: SMD 222B FINALIZED
‘WITHOUT PREJUDICE’
SAVE AS TO COSTS
Dear sirina,

Good day, o.k will be process base on finalized total amount COR $ 2007.44 PART/PART REPAIR and DOR 3 days
close.

Noted : All finalized document > LOA ,LOD,DV,LTA need send direct (LKK incharge person vic claim dept.

Thanks.

Best Regards,

Hock Ann| Assistant Automotive Assessor

LKK Auto Consultants

Phone: 6741 3061 | Email: HockAnn@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: sirina@successunited.com.sg [mailto:sirina@successunited.com.sg]
Sent: Thursday, 16 January, 2020 12:07 PM

To: Hock Ann (LKK Auto)

Subject: Re: SMD 222B FINALIZED

Hi Hock Ann

OK confirmed.

Thank You.
Best Regards,
Sirina Soon

Senior Claims Executive
Mobile: +65 9223 6288

SUCCESS UNITED PTE LTD

2 Kaki Bukit Ave 2

#01-33 / #02-29

Kaki Bukit AutoHub

Singapore 417921

Tel: 6746 1515  Fax: 6748 5015



On Thu, Jan 16, 2020 at 11:40 AM Hock Ann (LKK Auto) <HockAnn@Ilkkauto.com> wrote:

‘WITHOUT PREJUDICE’

SAVE AS TO COSTS

Dear sirina ,

Good day , Kindly attached refer SMD 222B HONDA JAZZ finalized updated calculate adjustment on
16.1.2020

COR - $ 2007.44
DOR -3 DAYS

Please refer adjustment updated total PART/PART amount $ 2007.44 if agree total PART/PART amount
and repair days, will be to close case.

Please to updated email back asap.

Thanks.

Best Regards,

Hock Annl Assistant Automotive Assessor

LKK Auto Consultants

Phone: 6741 3061 | Email: HockAnn@Ikkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)



