Oi Sun Pin (LKK Auto)

From: Elite Automotive <elite.automotive13@gmail.com>
Sent: Wednesday, May 13, 2020 9:57 AM

To: Oi Sun Pin (LKK Auto)

Subject: Re: Finalize SLA 7692)

Follow Up Flag: Follow up

Flag Status: Flagged

Categories: Green category

Hi Sun Pin,

Good day! We accept the offer $5000. Thanks!

Regards,
Christy

On Wed, 6 May 2020 at 12:51, Oi Sun Pin (LKK Auto) <sunpin@lkkauto.com> wrote:

Hi Christy,

Kindly refer the finalize amount $5,000. Repair day 7 days. (L/S, before gst).

If agree please update.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Oi Sun Pin| Assistant Automotive Assessor



