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Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)

From: Lim Gan Koon (Chris) <ChrisLim@msfirstcapital.com.sg>
Sent: Thursday, 15 April 2021 3:09 PM
To: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)
Cc: Admin A
Subject: FW: [MAINTAIN 50% & DO NOT SEND VIDEO TO TP] RE: FCI REF:  D20000159MFSH 

[EXPRESS SETTLEMENT VIA LKK] ACCIDENT BETWEEN SMN 1876E & SH 7749K (FCI) 
ON 18/12/2019

Dear Cecilia, 
 
We refer to your email below. 
 
Pls note that our insured had made a recovery of 50% from TP insurer. 
 
Pls offer 50% as per below : 
 
COR - $3,210 
LOU - $250 to $360 ($50 to $60 x 5 to 6 days) 
Sub Total - $3,460 to $3,570 
Liability at 50% - $1,730 to $1,785 
GIA Fee - $29.00 
Grand Total - $1,759 to $1,814 
 
Regards 
 
Chris Lim 
Motor Claims Dept. 
 
MS First Capital Insurance Ltd | 36 Robinson Road, City House #16-01 Singapore 068877  
| Tel: 6507 3848 | DID : 6507 3853 |  Fax No. : 6507 3849 |Email: ChrisLim@msfirstcapital.com.sg |Company Regn. 
No. 195000106C  
A Member of  Insurance Group 
 
Personal Data Protection Act 2012 ("PDPA"): 
Under the PDPA, there are various requirements that regulate the processing of your personal data. Please refer to 
http://www.msfirstcapital.com.sg for details of PDPA Personal Data Collection Statement. 
 
Confidentiality Notice: This e-mail is confidential. It may also be legally privileged. If you are not the addressee or to 
whom it is intended, you may not copy, forward, disclose or use any part of it. If you have received this message in 
error, please delete the message and all copies from your system and notify the sender immediately by return e-
mail. 
 

From: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto) <CeciliaChong@lkkauto.com>  
Sent: Tuesday, 30 March 2021 5:45 pm 
To: Vic Alpeh S. Sanghilan <VicSanghilan@msfirstcapital.com.sg> 
Cc: Jason Tea <JasonTea@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: [MAINTAIN 50% & DO NOT SEND VIDEO TO TP] RE: FCI REF: D20000159MFSH [EXPRESS SETTLEMENT 
VIA LKK] ACCIDENT BETWEEN SMN 1876E & SH 7749K (FCI) ON 18/12/2019 
 

Your ref : D20000159MFSH 
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Our ref : CC4/FCI20000404/Aga3q2          

  

Dear Sirs/Madam, 

  

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SMN 1876E & SH 7749K (FCI) ON 18/12/2019 

  

We refer to the above matter. 

  

Both parties changing of lane. Liability is based on 50%. 

  

We seek your approval to offer Third Party repairer "MG SOLUTION PTE LTD" at $1,814.00. 

  

The summary is as follows: - 

  
 Amount Claimed Amount Revised 
Cost of Repair (w/GST) $  8,697.31 $   1,605.00 
Loss of Use (6days x $200.00) $  1,200.00 $      180.00 (6days x $60.00) 
Loss of Income $     - $     - 
LTA/GIA Search Fee $      29.00 $       29.00 
Total $  9,926.31 $  1,814.00 

 

  

**05 days recommendation for repair + 1Sunday  = 06 days 

  

Enclosed here with all the relevant documents for your perusal. 

  

For your approval/instruction please. 
 
 
 

 

Best Regards, 

Cecilia Chong | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6749-4274 | email:  CeciliaChong @lkkauto.com| fax: 6741-4108 




