Denise Tay (LKKAuto)

From:
Sent:
To:

Cc:
Subject:

Dear Denise

Doris <doris@sh-motor.com>
Monday, 22 June 2020 11:02 AM
Denise Tay (LKKAuto)

Kenneth Kong (LKKAuto)

FW: vehicle no : PC 2630 M-Final

This case also, please arrange in merimein

Thank

Doris

From: Doris [mailto:doris@sh-motor.com]
Sent: Saturday, 13 June 2020 12:48 PM

To: 'Kenneth Kong (LKKAuto)'

Subject: vehicle no : PC 2630 M-Final

Dear Kenneth

Noted...Thank...Cosr Of Reapir $8,036.30 (Excess $1,500.00)

Please arrange in merimein
Thank

Dorus



