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Nivitha (LKK Auto)
e ———————————————————————————————————————————————

From: Claims =claims@premiumauto.com.sg>
Sent: Tuesday, 31 December 2019 1:43 PM
To: 'SUR'; 'assignments’

Cc: 'Claims’

Subject: OD CLAIMS FOR 5LX 7606 M
Attachments: SLX¥ 7606 M 27122019.PDF

Dear All,

Please assist to register own policy claims for the above mentioned vehicle.
Attached is the GIA report and DL for vour reference.

We will send you the repair estimate and Insurance certificate once is available.
Kindly arrange the survey on 6 of Jan 2020 @10am, owner waiting.

Address : 281 Alexandra Road Singapore 159938

lhank you.

Best Regards.
George Wong
Claims Advisor

Premium Automobiles Pte Ltd (Reg No 199902271W)

281 Alexandra Road Singapore 159938

p. 65 6366 2323, option 1

e. Claimsi@premiumauto.com.sg  w. www.audi.com.sg

Audi Showroom 281 Alexandra Road Singapore 159938 p. +6
WELCOME TO THE== E_J

8TH DIMENSION. 7

" '

THE ALL-NEW AUDI Q8.

..... el

Email Disclaimer

This emall, including any attachment, is cenfidential and may also be privileged,
If you have received it in error, please notify us immediately by reply email and then delete this message fram your system.
Please do not copy it or use it for any purpose, or disclose its contents or any attachment to any other person, Thank you



Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

From: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 12 March 2020 5:02 PM

To: Boo seng yak; SUR; Carrine Leong; jiayee.yap@premiumauto.com.sg; Chang Chee
Sing

Subject: RE: FINAL REVISION - SLX7606M - OD AIG - SURVEYED 6 JAN 20

Dear Mr Boo,

WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Confirm final fig $7,208.72 before excess $800.00 & G5T and 3 repair days.

Kindly expedite the discharge voucher and tax invoice to us for close case.

Best Regards,

Shiau Chan (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pre Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: siewse@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Pava Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S${408033)

From: Boo seng yak <boojohnny @gmail.com=>

Sent: Tuesday, 18 February 2020 6:14 PM

To: Rasul [LKKAuto) <Rasul@lkkauto.com>; Denise Tay (LKKAuto) <denisetay@lkkauto.com>; SUR
<sur@lkkauto.com=; Carrine Leong <carrine.leong@premiumauto.com.sg>; jlayee.yap@premiumauto.com.sg;
Chang Chee Sing <claims@premiumauto.com.sg>

Subject: FINAL REVISION - SLX7606M - OD AIG - SURVEYED 6 JAN 20

Hi Rasul and all,

Revised estimate and photographs is attached.

Please confirm repair cost of $7208.72 @ 3 days of repairs.

Your early closure is well appreciated.

Best regards - jb
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5 AUDIT TRAIL

28 Dec

Audit

Clm Veh
1 2019 Model
14:19 Changed
28 Dec
2 2019 Clm Created
14:19
31 Dec Cim
3 2019 Registration
11:23 Madifiad
02 Jan Clm
4 2020 Registration
17:06 Modified
07 Jan Clm
5 2020 Registration
10:57  Modified
. g;zjg" Adj Cim
10:57 Retrieved
7 2020 :::Icuned
10:57 9
g g;zjg" Adj Mext Rpt
10:57 Changed
U7Jan Adj Mandate
9 2020 Set
10:57
a7 Jan Clm
10 2020 Registration
10:57 Modified
07 Jan Clm Veh
11 2020 Model
10:57 Changed
a7 lan
Adj Adjuster
12 2020
10-58 Assigned
5 B A
11:50 Initiated
07 Jan
Clm Dtl
14 2020
11-50 Modified
Q7 Jan
Cim Dtl
15 2020
11:50 Maodified
16 303" CIm Detalls
11:50 Motified
07 Jan Adj Im.
17 2020 Advice
11:54 Submitted
07 Jan Adi Mandat
gtz /R0 IEMdein
11:54 Uy
08 Jan Clm
19 2020 Registration
14:11 Maodified
08 Jan
20 2020 Label Added
14:11
- gg;;" Adj Next Rpt
14:58 Changed
55 95321 Adj Mandate
Sat
14:58
Ly 22FED adj Mandate
1548 Request
- ;ﬁ;;ar Adj Next Rpt
13-46 Changed
12 Mar
25 2020 ;:'{ Mandate
13:46
Date From

Merimean e-Claims

Claim Audit

Remarks By

[1 Merimen
Administrator

Reg Me: SLX7606M, Acct Date: 2019/12/27, Claim Type: SC. Insurer: AlG Asla Pacific Insurance
Pte. Ltd. (5G], Ins.5tatus => Notification. Created from SAS:MPA115170717

[1] Merimen
Administrator

{1
Subramaniam,
Divyashni
(1
Subramaniam,
Divyashni

[]1 Mivitha
Govindasamy

Acct Time: 18:45:00->18:00:00.

Init.Est.:->5,000 - 6,000,

Setl, Type:3->0. Claim Type:5C->00D,

Adj: LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd [HG) G:ELE:;;:?I\V
LKK Auto Consultants Pre Ltd (HQ): GLt-Inry:lst:n‘:'rl
Next Rpt:Final Rpt,.Due Date;2020/01/16 GE:ﬁ']lnr::s!iahr:v
Approved:8000,00,Reinsp: Adj decides. GE:fr]ln?:l::r:v
Rep:1137-=200611, GLTr]ln'::lst;ﬂiV
(204806) AUDI A6 1.8 TFSI S-tronic {A). EEﬂnﬁ:Lt:,-:.,
[Mone] -= MOHD RASUL G[ofr]m;::rsltah!‘:v
[A] SHIAL
CHAN

i e [A] SHIAU
Claim Conclusion: == 3, CHAN
g [A] SHIAU
JP] Reg, Date: -= 2018/04/10. vy
[A] SHIAU
CHAN

Next Rpt:Final Rpt.Due Date:2020,/01/16 {A] SHIAU
CHAN
Cur.Req:6605.00:DAMAGES CONSISTENT. REPAIR COST ECONOMICAL, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORIS
E REFAIR.

[A] SHIAU
CHAN

Excess: -> 800.00, 2F Remarks; -> Nat Applicable. G5T: -> 7,00, H[jr]'chh?.ur:-;g
(20226):Caverage Confirmed, é:ﬁnm’;’;ﬁ;
Mext RptiFinal Rpt.Due Date:2020/01/16. Mandate Remarks: Re-inspection to be done for dama [1] Koh, Victor-
ge check and supplementary items / labour. CK

Approved:65183.00;Re-inspecticn to be done for damage check and supplementary items / labou [1] Keh, Victor-
r. Reinsp:Yes, CK

Cur.Req:7208.72:KINDLY APPROVE REPAIR COST OF $7,208.72. il
Cur Rpt:Final Rpt. Cur Due Date:2020/01/16. Mandate Remarks: Re-inspection to be done for da [I] Kaoh, Victor-
mage check and supplementary items / labour. CK

Approved:7208,72:Re-inspection to be done for damage check and supplementary items / labou  [I] Kah, Victor-
r CK

j_lr EH Date To JJ E L: Audit Type MNone v

Go

https://singapare. merimen.com/claimsfindex.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=dsp_viewhistory&caseid=901047 &extid=327863&CFID=6E5. ..

1z



Denise Tay (LKKAuto) |

From: Denise Tay (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 9 January 2020 9:10 AM

To: ‘claims@premiumauto.com.sg’; Shiau Chan (LKKAuto); SUR
Subject: RE: OD CLAIMS FOR SLX 7606 M

Dear Sir,

As instructed by our client, please proceed to repair the insured vehicle SLX 7606M (Excess $800/-).

If there are any check items or supplementary items please inform our office’s Assignment Team at Tel: 6741 8434
to arrange our surveyor for inspection,

All supplementary items and unconfirm items are subjected to further approval from insurance company before
completion of the repair.

*Qur client reserve their rights not to pay if there is no valid approval obtained before repair.

Best Regards,

Denise Tay | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: denisetay@lkkauto.com | fax: 65256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408333)

From: claims@premiumauto.com.sg <claims@premiumauto.com.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, 8 January 2020 12:10 PM

To: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) <siewsc@lkkauto.com=; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>
Cc: 'Claims' <claims@premiumauto.com.sg>

Subject: RE: OD CLAIMS FOR 5LX 7606 M

Dear Shiau Chan,
Attached is the Cl and DL for your reference.
Thank you.

Best Regards,
Kelvin Khoo
Claims Advisor

Premium Automobiles Pte Ltd (Reg No 199902271W)

55 Ubi Road 1 Road Singapore 408699

D. +65 6768 9911 P. +65 9871 9502

e, claims@premiumauto.com.sg  w. www.audi.com.sg

Audi Showroom, Audi Centre 281 Alexandra Road Singapore 159938 p. +65 6836 2223




View Received Message

This mail is associated with :
*SLETEO06M (49971160125G)
oD
Dec 27 2019 6:00FPM

[LIM HOCK HAI]
Premium Autcmoebiles Pte Ltd

“Reply | Reply All | Mari3s Unread | _print Message | Delete Message | Forward | -

From AIG Asla Pacific Insurance Pte, Ltd, (AIG_SG), sent on OB/01/2020 14:58 FM.
To LKK_HQ

Subject  Alert - Adj Mandate Approved (5$6183.00) - SLX7606M - Claim Handler: Gan, Hunchung

App_muea:sms.m;ne-inspectmn to be done for damage check and supplementary items / labour,

DOCUMENTS SUMMARY - eSS =
There are no documents,




1712020 ) Adjuster Immediate Advice
Note: This document has not been finalised.

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd coregnosssorissr)
51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25, Paya Ubi Industrial Park
Singapore 408933
Tel: 6256-3561 Fax: 6844-8805 Email: sur@lkkauto.com;assignments@Ikkauto.com

To: AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Lid, From: LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

AlG Building 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25

78 Shenton Way #08-16 Paya Ubi Industrial Park

Singapore 079120 Singapore 408933
Attn:  Azlan, Syazairdina Date: 07 Jan 2020

Prelimin Ad i
Vehicle No : SLX7606M Accident Date L 27122019
Make : AUDI AB Policy No. : 1800033031
Assignment Date : 07/01/2020 Excess : 5%0.00
Date of Inspection  : 06/01/2020 Est. Duration of Repair :3.00
Inspecticn At - PREMIUM AUTOMOBILES PTE LTD (UBI)
55 UBI ROAD 1

SINGAPORE 408693

Point of Impact | General Description of Damages
The vehicle sustained impact / damages front portion ani parts claimed are consistent to the accident.

Repairer's Estimate (Gross) 85 17.875.00
Revised Amount 5% 6,183.00
Check Items (Estimated) 5% 422.00
Total 5% 6,605.00
Lump Sum Repair 53

Total Loss Consideration

New for Old Value 53
Pre-Accident Value 53 145,000.00
COE [ PARF Rebate pr 1.3 67.527.00
Salvage Value -]
Margin for Repair 5% 77 473.00

Remarks

{ X } The vehicle is repairable at our adjusted amount. We have aso confirmed excess and policy coverage. Kindly
let us have your autharisation.

{ ) The vehicle is uneconomical to be repaired, you are advised toinvite tender for the wreck,

[ ) Other comments :

https:isinga pDI‘ﬂ'.mErirnen.GUm"clalm&ﬁndex.l;frn?fuaf;bDK=E‘u"Gdol;&fuse&cbcn=dsp_viemrslaﬂ&dncid=5ﬂ61{!3$1.&previaw=1 &nolayout=1&8CFl... 1M



» Back to OneMotoring

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Owner 1D Type: Singapore NRIC
Owner 10: 511A
Yehide Detalls e e e S e )
Vehicle No.: SLX7606M
Vehicle to be Exported: Mo
Intended Deregistration Date: 07 Jan 2020
Vehicle Make: AUDI
Vehicle Model: A6 1.8 TFSIULTRA (PI) (NAV)
Primary Colour: Grey
Manufacturing Year: 2017
Engine Mo.: CYG020601
Chassis No.: WAUZZZ4GXHN128184
Maximum Power Output; 140.0 kW (187 bhp)
Open Market Value: $40,45%.00
Criginal Registration Date: 10 Apr 2018
First Registration Date: 10 Apr 2018
Transfer Count: 0
Actual ARF Paid: £48,643.00
e e PR R AT e A e T
PARF Eligibility: Yes
PARF Eligibility Expiry Date: 0% Apr 2028
PARF Rebate Amount: £35,482.00
Intend¢d COR RaR e D e e e e e TR ey
COE Expiry Date: 0% Apr 2028
COE Category: B - Car above 1600cc or 97kW {130bhp)
COE Period(Years): 10
QP Paid: $37,605.00
COE Rebate Amount: $31,045.00
Total Rebate Amount: $67,527.00

The information contained herein is correct as at 07 Jan 2020

OK qs, 0wV



1/7/2020 Used Audi A5 Car & Used Cars & Vehicles Singapore - sgCarMart

SGCARMART.COM Login | signup  [TEEIEEEN
Mew Cars Rental Cars Sell My Car Directory Products Insurance Articles Forum Resourc

Jarama Interior i 1 u Itemn
A Chrome 19" : Leather Wrap 3 Lolion Pioneer Head

HP Alloy Rims ¢ } Improve Uinit In-Mint
= Handling

Post an Advertisement
Sall it yourself! Advertise it at just

%58 until it's SOLD!
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One Stop Car Hub
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iy
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oo« Bl e~ Bl oo~ B ~ Bl e o~ Bl e ~ B e~ B

Search Selection Audi A6 Ay Arry 2018 Ay ATy Arvy Available
[ Audi A6 1.8A TFSI Ultra S- $15%, 800 §15,.270 fyr 12-5ep-2018 1,788 oc 22,000 km Luoury Available
tronic

Latest Arrivall Most Valued Buyl New Road Tax! Beautiful White Unit With Pristine Condition! Peace OF Mind! Fully Serviced By Agent And
St Under Agent & Years Warranty! Free 2 More Servicing With Premium, 100% Accident Frea! Weil Maintained By 1 Careful Owner, Tra

[] audi A6 1.8 TFSI Ultra S- 5$155,999 $14,E70 fyr 13-Sap-2018 1,790 24,0040 km Lumsuary Available
tronic

5 Years Agent Warranty Tl Sept 2023/Unlimited Mieage With 24 Hours Audl Roadside Assist! High Loan Approvall Fully Audi Agent

Servicing Since Day Onel Lowest Bank Interest Rate 2,26%! Price Nego! Showroom Condition! Superb Tip Top Condition! High Trade In.. FFREWUN 1D |

Premium Automobiles

| | [ Audi A6 1.8A TFSI Ultra S- $156, 600 §15,200 fyr 18-5ep-2018 1,798 oc 22,812 km Luxury avallable
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-l\m One Cwner. Agent Uinit. 5 Years Warranty And Service Package By Premium Automobile. Well Keat By Owner, Purchase With A Peace OF
= Mind, Call/Whatsapp Now For Enguiny!

Repubic Auto

|:| Audi A6 1,BA TFSI Ultra 5- £149,000 £14,290 fyr 26-Jul-2018 1,798 cc 35,000 km Lupoury Available
tronic

5 Years Premium Automobile Wamanty. Accident Free, In Fantastic Congition. Facelifted Model Comes W Subtie Design Updates And A
Smaller Engine That Is Able To Produce More Power Than Before, Comfort Leved 1s Brought To Another Level With More Tech And Luwr...

Save this seanch criteria, o get emall alerts whenever a match is found. H Save Search

- H—F o Bl Bl F
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Premium Automobiles

%5 Uln Road 1, Singapore 4086959
Tel (3662323 Fax ., G841 1183 WIP: 24733

Lol Muora kL@ premouriidtet o o om S ¢ claims oo comereg o o L orn i
! i [ i

Telefax

Estimate : Accident Repars
Workshop 2 bt Road 1

Contact No : 63662323

Fax Mo : 6841 1183

Reference : PASODSODOBSZ020/KK
Date - G-Jan-20

Vehicle NOT IN workshop. Please arrange for survey

AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd
78 Shenton Way

#07-16 AlG Building

Singapore 079120

Attn: Mr. Adrian Ling - Motor Claims Dept
Tel: 6B41 0055 - Fax: 6256 4315

Owner's Name :  Mr. Lim Hock Lai
Address i 41 Choa Chu Kang Loop
#06-12
Singapore GBOGIT
Telephone 1 HP+G597712122
Type of Claim : Own Damage Claim
Paolicy No. : 1800033031
Vehicle No : SLX7606 M
Model Code : AudiAB1.BTFSIS TRONIC
Model / Year i Apr-18
Engine Mo : CYG 020601
Chassis No : WALZZZAOKHN] 28164
Mileago .
Date In : -
Estimated By 1 lohnny Boo / Allan Wu
Accident Date : 27Dec-19

Place of Accident : Great World City Car Park Basement 2



Premium Automobiles

55 Ubi Road 1, Singapore 408699
Tel 63662323 Fox:GB4A1 1183

Telefax

Estimated Surveyor's
5/N Mature of Jobs Charges Recommendations

Jo remove, check and reinstall front wire harness
:he_adhgl;htﬁ, Imms,uuts:_de tempEl:aturE sensor, S/ S 480.00 }( V/Mr..f"
eadlight washer assy and front parking aid.

To remove and reinstall aircond condenser and

radiator. To renew charged air coller. Check
: electrical fans and control unit. Pressurise cooling Al S 5009 :"{
system. To carry out vacuum and regas.
To dismantle and renew frant bumper. To remove <
and reinstall front lock carrier and align to %
4 .00
3 position. Re-organise crash management S ﬁﬂﬁ 0 5—0"3
components. Reinstall all parts removed.
4 Torepsray frant bumper. 5 1.2/00'.'6-1] 550
5 Tocarry out diagnostic check. SIN 8 192.0V

TOTAL LABOUR CHARGES ¢ 5 7,272.00




Premium Automobiles

55 Ubl Road 1, Singapore 408659
Tel - 6366 2327 Fax HRAY 1183

Telefax

Material List for Accident Vehicle Regn No. SLX 7606 M

S/N__Parts Deseription jf;ﬁtue Elm{;ﬁ::.-u
A~ FRoNT BUMPER (A < S 2,787.00
7 FRONT BUMPER FIXING PARTS 35 5 451.00
/35" FRONT BUMPER CENTRE CRICLE - LOWER (/" 5 11600
4 FRONT BUMPER ATR GUIDE GRILLE LOCKING CLIP % 14 & 51.00
5 FRONT BUMPER C1OSING ELEMENT ¥ $ 199,00
FRONT BUMPER LOWER SPOILER e+~ = 5 227.00
FRONT BUMPER UPPER sPOLER L. O s B60 00
B~ RADIATOR GRILLE Cfex 7 $ 1766 0D
9 RADIATOR GRILLE COVER T~ 5 33.00
10 RADIATOR SENSOR SUPPORT - LH/RH s 122 €0
11 FRONT BUMPER AR GUIDE GRILLE - LH/RH ¥ 5 90400
12 FRONT BUMPER AR GUIDE GRILLE COVER - LH/RH 7~ $ 497 00
13 FRONT WHEEL SPOILER - LH/RH 3 s 482.00
14 FRONT HEADLAMF WASHER COVER - LH/RH X 5 104.00
15 FOAM FILLER PIECE Yo s 215.00
FRONT BUMPER REINFORCEMENT f,}t ./ 5 754.00
FRONT BUMPER TOP COVER % 5 112.00
18 SIGN'CAUTION' ¥ 5 13 60
19 FRONT SENSOK ? 5 414 00
20 FRONT SENSOW SEAL RING As~ < i s 5,00

SUB TOTAL SPARE PARTS

5 8,752.00



Premium Automobiles
55 Ui Road 1, Singapore 408699
Tel " G3IGG 2323 Fax-GBA1 1183

Telefax

Material List for Accident Vehicle Regn No, SLX 7606 M

Damage Parts 8 Prices

5/H__ Parts Description 5/ Mokt Remarks
21 FRONT BUMPER Al CUIDE - LH/RH < g 50.00
22 RADIATOR UPPER COVER g 27,00
23 RADIATOR LOWER SEALING STRIP 3 § 21.00
24 AIRCODLER ¥ 5 513.00
25 FRONT NOPLATE & SN 6 40.00
26 SUNDRIES s 300,00

TOTAL SPARE PARTS s 10,703.00

TOTAL LABDUR CHARGES : s 7,272.00

GRAND TOTAL - 5 17.,975.00

Al aharges e nag ingivee al 5T
begend Upmaaks 00K = Approved, Bemarit (1) = Net approved
Spare B4 ate Special Meit



Premium Automobiles

55 U Road 1, Singapore 408695
Tel G366 2323 (ax; GRAL 11B3

Telefax

Name : !Enju,t,, = HT» Qoo (¥

Surveyed Date : pg‘!u:;}ﬂﬂ @ (o0
Authorised Date ;

Excess Cost '? 5(’} ﬁ-'}o

Liability ; ;
Remarks : CXLESS TBA
Revedd 4
rE-.}rM’J be ’P‘r* [’ <
Please Note +  This estimate is based on visual inspection of the affected vehicle

Should we require further labour charges and spare parts in the
progress of repair, we shall inform you accordingly,

For inspection of vehicle, please refer to Ms Narah Khai at
Tel:6765 9828 for appointment.

thi LKK &ulo Conspllan o
Yours faithiully, the Henamrf,%é; ;ﬁr:;e nofify

!
Premiurn Automohbiles Pte Lid * Yo msurvey batorniates spray g ri I
o To e Sy damaged paniisi o )ty

* Parts prices g E!uhe"l-_rl:-“'ﬂdl-i I
® Third gty FURER 1B O & “Wilhou! Presuden® [ 23]
= Ko illeqal matahionis) is sfowsd
* Suppitvnentary ieids] muds ps LI

8 Subpbct i i anbroval fram 'M.,la’ I:I:‘:is--. f

Acknowiedaed by Reparer
Sagraru;

LﬂJEﬁ"fWu

Johnny Boo
Body Repair Manager Claims Consultant




Premium Automobiles

55 Ubi Road 1, Singapore 408699
Tel ; 6366 2323 Fax . 6841 1183 WIP : 24733
Email: Nora.khai@premiumauto.com.sg / claims@premiumauto.com.sg

Telefax

Estimate Accident Repairs
Workshop Ubi Road 1

Contact No 6366 2323

Fax No 6841 1183
Reference PA/QOD/O008/2020/KK
Date G-Jan-20

Vehicle NOT IN workshop. Please arrange for survey

AlG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd

78 Shenton Way

#07-16 AIG Building

Singapore 079120

Attn: Mr. Adrian Ling - Motor Claims Dept

Tel: 6841 0055 - Fax: 6256 4315

Owner's Name Mr. Lim Hock Lai
Address 41 Choa Chu Kang Loop
#06-12
Singapore 689677
Telephone HP +65 97712122
Type of Claim Own Damage Claim
Policy No. 1800033031
Vehicle No SLX 7606 M
Model Code Audi A6 1.8 TFSI S TRONIC
Model / Year Apr-18
Engine No CYG 020601
Chassis No WAUZZZ4GXHN 128184
Mileage 2
Date In -
Estimated By Johnny Boo / Allan Wu
Accident Date 27-Dec-19

Place of Accident

Great World City Car Park Basement 2



Premium Automobiles

£5 Ubi Road 1, Singapore 408699
Tel : 6366 2323 Fax ;63841 1183

Telefax

Estimated Labour Charges for Accident Vehicle SLX 7606 M

Estimated Surveyor's
SIN Nature of Jobs Charges tecommendations

To remove, check and reinstall front wire harmess for
1 headlights, horns, outside temperature sensor, SN § 48000 % 480.00
headlight washer assy and front parking aid.

To remove and reinstall aircond condenser and

radiator. To renew charged air coller. Check electrical

fans and control unit. Pressurise cooling system. To SN 3 ha0N
carry out vacuum and regas.

To dismantle and renew front bumper. To remove and
reinstall front lock carrier and align to position. Re-

3 . : 3 400000 § 500.00
organise crash management components. Reinstall all
parts removed.

4 To repsray front bumper. 3 1,20000 $ 750.00
(Added spoiler $200)

5 To carry out diagnostic check. SN 3 192.00 5 192.00

TOTAL LABOUR CHARGES HEE 7,272.00 § 1,922.00
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Telefax

Material List for Accident Vehicle Regn No. SLX 7606 M

Damage Parts & Prices

S/N  Parts Description S/Nett Remarks
1 FRONT BUMPER ] 278700 % 2,229.60
2 FRONT BUMPER FIXING PARTS s 491.00
3 FRONT BUMPER CENTRE GRILLE - LOWER s 116.00 $ 92.40
4 FRONT BUMPER AIR GUIDE GRILLE LOCKING CLIP 14 5 51.00
5 FRONT BUMPER CLOSING ELEMENT $ 199.00
6 FRONT EUMPER LOWER SPOILER 3 22700 § 181.20
7 FRONT BUMPER UPPER SPOILER 5 860.00 $§ 687.60
8 RADIATOR GRILLE ] 1,766.00 § 1.412.80
9 RADIATOR GRILLE COVER 5 33.00
10 RADIATOR SENSOR SUPPORT - LH/RH 5 122,00
1 FRONT BUMPER AIR GUIDE GRILLE - LH/RH 5 904.00
12 FRONT BUMPER AIR GUIDE GRILLE COVER - LH/RH 5 92.00
13 FRONT WHEEL SPOILER - LH/RH ] 482.00
14 FRONT HEADLAMP WASHER COVER - LH/RH 3 104.00
15 FOAM FILLER PIECE ] 215.00
16  FRONT BUMPER REINFORCEMENT 5 75400 § 602.80
17 FRONT BUMPER TOP COVER 5 112.00
18 SIGN "CAUTION & 13.00
19  FRONT SENSOR 2 8 419.00
20 FRONT SENSOR SEAL RING 4 3 5.00
SUB TOTAL SPARE PARTS 5 9,762.00 § 5,206.40
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Material List for Accident Vehicle Reqn No. SLX 7606 M

Damage Parts & Prices

S/N _ Parts Description SiNett Remarks
cf 5 5 206,40
21 FRONT BUMPER AIR GUIDE - LH/RH £ 50.00
22 RADIATOR UPPER COVER $ 27.00
23 RADIATOR LOWER SEALING STRIP & 21.00
24 AIR COOLER 5 513.00
25 FRONT NO PLATE SN 5 4000 § 40.00
26 SUNDRIES 5 300,00 § 40.32
TOTAL SPARE PARTS $ 10,703.00 § 5,286.72
TOTAL LABOUR. CHARGES S 7,272.00 § 1,922.00
GRAND TOTAL ] 17,975.00 § 7,208.72

All charges are not inclusive of GST.
Lepend : Ramarks (0K} = Approved, Remarks (%) = Not approved
Spare pars are Special Meit
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Name

Surveyed Date
Authorised Date
Excess Cost
Liability
Remarks

Please Note 1 This estimate is based on visual inspection of the affected vehicle.
Should we require further labour charges and spare parts in the
progress of repair, we shall inform you accordingly.

For inspection of vehicle, please refer to Ms Norah Khai at
Tel:6768 9828 for appointment.

Yours faithfully,

Premium Automobiles Pte Ltd

Johnny Boo Allan Wu
Body Repair Manager Claims Consultant



