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£1 URLAVE 1, #01-25 PAYA UBT INDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408933 TEL : (063 62563561 FAX © (065) 62564315

Your Ref: Date: 14 Jan 2020

Our Ref: CS/SMO20000350/Uyf3

The Motor Claims Department
SOMPO INSURANCE SINGAPORE PL

Dear Sir/Madam,
INITIAL INSPECTION REPORT OF YEHICLE NO. SLH3694T .
Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the abovementioned vehicle

on 07/01/2020 at the premises of M/s JOO HAK KEE AUTO PTE LTD and have the
following to report:-

Workshop Estimate Amount :8§ 7.260.52
Revised Estimate Amount : 5% 2.658.32
“Check” ltems Amount 8% -
Market Value 153 -
LTA Reimbursement Value 1 5% -
Nett Value 5% -

Description of Damage:

s FROErEa
The vehicle sustained damages e
- o Ifr : S—
at the rear portion. _ | trom
"L"—._I'-'_?—;—a _-""-T:'-*_'_{.ll
affmoe

Yours faithfully

MARCUS CHUA
Licensed Appraiser



Yvonne Wung (LKK Auto)

———————
From: Yvonne Wong (LKK Auto)
Sent: Tuesday, January 14, 2020 10:29 AM
To: ‘Teo, Grace'; SUR
Cc: '‘Chua, Gek Tiang Ruth'; "Ye, Yong Kang Melvin'; 'Henry, Irene James'
Subject: RE: CMTD20000B0/RUC - LKK/ YMB426B & SLH3694T DOA : 3/1/2020 - VEH IN
Attachments: SLH3694T PRELI ADVISE.pdf

Dear Sir/ Madam

Enclosed preliminary revised of vehicle SLH36394T
Date of survey : 07/01/2020
Number of days : 3 days

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Yvonne Wong (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Litd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: yvonnewong@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408033)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, lanuary 07, 2020 9:52 AM

To: 'Teo, Grace' <grace.teo@sompo.com.sg>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>; assignments <assignments@Ikkauto.com>
Cc: 'Chua, Gek Tiang Ruth' <ruth.chua@sompo.com.sg>; 'Ye, Yong Kang Melvin' <melvin.ye @sompo.com.sg=>; 'Henry,
Irene James' <irene.henry@sompo.com.sg>

Subject: RE: CMTD2000080/RUC - LKK/ YM6426B & SLH3694T DOA : 3/1/2020 - VEH IN

Dear Sir/Madam,

Thank you for your assignment.

Best Regards,

Summer Lee | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6741-8434 | email: assignmentz@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Pava Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(q08033)



Nivitha (LKK Auto)

From: Teo, Grace <grace.teo@sompo.com.sg>

Sent: Monday, & January 2020 5:20 PM

To: shimin poh; ‘admin-d@lkkauto.com’; 'assignments@lkkauto.com’

Cc: Chua, Gek Tiang Ruth; Ye, Yong Kang Melvin; Henry, Irene James

Subject: CMTD2000080,/RUC - LKK/ YMB426B & SLH3634T DOA : 3/1/2020 - VEH IN
Attachments: SLH3694T report 2 (2).pdf

Our Reference : CMTD2000080/RUC
Your Reference: SLH3694T

Without Prejudice
EMAIL ONLY

Date: 06.01.2020
OUR Email: motorsurvey@sompo.com.sg

Attention:
M/S 100 HAK KEE AUTO PTE LTD

Dear Bridget

ACCIDENT INVOLVING YM6426B & 5LH36594T ON 03.01.2020

We refer to your email reply of today.

We will appoint Mr. Marcus of LKK Auto to conduct the survey.

Hi LKK AUTO,

Please make the arrangement to survey for SLH3694T on a without prejudice basis and revert your report upan
completion of survey to my colleague, Ms. Ruth.

Thank you.

Please note our office will be closed on 24™ January 2020 (Friday). Business will resume on 28" January 2020
(Tuesday).

Wishing you a happy and prosperous Lunar New Year, filled with wealth, good health and success always!
Best Regards

Grace Teo

Claims Division

D E329 5170 | T. 6461 6555 | F: 6221 3147

For motor claims survey request, please email to motorsurvey@sompo.com.sg




@ SOMPO A Century of Trust

Sompo Insurance Singapore Pte. Ltd.
20 Raffles Place, #05-01/06 Singapore Land Tower, Singapore 048623
Website: www.sompo.com.sq | Facebook: www. facebook.com/SompoSG

Quick & Easy Claims Submission' & Product Purchase’ via Sompo 5G

‘ E"Nuému,.
Download now @ pp Store Google Play

LFor Travel, Personal Accident & Home Insurance | 2 For Travel, Personal Accident, Home & Private Motor Insurance

Disclaimer: This e-mail, including attachments, is intended for the person(s) or company named and may contain confidential
and/or legally privileged information. Unauthorised disclosure, copying or use of this information may be unlawful and is prohibited.
If you are not the intended recipient, please delete this message

Privacy Policy Notice: Sompo Insurance Singapore Pte. Ltd. may collect, use and disclose your personal data for the purposes

stated in our Privacy Policy. This may include disciosure to holding and associated companies, credit bureau, parties to whom
disclosure is permitted/required by laws, our third party service providers and agents (acting on our behalf). Please click here for
our Privacy Paolicy

From: shimin poh <shimin@jhk.com.sg>

Sent: Monday, January 6, 2020 5:06 PM

To: Teo, Grace <grace.teo@sompo.com.sg>

Ce: Chua, Gek Tiang Ruth <ruth.chua@sompo.com.sg=>; Ye, Yong Kang Melvin <melvin.ye @sompo.com.sg>; Henry,
Irene James <irene.henry@sompo.com.sg>

Subject: Re: CMTD2000080/RUC - PRI{LIA)/ YMB426B & SLH3694T DOA : 3/1/2020

Dear Grace:

We choose LKK Marcus,
veh isin

Thank You !

Bridget Fah (Shimin)

Joo Hak Kee Auto Pte Ltd
Blk 3007 Ubi Road 1
#01-406 Singapore 408701
Office: 67431913

On Mon, Jan 6, 2020 at 4:35 PM Teo, Grace <grace.teo@sompo.com.sg> wrote:

Our Reference : CMTD2000080/RUC
Your Reference: SLH3694T

Without Prejudice
EMAIL ONLY

Date: 06.01.2020

OUR Email: motorsuryey @sompo.con.sg

Attention:

M/S JOO HAK KEE AUTO PTE LTD



Dear Bridget

ACCIDENT INVOLVING YM6426B & SLH3694T ON 03.01.2020

We refer to your Notice of Accident dated 06.01.2020.

Please be informed that Ms. Ruth Chua is the handler of this case who can be contacted at 63295 153/
ruth.chua@sompo.com.sg .

We intend to conduct a pre-repair survey of the damage to your client’s/your customer’s vehicle jointly
with your client/your motor workshop. We propose to use one of the motor surveyors named in the
attached list to conduct the joint pre-repair survey as a single joint expert.

Pre-Repair Survey

Selection (Indicate as
Motor Surveyor Surveyor tick)

1 | Raleigh Services Vincent Ng

Kenneth Kong [North
2 | LKK Auto Consultants area)

Marcus Chua (East area)
Mohd Rasul (West area)
Mohd Taufikh (West area)

3 | Priority Services limmy Lee

Lawrence Ng

leffery Ong

Please let us know within two (2) working days whether you agree to the appointment of any of these
motor surveyors as a single joint expert. You may select up to two of the listed motor surveyors. We will
bear the cost of the pre-repair survey carried out by the single joint expert.

Aside to Ruth,

Please assist on the liability from Joo Hak Kee Auto Pte Ltd.

Please note our office will be closed on 24™ January 2020 (Friday). Business will resume on 28" January 2020
[Tuesday).

Wishing you a happy and prosperous Lunar New Year, filled with wealth, good health and success always!

3



Best Regards
Grace Teo

Claims Division

D: 8329 5170 | T: B461 B555 | F: 6221 3147

For motor claims survey request, please email to motorsurvey@sompo.com.sg

—

@ SOMPO - A century of Trust

Sompo Insurance Singapore Pte. Ltd.
50 Raffles Place, #05-01/06 Singapore Land Tower, Singapore 048623
Website: www. sompo.com.sq | Facebook: www . facebook com/SompoSG

Quick & Easy Claims Submission’ & Product Purchase? via Sompo 5G

Download now @ pp Store or Hay

-or Travel, Parsonal Accident & Home Insurance |  For Travel, Personal Accident, Home & Private Motor Insurance

Disclaimer: This e-mail, including attachments, is intended for the personis) or company named and may contain confidential
and/or legally privileged information. Unauthorised disclosure, copying or use of this information may be unlawful and is
prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient, please delete this message

Privacy Policy MNotice: Sompo Insurance Singapore Pte. Lid. may collect, use and disclose your personal data for the purposes
stated in our Privacy Policy. This may include disclosure to holding and associated companies, credit bureau, parties to whom
disclosure is permitted/required by laws, our third party service providers and agents (acting on our behalf). Please click here for
our Privacy Policy

From: shimin poh <shimin@jhk.com.sg>

Sent: Monday, lanuary 6, 2020 1:06 PM

To: Claims - Motor Survey <MotorSury S0MpPo.Com.sg>

Subject: NEW THIRD PARTY DIRECT SETTLEMENT VEH NO : SLH3694T/ YM6426B DOA : 3/1/2020




Dear 5ir/Mdm,

Kindly arrange pre-repair survey for the above and if possible would like to do direct settlement.

Please provide us your list of surveyors for our selection.

Attached is the accident report for your reference and we're currently in the midst of preparing the estimate.

Thank you and hope to hear from you soon.

Thank You !

Bridget Poh (Shimin)

loo Hak Kee Auto Pte Ltd
Blk 3007 Ubi Road 1
#01-406 Singapore 408701

Office: 67431913



Used Sylphy Car & Used Cars & Vehicles Singapore - sgCarMart Page 1 of 2

sGCARMART.COM Login  Sign up

Mew Cars Used Cars Rental Cars Sell My Car Directory Products Insurance Articles Forum Resources

.

G AambkdAamT

CONNECTING CAR BUYERS & SELLERS. CONNECT,

We'll handle your loans, insurance & other paperwork for FREE.

. M Years Renewal COE Toyota Vios 1L.5A ™~ L}
Post an Advertisement paioclis S SN ONE STOR "
Sell it yoursalf! Advertee it at just B3 PLA, $0 Dlown, 30 Adr N =
i G iy e P
$58 until it's SOLD! lilsichigandt g
y L]
Browse by Category v Sart by Date Pasted w] 20 results/page ]
8 vehicles Sylphy Alvance a M Submits
ks Model Price Depreciation g Cate Eng Cap Mileage Veh Type
Search Selection Syiphy A 2016 y by ATy Available
Nissan Sylphy 1.6A $59,688 37,400 fyr 29-Dec-2016 1,598 cc 40,256 km Sedan Available
1 Owner, Excellent Condinion, 100% Accident Free, Full Loan Available, See To Believe, Do Call Us Now!
scctad D5 Y 0 1 5 Missan Sylsiny, 2016 nissan spphy, Nissan Sylphy, r viphy, Mevsan, Sylphy, sylph
Nissan Sylphy 1.6A Premium 558 888 S7,490 /yr 11-Dct-2016 1,588 cc &4,660 km Sedan Avallable
1 Owner, Road Tax Till Oct 2020, Fully Serviced And Mamntained By Agent, Sill Under Warranty, Excellent Condition, 100% Accdent Fre
T# viphy, nissan sviplyy, Missan, Sylphy, Syiphy, Usa
Missan Sylphy 1.6A 58,800 57,980 fyr 12-May-2016 1,598 cc 50,436 km Sadan Available
Agent Maintained. Purchased With Assurance From Henly Enterprises, \Well Established Since 1972, We Provide In-House Loan AL Low
In.,
Henly Enterprises Co
Posted: O1-Ja I2 5T = g
Mg
Nissan Sylphy 1.6A Premium 550,888 £7,630 fyr 13-Oct-2016 1,598 cc 57,000 km Sedan Availalrle
1 Owner, Well Maintained And Serviced By-8Bent Popudar Sedan With Low Depreciation. Car Sill In Original Painbwork And Condion. Sp Precens e}
Mizzan Sylphy (For Lease)
51,500/mth Sedan for lease with stable dreve, sufficient space & comfortable seating. Call us now ta find o more!
Mare inlo about thes wehicls
Missan Sylphy 1.6A Premium $53,800 57,430 fyr 20-Feb-2016 1,598 cc 102,000 km Saedan Avallable

Interest Rate 2.48% Onby! Secured And Well Maintained By Fussy Owner, Immaculate Condition Inssde And Outside. Certified With Assu

Car Search

Nigsan Sylphy 1.6A Premium $62,800 57,800 fyr 27-Dec-2016 1,598 cc 52,000 km Sedan Availalbie
1 Careful Owmer! Low Milzage! Nice Elegant Blue! Warranty Up To One Year! Bank And In House Full Loan Availabbe, Tnterior And Exteri

Viking Maotor Pre Lid

Missan Sylphy 1.6A Premium 357,888 38,210 fyr 2B-Jan- 2016 1,598 co 44,506 lm Sedan _Available

Compare

1 Owner! 100% Accident Free And 100% No Repairs Needed We Defiver Qur Promise, Super Low Mileage And Fully Service By Agent. 5.

https://www.sgcarmart.com/used_cars/listing.php?RGD=2016&MOD=Sylphy&RPG=20& VEH=0&AV... 07-Jan-20



PARF/COE Rebate Enquiry

> Back to OneMotoring

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Vehicle Owner Particulars
Owner ID Type:

Owner 1D:

Vehicle Details
Vehicle No.:

Vehicle to be Exported:
Intended Deregistration Date:
Vehicle Make:

Vehicle Model:

Primary Colour:
Manufacturing Year:

Engine No.:

Chassis No.:

Maximum Power Qutput:
Open Market Value:
Original Registration Date:
First Registration Date:
Transfer Count:

Actual ARF Paid:

Intended PARF Rebate Details
PARF Eligibility:

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date:
PARF Rebate Amount:
Intended COE Rebate Details
COE Expiry Date:

COE Category:

COE Period(Years):

QP Paid:

COE Rebate Amount:

Total Rebate Amount:

Singapore NRIC
001F

SLH3694T
No

07 Jan 2020
NISSAN

SYLPHY 1.6 CVT ABS D/AIRBAG 2ZWD
4DR

Red

2016

HR16992935B
MNTBBAB17Z0027902
85.0 kW (113 bhp)
$16,910.00

31 Oct 2016

310ct 2016

0
$16,910.00 M,—

Yes
30 Oct 2026
$12,682.00

30 Oct 2026

A - Carupto 1600cc & 97kW (130bhp)
10

$50,991.00

$34,734.00

$47,416.00

The information contained herein is correct as at 07 Jan 2020

https://vrl.lta.gov.sg/lta/vrl/action/enquireRebate By PublicBeforeDeregInput 7FUNCTION _ID=F030...

Page 1 of 1

07-Jan-20



CERTIFICATE OF INSURANCE

Please call +65-6322-2072 for FWD Emergency Assistance
if Your Car breaks down or s involved in an accident,
Al accidents must be reported within 24 howrs of the incident regardiess of whether it will ead 1o & clam

POLICY NUMBER: PNCVI015-00000356

Car plate number SLH3694T

Coverage start date: 01,/05/2019 Coverage end date’ 30/04/2020 o,’
Whio s insured to drive; You and any Authorsed Driver ]
Covered Geographical Area: Singapore, West Malaysia and Southern Thailand ge'
About you (the Policyholder] ¢

Name: Lim Ju How "/ NRIC/FIN: 51145001F

Address: 138 Ssmed Street 1 D4-38 Singapore 520138

Email. limjuhowiyahoo.com.sg Mobile Number - 91734868

Date of Birth: 11/09/1355 Gender : Male

Marital status: Married Certificate of Merit: No

Cusrent no daims discount: 50% Years of driving experience: Three or more
About your car and palicy

Car make and model: NISSAN SYLPHY 1.6

Yeear of fust registration . 2016

Plan type: Comprehensive Standard Excess: 552,000
NCD protector Not Applicable Your preferred workshop: Not Applicable
(verseas Booster: Not Applicable Premium patd (Inclushve of GST): §51,266.59

Finance company: Standard Chartered Bank (Singapors) Limited

D e PUe L0 b Demanet Soulrvard 8 B0 St Tower 4, Sngapee e CIEN8E 7 155 GEI0 BEEA Coevpaey Begrairadion e MOO500 TITH | wew Pl roes s

Lompyrighe € FIIN FIND tengagun e Fow £l AN Sighas Bt vl

Paga 7 of 24



. 7 P 4
S &
JOO HAK KEE AUTO PTE LTD
HELTFERARRA A

SINCE 1986

REPAIR ESTIMATE

ATTN: MOTOR CLAIMS DEPARTMENT Est No. : EST20010018
OWNER: Lim Ju How Date : 7-lan-20
INSURER: Sompao Insurance Singapore Pte. Ltd. Vehicle Num : SLH3694T
POLICY NO: PNCV2015-00000356 Make/Model : Nissan Sylphy 1.6 CVT
DOA: 03/01/2020 Chassis # : MNTBBAB17Z20027902
Engine # : HR169529358
¥Yr.Of Manu : 2016
MNo. Description Qty u/p Amt
Section: LIST ITEMS
1 Rear bumper 'DO/.Q 1.00 574.30 574.30
2 Rear Bumper Bracket AT 200 24.10 48.20 X
3 Rear Bumper Sensor A1 200 350.00 700.00 X
4  Rear Bumper Clips v 4 10.00 5.00 50.00 X
5 Rear Bumper Reinforcement VS 1.00 572.30 572.30 X
6  Rear End Panel /7 100 554.30 554.3ﬂ><
7 Rear End Panel Top Garnish A~ 100 181.30 181.30 X
8  Bootlid 6l po 20 /M 1.00 1199.90 1199.90~"
9  Bootlid Handle Chrome Garnish 4 & Crw 100 191.40 191.4Q—
i e
10  Bootlid Lower Chrome Garnish w100 131.30 131.30 )(
11  Bootlid Hinge A1 2.00 81.30 162.60 A
12 Bootlid "NISSAN" Logo Emblem {72-30 A 100 85.90 85.90_~
13 Bootlid "SYLPHY" Emblem £ 200 MA_ 100 79.90 79.90,~
14  Bootlid Lock L e 1.00 77.90 77.90 /
15  Bootlid Lock Stricker A4 100 69.30 69.30 X
= ,
16  Taillamp RH/LH Jé£-00 Msera 20044160 883.20 [PC
17 Inner Taillamp RH/LH A4 200 380.50 761.00 %
0. ¥¢1 Amt SS  6322.80
(% Discount (10.00%) 55 632.28
—2 80 Subtotal S 5690.52

Section: SPECIAL NETT ITEMS
18 Rear Number Plate With Cover

o 100

#0

50.00 50.00

Amt 55 50.00

Discount (0.00%) 55 0.00

Subtotal 55 50.00

Continue on next page...

BLK 3007 UBI ROAD 1 #01-408&, SINGAPORE 408701 TEL: 6743 1913 FAX: 6743 5234 CO/GST REG NO: 201300082W
BLK 3014 UBI ROAD 1 #01-324, SINGAPORE 408702 EMAIL: admin@jhk.com.sg WEBSITE: www.jhk.com.sg

DITSHFE.
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JOO HAK KEE AUTO PTE LTD
WELRERANAR AT
SINCE 1986
REPAIR ESTIMATE
ATTN: MOTOR CLAIMS DEPARTMENT Est No. : EST20010018
OWNER: Lim Ju How Date . 7-lan-20
INSURER: Sompo Insurance Singapore Pte. Ltd. Vehicle Num : 5LH3654T
POLICY NO: PNCV2019-00000356 Make/Model : Nissan Sylphy 1.6 CVT
DOA: 03/01/2020 Chassis # : MNTBBAB17Z0027902
Engine # : HR16992935B
¥Yr.Of Manu : 2016
No. Description Qty u/p Amt
Section: LABOUR
19 To Panel Beat on Necessary Damaged Parts 1.00 680.00 680.00 4{}3
20 15 sand Down, Putty and Spray Paint on Necessary Damaged 1.00 680.00 680.00 699
Parts
21 Labour to Check Wiring for Taillamps and Rear Bumper Sensor 1.00 20.00 80.00
22 Labour to remove and refit taillamp and rear bumper 1.00 80.00 &D,ﬂﬂng
Amt S5 1520.00
Discount (0.00%) 55 0.00

Subtotal S5 1520.00

0. 2232-%0
G- Yo.09
o fﬂ-ﬂ"m
/ﬁaﬁ/ﬂ—
ﬁ’lﬁ'
6x&IY
13605

Joo Hak Kee Auto Pte. Ltd.

LIST ITEMS Subtotal 55 5690.52

SPECIAL NETT ITEMS Subtotal SS 50.00

LABOUR Subtotal 55 1520.00

Total S5 7260.52

BLK 3007 UBI ROAD 1 #01-406, SINGAPORE 408701 TEL: 6743 1913 FAX: 6743 5234 CO/GST REG NO: 201300082W
BLK 3014 UBI ROAD 1 #01-324, SINGAPORE 408702 EMAIL: admin@jhk.com.sg WEBSITE: www.jhk.com.sg

hItSHTE,



¥y V V LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

- )-8 — 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Indusirial Park, Singapore 408933
- TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg. No: 199607198R GST Reg. No. 19-2607188-R

Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automohbile

SOMPO INSURANCE SINGAPORE PL Ref : CS/SMO20000350/Uyf3n2

50 RAFFLES PLACE
#05-01/06 Date : 16-01-2020

SINGAPORE LAND TOWERSINGAPCORE 048623

Code: SMOD
1; Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. ¥M 64268 Veh. Inspected SLH 36947
Policy No. Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. CMTD2000080/RUC Excess (§) 0.00
Assign From GRACE TED Assign Date 06/01/2020
2, Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model NISSAN SYLPHY (A) c.c 1598
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2016
Chassis No. MNTBBAB17Z0027902 Colour RED
Odometer 200001 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification SPORTS RIM
General GOOoD
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |205/55R16 MICHELIN 7 mm
L/H Front Tyre |[205/55 R16 MICHELIN 7 mm
R/H Rear Tyre |205/55 R16 MICHELIN 7 mm
L/H Rear Tyre |205/55 R16 MICHELIN 7 mm
4, Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE REAR PORTION.
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
5. General Information
Accident Date  02/01/2020 |Inspnctiun Date 07/01/2020
Survey held at JOO HAK KEE AUTO PTELTD
3007 UBI ROAD 1 #01-406
KAMPONG UBI INDUSTRIAL ESTATE
SINGAPORE 408701
5a. Remarks
AJTHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
B)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.

5b. Estimate Days of Repair

|ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR: 3 Working Days
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapare 408833
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg. No: 199807198 GST Reg. No. 19-9607188-R Page MNo.:1 of 2
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SLH 3694T
; ' Estimate By | Our Adjusted
Qty Description of Parts Condition Workshop (§)) ()
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|REAR BUMPER DENTED / 574.30 574.30
DEFORMED
2|REAR BUMPER BRACKET @$24.10 NOT NECESSARY 48.20 -
2|REAR BUMPER SENSOR @$350.00 NOT NECESSARY 700.00
10|REAR BUMPER CLIPS @3$5.00 NOT NECESSARY 50.00 -
1|REAR BUMPER REINFORCEMENT NO SUCH PARTS 572.30 -
1|REAR END PAMEL TO REPAIR SEE 554.30 -
LABOUR
1|REAR END PANEL TOP GARNISH NOT MECESSARY 181.30 -
1|BOOTLID DENTED / BENT 1,192.90 1,163.80
1|BOOTLID HANDLE CHROME GARNISH TOP CRACKED 191.40 185.70
1|BOOTLID LOWER CHROME GARNISH SERVICEABLE 131.30 -
2|BOOTLID HINGE @3$81.30 NOT NECESSARY 162.60 -
1{BOOTLID "NISSAN" LOGO EMBLEM NECESSARY B85.90 52.30
1|BOOTLID "SYLPHY" EMBLEM NECESSARY 79.90 62.00
1|BOOTLID LOCK TWISTED 77.90 77.90
1|BOOTLID LOCK STRICKER NOT NECESSARY £9.30 -
2|TAILLAMP RH/LH @$441.60 NS CRACKED 883.20 365.00
2|INMER TAILLAMP RH/LH @$380.50 NOT NECESSARY 761.00 -
LESS 10% DISCOUNT -632.28 -248.10
5,690.52 2,232.90
SPECIAL NETT ITEMS
1|REAR NUMBER PLATE WITH COVER (SN) BENT 50.00 40.00
50.00 40.00
LABOUR
TO PANEL BEAT ON NECESSARY DAMAGED 680.00 400.00
PARTS.INCLUSIVE OF THE REPAIR OF REAR END
PANEL.
TO SAND DOWN,PUTTY AND SPRAY PAINT ON 680.00 600.00
MECESSARY DAMAGED PARTS.
LABOUR TO CHECK WIRING FOR TAILLAMPS AND REAR 80.00 50.00
BUMPER SENSOR. }

Report Ref No. CS/SM0O20000350/Uyf3n2
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Estimate By | Our Adjusted
Qty Description of Parts Condition Workshop (§)) (s)
LABOUR TO REMOVE AND REFIT TAILLAMP AND REAR 80.00
BUMPER. }

1,520.00 1,050.00

GRAND TOTAL 7,260.52 3,322.90

RECOMMENDED COST OF LUMP SUM REPAIRS 2,650.00

(TO ITS PRE-ACCIDENT CONDITION)

Report Ref No. CS/SMO20000350/Uyf3n2

CHUA KANG SENG

Licensed Appraiser

DISCLAIMER OF LIABILITY TO THERD PARTIES:- This Repart s mads salaly for tha use and banafit of the Client named on ths front pags of this Repon.
; : hird party scling or reolying on this




