
Our Ref: CC4/AIG20000316/Aha3               
 

22 JANUARY 2020      

     

RESTART TRADING      By Post & By Email 

55 SERANGOON NORTH AVENUE 4 

#02-01 

SINGAPORE 555859 
 

Dear Sir/Madam, 

 

ACCIDENT INVOLVING GR 7327J AND SGY 3982G ON 31/12/2019  
 

We refer to the above accident where we are acting for AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte 

Ltd to resolve the claim against you and/or your authorized driver under the Auto 

Insurance policy taken up with them. 

 

We have received a claim from Body Repairer/Workshop acting on behalf of the owner 

of SGY 3982G against your motor insurance policy. 

  

Pursuant to the above said accident wherein you and/or your authorized driver had 

amongst other information given us your version of how the accident had occurred, we as 

the appointed agent of your insurers shall proceed to negotiate for an amicable settlement 

with third party claimant. Unless proven otherwise. 

 
Should you however wish to further discuss on the matter prior to our negotiations and 

settlement, please contact us within 10 days from the date of this letter. 

 

Please call us if you have further queries. 

 

 

Yours faithfully, 

 

 

 

Vic Alpeh  

DID: 6841 2096 

FAX: 6741 4108 

Email: vicalpeh@lkkauto.com 

 

c.c. AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd  

            (Motor Claims Dept) 

 henglenggoh@yahoo.com.sg   

(Email) 
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Vic (LKKAuto)

From: Vic (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 22 January, 2020 10:37 AM

To: henglenggoh@yahoo.com.sg

Cc: Admin A; Vic (LKKAuto)

Subject: Your Ref: GR 7327J - ACCIDENT INVOLVING GR 7327J AND SGY 3982G ON 

31/12/2019 

Our Ref: CC4/AIG20000316/Aha3                                                          

 

22 JANUARY 2020                                                                              

                                                                 

RESTART TRADING                                                                                          By Post & By Email  

55 SERANGOON NORTH AVENUE 4 

#02-01 

SINGAPORE 555859 

 

Dear Sir/Madam, 

 

ACCIDENT INVOLVING GR 7327J AND SGY 3982G ON 31/12/2019  

 

We refer to the above accident where we are acting for AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd to resolve the claim against 

you and/or your authorized driver under the Auto Insurance policy taken up with them. 

 

We have received a claim from Body Repairer/Workshop acting on behalf of the owner of SGY 3982G against your 

motor insurance policy. 

                 

Pursuant to the above said accident wherein you and/or your authorized driver had amongst other information given 

us your version of how the accident had occurred, we as the appointed agent of your insurers shall proceed to 

negotiate for an amicable settlement with third party claimant. Unless proven otherwise. 

 

Should you however wish to further discuss on the matter prior to our negotiations and settlement, please contact us 

within 10 days from the date of this letter. 

 

Please call us if you have further queries. 
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Best Regards, 

Vic Alpeh | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6841-2096 | email: vicalpeh@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

Save the Earth. Print only when necessarySave the Earth. Print only when necessarySave the Earth. Print only when necessarySave the Earth. Print only when necessary.... 

 

 

This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by an 
unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mail in error, please do not 
read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the 
sender that you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and any copies thereof. Thank you. 
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Jasper Chua (LKK Auto)

From: Loh, Chee-Heng <Chee-Heng.Loh@aig.com>
Sent: Wednesday, 6 January 2021 12:06 PM
To: Jasper Chua (LKK Auto)
Subject: RE: 3215553487SG

Hi Jasper, 
 
Please maintain rejection under BOLA 31. As long as there is no PIR in TP’s favour, BOLA 31 scenario will apply.  
 
Thank you. 
 
Loh Chee Heng 
Senior Complex Claims Examiner – Auto Property Damage Claims 
AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd 
 
AIG Building 
78 Shenton Way, Level 10 
Singapore 079120 
Tel +(65) 6419 1881 
Chee-Heng.Loh@aig.com | www.AIG.sg 
  
If you have received this message outside of your usual work hours, I do not expect that you will read, respond to or action it until appropriate for you. 
 

From: Jasper Chua (LKK Auto) [mailto:jasperchua@lkkauto.com]  
Sent: Wednesday, 6 January 2021 9:01 AM 
To: Loh, Chee-Heng <Chee-Heng.Loh@aig.com> 
Subject: [EXTERNAL] 3215553487SG 
 
This message is from an external sender; be cautious with links and attachments. 

Dear Chee Heng, 
 
TP workshop rejected our propose of rejection , they propose to settle at 50% liability since they there’s no 
final results produced by traffic police. 
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Kindly have your approval or maintain the rejection. 

 

Thanks  

Best Regards, 

Jasper Chua| Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6841-2928 | email: jasperchua@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

From: Loh, Chee-Heng <Chee-Heng.Loh@aig.com>  
Sent: Wednesday, 23 December 2020 2:06 PM 
To: Jasper Chua (LKK Auto) <jasperchua@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: 3215553487SG 
 
Hi Jasper, 
 
You may proceed to reject claim based on BOLA 31.  
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Thank you. 
 
Loh Chee Heng 
Senior Complex Claims Examiner – Auto Property Damage Claims 
AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd 
 
AIG Building 
78 Shenton Way, Level 10 
Singapore 079120 
Tel +(65) 6419 1881 
Chee-Heng.Loh@aig.com | www.AIG.sg 
  
If you have received this message outside of your usual work hours, I do not expect that you will read, respond to or action it until appropriate for you. 
 

From: Jasper Chua (LKK Auto) [mailto:jasperchua@lkkauto.com]  
Sent: Wednesday, 23 December 2020 1:34 PM 
To: Loh, Chee-Heng <Chee-Heng.Loh@aig.com> 
Subject: [EXTERNAL] 3215553487SG 
 
This message is from an external sender; be cautious with links and attachments. 

Dear Chee Heng, 
 
We refer to the matter above. 
 
Based on both party accident statement , BOLA 31 apply. TP vehicle was filtering to the right after entering 
the yellow box from the slip road while our insured diver driving straight. 
 
Kindly have your rejection approval based on BOLA 31. 
 
Thanks  
 
"Best Wishes for Merry Christmas & Happy New Year 2021" 
 

Best Regards, 

Jasper Chua| Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6841-2928 | email: jasperchua@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 
IMPORTANT NOTICE:  
The information in this email (and any attachments) is confidential. If you are not the intended recipient, you must 
not use or disseminate the information. If you have received this email in error, please immediately notify me by 
"Reply" command and permanently delete the original and any copies or printouts thereof. Although this email and 
any attachments are believed to be free of any virus or other defect that might affect any computer system into 
which it is received and opened, it is the responsibility of the recipient to ensure that it is virus free and no 
responsibility is accepted by American International Group, Inc. or its subsidiaries or affiliates either jointly or 
severally, for any loss or damage arising in any way from its use. 
IMPORTANT NOTICE:  
The information in this email (and any attachments) is confidential. If you are not the intended recipient, you must 
not use or disseminate the information. If you have received this email in error, please immediately notify me by 
"Reply" command and permanently delete the original and any copies or printouts thereof. Although this email and 
any attachments are believed to be free of any virus or other defect that might affect any computer system into 
which it is received and opened, it is the responsibility of the recipient to ensure that it is virus free and no 
responsibility is accepted by American International Group, Inc. or its subsidiaries or affiliates either jointly or 
severally, for any loss or damage arising in any way from its use. 


