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Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto)

From: Chew Goon Motor(ad3) <ad3@chewgoonmotor.com.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, 1 July 2020 10:25 am

To: Guo Qiang (LKKAuto)

Cc: Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto)

Subject: RE: SDV 9955Y - Finalize

Dear Guo Qiang, 

 

Confirm $ 3,446.65 (before gst) and 3 days. 

 

Thanks & Regards, 
Kelly 
 
Chew Goon Motor 
Blk 10, Ang Mo Kio Ind Park 2A, 
Ave 5 #01-15 , 16 & 17, 
Ang Mo Kio Autopoint 
Singapore 568047 
Tel : 6484 1626 
Fax : 6484 0465 

 

From: Guo Qiang (LKKAuto) 

Sent: Monday, 29 June 2020 5:42 PM 

To: Chew Goon Motor(ad3) 

Cc: Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto) 

Subject: 回复: SDV 9955Y - Finalize 

 

Dear Kelly, 

  

Finalize COR $3446.65 before GST @ 3 working days. 

  

Regards, 

Guo Qiang 

 

 

 

发件人: Chew Goon Motor(ad3) <ad3@chewgoonmotor.com.sg> 

发送时间: 2020年 6月 29日 15:07 
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收件人: Guo Qiang (LKKAuto) <GuoQiang@lkkauto.com> 

抄送: Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto) <ShirleyHiew@lkkauto.com> 

主题: RE: SDV 9955Y - Finalize  

  

Dear Guo Qiang, 

  

Attached is the pricing from another supplier. 

We wish to counter propose 

• Rear Bumper $ 1,755.00 

• Taillamp LH - $ 755 

  

Thanks & Regards, 
Kelly 
 
Chew Goon Motor 
Blk 10, Ang Mo Kio Ind Park 2A, 
Ave 5 #01-15 , 16 & 17, 
Ang Mo Kio Autopoint 
Singapore 568047 
Tel : 6484 1626 
Fax : 6484 0465 

  

From: Guo Qiang (LKKAuto) 

Sent: Friday, 26 June 2020 5:48 PM 

To: Chew Goon Motor(ad3) 

Cc: Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto) 

Subject: 回复: SDV 9955Y - Finalize 

  

Dear Kelly, 

  

Finalize COR $3350.2 before GST @ 3 working days. 

  

Regards, 

Guo Qiang 

  

  

 

发件人: Chew Goon Motor(ad3) <ad3@chewgoonmotor.com.sg> 

发送时间: 2020年 6月 23日 14:15 

收件人: Guo Qiang (LKKAuto) <GuoQiang@lkkauto.com> 
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抄送: Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto) <ShirleyHiew@lkkauto.com> 

主题: RE: SDV 9955Y - Finalize  

  

Dear Guo Qiang, 

  

Attached is the estimate for finalize. 

  

Thanks & Regards, 
Kelly 
 
Chew Goon Motor 
Blk 10, Ang Mo Kio Ind Park 2A, 
Ave 5 #01-15 , 16 & 17, 
Ang Mo Kio Autopoint 
Singapore 568047 
Tel : 6484 1626 
Fax : 6484 0465 

  

From: Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto) 

Sent: Friday, 19 June 2020 5:44 PM 

To: Chew Goon Motor(ad3) 

Cc: Guo Qiang (LKKAuto) 

Subject: RE: SDV 9955Y - Finalize 

  

Hi Kelly, 

  

Kindly update the below email above matter & finalize with our surveyor soonest. 

  

Insurance is chasing. 

  

  

Thank you. 

Best Regards, 

Shirley Hiew | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

  

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email.  Submission 

of claim related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted. 
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From: Guo Qiang (LKKAuto) <GuoQiang@lkkauto.com>  

Sent: Friday, 29 May 2020 5:14 pm 

To: Chew Goon Motor(ad3) <ad3@chewgoonmotor.com.sg> 

Cc: Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto) <ShirleyHiew@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: SDV 9955Y - Finalize 

  

Dear Kelly, 

  

Please provide parts price for finalize. 

  

Regards, 

Guo Qiang 

  

  

  

 


